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Foreword 

The Federal criminal Justice system 
focuses on major areas of public 
concern such as high level drug 
offenses, public fraud, weapons 
violations and Immigration offenses. 
The processing of Federal offenders 
also reflects current practices 
regarding prosecution, pretrial 
release, sentencing and corrections. 
The study of Federal offenders and 
th~ir case processing are critical, 
therefore, to understanding the 
operations of the Federal justice 
system and to evaluating the effec­
tiveness of policies and procedures 
for Federal crime control. 

This compendium provides data on 
Federal offenders from initial review 
by U.S. attorneys through charging, 
pretrial release, prosecution, adjudi­
cation, sentencing and correctional 
supervision. The data, which 
describe transactions occurring in 
calendar year 1990, are complied 
both nationally and, in the appendix, 
on the basis of individual jurisdictions. 
Data are derived from the Bureau of 
Justice Statistics (BJS) Federal 
Justice database which includes 
records obtained directly from 
individual operating agencies. 
Uniform crime categories and time 
frames are used In reporting the dala 
to permit the user to trace activity 
across different components of the 
Federal system. 

= 
The 1990 Compendium is the 
sixth In the annual BJS series. 
BJS hopes that the material 
presented in these volumes will 
assist criminal Justice practitioners, 
policymakers and researchers In 
the analysis of current activity and 
the identification of trends in the 
Federai criminal Justice system. 

Lawrence Greenfeld 
Acting Director, BJS 
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Introduction 

The 1990 Compendium of Federai 
Justice Statistics Is a comprehensive 
Bureau of Justice Statistics report 
presenting an overview of Federal 
criminal case processing. The data In 
the compendium are extracted from 
the BJS Federal justice database, 
which links data describing each com­
ponent of Federal processing. Data 
are presently Included from the Ex­
ecutive Office for the U.S. Attorneys, 
the Pretrial Services Agency (PSA) , 
the Administrative Office of the U.S. 
Courts, the U.S. Sentencing Commis­
sion, and the U.S. Bureau of Prisons. 
Future editions of the compendium 
will incorporate data from additional 
Federal agencies. 

The compendium describes the 
progress of Federal criminal suspects 
through prosecution (chapter i), pre­
trial release (chapter 2), adjudication 
(chapter 3), sentencing (chapter 4), 
and corrections (chapter 5). Tables 
follow the text of each chapter. 

Both Individual and corporate cases 
are included in the tables, and both 
felonies and misdemeanors, unless 
otherwise Indicated. Corporations are 
not represented in tables based on 
data collected during pretTlalinter­
views or In tables showing offenders 
sentenced to supervision or Incar-
ceration. . 

The 1990 compendium, sixth in a 
series which also includes 1984, 
1985, 1986, 1988, and 1989, de­
scribes each aspect of processing in 
relation to suspects or defendants 
who completed a pertinent stage of 
processing during calendar year 
1990. For exa,mple, the tables In 
chapter 1 describe suspects whose 
criminal matters were initiated in 1990 
or those whose matters were con­
cluded during 1990. Chapter 3 de­
scribes defendants whose cases 
were terminated or disposed in the 
Federal courts during calendar year 
1990. These are not necessarily the 

------------------------------------------

same as the suspects whose criminal 
matters are tabulated In chapter 1. 

In text discussions of tables, any 
comments about changes between 
1989 and 1990 or between 1984 and 
1990 are based on comparisons with 
the corresponding table in the Com­
pendium of Federal Justice Statistics 
for the indicated year. 

In the Federal justice database, indi­
viduals and corporations are tracked 
tram one stage of processing to the 
next. Files are linked on the basis of 
names, demographic characteristics, 
and key events to permit a system­
wide view of the Federal justice pro­
cess. Consistent with Federal stat­
ute, identifiable data In the database 
may not be revealed or used for any 
purposes other than research or sta­
tistics. 

Incomplete linkages do not affect 
any of the tables in this publication 
that are derived from a single data 
source, since records are Included In 
the tabulated statistics whether or not 
they have been linked to other 
records In the database. However, 
some tables in this compendium pre­
vide greater richness and detail by 
drawing on more than one data 
source for each case; these tables 
are necessarily based upon linked 
records only. 

Organization of the compendium 

Each chapter of the compendium 
describes a major stage In the pro­
cessing of criminal suspects and de­
fendants and combines data from all 
U.S. Judicial districts. Geographically 
detailed data appear in the district 
tables at the end of this compendIum. 
The contents of the compendium In­
clude: 

System overview. This section pro­
vides a graphic overview of the Fed­
eral system. Figure 1 is a flow chart 

of Federal processing in 1990. Figure 
2 describes the attrition of suspects 
from prosecutorial review to sentenc­
Ing, incarceration, and release. 

Chapter 1. This chapter describes 
decisions taken by Federal prosecu­
tors in screening criminal matters and 
the characteristics of cases pros­
ecuted or declined. 

Chapter 2. This chapter provides 
information on pretrial release, deten­
tion, and defendant conduct while 
awaiting trial. 

Chapter 3. This chapter describes 
actions of U.S. district courts in adju­
dicating guilt or innocence. Charac­
teristics of offenses and convicted 
offenders are described. 

Chapter 4. This chapter describes 
sentencing decisions and offense and 
offender characteristics. 

Chapter 5. This chapter addresses 
corrections. Data describe the time 
served in incarceration, prisoner 
movements into and out of Federal 
prison, and the results of supervision 
under probation, parole, or super­
vised release. 

Methodology. This section de­
scribes the procedures followed in 
analyzing data and developing tables. 

Data notea. This section contains 
information relevant to the interpreta­
tion of individual tables. 

Glossary. This section contains 
definitions for terms used In the com­
pendium. Since many terms used in 
the text or tables have specialized 
meanings (either because they refer 
to Federal law or because of reporting 
procedures in the Federal agencies 
supplying the source data), readers 
are encouraged to check the glossary 
for exact definitions of tabulated data. 
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Note to reader 

The tables In 'the compendium were 
constructed to permit valid compari­
sons within each table and to allow 
the reader to compare percentages 
(but not raw totals) across tables. It 
shoUld be understood, however, that 
the total number of subjects shown In 
a particular table may not equal the 
number of subjects Involved In a par­
ticular stage of processing, since 
some records could not be linked and 
some data sources did not Include 
Information on particular data ele­
ments classified In a particular table. 
Data notes Indicate the exact uni­
verse for individual tables. Numbers 
cited In the text are based on exact 
calculations and may vary slightly 
from totals derived from tables. 

Comparisons. between selected stat­
istics for 1990 arid those for othtlr 
years are presented In the BJS publi­
cation Federal Criminal Case Pro­
cessing, 1980-90, which currently In­
cludes updates through part of 1991.1 
This compendium contains more 
complete Information for 1990 than Is 
found In Federal Criminal Case Pro­
cessing, 1980-90. 

The compendium presents only fac­
tuallnformation, without analyses of 
trends or explanatory factors underly­
ing the statistics. Analyses of Federal 
justice statistics may be found In Spe­
cial Reports and other publications, 
some of which are cited In the com­
pendium. Assessment of changing 

1 Federal Criminal Case Processing, 
1980·90, with Preliminary Data for 1991, 
Bureau of Justice Statistics, September 
1992 (NCJ-136945). 

patterns In the compendium's tabula­
tions may depend on detailed exami­
nation of subcategories not shown In 
the tabulations or may require other 
sources of Information, such as 
knowledge of leg!slation or Federal 
agenoy procedures. 

The compendium Is prepared under 
the BJS Federal jUstice Statistics 
program. The BJS Federal justice 
database, maintained under the pro­
gram, Is available for public use at the 
Nat!onal Archive of Criminal Justice 
Data, Inter-university Consortium for 
Political and Social Research, as data 
collection ICPSR 9296. 

2 Compelldium of FederaLJustice Statistics, 1990 
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Federal criminal case processing, 1990 

In mattel'l!, opened t'v U.S. attorneys: 

All offenses 

Suspects Investigated t:::m:H::m:m:tmmm::::tmmm::fm:mr:m::t:::t::::~:l:::im:t:m:rw:mw:m:m:I1OO% 

Defendants prosecutedaf:i::ii:if::::i:i:iNi,@i:iMFtil.:i:m:::mi:m::mm:i:i:i:i:i:::i:J 68% 
Offenders convlctedBW::::::::::::m::m:m:::m::m::tHi,:m:m:::::::::::l! 53% 

Offenders sentenced to prlsonb U::::::::m:m:::::t:m:m:H 27% 
Offenders sentenced to prObatlOnb", [Bm",mi:",im;",~:;i ... : _1_3_% ____ -.. ________ .., 

~ I , 
o 50 100% 

Violent offenses 

Convicted ~m@tmt{*f:jjf:f~1f:W:f.ili@j;ljij1jjam 58% 

Prison ntMi:m:ii::mli:~:::::tii!M:@ilil] 49% 
Probatio~ ~6_% ___ :_' ___ -'-1 ______ ---, 

o 50 "100% 
Property offenses-1raudulent 

Prosecuted [mjjill~~lili~t~ljjilit~l~jf~~l;~;mtlm~J?!i!@jJ 55% 

Convicted 1::m:Mni!mll~lli:i~i:i:i:f:::il\il 46% 
prI50n~19% 

Proballon ":i:iW/::t:) 23% 
o 

I 50 

Olher property offenses 

I 100% 

Investigated m[\M:nt::Mi@mn:mt:t.f.Wi:i.tili@l::l:::iljtlgt::Wl:~l:il:il@t::J 100% 

Prosecuted MM1:::f1jjI:i;:::i:m:::m:iljlljjj\iw:::W;:Wiii::i:i:) 63% 
Oonvlcted lBDiMtmW:iiilr;;i:tt)' ~6% 

Pflson mlIlm 17% 

p·;·;·;···················121'" 
Probation fl~i::l:~~~*l;~ll~l~l~~l IV 

o 
I 

50 
I 100% 

Drug offenses 

Investigated 11;ij~llili;1f:;il;1~11tllm;1111i~m;1111t~~mt;l~!jl~ljillr:jl;~~ljW:f:ilijfJ.~jlljrjjjmf:l~j@tjilir~jjlijif:jI1 00% 

Prosecuted [jijjjjjjj~mjjljllllf:jjjjjlljljjWf~jjjl1f:mM.~Jlj~rjrlj@lJltjjl~j¥.jlf:~tJ 81% 

Oonvlcted Imm:m::::::::::\m::mm:m:mm%:::i:iiMw::m¥11 64% 

Prison 1!:iH::::::::it:m:m:::::::;@n:m:m::r::::::f:l:1 55% 
Probation fI"W",:::: ... : _B_% ______ "TI ________ -" 

o 50 100% 
Public-order offenues-regulatory 

Investigated rjjjjjjjjjjjjjf~jjjljlliltl??:jljl@t1jll;jli;?:f:~~illlm;jljjjlj~~r?:!;jjilm11W1F:f:~f:~1~mjjjjjjf:jmlmj~~j~11 00% 

Prosecuted M:mm:lm::m:m::m:t:iJ::ml::) 39% 

Convicted ~ii~~:l:::i:iWml:l::Wm?J 30% 
Prison lti:l:ilH 10% 

mmm Probation ~ 13% 
o 

I 50 

Other public-ordar offense. 

I 100% 

Investigated Itl::ii~mf:i:::m:H~ifi:ii~iii.H::t~:ii:mtt:ltm@:i:i:::M@m:i@::m:l:lt~I1oo% 

Prosecuted l~jjjijijijl1jjjjjjjjjl1iiliililijljj11~j~lilj~ff.~jmilf:tff:lf:f:mmjjjtjilijj~ll~j!r:$illf 75% 

Oonvlcted ~::jttt:::::mtli.~:;:::imii:i:ii:i:iM;:il@1 55% 
Prison :::~~:::f:::~: 14% IINNNN 

....•.....•...... 

Probation Jl]f%"'t"'i ..... 9_% _____ --rI ________ -,1 

o 50 100% 

Note: See data note 1. sentenced to prison or probation were sentenced 
by magistrates or received a fino-only sentence 
In Federal court. Probation exclUdes persons 
sentenced to prison. 

"lncludas magistrate proceedings_ 
bprlson Includes split, life, Indeterminate, regular, 
and youth sentences. Offenders not shown as 

FIgure 2 
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Federa! crimina! cases may be 
brought by the U.S. Attorney's Office, 
by the Crimina! Division of the U.S. 
Department of Justice, or by other 
authorized agencies. 

Most commonly, investigations are 
referred to the U.S. attorney by the 
Criminal Division of the U.S. Depart­
ment of Justice, by a Federallnvesti­
gatlve agency (primarily the Drug En­
forcement Administration; Federal 
Bureau of Investigation; Postal In­
spection Service; Bureau of Alcohol, 
Tobacco and Firearms; or Secret Ser­
vice), or by a State or local investiga­
tive agency. Investigations may also 
be initiated and cases brought directly 
by U.S. attorneys or by the Criminal 
Division of the U.S. Department of 
Justice. This chapter reports only on 
suspects Investigated by U.S. attor­
neys. 

Investigations referred to the U.S. 
attorneys may be immediately de­
clined for prosecution or pursued fur­
ther. In the latter case, additional illl­
vestlgation may be conducted in 
order to determine whether the mat­
ter should be filed as a case in the 
Federal courts, referred to a U.S. 
magistrate for disposition, or declined 
for prosecution. Matters that are de­
clined may be referred to another au­
thority for prosecution or settled 
through alternative resolution proce­
dures. 

Declination policies frequently limit 
the types of matters that will be filed 
as cases or stipulate the level gf in­
vestigation that must be completed 
before a presentation can be accept­
ed as a matter. Individual policies 
vary widely across Federal districts 
and may be Influenced by a variety of 
factors, Including Federal prosecutorl­
al policies, regional needs, and Indi­
vidual U.S. attorneys' priorities and 
staff resources. 

For purposes of statistical calcula­
tions, only those investigations and 
other activities requiring over one 
hour's attention are classified as mat­
ters by the U.S. attorneys. 

Matters received (table 1.1) 

Over 111,000 suspects were In­
volved in matters received by the 
U.S. attorneys in 1990, about 2,600 
higher than in the previous year. 

Drug offenses as a group accounted 
for 30% of all suspects in matters re­
ceived. The total number of drug sus­
pects investigated was, however, 
slightly lower in 1990 than in 1989, 
the first annual decrease In drug of­
fense suspects since this compendium 
series began in 1984. Drug offenses 
include possession, manufacturing, 
importing, and trafficking in narcotics, 
controlled substances, and marijuana, 
as well as any unspecified drug-related 
offense other than conspiracy. 

Over a fourth of the suspects 
(28,942) were Investigated for fraudu­
lent property offenses, which include 
fraud (except tax fraud), forgery, em­
bezzlement, and counterfeiting. Of 
these, 21,137 persons (19% of all 
suspects in matters received) were 
investigated for frauds other than tax 
fraud. 

Regulatory offenses accounted for 
8% of all suspects In matters re­
ceived. The number of suspects in­
vestigated for Immigration offenses 
(8% of all suspects in matters re­
ceived) and weapons offenses (5%) 
increased substantially between 1989 
and 1990. 

Violent offenses accounted for 5% of 
all suspects. About half of these were 
investigated for robbery (3% of all sus­
pects). Three percent of the suspects 
were Investigated for nonfraudulent 
property offenses, mostly larceny (2% 
of all suspects). 

Two percent of suspects could not 
be classified by SUbstantive offense 
because the recorded United States 
Code citations referred to offenses 
such as conspiracy and aiding and 
abetting. 

Disposition of matters concluded 
(table 1.2) 

Matters Involving 109,948 suspects 
were concluded by U.S. attorneys In 
calendar year 1990, an Increase of 5 
percent since 1989. 

U.S. att,orneys flied cases against 
- 55% of the suspects, declined to 

prosecut,e 32%, and referred 13% for 
disposltlcln by U.S. magistrates. Of 
the 60,521 suspects In matters filed 
as cases for prosecution in U.S. dis­
trict court, 41 % (25,094 suspects) 
were Investigated in connection with 
drug offenses, and 24% (14,266 sus­
pects) with fraudulent property offens­
es. 

Prosecution rates, by offense 

Among matters concluded In 1990, 
U.S. attorneys prosecuted 75% of all 
suspects In drug offense matters, and 
78% of suspects In robbery matters. 
Sixty-five percent of suspects In mur­
der/manslaughter charges were pros­
ecuted by U.S. attorneys. Sixty-six 
percent of suspects In tax law viola­
tions were prosecuted, compared to 
49% of suspects In fraud matters 
other than tax fraud. About 32% of 
suspects In regulatory matters were 
prosecuted, although antitrust offens­
es were prosecuted at a much lower 
rate than in 1989 (49% In 1990 com­
pared to 86% in 1989). 

Magistrates 

Some criminal cases are referred to 
U.S. magistrates for processing. Most 
U.S. magistrates' caseloads are pri­
marily misdemeanors, but referral 
practices vary among U.S. district 
courts. Overall, 13% of suspects In 
matters concluded in 1990 were dis­
posed by U.S. magistrates. However, 
66% of all immigration suspects were 
disposed by U.S. magistrates. Magis­
trate proceedings played a Significant 
role In the disposition of escape sus­
pects (44%) and persons suspected 
of violating migratory bird laws (77%). 

Chapter 1: Prosecution 9 



Busls for declination (tables 1.3 
and 1.4) 

A variety of factors Influence the de­
termination to decline prosecution of 
a case (table 1.3). 

Twenty-seven percent of suspects in 
matters declined were not prosecuted 
because the evidence was too weak. 
Sixteen percent were not prosecuted 
due to the lack of a prosecutable of­
fense. The majority of these were de­
clined either because U.S. attorneys 
ascertained that no Federal law was 
violated (8%) or because they found 
no proof of criminal Intent (8%). 

Another 19% of all suspects in mat­
ters declined were not prosecuted for 
reasons variously described as mini­
mal Federal interest (4%) , lack of re­
sources (6%), and Justice Depart­
ment or U.S. attorney policy (5%). 
The U.S. attorneys' decisions not to 
prosecute, however, do not automati­
cally relieve suspects of all further 
action: 25% of the 35,239 suspects in 
matters declined by U.S. attorneys 
were referred for criminal prosecution 
elsewhere or prosecuted in other ac­
tions; 7% were subject to some non­
criminal proceedings, such as pretrial 
diversion (4%) or civil or administra­
tive alternative actions (3%). 

Among matters declined, those in­
volving escape, kidnaping, robbery, 
and drug offenses were more often 
referred to other authorities for prose­
cution than were other declined of­
fense types (table 1.4). Combining 
the 2,720 drug suspects referred to 
other prosecution with the 26,852 
drug suspects prosecuted in Federal 
courts or heard by U.S. magistrates, 
table 1.2 shows that 89% of drug sus­
pects in matters crmcluded In 1990 
were either prosecl 'ed or referred for 
prosecution in another jurisdiction. 

Noncriminal resolutions wef.;>; widely 
used In white co liar matters such as 
forgery and embezzlement matters 
(18% and 22%, respectively), viola­
tions of agricultural or food and drug 
regulations (15% and 19%), and in 
gambling matters (18%). 

Processing time (table 1.5) 

Processing time for matters Is mea­
sured in months from the time a mat­
ter is received by the U.S. attorney to 
the time of declination, filing as a 
case, or disposition by a U.S. magis­
trate. 

The average processing time for all 
matters concluded in 1990 was 10.5 
months, 1.7 months longer than in 
1988 and 1989. Average processing 
time was higher where prosecution 
was declined (21 months) than where 
a matter was filed as a case (6 months). 

The average processing time for 
declination was also longer than for 
any actions by U.S. magistrates (2 
months where suspects were convict­
ed by a U.S. magistrate; 9 months 
where suspects were acquitted). 

Across all offenses, average pro­
cessing time for cases prosecuted in 
U.S. district court was longest for sus­
pects charged with fraudulent proper­
ty offenses (8 months if the matter 
was filed as a case; 24 months if the 
matter was declined). Suspects in 
fraudulent property crimes who were 
dispclsed by U.S. magistrates had an 
average processing time of 5 months 
if convicted and 10 months if acquit­
ted. The average processing time was 
largest for suspects in nonfraudulent 
property offenses who were declined 
by a U.S. attorney (27 months). 

10 Compendium of Federal Justice Statistics, 1990 



Table 1.1 Suspects In matters received by U.S. attorneys, 
by offense, 1990 

Suspects In criminal matters 

Most serious 
received by U.S. attorney.s 

offense investigated Number Percent 

All offenses8 111,118 100.0 

Violent offenses 5,238 4.8 
Murder/manslaughterb 276 .3 
Assault 1,117 1.0 
Robbery 2,688 2.5 
Rape 400 .4 
Other sex offensesc 448 .4 
Kidnaping 214 .2 
Threats against the President 95 .1 

Property offenses 32,481 29.8 

Fraudulent OffensG$ 28,942 26.5 
Embezzlement 5,643 5.2 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 21,137 19.4 
Forgery 2,010 1.8 
Counterfeiting 152 .1 

Other offenses 3,539 3.2 
Burglary 75 .1 
Larcenyd 2,253 2.1 
Motor vehicle theft 654 .6 
Arson 22 --
Transportation of stolen jroperty 198 .2 
Other property offenses 337 .3 

Drug offenses 33,082 30.3 

Public order offenses 38,375 35.1 

Regulatory offenses 8,347 7.6 
Agriculture 627 .6 
Antitrust 82 .1 
Labor law 29 --
Food and drug 199 .2 
Motor carrier 138 .1 
Other regulatory offenses 7,272 6.7 

Other offenses 30,028 27.5 
Weapons 5,800 5.3 
Immigration offenses 8,784 8.0 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 1,733 1.6 
Bribery 697 .6 
Perjury 290 .3 
National defense 646 .6 
Escape 3,970 3.6 
Racketeering and extortionb 2,934 2.7 
Gambling offenses 468 .4 
Liquor offenses 23 --
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 112 .1 
Migratory birds 977 .9 
Conspiracy, aiding and 

abetting, traffic, and 
jUrisdictional offenses 2,726 2.5 

Other 868 .8 

-- Less than .05% d Excluding transportation of 
a Includes suspects for whom offense stolen property. 

category could not be determined. e Excluding fraudulent property 
b See methodology. offenses; including destruction 
c. • of property and trespass. 

May Include some non'llolent S d ta t 2 d 3 
offenses. ee a no es an • 
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Table 1.2 Disposition of suspects I" matters concluded, by offense, 1990 

Suspects in criminal matters concluded 

Number Percent 

Prosecuted Prosecuted 
Most serious In U.S. dis- Disposed by In U.S. dls- Disposed by 
offense Investigated Total trict court Declined magistrate Total trict court Declined magistrate 

All offenses8 109,948 60,521 35,239 14,188 100.0% 55.0% 32.1% 12.9% 

Violent offenses 5,076 3,425 1,409 242 100.0% 67.5% 27.8% 4.8% 
Murder/manslaughterb 254 166 78 10 100.0 65.4 30.7 3.9 
Assault 1,023 573 344 106 100.0 56.0 33.6 10.4 
Robbery 2,722 2,134 502 86 100.0 78.4 18.4 3.2 
Rape 367 216 142 9 100.0 58.9 38.7 2.5 
Other sex offensesc 392 192 194 6 100.0 49.0 49.5 1.5 
Kidnaping 216 105 96 13 100.0 46.6 45.4 6.0 
Threats against the President 102 39 51 12 100.0 36.2 50.0 11.8 

Property offenses 32,441 16,289 14,237 1,915 100.0% 50.2% 43.9% 5.9% 

Fraudulent offenses 26,765 14,266 12,691 1,606 100.0% 49.6% 44.8% 5.6% 
Embezzlement 5,516 2,714 2,299 503 100.0 49.2 41.7 9.1 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 20,650 10,230 9,711 909 100.0 49.1 46.6 4.4 
Forgery 2,254 1,242 824 186 100.0 55.1 36.6 8.3 
Counterfeiting 145 80 57 8 100.0 55.2 39.3 5.5 

Other offenses 3,676 2,023 1,346 307 100.0% 55.0% 36.6% 8.4% 
Burglary 81 53 25 3 100.0 65.4 30.9 3.7 
Larcenyd 2,408 1,398 850 160 100.0 58.1 35.3 6.6 
Motor vehicle theft 679 : 343 309 27 100.0 50.5 45.5 4.0 
Arson 29 12 14 3 100.0 41.4 48.3 10.3 
Transportation of stolen froperty 153 I 8~ 57 13 100.0 54.2 37.3 8.5 
Other property offenses 326 134 91 101 100.0 41.1 27.9 31.0 

Drug offenses 33,265 25,094 6,413 1,758 100.0% 75.4% 19.3% 5.3% 

Public order offenses 37,392 14,936 12,374 10,082 100.0% 39.9% 33.1% 27.0% 

Regulatory offenses 8,556 2,768 5,184 604 100.0% 32.4% 60.6% 7.1% 
Agriculture 612 233 219 160 100.0 38.1 35.8 26.1 
Antitrust 103 50 47 6 100.0 48.5 45.6 5.8 
Labor law 39 21 17 1 100.0 53.8 43.6 2.6 
Food and drug 303 172 95 36 100.0 56.8 31.4 11.9 
Motor carrier 98 54 39 5 100.0 55.1 39.8 5.1 
Other regulatory offenses 7,401 2,238 4,767 396 100.0 30.2 64.4 5.4 

Other offenses 28,836 12,168 7,190 9,478 100.0% 42.2% 24.9% 32.9% 
Weapons 5,446 3,627 1,630 189 100.0 66.6 29.9 3.5 
Immigration offenses 8,596 2,676 283 5,637 100.0 31.1 3.3 65.6 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 1,901 1,248 611 42 100.0 65.6 32.1 2.2 
Bribery 712 290 404 18 100.0 40.7 56.7 2.5 
Perjury 282 158 122 2 100.0 56.0 43.3 .7 
National defense 720 2~1 227 212 100.0 39.0 31.5 29.4 
Escape 3,774 894 1,209 1,671 100.0 23.7 32.0 44.3 
Racketeering and extortionb 2,766 1,232 1,487 47 100.0 44.5 53.8 1.7 
Gambling offenses 463 291 166 6 100.0 62.9 35.9 1.3 
Liquor offenses 25 16 8 1 100.0 64.0 32.0 4.0 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 138 65 67 6 100.0 47.1 48.6 4.3 
Migratory birds 751 55 120 576 100.0 7.3 16.0 76.7 
Conspiracy, aiding and 

abetting, traffic, and 
Jurisdictional offenses 2,455 860 649 946 100.0 35.0 26.4 38.5 

Other 807 475 207 125 100.0 58.9 25.7 15.5 

a Includes suspects for whom offense category could not be d Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
determined. e Excluding fraudulent property offenses; including destruction of 

b See methodology. property and trespass. 
C May include some nonviolent offenses. See data notes 2 and 3. 
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Table 1.3 Basis for declination 01 prosecution by U.S. attorneys, 1990 I 
Suspects in criminal matters 
declined by U.S. attorneys 

Basis for declination Number Percent 

Total declinations 35.239 100.0% 

Nocrlma 5,641 16.0% 

No true bill returned 17 --
No Federal offense 2,656 7.5 

Lack of criminal intent 2,968 8.4 

Referred or handled In 
other prosecution 8,682 24.6% 

Removed 3,190 9.1 

Prosecuted on other charges 1,654 4.7 

Prosecuted by other authorities 3,389 9.6 

Complaint combined with 
other indictment 393 1.1 

Youthful offender transfer to 
State authority 56 .2 

Alternative resolution 2,477 7.0% 

Restitution 171 .5 

Civil or administrative alternative 915 2.6 

Pretrial diversion 1,391 3.9 

Suspect-related reason. 889 2.5% 

Suspect serving sentence 180 .5 

No known suspect 305 .9 

Suspect a fugitive 137 .4 

Suspect deceased 232 .7 
Suspect deported 35 .1 

Case-related reasons 10,695 30.3% 

Stale case 400 1.1 

Weak evidence 9,405 26.7 

Statute of limitations exceeded 246 .7 

Jurisdiction or venue problems 325 .9 
Witness problems 319 .9 

All other reasons 6,855 19.5% 

Minimal Federal interest 1,471 4.2 

Petite P()ticy 117 .3 

Lack of resources 2,084 5.9 

Financial Priva.:y Act 1 --
Tax Reform Act 1 --
Court policy 10 --
DOJ policy 753 2.1 

U.S. Attorney policy 983 2.8 

Speedy Trial Act 1 --
Agency request 978 2.8 

Juvenile suspect 50 .1 

Offender's health, age, prior record 
or other personal circumstances 161 .5 

Suspect's cooperation 245 .7 

.- Less than .05% 
See data note 2. 
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Table 1.4 Disposition of matters declined for prosecution by U.S. attorneys, by offense, 1990 

Number of suspects In declined matters: Percent of suspects in declined matters: 

Resolved with Resolved with 
Referred restitution, civil! Referred restitution, civil! 
or handled administrative or handled administrative 

Most serious in other procedure, pre- in other procedure, pre-
offense investigated Total prosecutiona trial diversion Other Total prosecutionS trial diversion Other 

All offensesb 35,239 8,682 2,477 24,080 100.0% 24.6% 7.0% 68.3% 

Violent offenses 1,409 415 76 918 100.0% 29.5% 5.4% 65.2% 
Murder!manslsughterC 78 17 2 59 100.0 21.8 2.6 75.6 
Assault 344 51 34 259 100.0 14.8 9.9 75.3 
Robbery 502 221 11 270 100.0 44.0 2.2 53.8 
Rape d 142 21 4 117 100.0 14.8 2.8 82.4 
Other sex offenses 194 51 20 123 100.0 26.3 10.3 63.4 
Kidnaping 98 49 0 49 100.0 50.0 0 50.0 
Threats against the President 51 5 5 41 100.0 9.8 9.8 80.4 

Property offenses 14,237 2,378 1,686 10,173 100.0% 16.7% 11.8% 71.5% 

Fraudulent offenses 12,891 2,054 1,561 9,276 100.0% 15.9% 12.1% 72.0% 
Embezzlement 2,299 283 495 1,521 100.0 12.3 21.5 66.2 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 9,711 1,609 915 7,187 100.0 16.6 9.4 74.0 
Forgery 824 145 145 534 100.0 17.6 17.6 64.8 
Counterfeiting 57 17 6 34 100.0 29.8 10.5 59.6 

Other offensea 1,346 324 125 897 100.0% 24.1% 9.3% 66.6% 
Burglary 25 10 3 12 100.0 40.0 12.0 48.0 
Larcenye 850 185 91 574 100.0 21.8 10.7 67.5 
Motor vehicle theft 309 107 12 190 100.0 34.6 3.9 61.5 
Arson 14 0 0 14 - - - -
Transportation of stolenroperty 57 15 1 41 100.0 26.3 1.8 71.9 
Other property offenses 91 7 18 66 100.0 7.7 19.8 72.5 

Drug offenses 6,413 2,720 124 3,569 100.0% 42.4% 1.9% 55.7% 

Public order offenses 12,374 2,833 552 8,989 100.0% 22.9% 4.5% 72.6% 

Regulatory offenses 5,184 501 269 4,414 100.0% 9.7% 5.2% 85.1% 
Agriculture 219 56 33 130 100.0 25.6 15.1 59.4 
Antitrust 47 8 1 38 100.0 17.0 2.1 80.9 
Labor law 17 0 1 16 - - - -
Food and drug 95 17 18 60 100.0 17.9 18.9 63.2 
Motor carrier 39 10 0 29 100.0 25.6 0 74.4 
Other regulatory offenses 4,767 410 216 4,141 100.0 8.6 4.5 86.9 

Other offensea 7,190 2,332 283 4,575 100.0% 32.4% 3.9% 63.6% 
Weapons 1,630 499 28 1,103 100.0 30.6 1.7 67.7 
Immigration offenses 283 81 20 182 100.0 28.6 7.1 64.3 
Tal( law violations 

including tax fraud 611 107 19 485 100.0 17.5 3.1 79.4 
Bribery 404 49 20 335 100.0 12.1 5.0 82.9 
Perjury 122 9 3 110 100.0 7.4 2.5 90.2 
National defense 227 24 14 189 100.0 10.6 6.2 83.3 
Escape 1,209 815 7 387 100.0 67.4 .6 32.0 
Racketeering and extortionC 1,487 260 22 1,205 100.0 17.5 1.5 81.0 
Gambling offenses 166 34 30 102 100.0 20.5 18.1 61.4 
Uquor offenses 8 0 0 8 - - - -
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 67 16 7 44 100.0 23.9 10.4 65.7 
Migratory birds 120 39 39 42 100.0 32.5 32.5 35.0 
Conspiracy, aiding and 

abetting, traffic, and 
jurisdictional offenses 649 229 67 353 100.0 35.3 10.3 54.4 

Other 207 170 7 30 100.0 82.1 3.4 14.5 

-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. C See methodology. 
a Includes suspects in matters removed, prosecuted on other d May include some nonviolent offenses. 

charges, prosecuted by other authorities, complaints filed with e Excluding transportation of stolen property. other indictiments and those transferred to State authority 
f Excluding fraudulent property offenses; including destruction of (youthful offenders). 

b Includes suspects for whom offense category could not be property and trespass. 

determined. See data notes 2 and 3. 
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Table 1.5 Average processing time from receipt to filing or declination, by offense, 1990 

Average time per suspect from receipt of matter to decision 

Disposed by magistrate Concluded by U.S. attomey 

Prosecuted in 
Most serious Not U.S. district 
offense Investigated Total Total Convicted convicted Total court Declined 

All offenses- 10.5 mo 4.3mo 1.7 mo 8.9mo 11.4 mo 5.8mo 21.0 mo 
Violent offenees 6.6 5.1 3.4 5.9 6.6 3.5 14.3 
Property offense. 15.1 7.4 5.3 9.7 15.6 7.9 24.3 

Fraudulent offensesb 15.4 7.5 5.2 10.2 15.8 8.3 24.1 
Other offenses 13.3 6.6 5.5 7.5 14.0 5.0 27.2 

Drug offenses 7.2 7.0 5.1 7.6 7.3 4.8 16.6 
Public order offenses 10.1 3.3 .9 9.5 12.6 5.9 20.6 

Regulatory offenses 14.8 7.3 3.1 12.5 15.4 6.8 19.9 
Other offensesc 8.7 3.0 .8 9.2 11.4 5.7 21.1 

Number of suspected 108,352 14,099 8,911 5,188 94,253 59,268 34,985 

a Includes suspects for whom offense category could not be d Excludes suspects with Insufficient data to determine 
determined. processing time. 

b Excluding tax fraud. See data note 2. 
c Including tax fraud. 
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r------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
i 

The Bail Reform Act of 1984 (18 
U.S.C. 3141) sets the terms for re­
lease and detention of defendants 
facing charges in Federal courts. At 
the time defendants first appear be­
fore a judicial officer, they may be (1) 
released on personai recognizance or 
unsecured bond; (2) released subject 
to conditions imposed by the court, 
possibly including traditional bail; (3) 
temporarily detained without bail (lim­
ited to 10 working days) to permit de­
portation, exclusion, or revocation 
of previously granted conditional re­
lease; or (4) detained without bail af­
ter a hearing.1 

Federal defendants may be detained 
without bail if charged with specified 
categories of offenses and if it Is de­
termined at a special hearing that no 
financial or other conditions will rea­
sonably assure the appearance of the 
person as required and the safety of 
any other person and the community. 
Defendants not detained under these 
criteria must be released, ei~her on 
personal rec:ognizance, unsecured 
bond, or such conditions as are nec­
essary to assure their appearance at 
trial and the public safety.2 The law 
explicitly states that the court "may 
not impose a financial condition that 
results In the pretrial detention of the 
person." 

Release procedures 

Once arrested, a defendant must be 
brought before a judicial officer with­
out unnecessary delay. The Judicial 
officer,· who may be a judge but Is 
generally a U.S. magistrate, deter­
mines whether the defendant will be 
released or detained prior to trial. If a 
hearing is required, the release deci­
sion may be delayed no more than 3 
days (5 if the defendant requests). 

' 18 U.S.C. 3142 (e) (1984). 

2 18 U.S.C. 3142 (c) (1984). 

Defendants may be released at any 
time before trial. Some defendants, 
therefore, are detained for some time 
and then eventually released before 
trial. This generally occurs where an 
appeal resuits in a lowering of bail 
conditions or the defendant requires 
additional time to arrange compliance 
with the originally set terms of re­
lease. Defendants who have been 
detained prior to their release are in­
cluded in tabulations of both "defen­
dants detained" and "defendants re­
leased." 

Types of pretrial release 

Defendants may be released without 
financial conditions: 

Personal recognizance-defen­
dant released subject to no financial 
or other conditions, 

Unsecured bond-no money re­
quired to be posted before release, 
but defendant Is liabie for fuil bail 
amount if he or she fails to appear. 

Conditional release-any combi­
nation of restrictions that are deemed 
necessary to guarantee the defen­
dant's appearance at trial or the 
safety of the community. Nonfinan­
cial conditions commonly place re­
strictions on the defendant's move­
ments, associations, and/or actions. 
They may also involve employment, 
education, or treatment for medical, 
psychological or sUbstance abuse 
conditions. 

Defendants may also be released on 
financiai conditions. Financial condi­
tions include deposit bond (defendant 
required to post a percent of the total 
ball amount, usually 10%), surety 
bond (defendant released subject to 
guarantees by a third person that the 
full bail amount will be paid), or collat­
eral bond (collateral equal to the full 
bail amount required to be posted by 
the defendant before release), possi­
bly in combination with nonfinancial 
conditions. 

Factors relating to release or 
detention 

In deciding whether to release a de­
fendant, and in setting release condi­
tions, the CO~Jrt is directed to consider 
the nature and circumstances of the 
offense charged; the weight of the 
evidence against the defendant; the 
defendant's "character, physical and 
mental condition, family ties, employ­
ment, financial resources, length of 
residence in the community, commu­
nity ties, past conduct, history relating 
to drug or alcohol abuse, criminal his­
tory, and record concerning appear­
ance at court proceedings:3 

Detention hearings may be re­
quested In cases that Involve crimes 
of violence, offenses for which the 
maximum sentence Is life imprison­
ment or death, or serious drug of­
fenses. Defendants with two prior 
convictions of such offenses are also 
subject to detention if charged with 
any felony. Detention may also be 
requested In cases where there Is a 
serious risk that the defendant will 
fiee or attempt to obstruct justice. 

Rates of release and detention 
(table 2.1) 

Fifty-six percent of all defendants 
scheduied for a pretrial interview in 
1990 were detained with or without 
bail prior to trial, approximately the 
same as in 1989 (55%). Eventually. 
62% of the defendants were released, 
most commonly (45%) without finan­
ciai conditions; of these, 33% were 
released on personal recognizance, 
and 67% were released on unsecured 
bond. A third of defendants who were 
detained were subsequently released 
at some time prior to trial. 

3 18 U.S.C. 3142 (g) 
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Suspects charged with offenses spe­
cifically cited in the Ball Reform Act 
were more likely to be detained than 
others. Over 72% of all alleged violent 
offenders were detained, including 
approximately 76% of those charged 
with murder or kidnaping, and 92% of 
those charged with robbery or threats 
against the President. 

More than half of defendants in 
weapons cases were detained. Bur­
glary may also be treated as a violent 
offense for some purposes: Sixty­
nine percent of defendants accused 
of burglary were detained. 

More than half of pretrial detainees 
were accused of drug offenses. The 
detention rate for defendants accused 
of drug trafficking was more than 
twice as high as that for those ac­
cused of possession (73% and 28%, 
respectively) . 

The high detention rate for immigra­
tion offenses (81 %) may be attribut­
able to the nature of the offense: De­
fendants accused of immigration 
offenses may be detained to permit 
their transfer to Immigration and 
Naturalization Service (INS) custody 
or to facilitate their deportation.4 Sus­
pects in immigration offenses also 
often lack the community ties which 
would assure their appearance in 
court. Similarly, defendants charged 
with escape were often detained 
(77%). 

Defendants charged with white collar 
offenses were unlikely to be detained 
while awaiting trial. Only 27% of 
those charged with fraudulent prop­
erty offenses, 30% of those charged 
with regulatory offenses, and 11 % of 
those accused of tax law violations 
were detained. Among released de­
fendants charged with .fraudulent 

4 16 U.S.C. 3142 (d) (1984) 

property offenses, 30% were re­
leased on personal recognizance, 
59% on unsecured bond, and 12% on 
financial conditions. The rate at 
which defendants were released has 
fallen substantially since the enact­
ment of the Bail Reform Act of 1986, 
from 78% of all defendants In 1984 to 
62% in 1990. The rate of release for 
drug defendants fell from 67% in 
1985 to 54% in 1990. During this 
time period, the use of financial bail 
conditions and unsecured bond as 
release methods decreased, while 
personal recognizance increased or 
remained approximately constant for 
non-drug defendants. 

Types of detention 
(tables 2.1, and 2.2) 

Of the 27,079 persons detained, 
66% were held without bail, and the 
remaining 34% were held because 
they could not meet the financial con­
ditions imposed by the court (table 
2.1). Seventy-two percent of those 
who were held without bail were or­
dered detained after a hearing to de­
termine whether they posed a danger 
to the community (table 2.2). The 
remainder of those held without bail 
were temporarily detained to allow 
deportation, exclusion, or revocation 
of previously granted conditional re­
lease. 

Hearings to determine dangerous­
ness were held for 36% of all defen­
dants scheduled for pretrial interviews 
in 1990 (table 2.2). Cases involving 
violent offenses, drug offenses, bur­
glary, and escape were more likely 
than others to result in a detention 
hearing (57%, 53%,51%, and 51%, 
respectively). 

Seventy-four percent of the hearings 
resulted in a detention order. Alleged 

5 Average length of detention was estimated 
by excluding defendants whose 
observation period in the source data was 
less than 9 months and is not comparable 
with the estimate in previous years' 
compendia. 
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drug offenders made up 61 % of all 
persons detained by this procedure. 
Defendants detained as a resuit of 
these hearings were heid an average 
of 88 days while awaiting triaLS Defen­
dants who were temporarily detained 
or held on financial conditions aver­
aged less than half as many days in 
detention (tables 2.2 and 2.6). 

Men were more than twice as likely 
as women to be detained as a result 
of these hearings (table 2.3). Deten­
tion was also ordered with more than 
average frequency for Hispanic de­
fendants (33%), black and other mi­
nority races (33% and 31%, respec­
tively), the unemployed (31%) or 
poorly educated (31 % of those who 
did not finish high school), and those 
with a history of felony conviction 
(40%) or drug abuse (33%). 

Incidence of pretrial violations 
(tables 2.4 and 2.5) 

Pretrial misconduct includes failure 
to appear at court, arrest for a new 
crime (either a felony or a misde­
meanor), and any technical violation 
of the defendants' bail conditions. 
Overall, 12% of all defendants who 
completed a period of pretrial supervi­
sion in 1990 violated the terms of 
their pretrial release; 2% failed to ap­
pear; 3% were charged with a new 
offense (2% with felonies and 1 % with 
misdemeanors); and 8% committed 
technical violations of their bail condi­
tions (table 2.4). 

About 18% of persons charged with 
drug offenses and 17% of persons 
charged with violent crimes committed 
at least one pretrial violation, higher 
than for other types of offenses. De­
fendants accused of fraudulent prop­
erty offenses or public-order offenses 

This compendium's tabulations of 
characteristics related to deten­
tion are not controlled for explan­
atory factors such as details of 
the charged offense. 



committed fewer violations than oth­
ers (8% and 7%, respectively). 

Violations were more likely for defen­
dants,released on financial conditions 
(17%) than for those released on per­
sonal recognizance (9%) or unse­
cured bond (11 %) (table 2.5). 

Revocation. Release was revoked 
for 37% of the defendants who vio­
lated the conditions of their pretrial 
release. Alleged violent offenders 
who violated release conditions were 
returned to detention over half of the 
time. 

Because defendants on financial 
release were more likely than other 
released defendants to commit a vio­
lation of their release conditions, they 
were also more likely to have their 
release revoked: 6% of all defendants 
released on financial conditions were 
subsequently detained, in contrast to 
4% of defendants released on unse­
cured bond or on personal recogni­
zance (table 2.5). 

Defendant characteristics 
(table 2.6) 

Sex. More than half of male defen­
dants were detained, while approxi­
mately a third of women were so 
held. Men were also detained an av­
erage of 12 days longer than women 
(61 days versus 49 days, respec­
tively). These figures may partially 
reflect the fact that male defendants 
more frequently commit those crimes 
that are likely to result in pretrial de­
tention, such as violent offenses. 

Women were more likely than men 
to be released on personal recogni­
zance (24% versus 13% respectively) 
or on unsecured bond (42% versus 
28%, respectively). 

Race. Thirty percent of defendants 
were described as either black (26%) 
or ·other" (4%). In 1990 white, black, 
and other minority defendants were 
detained at approximately the same 
rate (55"10, 58%, and 53% respec­
tively). White defendants were more 
likely than others to be released on 

financial conditions (16% versus 12% 
of blacks and 14% of "others"). Black 
defendants were more likely than oth­
ers to be released on unsecured bond 
(32"10 versus 29% of whites and 27% 
of "others"). A quarter of defendants 
who were of non-black minority 
groups were released on their own 
recognizance, compared to 13% of 
blacks and 14% of whites. 

Ethnlclty. Overall, 30% of the de­
fendants identified themselves as His­
panic. 

In 1990, 80% of Hispanic defendants 
were detained, compared to 45% of 
non-Hispanic defendants. The high 
rate of detention among Hispanics 
probably reflects the fact that 81 % of 
defendants in immigration offenses 
are detained (table 2.1) and that pro­
visions of the Ball Reform Act specifi­
cally permit the temporary detention 
of defendants charged with Immigra­
tion offenses pending deportation or 
transfer to the INS. 

Age. In 1990 only 7% of Federal 
criminal defendants were 20 years old 
or younger. Defendants age 30 or 
under were more likely to be detained 
(62%) than those in their thirties 
(57%) or older (42%). However, the 
average length of the detention period 
is shorter for the younger defendants. 

Education. The majority of defend­
ants had either a high school educa­
tion (33%) or less (37%), while only 
9% of all defendants had completed 
college. College graduates were de­
tained at a lower rate than defendants 
with less education. While 35% of the 
college graduates were detained be­
fore trial, and 79% were eventually 
released, 66% of defendants with less 
than a high school education were 
detained before trial, and only 56% 
were ever released. 

Marital and employment status. 
In 1990, 40% of defendants were 
married, 19% were separated or di­
vorced, and 33% had never been 
married. Married defendants were 
somewhat less likely to be detained 
(48%) than defendants who were di-

vorced or separated (52%) or single 
(61 %). The higher rate of release 
may be attributable to the perception 
that married defendants have more 
ties to the community and are there­
fore presumed less likely to flee than 
single defendants. 

Employment status may also be re­
garded as Indicative of community 
ties that would prevent flight. Unem­
ployed defendants were detained at a 
higher rate than those who were em­
ployed at the time of their arrest (66% 
versus 46%, respectively). 

Prior criminal record. Records on 
31 % of defendants showed one or 
more felony convictions; 17% had at 
least one prior misdemeanor convic­
tion but no felony convictions; and no 
criminal record was found for 52% of 
defendants. Defendants with prior 
felony convictions were most likely to 
be detained (71 %) and least likely to 
be released on personal recognizance 
(8%) or unsecured bond (23%). 

Drug use. In 1990, 22% of defen­
dants admitted a history of drug 
abuse In their pretrial services inter­
view. Defendants with a history of 
drug abuse had a higher probability of 
pretrial detention than other defend­
ants (63% versus 49%, respectively). 
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Tabl'82.1 Form ot pretrial release or detention, by offense, 1990 

Percent of defendants who at an~ time after Initial appearance were:a 
Number of defendants 

Released on6 Detained who at any time after 

Most serious Personal Unsecured Financial Wi!'a0ut Financial appearance were: 

offense charged recognizance bond conditionsc bail conditionsc Total Released Detained 

All offenses 14.8% 30.0% 15.1% 36.5% 19.2% 48,585 30,326 27,079 

Violent offenses 16.5% 18.0% 8.0% 59.4% 12.7% 2,825 1,272 2,036 
Murder/nonnegligent 

manslaughter 10.5 19.7 11.4 61.6 13.1 229 104 171 
Negligent manslaughter 6::1.4 24.4 4.9 14.6 2.4 41 38 7 
Assault 28.6 31.4 9.6 39.1 9.6 668 490 325 
Robbery 4.8 8.9 7.0 75.8 16.3 1,362 300 1,254 
Rape 45.5 15.7 5.8 47.1 6.2 242 179 129 
Other sex offensese 23.3 53.4 9.0 15.0 6.0 133 116 28 
Kidnaping 14.7 5.2 7.8 65.5 12.9 116 34 91 
Threats against the President 5.9 20.6 5.9 82.4 8.8 34 11 31 

Property offenses 24.4% 46.7% 9.4% 18.1% 10.5% 12,407 10,263 3,553 

Fraudulent offenses 24.3% 48.0% 9.5% 16.9% 10.0%. 9,405 7,896 2,529 
Embezzlement 34.8 58.4 3.7 3.9 2.1 1,742 1,702 105 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 22.2 44.6 10.8 20.1 11.2 6,218 5,003 1,947 
Forgery 21.8 51.1 8.5 18.2 14.0 963 796 310 
Counterfeiting 18.0 47.1 15.8 19.1 15.6 482 395 167 

Other offenses 24.7% 42.9% 9.2% 22.0% 12.1% 3,002 2,367 1,024 
BurglalY, 20.9 16.1 7.0 55.2 13.9 230 102 159 
Larcenyf 24.8 46.8 8.5 18.3 11.4 2,149 1,n3 639 
Motor vehicle theft 18.0 43.0 13.1 23.4 16.8 244 184 98 
Arson - - - - - 12 8 7 
Transportation of stolen jroperty 25.4 41.8 15.3 16.8 11.9 268 222 n 
Other property offenses 41.4 27.3 4.0 34.3 10.1 99 78 44 

Drug offenses 7.4% 23.0% 22.5% 44.2% 27.3% 20,500 11,117 14,663 
Trafficking 6.5 22.8 22.7 45.2 27.6 19,919 10,621 14,501 
Possession and other 36.0 31.2 15.5 11.5 16.4 581 496 162 

Public order offenses 17.2% 27.6% 10.3% 36.9% 16.2% 12,851 7,673 6,825 

Regulatory offensea 23.1% 44.7% 15.2% 17.3% 12.6% 1,831 1,560 546 
Agriculture 44.4 49.0 4.5 8.6 2.0 198 195 21 
Antitrust 29.2 62.5 8.3 0 0 24 24 0 
Labor law - - - - - 18 17 1 
Food and drug 41.9 48.4 4.8 0 1.6 62 61 1 
Motor carrier 17.1 68.6 5.7 5.7 0 35 33 2 
Other regulatory offenses 19.1 43.2 17.5 19.9 15.0 1,494 1,230 521 

Other offenses 16.2% 24.7% 9.5% 40.2% 16.8% 11,020 6,113 6,279 
Weapons 11.8 35.2 15.0 38.6 16.8 2,629 1,674 1,457 
Immigration offenses 5.8 9.1 5.7 57.7 23.8 4,804 1,455 3,914 
Tax law violations 

Including tax fraud 31.5 53.6 10.7 5.6 5.6 769 740 86 
Bribery 19.5 40.2 28.0 8.1 22.0 246 218 74 
Perjury 21.0 57.0 12.0 12.0 9.0 100 92 21 
National defense 31.7 32.4 9.9 21.1 14.8 142 114 51 
Escape 7.1 14.5 7.3 65.2 12.0 491 158 379 
Racketeering and extortion 12.8 40.9 18.0 30.8 8.1 494 358 192 
Gambling offenses 21.9 70.5 6.8 3.4 1'.7 237 235 12 
Uquor offenses - - - - - 13 12 1 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 27.5 52.5 12.5 5.0 2.5 40 37 3 
Traffic offenses 61.4 29.2 5.0 5.2 2.7 808 783 64 
Migratory birds 45.8 54.2 0 
Other 74.0 13.0 5.8 6.7 4.0 223 213 24 

Note: The sum of the defendants released a Data describe number of defendants d Includes temporary detention and detention 
and detained exceeds 100% because some scheduled to be Interviewed. ordered after a pretrial detention hearing. 
defendants who were initially detained even- b In addition to the three types of release e May Include some nonviolent offenses. 
tually raised bail or had the conditions of their shown, 1,221 defendants (2.5%) were f Excluding transportation of stolen property. bail changed by rehearing or appeal. Total released subject to other conditions such 

9 Excluding fraudulent property offensesj also includes defendants for whom release as PSA supervision or third party custody. 
status data were unavailable. c Includes deposit bond, surety bond, and 

Including destruction of property and 
trespass. 

- Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable collateral bond. 
See data notes 4 and 5. data. 
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Tabla 2.2 Pretrial detention hearing outcomes, by offense, 1990 

Defendants with pretrial detention hearings 

Number of defendants Percent of defendants 

Most seri-;.us All Hearings Ordered Hearings Ordered Average days 
offense charged defendants held detained held detained detainedB 

All offenseab 48,585 17,387 12,805 35.8% 26.4% 88.3 days 

Violent offenses 2,825 1,605 1,329 56.8% 47.0% 94.0 days 
Murder 229 144 114 62.9 49.8 106.5 
Negligent manslaughter 41 5 3 12.2 7.3 -
Assault 668 243 174 36.4 26.0 69.8 
Robbery 1,362 1,009 875 74.1 64.2 98.6 
Rape 242 99 71 40.9 29.3 77.6 
Other sex offensesc 133 12 9 9.0 6.8 -
Kidnaping 116 72 62 62.1 53.4 124.3 
Threats against the President 34 21 21 61.8 61.8 99.8 

Property offenses 12,407 1,885 1,299 15.2% 10.5% 64.5 days 

Fraudulent offenses 9,405 1,342 904 14.3% 9.6% 60.8 days 
Embezzlement 1,742 48 31 2.8 1.8 52.1 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 6,218 1,060 715 17.0 11.5 63.0 
Forgery 963 143 98 14.8 10.2 52.8 
Counterfeiting 482 91 60 18.9 12.4 54.9 

Other offenses 3,002 543 395 18.1% 13.2% 72.4 days 
Burglaryd 230 118 sa 51.3 42.6 93.4 
Larceny 2,149 294 206 13.7 9.6 71.3 
Molor vehicle theft 244 57 41 23.4 16.8 40.6 
Arson 12 5 3 - - -
Transportation of stolen jroperty 268 43 35 16.0 13.1 70.7 
Other property offenses 99 26 12 26.3 12.1 54.5 

Drug offenses 20,500 10,819 7,835 52.8% 38.2% 101.4 days 
Trafficking 19,919 10,747 7,791 54.0 39.1 101.7 
Possession and other 581 72 44 12.4 7.6 44.8 

Public order offenses 12,851 3,077 2,341 23.9% 18.2% 62.7 days 

Regulatory offenses 1,831 379 228 20.7% 12.5% 59.3 days 
Agriculture 198 16 0 8.1 0 -
Antitrust 24 0 0 0 0 -
Labor law 18 0 0 - - -
Food and drug 62 0 0 0 0 -
Motor carrier 35 2 2 5.7 5.7 -
Other regulatory offenses 1,494 361 226 24.2 15.1 59.8 

Other offenses 11,020 2,698 2,113 24.5% 19.2% 63.0 days 
Weapons 2,629 949 732 36.1 27.8 88.9 
Immigration offenses 4,804 1,149 929 23.9 19.3 46.1 
Tax law violations 

Including tax fraud 769 50 27 6.5 3.5 64.9 
Bribe.ry 246 45 25 18.3 10.2 74.7 
Perjury 100 12 10 12.0 10.0 -
National defense 142 30 20 21.1 14.1 65.8 
Escape 491 252 220 51.3 44.8 55.8 
Racketeering and extortion 494 161 126 32.6 25.5 102.7 
Gambling offenses 237 2 2 .8 .8 -
Uquor offenses 13 0 0 - - -
Mall or transport of 

obscene material 40 1 1 2.5 2.5 -
Traffic offenses 80B 32 17 4.0 2.1 14.B 
Migratory birds 24 1 1 4.2 4.2 -
Other 223 14 3 6.3 1.3 -

-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. c May Include some nonviolent offenses. 
Note~ Defendants may also be detained for failure to meet bail conditions, or d Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
temporarily detained pending action of other agencies. e Excluding fraudulent property offenses; Including destruc-
a Based on defendants scheduled for interviews 1/1/90-9/30/90 only. Not tlon of property and trespass. 

directly comparable to data from prior years. See data notes 4 and 5. 
b Includes defendants for whom offense category could not be dt:\termined. 
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Table 2.3 Pretrial detention hearings, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Number of defendants Percent of defendants 

Most serious All Hearings Ordered Hearings Ordered AverageRays 
offense charged defendants held detained held detained detained 

All defendantsb 48,585 17,387 12,805 35.8% 26.4% 88.3 days 
Sex 

Male 40,924 15,707 11,721 38.4% 28.6% 89.0 days 
Female 7,645 1,678 1,083 21.9 14.2 79.8 

Race 
White 33,825 11,214 8,040 33.2% 23.8% 87.4 days 
Black 12,421 5,204 4,070 41.9 32.8 93.4 
Other 2,080 899 636 43.2 30.6 70.6 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 14,569 6,354 4,741 43.6% 32.5% 87.9 days 
Non-Hispanic 33,757 10,963 8,005 32.5 23.7 88.5 

Age 
16-18 years 867 291 195 33.6% 22.5% 77.2 days 
19-20 years 2,424 825 607 34.0 25.0 79.2 
21-30 years 17,938 6,918 5,165 38.6 28.8 85.4 
31-40 years 15,364 5,908 4,340 38.5 28.2 91.3 
Over 40 years 11,653 3,364 2,426 28.9 20.8 93.7 

Education 
Leas than high 

school graduate 15,912 6,634 4,924 41.7% SO.9% 88.2 days 
High school graduate 14,122 4,757 3,430 33.7 24.3 93.0 
Some college 8,741 2,830 1,889 32.4 21.6 88.1 
College graduate 3,729 973 880 26.1 18.2 87.3 

Marital status 
Never married 14,703 5,667 4,248 38.5% 28.9% 87.2 days 
Divorced/separated 17,863 3,086 2,256 17.3 12.6 95.5 
Married 8,746 5,309 3,686 60.7 42.1 88.8 
Common law 3,277 1,640 1,179 50.0 36.0 88.4 
Other 477 143 112 30.0 23.5 ~4,1 

Employment status at arrest 
Unemployed 18,382 7,439 5,732 40.5% 31.2% 87.9 days 
Employed 26,178 8,188 5,584 31.3 21.3 90.3 

Criminal record 
No convictions 21,331 6,136 4,236 28.8% 19.9% 84.1 days 
Prior conviction 

Misdemeanor only 7,090 2,318 1,577 32.7 22.2 85.7 
Felony 12,524 . 6,064 4,967 48.4 39.7 90.4 

Drug abuse 
No known abuse 31,461 10,379 7,388 33.0% 23.5% 88.8 days 
Drug history 9,086 3,913 2,958 43.1 32.6 87.3 

a Based on defendants scheduled for Interviews 1/1/90-9/30/90 only. See data notes 4 and 5. 
Not directly comparable to data from prior years. 

b Includes defendants for whom these characteristics are unknown. 
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Table 2.4 Behavior of defendants released prior to trial, by offens., 1990 

Percent of released defendants who had: 

Violations while on release 

New offense Technical 
charged violations Number of 

Most serious No Failed to of ball Release released 
offense charged violation Tolal appear Felony Misdemeanor conditions revoked defendants8 

All offens.s 87.7% 12.3% 2.5% 1.8% 1.1% 7.9% 4.5% 22,9n 

Vlol.nt offen ••• 82.7% 17.3% 1.8% 2.4% 3.5% 10.8% 9.7% 878 

Property offense. 90.5% 9.5% 1.7% 1.5% 1.0% 6.2% 3.2% 7,782 

Fraudulent offensesb 92.1 7.9 1.6 1.1 .8 5.1 2.6 5,973 
Other offenses 84.9 15.1 2.2 2.9 1.9 9.8 5.5 1,809 

Drug offen.e. 82.2% 17.8% 3.6% 2.3% 1.3% 11.9% 6.6% 8,533 

Public ord.r offens.s 93.0% 7.0% 1.9% 1.1% .7% 3.9% 2.5% 5,784 
Regulatory offenses 94.0 6.0 1.9 1.1 .3 3.2 1.9 1,326 
Other offensesc 92.7 7.3 1.9 1.1 .8 4.0 2.7 4,458 

Note: Data describe defendants whose pretrial services were a Excludes defendants who were released but whose recorde did 
terminated in 1990. A defendant with more than one type qf vio- not contain sufficient information to determine type of release or 
lation appears in more than one column. A defendant with more violation behavior. 
than one of the same type of violation ap~ars only once in that b Excluding tax fraud. 
column. Therefore, sum of individual vio ations exceeds the total. 

C Including tax fraud. Not all violations resulted in revocation. 
See data notes 4 and 6. 

Table 2.5 Behavior of defendants released prior to trial, by type of release, 1990 

Percent of released defendants who had: 

Violations while on release 

New offense Technical 
charged violations Number of 

No Failed to of ball Release released 
Type of release violation Total appear Felony Misdemeanor conditions revoked defendants* 

All typ.s 87.7% 12.3% 2.5% 1.8% 1.1% 7.9% 4.5% 22,9n 

Personal recognizance 90.6 9.4 1.7 1.2 1.2 5.9 3.7 5,766 
Unsecured bond 88.8 11.2 1.8 1.5 1.0 7.9 4.4 11,290 
Financial release 82.9 17.1 4.5 2.8 1.2 9.9 5.7 5,921 

Note: Data describe defendants whose pretrial services were * Excludes defendants who were released but whose records did 
terminated in 1990. A defendant with more than one type of vio- not contain sufficient Information to determine type of release or 
lation appears In more than one column. A defendant with more violation behavior. 
than one of the same type of violation appears only once In that See data notes 4 and 6. 
column. Therefore, sum of individual violations exceeds the total. 
Not all violations resulted in revocation. 
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Table 2.6 Pretrial release and detention status, by defendant characteristics, 1990 

Percent of defendants released at any time after 
Initial ball hearin~ Defendants detained 

Personal Percent Average Number 
Defendant Total recognl- Unsecured Financial of all days of defen-
characteristics released zance bond conditions defendants detainedB dants 

All offenders 62.4% 14.8% 30.0% 15.1% 55.7% 59.9 days 48,585 

Sex 
Male 58.9% 13.0% 27.8% 15.5% 59.5% 61.1 days 40,924 
Female 81.3 24.4 41.9 12.7 35.5 49.2 7,645 

Race 
White 63.0% 14.5% 29.5% 16.1% 55.0% 56.7 days 33,825 
Black 59.4 13.3 32.2 12.5 58.4 69.9 12,421 
Other 70.1 26.0 27.0 14.4 53.0 52.4 2,080 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 40.3% 5.4% 14.1% 16.0% 80.0% 54.5 days 14,569 
Non-Hispanic 71.9 18.7 37.0 14.7 45.3 64.1 33,757 

Age 
16-18 years 61.1% 20.2% 24.9% 10.7% 61.5% 44.1 days 867 
19·20 years 57.9 15.1 27.0 11.7 60.9 48.2 2,424 
21-30 years 56.5 12.8 26.3 14.3 62.6 56.6 17,938 
31·40 years 61.9 13.8 29.7 16.3 57.2 64.4 15,364 
OVer 40 years 73.4 18.4 37.5 15.9 41.8 67.0 11,653 

Education 
Less than high 

school gradUate 55.9% 11.2% 26.6% 16.2% 65.6% 61.9 days 15,912 
High school graduate 70.2 17.2 35.3 16.3 48.8 65.2 14,122 
Some college 74.8 18.5 37.9 17.1 43.7 61.5 8,741 
College graduate 79.5 19.9 41.2 17.0 34.7 60.7 3,729 

Marital status 
Never married 58.0% 13.0% 29.0% 13.7% 60.9% 58.4 days 14,703 
DiVorced/separated 67.0 15.0 35.1 15.5 52.2 66.3 8,746 
Married 69.9 16.7 33.8 17.7 47.6 56.4 17,863 
Common law 51.6 9.6 22.6 17.4 72.9 63.6 3,277 
Other 71.7 20.3 39.2 10.9 39.4 63.5 477 

Employment status at arrest 
Unemployed 52.5% 11.8% 26.9% 12.1% 65.8% 57.9 days 18,382 
Employed 72.5 17.3 35.3 18.4 46.3 60.8 26,178 

Criminal record 
No convictionsb 69.0% 19.6% 33.3% 13.9% 46.5% 50.2 days 21,331 
Prior conviction 

Misdemeanor only 70.0 15.5 33.6 18.9 52.9 57.3 7,090 
Felony 47.3 8.5 22.7 13.6 70.9 71.0 12,524 

Drug abuse 
No known abuse 68.5% 15.9% 34.6% 16.5% 49.4% 61.0 days 31,461 
Drug history 59.8 12.0 30.8 15.6 63.2 65.1 9,086 

Note: Data describe number of defendants scheduled to be interviewed b Includes only those defendants whose PSA records 
during 1990 by the Pretrial Services Agencies. The sum of the defendants explicitly showed no prior convictions. 
release and detained exceeds 100% because some defendants who were See data notes 4 and 5. 
initially detained eventually raised bail or had the conditions of their bail 
changed by rehearing or appeal. 
B Based on defendants scheduled for interviews 1/1/90-9/30/90 only. Not 

directiy comparable to data from prior years. 

26 Compendium of Federal Justice Statistics, 1990 



Chapter 3 

Adjudication 

Preliminary 
hearing 

Referred to 
magistrates 

_lo. 
r 

Cases 
to 
trial 

.... 
". 

Guilty pleas 

~ Acquitted 

Federal ~, 

district 
court trial 

.... Sentencing " 
(jury or GUilty 

verdicts ~"" bench) 

I Acquitted 

Magistrate Convicted 

hearing 

Chapter 3: Adjudication 27 



Federal criminal cases may result in 
conviction of the defendant following 
either a plea or trial, acquittal of the 
defendant after trial, or dismissal of 
the case. Unless other.vise noted, 
data describe cases In Federal court 
and do not include matters disposed 
by U.S. magistrates. 

Defendants In cases terminated 
(table 3.1) 

Defendants convicted. Cases 
were terminated against 58,696 de­
fendants in 1990, 2% higher than in 
1989. Of these, 47,486 (81%) were 
convicted. Of those defendants who 
were convicted, 41,099 (87%) 
pleaded guilty, and another 552 (1 %) 
pleaded nolo contendere.' The re­
maining 5,835 (12%) were convicted 
at trials, most of which (83%) involved 
juries. 

A total of 11,210 defendants were 
not convicted. Most of these (85%) 
had cases against them dismissed. 
Another 9% were acquitted by a jury, 
and 6% were acquitted in trials with­
out juries. Of the 7,557 defendants 
who went to trial, 77% were convict­
ed. 

Defendants charged with robbery, 
embezzlement, burglary, tax law vio­
lations including tax fraud, immigra­
tion offenses, and motor carrier and 
labor law violations were convicted at 
the highest rates (89% or higher). 
Conviction rates were below the aver­
age for assault (68%), larceny (77%), 
and for nonregulatory public-order 
offenses (74%). 

Trial verSLlS guilty pleas. Overall, 
87% of all defendants convicted in 
1990 pleaded gUilty. Convictions in­
volving all types of fraudulent property 
offenses, larceny, motor vehicle theft, 

t A plea of nolo contendere does not 
concede guilt; therefore, it cannot be used 
In a civil action as an admission. Fed. R. 
Crim. P. 11 (e) (6). 

labor law violations, food and drug, 
motor carrier, and immigration offens­
es, liquor law violations, and drug 
possession were obtained qy guilty 
plea more often than average (92% 
or more). Convicted defendants 
charged with murder or nonnegllgent 
manslaughter, assault, rape, kidnap­
ing, threats against the President, 
perjury, national defense, racketeer­
Ing and extortion, or migratory birds 
offenses pleaded guilty less often 
than average (79% or less). 

Case-processing time (tallie 3.2) 

Title I of the Speedy Trial Act of 
1974, as amended, sets time require­
ments for processing criminal cases 
in Federal courts. Except for certain 
listed exclusions, indictment mustoc­
cur within 30 days, of i:lrrest;' defeh~.... . 
dants are guaranteed at least 30 days 
to prepare for tria!; and the Govern­
ment must be ready for trial within 70 
days. The Speedy Trial Act does not 
specify a time interval from trial to 
sentencing, and the time limits set by 
the act exclud~ several enumerated 
periods of pretrial procedure such as 
time spent aw,,\iting ruling on mo­
tlons.2 As a result, the actual pro­
cessing time for most defendants can 
be longer than these limits without 
violating the provisions of the act. 

Overall, defendants in cases termi­
nated in 1990 had their Cases pro­
cessed In an average of 10.3 months 
when cases were dismissed, 7.9 
months when cases went to trial, and 
6.3 months when convictions were by 
plea. Drug possession anp traffic of­
fenses, which are relatively speedily 
settled, substantially reduced these 
average times. Excluding them, guilty 
pleas to other types of offenses re­
quired 7 months, trials averaged 
more than 9 months, and dismissals 

218 U.S.C. 3161 et seq. 

----------------------

took over a year from filing to final 
disposition. Larceny charges are also 
disposed faster than average, and 
pleas and trials for defendants 
charged with immigration offenses 
were concluded with greater than av­
erage speed. 

Rega;dless of the method of disposi­
tion, drug trafficking, murder/nonnegli­
gent manslaughter, and motor vehicle 
theft charges took longer than aver­
age time to dispose. 

I n addition to defendants charged 
with drug possession and traffic of­
fenses, those charged with labor law 
violations and "other" property offens­
es pleaded guilty substantially faster 
than average defendants (4 months 
or less). Defendants who pleaded 
guilty to transportation of stolen prop­
erty, weapons, perjury, escape, or 
racketeering and extortion, or mail or 
transport of obscene material charges 
did so more slowly than average (8 
months or longer). 

Charges of murder/nonnegligent 
manslaughter, fraud, forgery, motor 
vehicle theft, transportation of stolen 
property, tax law violations, escape, 
and racketeering and extortion that 
were disposed by trial took 10 months 
or more for disposition. 

Categories of offenses resolved by 
dismissal in 6 months or less included 
violent offense charges (except ml,Jr­
der/nonnegligent manslaughter), lar­
ceny, gambling, perjury, migratory 
birds and traffic offenses (6 months or 
less). Categoreis of offenses whose 
defendants took much longer than 
average for a disposition by dismissal 
(21 months or more) include escape, 
national defense, and racketeering 
and extortion charges. 

This compendium's tabulations of 
characteristics of convicted offen­
ders are not controlled for other 
related characteristics. 
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Charaeterlstics of convicted 
offenders (table 3.3) 

Data on offender characteristics are 
obtained from selected records of 
sentences imposed, and for 1990 are 
not directly comparable to similar tab­
ulations In other years. (See method­
ology.) 

Sex. Across all offense categories, 
84% of all convicted offenders with 
available data in 1990 were male. 
The proportion of male offenders var­
Ied, however, by offense type: 94% of 
offenders convicted of violent offens­
es, 93% of those convicted of nonreg­
ulatory pUblic-order offenses, and 
87% of those convicted of drug of­
fenses were men. 

Race. Overall, 66% of convicted 
offenders were described as white, 
29% as black, and 5% as other, such 
as American Indian, Alaskan Native, 
Asian or Pacific Islander. Although 
the majority of convicted defendants 
were white, the percent varied by of­
fense category: regulatory offenses, 
81 %; other public-order offenses, 
74%; fraudulent property crimes, 
66%; drug offenses, 63%; and violent 
offenses, 62%. Although nonblack 
minority offenders were only 5% of 
convicted offenders, they represented 
11 % of offenders convicted of a vio­
lent crime. 

Ethnlclty. Overall, 21 % of convict­
ed offenders with available data in 
1990 were Hispanic. Categories of 
offenses with above-average repre­
sentation of Hispanic offenders are 
nonregulatory public-order offeflses 
(32% Hispanic, mostly in the category 
of Immigration offenses) and drug 
offenses (26% Hispanic). 

Age. Forty percent of adult convict­
ed offenders were under 31 years of 
age. Thirty-three percent of offenders 
were 31-40 years of age, and 28% 
were over 40. 

Offenders convicted of public-order 
offenses were substantially older than 
other offenders; 41 % of regulatory 
offenders and 31 % of other public-

order offenders were over 40. Of­
fenders convicted of violent offenses 
were disproportionately young; 38% 
of them were 30 or younger, and 3% 
were under 21. 

Education. Forty-three percent of 
all convicted offenders had less than 
a high school education. Another 
33% had completed high school, 7% 
were college graduates, and another 
18% had attended college but not 
completed a degree program. 

Prior record. Two-thirds of convict­
ed offenders with available data had 
been previously convicted of at least 
one prior State or Federal offense. 
Nine percent had been previously im­
prisoned for a term longer than one 
year. 

Offenders convicted of violent of­
fenses had more serious criminal 
records than other offenders: 85% 
had a prior conviction. Fraudulent 
property and regulatory offenders had 
the least serious records: most (55% 
and 52%, respectively) were first of­
fenders. 

Matters concluded by U.S. 
magistrates (table 3.4) 

In addition to cases terminated in 
district courts, another 14,188 per­
sons were brought before U.S. magis­
trates in 1990. The largest group of 
these matters (40%) involved immi­
gration law violations. Another 12% 
were accused of escape. 

Overall, 63% of these persons were 
convicted, about the same as in 1988 
and 1989. The conviction rate in mat­
ters disposed by U.S. magistrates 
was lower than the average rate of 
conviction for defendants In cases 
terminated by the district courts 
(81 %). However, 95% of defendants 
who appeared before a U.S. magis­
trate charged with immigration offens­
es were convicted. Persons who ap­
peared before U.S. magistrates 
charged with violent offenses or drug 
offenses were acquitted over 70% of 
the time. 
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Table 3.1 Disposition of cases terminated in 1990, by offense 

Number of defendants in terminated cases who were: 

Convicted Not convicted 

Percent of Trial Trial 
Most serious all defendants Guilty Nolo Non-

Juryb 
Non-

offense charged convicted Total plea contendere Jury Jury Total Disrnisseds 
Jury 

All offensesc 80.9% 47,486 41,099 552 4,858 977 11,210 9,488 1,056 666 

VIolent offenses 83.3% 2,380 2,012 13 323 32 477 378 87 12 
Murder/nonnegligent 

manslaughter 78.6 154 121 1 30 2 42 34 7 1 
Negligent manslaughter 73.1 19 14 0 5 0 7 5 2 0 
Assault 68,4 450 349 1 85 15 208 171 34 3 
Robbery 93.0 1,363 1,199 10 149 5 102 77 24 1 
Rape 73.6 145 115 0 24 6 52 40 11 1 
Other sex offensesd 82.4 169 152 0 13 4 36 29 2 5 
Kidnaping 78,4 58 45 0 13 0 16 13 3 0 
Threats against 

the President 61.1 22 17 1 4 0 14 9 4 1 

Property offenses 84.6% 13,648 12,663 62 786 137 2,478 2,184 234 60 

Fraudulent offenses 87.6% 10,133 9,429 46 604 54 1,437 1,245 175 17 
Embezzlement 88.8 1,880 1,787 11 76 6 237 215 22 0 
Fraud (excluding 

tax fraud) 87.5 6,725 6,200 28 454 43 960 803 140 17 
Forgery 87.2 997 952 4 36 5 147 144 3 0 
Counterfeiting 85.1 531 490 3 38 0 93 83 10 0 

Other offenses 77.2% 3,515 3,234 16 182 83 1,041 939 59 43 
Burglary 89.8 114 104 0 10 0 13 11 2 0 
Larcen/ 76.7 2,732 2,541 15 119 57 829 769 31 29 
Motor vehicle theft 84.2 272 252 0 20 0 51 44 7 0 
Arson - 1 1 0 0 0 3 2 1 0 
Transportation of 

stolen property 81.4 254 229 0 25 0 58 41 16 1 
Other property 

offenses' 62.0 142 107 1 8 26 87 72 2 13 

Drug offenses 83.6% 16,753 13,846 30 2,764 113 3,278 2,750 471 57 
Trafficking 84.2 15,703 12,835 24 2,744 100 2,944 2,432 468 44 
Possession and other 75.9 1,050 1,011 6 20 13 334 318 3 13 

Public order offenses 74.7% 14,705 12,578 447 985 695 4,977 4,176 264 537 

Regulatory offenses 81.2% 1,880 1,608 19 209 44 436 333 81 22 
Agriculture 77.7 233 204 8 13 8 67 52 5 10 
Antitrust 84.2 80 73 3 4 0 15 1 11 3 
Labor law 100.0 30 30 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
Food and drug 67.0 67 85 0 2 0 13 11 2 0 
Motor carrier 69.3 50 49 1 0 0 6 6 0 0 
Other regulatory offenses 80.7 1,400 1,167 7 190 36 335 263 63 9 

Other offenses 73.9% 12,825 10,970 428 776 651 4,541 3,843 183 515 
Weapons 84.0 2,325 2,014 6 260 25 444 371 64 9 
Immigration offenses 89.5 2,543 2,453 6 70 14 298 290 6 2 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 91.S 1,090 951 8 121 10 97 66 26 5 
BrilNry 80.7 218 184 1 32 1 52 39 12 1 
Per;!Jry 64.8 83 59 0 22 2 45 28 14 3 
National defense 73.9 102 65 1 28 8 36 33 1 2 
Escape 76.7 610 546 2 41 21 185 165 13 7 
Racketeering and 

extortion 80.2 424 312 5 103 4 105 88 15 2 
Gambling offenses 82.8 212 190 0 22 0 44 37 7 0 
Uquor offenses 71.4 20 19 0 1 0 8 7 1 0 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 81.2 69 58 0 9 2 16 12 4 0 
Traffic 61.6 4,988 4,011 397 43 537 3,108 2,609 20 479 
Migratory birds 64.4 56 36 1 2 17 31 29 0 2 
Other 54.1 85 72 1 2 10 72 69 0 3 

- Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable c Excludes 8 defendants for whom disposition f Excluding fraudulent property offenses; 
data. could not be determined. including destruction of property and 

a Includes nolle prosequi, deferred prosecution, d May include some nonviolent offenses. trespass. 
Narcotics Addicts Rehabilitation Act (NARA) e Excluding transportation of stolen property. See data note 7. 
Titles I and II, and all dismissals. 

b Includes mistrials. 

Chapter 3: Adjudication 31 



Table :31.2 Time from filing to disposition of cases terminated In 1990 

Most serious 
Average time from filing to disposition for defendants In cases resulting In: 

offense charged All outcomes Dlsmlssala Guilty pleab Trialc 

All offenses 7.1 mo 10.3 mo 6.3mo 7.9mo 

Vlolant offenses 6.5mo 8.6mo 6.0mo 7.2mo 
Murder/nonnegligent 

manslaughter 10.3 11.S 9.7 10.7 
Negligent manslaughter 7.2 - - -
Assault 5.6 7.1 4.7 6.2 
Robbery 6.2 8.0 5.9 7.6 
Rape 6.6 5.2 7.0 6.8 
Other sex offensesd 6.0 7.2 5.8 5.5 
Kidnaping 11.8 - 7.8 -
Threats agalnst the President 8.6 - - -

Property offensas 6.5mo 9.0mo 5.8mo 9.7mo 

Fraudulent offenses 6.7mo 10.7 mo 5.8mo 10.5mo 
Embezzlement 5.8 8.3 5.3 9.6 
Fraud (exc!udlng tax fraud) 6.8 11.5 5.7 10.8 
Forgery 7.8 10.8 7.1 12.0 
Counterfeiting 6.5 8.4 6.0 8.1 

Other offensee 6.1 mo 6.9mo 5.8mo 7.7mo 
Burglary 9.2 - 6.3 -
Larcenye 5.4 5.9 5.2 5.7 
Motor vehicle theft 12.2 21.8 10.1 16.1 
Arson - - - -
Transportation of stolenroperty 9.1 9.7 8.6 11.5 
Other property offenses 3.9 5.4 3.0 3.7 

Drug offenses 9.1 mo 13.5 mo 8.2mo 9.4mo 
Trafficking 9.5 13.9 8.7 9.4 
Possession and other 4.7 9.9 3.0 6.5 

Public order offen.es 5.6mo 9.1 mo 4.6mo 5.2mo 

Regulatory offenses S.9mo 8.7mo S.2mo 8.1 mo 
Agriculture 4.7 6.3 4.5 4.0 
Antltrust 6.1 - 4.9 -
Labor law 3.1 - 3.1 -
Food and drug 4.3 - 4.1 -
Motor carrier 9.9 - 5.0 -
Other regulatory offenses 7.4 8.5 6.9 8.4 

Other offenees 5.4mo 9.1 mo 4.3mo 4.7mo 
Weapons 7.5 12.0 6.6 7.8 
Immigratlon offenses 5.1 17.0 3.6 5.7 
Tax law violations 

Including tax fraud 7.5 17.6 6.2 10.8 
Bribery 8.2 12.3 7.4 8.1 
Pe~ury 7.8 6.1 8.6 7.7 
Natlonal defense 10.3 23.4 5.4 7.5 
Escape 15.4 30.4 11.5 10.6 
Racketeering and extortion 12.8 20.6 10.5 13.2 
Gambling offenses 7.1 4.3 7.4 8.8 
Uquor offenses 2.1 - - -
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 9.6 - 8.3 -
Traffic offenses 2.9 6.0 1.6 .6 
Migratory birds 4.6 5.0 3.8 5.4 
Other 3.1 3.8 2.5 -

Note: Interval from filing to disposition Includes periods b Includes nolo contendere. 
which mar, be excluded under the Speed" Trial Act of C Includes mistrials. 
1974 (18 .S.C. 3161 at seq). Not dlrec y comparable 

d May Include some nonviolent offenses. to data from prior years. 
-Too few cases to obtain statlstlcally reliable data. e Excluding transportation of stolen property. 

a Includes nolle prosequi, deferred prosecution, f Excluding fraudulent property offenses; Including 
Narcotics Addicts Rehabilitation Act (NARA) Titles I destructlon of property and trespass. 

and II, and all dismissals. See data note 7. 
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Table 3.3 Characteristics of convicted offenders, 1990 

Percent of offenders convicted of: 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 

Offender number of All Violent Drug 
characteristics offenders offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

Sax 
Male 19,218 84.5% 94.4% 89.5% 75.7% 87.5% 85.9% 92.9% 
Female 3,534 15.5 5.6 30.5 24.3 12.5 14.1 7.1 

Rece 
White 14,978 66.1% 62.1% 65.7% 60.7% 63.3% 80.7% 74.5% 
Black 6,656 29.4 27.1 30.8 34.2 33.2 13.3 20.1 
other 1,025 4.5 10.8 3.5 5.1 3.5 6.0 5.4 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 4,817 21.0% 6.9% 10.1% 5.9% 26.4% 14.1% 32.0% 
Non·Hispanlc 18,106 79.0 93.1 89.9 94.1 73.6 85.9 68.0 

Age 
19·20 years 430 2.1% 2.6% 1.4% 3.6% 2.1% 1.5% 2.0% 
21·30 years 7,800 37.6 35.8 32.6 37.2 41.3 25.9 36.9 
31-40 years 6,m 32.7 36.0 31.4 28.6 34.5 32.0 30.2 
Over 40 years 5,725 27.6 25.4 34.5 30.7 22.0 40.6 30.9 

Education 
Less than high 

school graduate 9,366 42.8% 42.9% 26.0% 35.8% 47.9% 27.6% 53.9% 
High school graduate 7,141 32.6 34.3 34.5 40.1 31.4 37.5 28.8 
SomecoUege 3,939 18.0 18.1 26.9 18.2 16.3 20.9 12.0 
College graduate 1,452 6.6 4.7 12.6 5.9 4.4 14.0 5.3 

Criminal ,ecord 
None 7,439 32.9% 15.0% 44.7% 34.8% 32.5% 47.6% 23.7% 
Prior adult conviction 

Never incarcerated 7,696 34.1 28.4 32.7 34.3 37.4 33.4 29.1 
Incarcerated 

1 year or less 5,362 23.7 38.3 17.1 22.5 21.5 14.7 33.9 
More than 1 year 2,090 9.3 18.3 5.5 8.3 8.6 4.3 13.3 

See data note 8: Offender characteristics are not comparable with previous years' compendia. 
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Table 3.4 Dispositions by U.S. magistrates, by offense, 1990 

Number of defendants in 
matters concluded 

Not Percent 
Most serious offense investigated Total Convicted convicted convicted 

All offensesa 14,188 8,956 5,232 63.1% 

Violent offenses 242 72 170 29.8% 
Murder/manslaughter 10 1 9 -
Assault 106 52 54 49.1 
Robbery 86 12 74 14.0 
Rape 9 4 5 -
Other sex offensesb 6 3 3 -
Kidnaping 13 0 13 -
Threats against the President 12 0 12 -

Property offenses 1,915 997 918 52.1% 

Fraudulent offenses 1,608 855 753 53.2% 
Embezzlement 503 351 152 69.8 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 909 421 488 46.3 
Forgery 188 81 107 43.1 
Counterfeiting 8 2 6 -

Other offenses 307 142 165 46.3% 
Burglary 3 0 3 -
LarcenyC 160 72 88 45.0 
Motor vehicle theft 27 2 25 7.4 
Arson 3 1 2 -
Transportation of stolen tProperty 13 2 11 -
Other property offenses 101 65 36 64.4 

Drug offenses 1,758 444 1,314 25.3% 

Public order offenses 10,082 7,314 2,768 72.5% 

Regulatory offenses 604 336 268 55.6% 
Agriculture 160 148 12 92.5 
Antitrust 6 3 3 -
Labor law 1 1 0 -
Food and drug 36 4 32 11.1 
Motor carrier 5 4 1 -
Other regulatory offenses 396 176 220 44.4 

Other offenses 9,478 6,978 2,500 73.6% 
Weapons 189 40 149 21.2 
Immigration offenses 5,637 5,331 306 94.6 
Tax law violations 42 37 5 88.1 

Including tax fraud 
Bribery 18 9 9 -
Pe~ury 2 0 2 -
National defense 212 178 34 84.0 
Escape 1,671 20 1,651 1.2 
Racketeering and extortion 47 4 43 8.5 
Gambling offenses 6 3 3 -
Uquor offenses 1 0 1 -
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 6 3 3 -
Migratory birds 576 543 33 94.3 
Conspiracy, aiding and 

abetting, traffic, and 
jUrisdictional offenses 946 716 230 75.7 

Other 125 94 31 75.2 

-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. C Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
a Includes suspects for whom offense category could not be d Excluding fraudulent property offenses; including 

determined. destruction of property and trespass. 
b May include some nonviolent offenses. See data note 2. 
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Depending on the offense, convicted 
offenders may be sentenced to Incar­
ceration, probation, a fine, or a com­
bination of sanctions such as a split 
or mixed sentence (Imprisonment as 
well as a period of probation suparvl-
510n).1 The court's sentencing deci­
sion Is Influenced by a number of fac­
tors Including statutory penalties for 
the conviction offense, the serious­
ness of the offender's conduct In the 
offense, the offender's prior record, 
the judge's assessment of an offend­

. er's prospects for rehabilitation, and 
any plea-bargaining agreements that 
may have been made. 

Procedures for sentencing and pa­
roling offenders convicted of violating 
a Federal law were changed signifi­
cantly by the Sentencing Reform 
Act2-appllcable to offenses commit­
ted after November 1, 1987. For 
such cases, sentencing guidelines 
prescribe ranges of recommended 
sentences for each combination of 
offense and offender characteristics, 
and imprisonment sentences imposed 
under the guidelines are sElrYed in 
full, except for time off for good be­
havior earned by prisoners. Prison­
ers sentenced under the guidelines 
are not eUgible for release by the U.S. 
Parole Commission prior to the expi­
ration of their sentences. 

Approximately two-thirds of offend­
ers convicted in 1990 were subject to 
the guidelines, while the remaining 
offenders were convicted of offenses 
committed prior to the effective date 
of the guidelines. Therefore, the sta­
tistics In this chapter describe a year 
In which there was a transition be­
tween two systems of sentencing. 
Separate statistics, calculated only for 
those cases that were sentenced un­
der the guidelines during the first six 
months of 1990, are included in a 

, See Glossary for the distinction between 
split sentences and mixed sentences. 

2 Pub. L. No. 98-473, 98 Stat. 1837 (1984) 

BJS special report, Federal Sentenc­
ing in Transition: Sentencing and 
Time Served in Prison, 1986-1990. 

Plea bargaining may reduce the of­
fender's sentence by reducing the 
seriousness of the offense charged, 
rec;!uclilg the number of counts in the 
indictment against the defendant, or 
negotiating a lesser sentence for a 
given charge. Except where other­
wise noted, tables In this chapter are 
based on the most serious offense of 
conviction Md are not directly compa­
rable with tables In earlier chapters 
that are based an most serious of­
fense investigated or most serious 
offense charged. 

Offenders convicted and sentenc­
es Imposed (tables 4.1 and 4.2) 

Eighty-one percent of all offenders In 
cases terminated in 1990 were con­
victed (see chapter 3). Of these, 
51 % were sentenced to Incarceration 
onIY,3 30% were sentenced to proba­
tion only, 9% were sentenced to both 
incarceration and probation, and 9% 
were fined (table 4.1). (In most ta­
bles, the convicted offenders who re­
ceived split or mixed sentences are 
Included in bl::lth the probation and the 
incarceration data.) 

Overall, 60% of convicted offenders 
were sentenced to Incarceration, ei­
ther alone or accompanied by proba­
tion or a 1ine. Offenders convicted of 
violent offenses-especially robbery 
(98%), murder (93%), and kidnaping 
(91 %)-were mast likely to be incar­
cerated. Other violent offenders also 
had a high likelihood of being incar­
cerated, especially those convicted of 
negligent manslaughter (87%), 
threats against the President (86%) 
and rape (81 %). Drug traffickers 
were also frequently sentenced to 

3 In this chapter, fines are not mentioned if 
another sanction Is also Imposed. 
Statistics for numbers of fined offenders 
refer only to those with no other penalty. 

prison (91 %). Prison sentences ware 
frequently Imposed on offenders con­
victed of escape (89%), burglary 
(84%), racketeering or extortion 
(78%), or weapons offenses (78%). 

Offenders convicted of property of­
fenses were least likely to be incar­
cerated (averaging 43%). Among 
these offenders, those convicted of 
embezzlement (28%) and larceny 
(35%) had the lowest likelihood of 
being incarcerated. Offenders con­
victed on drug possession and publlc­
order charges were also less likely 
than the average offender to be Incar­
cerated (averaging 35% and 44% re­
spectively). If traffic offenses are ex­
cluded, however, 62% ofthe remaining 
offenders convicted of public-order 
offenses were incarcerated. 

Offenders convicted of tax law viola­
tions (76%), drug possession (66%), 
property offenses (63%) and regula­
tory offenses (59%) were mast likely 
to be sentenced to same term of pro­
bation, either alone or as part of a 
sentence that included incarceration. 
Sentences combining probation with a 
term of incarceration were frequently 
used with white collar and similar 
crimes such as tax offenses (23%), 
antitrust offenses (18%), violations of 
motor carrier regulations (16%), and 
those convicted of racketeering and 
extortion (14%), and fraud (13%) (ex­
cluding tax fraud). These sentences 
were also 1requently used to punish 
offenders convicted of transportation 
of stoien property. 

Sixty percent of ali offenders convict­
ed of traffic offenses were sentenced 
only to pay fines. Other offenders 
who were often fined were those con­
victedof migratory birds violations 
(53%), "other" nonregulatory public­
order violations (44%), antitrust viola­
tions (42%), agriculture and food and 
drug violations (22% each) and mail 
or transport of obscene material 
(21 %). Except for 19 persons con­
victed of assault and four persons 
convicted of "ather" (possibly nonvio-
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lent} sex offenses, fines were never 
the sale punishment for violent of­
fenses (table 4.2). Only 17 of the 
15,006 convicted drug traffickers re­
ceived no punishment other than a 
fine. 

Relationship between sentence 
and method of case disposition 
(table 4.3) 

Likelihood of Incarceration. De­
fendants who were convicted at trial 
received more severe sentences than 
defendants who pleaded guilty. Over­
all, 80% of offenders convicted at trial 
were Incarcerated (with a prison sen­
tence alone or a sentence that includ­
ed probation as well as prison), com­
pared to 58% of offenders convicted 
by plea. Drug offenders who pleaded 
guilty were about seven times as like­
ly to avoid Incarceration as those con­
victed at trial. Offenders pleading 
guilty to fraudulent property offenses 
or regulatory offenses were more 
than twice as likely to avoid incarcera­
tion as those convicted at trial. 

Length of sentence. Offenders 
sentenced to incarceration as a result 
of guilty plea received average sen­
tences 62% shorter than offenders 
convicted at trial. Offenders convict­
ed at trial received sentences averag­
ing 10.0 years; the average sentence 
for offenders convicted by plea was 
3.8 years. 

Characteristics of offenders sen­
tenced to Incarceration (table 4.4) 

The majority of offenders sentenced 
to Incarceration in 1990 were white 
(65%) and male (89%). The data in­
dicate that the percentage sentenced 
to incarceration was not uniform 
across all categories of age, race, 
sex, and ethnicity. However, no con­
clusions can be drawn from the data 
about the influence of these charac­
teristics on sentencing. Such an as­
oessment would require detailed in­
forrrstion for each category showing 
the presence or absence of factors 
that are legally intended to affect sen­
tencing, such as weapon use, victim' 
injury, dollar loss, etc. 

Women were substantially less likely 
to be confined than men who were 
convicted of similar offenses. In all, 
81 % of men and 54% of women were 
sentenced to be incarcerated. Black 
offenders were slightly more likely to 
be incarcerated than white offenders 
In the same categories, except that 
white fraudulent property offenders 
had a slightly higher incarceration 
rate than black offenders convicted of 
offenses in the same category. His­
panic offenders were more likely to be 
incarcerated than were non-Hispanic 
offenders with the same category of 
convictions. More detailed analysis of 
offense characteristics might show 
that most of these apparent dispari­
ties reflect factors recognized as a 
legitimate basis for sentencing, such 
as weapons use and offenders' prior 
records. 

Offenders with a history of prior con­
victions were substantially mo~e likely 
to be sentenced to incarceration than 
were first offenders. Property offend­
ers aged 19 or 20 were slightly less 
likely to be incarcerated than older 
offenders convicted of similar offens­
es, perhaps in part because most of 
them had shorter prior records. In 
most other offense categories, age 
bore little relationship to sentence. 
Better educated offenders were 
somewhat less likely to be incarcerat­
ed than high school dropouts,except 
for those convicted of fraudulent 
property offenses. 

Average prison sentence length 
(tables 4.2, 4.3 and 4.5) 

The average imposed prison sen­
tence term for all offenders convicted 
in 1990 was 57 months. Offenders 
convicted of violent crimes received 
the longest prison sentences (89 
months average sentence for all vio­
lent Offenses). Sentences for drug 
offenders were also much longer than 
average (81 months). For most other 
types of offenses, the average prison 
sentences were between 24 and 30 
months. Notable exceptions were 
burglary (34 months), transportation 
of stolen property (32 months)"weap­
ons offenses (47 months) and racke-
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teering or extortion (61 months). 
Short periods of Incarceration were 
imposed for gambllng-(14 months), 
drug possession-(15 months). some 
traffic offenses (4 months), some reg­
ulatory offenses like agriculture (9 
months), antitrust (13 months) and 
immigration offenses (10 months). 

Relationship of prison term to of­
fender characteristics (table 4.5) 

For most offenses, younger persons 
were sentenced to shorter terms than 
older offenders. Similarly, women 
received sentences averaging a third 
shorter than those imposed on men 
incarc9iated for similar offense types. 

Convicted offenders with no prior 
convictions received sentences aver­
aging 43% shorter than offenders 
convicted of similar offenses who had 
previously served prison terms ex­
ceeding 1 year. 



Table 4.1 Sentence types In cases terminated, by offense, 1990 

Total 
Percent of offenders convicted and sentenced to: 

Most serious offenders 
Incarcerations Probatlonb Split or 

offense of conviction sentenced mixed sentencec Fine 

All offenses 47,486 60.4% 39.5% 9.3% 8.5% 

Violent offenses 2,331 87.2% 22.2% 11.2% 1.0% 
Murder/nonnegllgent 

manslaughter 133 93.2 12.8 7.5 0 
Negligent manslaughter 23 87.0 26.1 13.0 0 
Assault 455 62.0 37.6 7.0 4.2 
Robbery 1,337 98.2 14.6 12.9 0 
Rape 149 80.5 30.:? 10.7 0 
Other sex offensesd 159 66.7 44.7 13.8 2.5 
Kidnaping 53 90.6 15.1 7.5 0 
Threats against the President 22 86.4 22.7 9.1 0 

Property offenses 13,592 43.3% 63.0% 11.0% 3.6% 

Fraudulent offenses 10,126 44.1% 64.5% 12.0% 2.3% 
Embezzlement 1.833 28.4 79.2 9.1 1.1 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 6,860 46.9 62.1 13.4 2.8 
Forgery 907 43.8 63.4 8.8 1.0 
Counterfeiting 506 62.6 45.1 9.5 1.4 

Other offenses 3,466 41.0% 58.6% 8.0% 7.5% 
Burglary 99 83.8 28.3 12.1 0 
Larcenye 2,709 34.7 63.3 7.4 a.3 
Motor vehicle theft 275 72.7 34.2 8.7 1.1 
Arson 1 - - - -
Transportation of stolenroperty 234 73.1 41.0 14.5 0 
Other property offenses 148 17.6 65.5 5.4 20.9 

Drug offenses 16,307 86.4% 21.6% 8.9% .4% 
Trafficking 15,006 90.9 17.7 9.2 .1 
Possession and other 1,301 34.7 66.1 6.0 4.2 

Public order offenses 15,256 43.6% 40.3% 7.8% 22.7% 

Regulatory offens". 2,054 38.9% 59.3% 9.2% 9.9% 
Agriculture 259 18.9 66.4 7.7 22.4 
Antitrust 83 26.5 41.0 18.1 42.2 
Labor law 34 8.8 - 5.9 8.8 
Food and drug 97 16.5 - 8.2 21.6 
Motor carrier 51 37.3 76.5 15.7 2.0 
Other regu latory offenses 1,530 45.1 57.2 8.8 5.6 

Other offenses 13,202 44.3% 37.3% 7.6% 24.7% , 
Weapons 2,438 77.7 28.2 7.9 1.3 
Immigration offenses 2,569 73.0 31.0 8.6 1.5 
Tax law violations 

Including tax fraud 1,165 43.5 76.1 23.2 3.1 
Bribery 220 50.5 56.8 12.3 5.0 
Perjury 87 71.3 39.1 i 1.5 1.1 
National defense 141 43.3 51.8 8.5 7.8 
Escape 612 89.1 19.3 10.5 .5 
Racketeering and extortion 518 78.0 31.7 13.5 2.3 
Gambllng offenses 211 53.6 51.7 6.2 .9 
Uquor offenses 22 50.0 - 4.5 18.2 
Mall or transport of 

obscene material 72 26.4 52.S 0 20.8 
Traffic offenses 4,984 4.7 36,4 2.3 60.5 
Migratory birds 57 3.5 - 1.8 52.6 
Other 106 12.3 - 2.8 44.3 

Note: Total excludes 8 convicted defendants whose d May Include some nonviolent offenses. 
sentence could not be determined. e Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. I Excluding fraudulent property offenses; 
a All sentences to incarceration, inciudlng split, mixed, Including destruction of property and trespass. 

life, Indeterminate, and youth sentences. See data note 7. 
b Includes offenders with split and mixed sentences. 
c Sentences to probatlon combined with Incarceration. 
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Table 4.2 Type and length of sentence Imposed, by offense, 1990 

Offenders convicted and sentenced in cases terminated in 1990 

Most serious 
Number Average sentence length 

offense of conviction Total Incarcerationa Probationb" -,",., Fine Incarcerationc Probationb 

All offenses 47,486 28,659 18,738 4,041 57.2mo 35.0mo 

Violent offenses 2,331 2,032 518 23 89.2mo 38.7 mo 
Murder/nonnegligent 

manslaughter 133 124 17 0 134.7 -
Negligent manslaughter 23 20 6 0 19.9 -
Assault 455 282 171 19 34.8 27.5 
Robbery 1,337 1,313 195 0 100.7 43.7 
Rape 149 120 45 0 78.9 46.4 
Other sex offensesd 159 106 71 4 33.1 41.7 
Kidnaping 53 48 8 0 178.5 -
Threats against the President 22 19 5 0 - -

Property offenses 13,592 5,885 8,560 487 22.0 mo 36.9 mo 

Fraudulent offenses 10,126 4,464 6,529 228 21.9 mo 39.1 mo 
Embezzlement 1,833 520 1,452 20 17.5 37.4 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 6,880 3,230 4,274 192 23.4 40.2 
Forgery 907 397 575 9 16.9 36.3 
Counterfeiting 506 317 228 7 19.4 38.2 

other offenses 3,466 1,421 2,031 259 22.4 mo 29.9 mo 
Burglary 99 83 28 0 34.4 40.1 
Larcenye 2,709 940 1,716 225 18.8 28.7 
Motor vehicle theft 275 200 94 3 27.6 38.6 
Arson 1 1 0 0 - ... 
Transportation of 

stolen property 234 171 96 0 31.8 47.7 
Other property offensesl 148 26 97 31 11.5 22.3 

Drug offenses 16,307 14,092 3,517 71 80.9 mo 41.1 mo 
Trafficking 15,006 13,640 2,657 17 83.1 47.5 
Possession and other 1,301 452 860 54 14.9 21.2 

Public order offenses 15,256 6,650 6,143 3,460 28.3 mo 28.5 mo 

Regulatory offenses 2,054 799 1,218 203 26.7 mo 31.4 mo 
Agriculture 259 49 172 58 9.1 27.1 
Antitrust 83 22 34 35 12.9 41.2 
Labor law 34 3 30 3 - 32.4 
Food and drug 97 16 68 21 - 32.5 
Motor carrier 51 19 39 1 - 30.5 
Other regulatory offenses 1,530 690 875 85 29.1 31.8 

other offenses 13,202 5,851 4,925 3,257 28.5 mo 27.7 mo 
Weapons 2,438 1,894 687 32 47.3 36.5 
Immigration offenses 2,569 1,876 797 39 10.5 31.0 
Tax law vio.lations 

including tax fraud 1,165 507 886 36 24.3 42.S 
Bribery 220 111 125 11 24.8 36.4 
Perjury 87 62 34 1 22.5 39.7 
National defense 141 61 73 11 15.9 21.6 
Escape 612 545 118 3 22.2 30.1 
Racketeering and extortion 518 404 164 12 61.4 42.5 
Gambling offenses 211 113 109 2 13.6 37.1 
Uquor offenses 22 11 8 4 - -
Mail or trans~ort of 

obscene ma' Irlal 72 19 38 15 - 34.6 
Traffic 4,984 233 1,812 3,014 4.5 13.6 
Migratory birds 57 2 26 30 - 12.1 
Other 106 13 48 47 - 14.8 

Note: Total excludes 8 convicted defendants whose sentence c Excludes life sentences and indeterminate sentences 
could not be determined.Totai exceeds sum of individual sanctions for youthful or drug offenders (0.03% of all incarcera-
because split and mixed sentences are counted in both prison and tions) , 
probation. d May include some nonviolent offenses. 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. e Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
... No cases of this type occurred in the data. I Excluding fraudulent property offenses; Including 
a All sentences to incarceration, Including split, mixed, life, destruction of property and trespass. 

indeterminate, and youth sentences. See data note 7. 
b Includes offenders with split and mixed sentences. 
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Table 4.3 Sentences Imposed on convicted offenders, by offense of convl~i',;')n and method of disposition, 1990 

Offenders sentenced to 

Number of offenders in terrr\i'clted 
some incarceration 

Number of cases convicted and sentenced to: Percent of Average 
Offense of conviction convicted 

Incarcerationa Probationb convicted sentertce 
and method of disposition offenders Fine offenders length 

All offenses 47,486 28,659 18,738 4,041 60.4% 57.2mo 

Guil~ plead 41,651 23,996 17,402 3,611 57.6 45.1 
Trial 5,835 4,663 1,336 430 79.9 119.5 

Violent offenses 2,331 2,032 518 23 87.2% 89.2mo 
Guilty plea 1,974 1,712 470 17 86.7 77.3 
Trial 357 320 48 6 89.6 152.5 

Property offenses 

Fraudulent offenses 10,126 4,464 6,529 228 44.1% 21.9mo 
Guilty plea 9,447 3,976 6,221 188 42.1 18.8 
Trial 679 488 308 40 71.9 46.5 

Other offenses 3,466 1,421 2,031 259 41.0% 22.4mo 
Guilty plea 3,203 1,269 1,894 247 39.6 20.0 
Trial 263 152 137 12 57.8 42.0 

Drug offenses 16,307 14,092 3,517 71 86.4% 80.9mo 
Guilty plea 13,469 11,319 3,241 66 84.0 63.6 
Trial 2,838 2,773 276 5 97.7 151.6 

Public order offenses 

Regulatory offenses 2,054 799 1,218 203 38.9% 26.7mo 
Guilty plea 1,811 634 1,135 185 35.0 19.0 
Trial 243 165 83 18 67.9 56.8 

Other offenses 13,202 5,851 4,925 3,257 44.3% 28.5 mo 
Guilty plea 11,747 5,086 4,441 2,908 43.3 23.0 
Trial 1,455 765 484 349 52.6 64.7 

Note: Total excludes B convicted offenders whose sentence c Excludes offenders sentenced to life sentences and 
could not be determined. indeterminate sentences for youthful or drug offenders. 
a All sentences to incarceration, in~luding split, mixed, life, Includes prison portion of split or mixed sentences. 

indeterminate, and youth sentences. d Includes nolo contendere. 
b Includes offenders with split and mixed sentences. See data note 7. 
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Table 4.4 Convicted offenders sentenced to Incarceration, by offense and offender characteristics, 1990 

Of all offenders convicted In cases terminated In 1990, the percent 
who were incarcerated 

Property offenses Public order offenses Total 
Offender All Violent Drug number of 
characteristics offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other offenders 

All offenders· 60.4 87.2% 44.1% 41.0% 86.4% 38.9% 44.3% 47,543 

Sex 
Male 81.5 94.4% 58.5% 56.1% 93.9% 53.5% 79.7% 19,218 
Female 54.1 85.2 35.4 23.9 79.4 50.0 63.8 3,534 

Race 
White 76.6 92.6% 53.6% 48.7% 91.1% 52.3% 77.1% 14,978 
Black 79.3 97.2 48.1 49.1 94.1 54.1 85.4 6,656 
Other 74.8 92.9 40.1 44.8 90.9 61.2 74.4 1,025 

Ethnlcity 
Hispanic 86.0 95.0% 52.3% 54.9% 94.6% 63.2% 83.2% 4,817 
Non-Hispanic 74.7 93.7 50.9 47.9 91.1 51.0 76.4 18,106 

Age 
19-20 years 74.4 97.1% 36.8% 25.0% 92.9% - 81.3% 4:30 
21-30 years 78.6 95.0 47.7 47.2 91.9 61.0 81.6 7,800 
31-40 years 79.2 95.5 54.1 58.7 92.0 52.3 78.3 6,777 
Over 40 years 72.0 88.0 51.3 43.5 92.4 46.2 74.7 5,725 

Education 
Less than high 

school graduate 83.9 95.7% 53.9% 58.9% 93.7% 62.7% 83.1% 9,366 
High school graduate 73.9 95.2 47.8 45.0 91.2 52.4 73.6 7,141 
Some college 69.9 91.3 50.1 39.7 89.1 42.1 69.2 3,939 
College graduate 68.4 75.8 58.9 35.4 89.8 53.6 68.6 1,452 

Criminal record 
None 63.8 79.4% 37.7% 22.9% 88.9% 39.6% 60.1% 7,439 
Prior adUlt conviction 

Never incarcerated 76.7 92.6 51.4 43.3 91.2 60.5 74.7 7,696 
Incarcerated 

1 year or less 90.6 98.4 76.4 82.3 96.1 72.3 90.1 5,362 
More than 1 year 93.5 98.1 85.3 87.3 97.7 82.9 90.4 2,090 

Note: Excludes corporations. Offenders are classified by the * Includes offenders for whom these characteristics are unknown. 
most serious offense of conviction. See data note 8: Offender characteristics are not comparable with 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. previous years' compendia. 
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Table 4.5 Average Incarceration sentence lengths Imposed, by offense and offender characteristics, 1990 
Average sentence length for offenders convicted of: 

Offender All Violent 
Property offenses Drug Public order offenses 

characteristics offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All offendera* 57.2mo 89.2mo 21.9 ma 22.4 mo aO.9mo 26.7 mo 28.5mo 

Sex 
Male 63.2mo 93.4 mo 18.6mo 19.5 mo 84.5 mo 30.2mo 31.5 mo 
Female 42.5 58.4 13.6 15.9 62.7 16.8 20.1 

Race 
White 53.9mo 84.emo 19.2mo 20.4 mo 73.7mo 28.9mo 26.3mo 
Black n.4 115.5 14.3 17.3 98.2 28.1 48.0 
Other 53.8 64.9 10.6 15.0 80.1 22.2 22.1 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 53.1 mo 105.8 mo 15.1 mo 19.6 mo 71.4 mo 42.1 mo 15.6mo 
Non-Hispanic 63.2 90.5 17.8 18.9 86.1 25.6 38.4 

Age 
19-20 years 52.8 mo 49.5 ma 11.3 ma - 72.7 ma - 23.7mo 
21-30 years 59.4 87.7 15.2 18.9 78.2 22.3 27.5 
31-40 years 62.9 107.1 18.3 19.4 80.3 26.8 35.0 
Over 40 years 61.4 85.2 20.0 19.8 93.8 33.2 31.2 

Education 
Less than high 

school giCiduate 81.9 me:; 92.7mo i5.Smu 1S.2mo 81.9 me:; 29.6mo 27.2mo 
High school graduate 63.3 93.0 17.5 20.6 82.8 25.4 40.7 
Some college 59.0 91.7 17.8 18.7 80.4 32.6 33.0 
College graduate 43.5 53.5 20.9 16.4 70.5 29.7 26.9 

Criminal record 
None 50.5mo 56.2 ma 14.7 mo 13.3 mo 68.4 mo 18.5 mo 1B.6mo 
Prior adult conviction 

Never incarcerated 56.6 62.6 16.1 14.9 76.7 34.7 22.7 
Incarcerated 

1 year or less 65.3 99.9 20.8 20.5 93.8 27.8 35.0 
More than 1 year 88.0 137.1 23.9 29.8 120.8 41.9 48.0 

Note: Excludes corporations and offenders sentenced to life sen- • Includes offenders for whom these characteristics are unknown. 
tences and indeterminate sentences for youthful or drug offenders. See data note 8: Offender characteristics are not comparable with 
Includes prison portion of split or mixed sentences. previous years' compendia, 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. 
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Under the Sentencing Reform Act of 
1984, applicable to offenses commit­
ted on or after November 1, 1987, 
Federal prisoners are no longer re­
leased from prison under the authori­
ty of the U.S. Parole Commission. 
The act provides that Federal judges 
may sentence convicted offenders to 
terms of probation supervision and/or 
to terms of Incarceration followed by 
a period of supervised release that 
they specify at the time of sentencing. 

However most of the persons de­
scribed In this chapter as terminating 
periods of Incarceration or supervi­
sion were serving sentences Imposed 
under laws applicable before the act's 
passage (called the ·old law"). Of­
fenders Incarcerated under the old 
law were eligible for release to parole 
supervision after completing a third or 
less of their prison terms. Offenders 
who remained In prison until their 
mandatory release date were possibly 
subject to a period of post-release 
community supervision. 

Offenders under supervision, wheth­
er probation, parole, or supervised 
release, are normally required to 
meet certain standard conditions, 
such as reporting to their supervising 
officers on a specified regular sched­
ule, Informing supervising officers of 
their places of residence, and refrain­
Ing from new violations of law. Sen­
tencing Judges may aiso Impose spe­
cial conditions such as participating In 
substance abuse treatment or psy­
chological counseling, remaining in a 
specified area, or performing commu­
nity service. 

Violation of the conditions of supervi­
sion or arrest for a new offense can 
result In Imposition of additional re­
strictions or in removal from active 
supervision. Removal from active 
supervision may entail Incarceration 
of a probationer or relncarceration of 
an offender who was under parole or 
supervised release. Offenders who 
are removed from active supervision 
with violations but are not incarcerat­
ed may have some other action taken 
against them, such as deportation, 

issuance of an arrest warrant, assign­
ment to community corrections, or 
supervision by some other State or 
local authority. 

The rate at which offenders success­
fully complete (or violate) a period of 
paroie or probation supervision 
depends upon the length of the super­
vision term (which may reflect charac­
teristics of the offense or offender), 
the stringency of supervision condi­
tions, and the strictness of super­
visory review. Statistics on violation 
rates, therefore, reflect a combination 
of the behavior of the offender, the 
supervision system, and the time 
under supervision. 

Probation outcomes (tables 5.1 
and 5.2) 

In 199023,404 offenders completed 
one or more terms of active probation 
supervision (table 5.1). Eighty-four 
percent of probation terminations 
were either successful completions of 
the term of supervision or were ad­
ministrative closures such as incar­
ceration for a prior offense. Sixteen 
percent were removals or revocations 
for technical violations (12%) or new 
crimes (over 4%). 

Violations by offense. Probation 
sentences were frequently Imposed 
on certain types of white collar offend­
ers (see chapter 4). Violation rates 
for several of these offenses were 
lower than the average for all proba­
tioners: embezzlement (9% technical, 
3% new crimes); fraud (8% and 4%, 
respectively), and tax law violations 
{5% and 1 %}. Fewer than 3% of reg­
ulatory offenders violated their proba­
tion by committing a new crime. Pro­
bationers convicted of racketeering or 
extortion were also less likely than 
average to have violations entailing 
removal or Incarceration. 

The rate of removal or relncarcer­
atlon for violations or new crimes was 
relatively high among offenders who 
had been convicted of rape (37%), 
burglary (37%), robbery (34%), or 
forgery (32%). 

Offender chnracterlstics. Offend­
ers with higher levels of education 
experienced lower violation rates than 
those with lesser education. Among 
offenders whose drug history Is 
known, drug abusers were 8 times as 
likely to have a probation termination 
for violating conditions of drug use 
than were offenders originally be­
lieved not to be drug abusers. The 
offenders with known histories of drug 
abuse also had higher levels of non­
drug use technical violations and new 
crimes than did the remaining proba­
tioners. 

Outcomes of parole and super­
vised release (tables 5.3 and 5.4) 

A total of 14,898 offenders who had 
been released to parole or supervised 
release completed their supervision In 
1990. Ten percent of the terminations 
were removals from supervision or 
relncarcerations for commission of a 
new crime. Another 20% were for 
technical violations. 

The violation rate for offenders ter­
minating parole or supervised release 
In each major offense category was 
substantially higher than the corre­
sponding rate for offenders terminat­
Ing probation. The higher violation 
rate after parole or supervised re­
lease may reflect the fact that all of 
these offenders were Initially sen­
tenced to prlson-a determination 
that probably reflected the serious­
ness of the offenses and the offend­
ers' prior record (see chapter 4). 

Violations by offense. Offenders 
originally convicted of burglary or vio­
lent offenses had the highest levels of 
terminating supervision with violations 
(57% for burglary and 51% for violent 
offenses). Persons convicted of drug 
crimes had average rates of technical 
violations for drug use and lower-than­
average rates of other technical viola­
tions and new crimes, reflecting the 
fact that drug traffickers who are im­
prisoned are not more likely than oth­
er prisoners to have been Involved In 
drug abuse. 
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Offender characteristics. In con­
trast to persons convicted of drug of­
fenses, offenders known to have a 
history of drug abuse violated their 
terms of supervision in 41 % of termi­
nations (13% for drug use, 13% for 
new crimes, and 15% for nondrug 
technical violations) (table 5.4), com­
pared to 22% of supervision termina­
tions for offenders with no previously 
known drug use. As with probation­
ers, offenders with higher levels of 
education who terminated parole or 
supervised release had lower levels 
of each form of violation than did of­
fenders with low levels of education. 

Violation rata (table 5.5) 

The likelihood that an offender was 
cited for a violation during the first 
year of supervision differed between 
offenders on probation supervision 
(6%) and offenders on supervision 
after release from prison (on average, 
13% for three forms of supervision). 
Among offenders who entered proba­
tion supervision in 1990, the violation 
rate tor new crimes was higher for 
those whose probation was imposed 
by a magistrate (5%) than for those 
whose probation was imposed by a 
judge (3%). Aithough paroiees had 
higher violation rates than offenders 
who entered supervised release or 
mandatory release supervision, the 
difference is probabiy explained by 
the fact that offenders entering parole 
in 1990 had been sentenced under 
the old law and ther~fore had served 
longer prison terms than offenders 
who entered supervised release. 

Because the likelihood of a violation 
increases as the period of supervision 
Increases, the annual vioiation rate, 
which more cleariy reflects differenc­
es among offender groups, is gener­
ally lower than the overall vioiation 
rate for similar groups during the total 
period of supervision. 

Time served In prison (tables 5.6 
and 5.7) 

In 1990, a total of 26,955 prisoners 
were released for the first time from 
the custody of the U.S. Bureau of 
Prisons after serving sentences im-

posed by U.S. district courts for viola­
tions of the U.S. Code (table 5.6).' 
Most of them had been sentenced to 
prison for offenses committed prior to 
the effective date of sentencing 
guidelines, but some prisoners re­
leased in 1990 had been sentenced 
under the guidelines. 

Including credits for time spent in jail 
prior to final disposition, inmates first 
released in 1990 served an average 
of 20 months-89% of the sentence 
imposed for the most serious of­
fense-in confinement. The average 
length of time served was the same 
as in 1988 and 1989, but the percent­
age of imposed sentence increased 
(from 80% in 1988 and 86% in 1990), 
reflecting the influence of sentencing 
guidelines. 

Violent offenders served terms near­
ly 3 times as long as the average (4.7 
years), while terms for public-order 
offenders were less than half the av­
erage (9 months). Because more 
provisions for early release, such as 
parole and time credited for good be­
havior, are available to inmates serv­
Ing longer sentences, violent offend­
ers serve an average of 72% of their 
sentences, whiie inmates convicted of 
public-order offenses serve 97% of 
their sentences. 

Prisoners convicted of drug traffick­
ing offenses (inciuding saies, importa­
tion, and manufacture) served an av­
erage of nearly 2 years and 7 months 
in 1990, 7% longer than the average 
time served by the cohort of similar 
offenders released in 1989. 

Prisoners released in 1990 who 
were sentenced to 5-ysar terms for 
their most serious offense actually 
served an average of 3 years and 3 
months (table 5.7). Those with ten-

1 U.S. Bureau of Prisons facilities hold many 
other kinds of inmates, such as material 
witnesses, probation and parole violators, 
prisoners held for other jurisdictions, and 
offenders convicted of violating the D.C. 
Code or sentenced by D.C. Superior Court 
or the courts martial. All these inmates are 
excluded from this discussion. 
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year terms actually served on aver­
age 4 years and 11 months, and 
those sentenced to 20 years actually 
served on average 8 years and 2 
months in prison. 

At each level of imposed sentences 
over 1 year, violent offenders re­
mained in prison for a somewhat 
longer time than average, ranging 
from 3 months longer for 2-year sen­
tences to 12 months longer for 10-
year sentences. 

Prisoner movements (table 5.8) 

In 1990 the U.S. Bureau of Prisons 
received 32,487 prisoners directly 
from sentences imposed by U.S. dis­
trict courts. Another 11,125 persons 
were committed to prison for having 
vioiated conditional release, as a re­
sult of sentences by military or other 
courts, or for treatment or examina­
tion. Forty percent of the district 
court commitments were for drug traf­
ficking, and another 37% were for 
offenses classified as public-order 
offenses. Most of the imprisoned 
public-order offenders were convicted 
of violations of immigration laws. 

In all, commitments in 1990 exceed­
ed releases by 4,421, with the result 
that the Federal prisoner population 
increased by 85 prisone.rs per week. 
The prison popuiation in most catego­
ries of offenses decreased during 
1989, but the number of offenders 
imprisoned for drug offenses in­
creased by 5,161 and for weapons 
offenses by 584. 



Table 5.1 Outcome of probation supervision, by offense, 1990 

Percent of probation supervh;ions terminating with: 

Number of Technical violations8 

Most serious offense probation No Drug Fugitive New Administrative 
of conviction terminations Total violation use status Other crimeb case closures 

Ali offenses 23,541 100.0% 78.5% 2.0% 1.2% 8.3% 4.5% 5.5% 

Violent offenses 650 100.0% 71.8% 2.5% .9% 12.0% 7.7% 5.1% 
Murder/manslaughter 10 100.0 - - - - - -
Negligent manslaughter 13 100.0 - - - - - -
Assault 315 100.0 73.0 1.0 1.3 13.0 7.3 4.4 
Robbery 154 100.0 59.7 7.1 1.3 13.0 12.3 6.5 
Rape 24 100.0 50.0 0 0 29.2 8.3 12.5 
Other sex offensesc 119 100.0 90.8 0 0 4.2 1.7 3.4 
Kidnaping 7 100.0 - - - - - -
Threats against the President 8 100.0 - - - - - -

PrQP!u1y offenses 9,392 100.0% 77.3% 2.0% 1.3% 9.0% 4.8% 5.6% 

Fraudulent offenses 6,880 100.0% 79.0% 1.8% 1.1% 8.1% 4.3% 5.8% 
Embezzlement 1,863 100.0 84.0 1.3 .9 6.9 2.7 4.3 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 3,763 100.0 81.1 1.1 .8 6.6 3.6 6.8 
Forgery 938 100.0 62.6 4.8 2.6 16.0 9.0 5.1 
Counterfeiting 316 100.0 74.1 4.7 1.3 8.5 7.0 4.4 

Other offenses 2,512 100.0% 72.6% 2.4% 1.9% 11.6% 6.4% 5.1% 
Burglaryd 63 100.0 57.1 4.8 1.6 22.2 7.9 6.3 
Larceny 1,914 100.0 72.3 2.6 2.1 12.3 6.3 4.5 
Motor vehicle theft 166 100.0 70.5 3.6 1.8 5.4 11.4 7.2 
Arson 5 100.0 - - - - - -
Transportation of stolen froperty 196 100.0 78.6 0 1.5 7.7 3.1 9.2 
Other property offenses 168 100.0 77.4 .6 0 11.3 6.0 4.8 

Drug offenses 4,289 100.0% 77.4% 3.7% 1.1% 7.9% 3.8% 6.1% 
Trafficking 2,679 100.0 78.5 3.1 .6 6.9 3.9 7.0 
Possession and other 1,610 100.0 75.6 4.7 2.0 9.6 3.7 4.5 

Public order offenses 9,209 100.0% 80.6% 1.2% 1.2% 7.5% 4.2% 5.2% 

Regulatory offenses 1,557 100.0% 84.1% 2.1% .7% 4.8% 3.0% 5.3% 
Agriculture 169 100.0 88.2 1.2 .6 2.4 1.8 5.9 
Antitrust 43 100.0 95.3 0 0 0 0 4.7 
Labor law 33 100.0 81.8 3.0 3.0 0 3.0 9.1 
Food and drug 44 100.0 79.5 2.3 0 0 4.5 13.6 
Motor carrier 47 100.0 87.2 0 0 2.1 2.1 8.5 
Other regulatory offenses 1,221 100.0 83.2 2.4 .7 5.7 3.2 4.8 

Other offens8s 7,652 100.0% 79.9% 1.0% 1.3% 8.1% 4.5% 5.2% 
Weapons 810 100.0 72.0 2.6 1.2 9.9 8.8 5.6 
Immigration offenses 901 100.0 75.2 1.0 3.3 9.0 4.2 7.2 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 1,072 100.0 87.0 .8 .1 4.1 1.4 6.5 
Bribery 145 100.0 84.~ 0 0 6.2 2.1 7.6 
Perjury 66 100.0 72.7 1.5 1.5 7.6 6.1 10.6 
National defense 212 100.0 81.1 .9 .5 8.0 4.2 5.2 
Escape 75 100.0 73.3 1.3 2.7 12.0 2.7 8.0 
Racketeering and extortion 226 100.0 85.4 .9 0 4.0 3.5 6.2 
Gambling offenses 128 100.0 87.5 0 0 3.1 1.6 7.8 
Uquor offenses 15 100.0 - - - - - -
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 45 100.0 86.7 0 0 2.2 0 11.1 
Traffic 3,342 100.0 79.3 .8 1.5 9.4 5.4 3.7 
Migratory birds 225 100.0 91.6 .4 .4 1.8 .9 4.9 
Other 390 100.0 80.5 .5 .5 10.8 2.3 5.4 

Note: Total Includes terminations of supervision for b Supervision terminated with Incarceration or removal 
offenders whose offense category could not be to Inactive status after arrest for a "major" or "minor" 
determined. The number of offenders who terminated offense. 
probation supervision In 1990 was 23,404. c May Include some nonviolent offenses. 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. d Excludes transportation of stolen property. 
a Supervision terminated with Incarceration or removal to e Excluding fraudulent property offenses; Including 

inactive status for violation of supervision conditions destruction of property and trespass. 
other than charges for new offenses. 

See data note 9. 
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Table 5.2 Characteristics of offenders terminating probation supervision, 1990 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with: 

Number of Technical violations8 

Offense probation No Drug Fugitive New Administrative 
characteristics terminations Total violation use status Other crimeb case closures 

All offenderae 23,541 100.0% 78.5% 2.0% 1.2% 8.3% 4.5% 5.5% 

Sex 
Male 18,185 100.0% n,2% 2.0% 1.2% 8.7% 5.0% 5.8% 
Female 5,356 100.0 82.7 2.0 1.1 6.9 2.7 4.6 

Race 
White 17,112 100.0% 81.3% 1.5% 1.0% 6.5% 3.9% 5.8% 
Blaek 5,571 100.0 70.2 3.7 1.9 13.4 6.3 4.5 
Other 834 100.0 75.8 .6 1.3 12.0 4.2 6.1 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 2,337 100.0% 75.5% 2.2% 2.6% 8.8% 5.9% 5.0% 
Non·Hispanic 21,164 100.0 78.8 2.0 1.1 8.3 4.3 5.6 

Age 
16-18 years 136 100.0% 69.1% .7% 3.7% 11.0% 3.7% 11.8% 
19·20 years 584 100.0 69.2 2.1 2.6 13.7 6.2 6.3 
21-30 years 7,102 100.0 72.2 3.0 1.9 11.7 6.4 4.8 
31·40 years 7,456 100.0 n,5 2.4 1.2 9.0 4.7 5.1 
Over 40 years 8,184 100.0 85.7 .7 .4 4.2 2.5 6.4 

Education 
Less than high school graduate 7,223 100.0% 72.4% 2.5% 2.0% 11.0% 6.4% 5.7% 
High school graduate 8,873 100.0 79.7 2.1 1.0 8.4 4.4 4.5 
Some college 4,993 100.0 81.9 1.5 .7 6.4 3.5 5.9 
College graduate 2,272 100.0 86.4 .6 .4 3.7 1.2 7.9 

Drug abu •• 
No known abuse 15,398 100.0% 84.8% .9% .9% 6.S% 3.9% 3.2% 
Drug history 3,314 100.0 65.7 7.3 1.9 14.0 7.5 a.a 

Note: Total Includes terminations of supervision for b Supervision terminated with incarceration or rem,,:,val 
offenders whose offense cate»ory could not be to inactive status after arrest for a "major" or "minor" 
determined. The number of 0 enders who terminated offense. 
probation supervision in 1990 was 23,404. c Includes offenders with unknown characteristics. 
a Supervision terminated with incarceration or removal See data note 9. 

to Inactive status for violation of supervision conditions 
other than charges for new offenses. 
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Table 5.3 Outcome of parole or supervised release, by offense, 1990 

Number of Percent terminating supervisions with: 
terminations of Technical violationsa 
parole or 

Most serious offense supervised No Drug Fugitive New Administrative 
of conviction releas,e Total violation use status Other crimeb case closures 

All offenses 14,981 100.0% 61.4% 7.5% 2.4% 10.1% 10.5% 8.1% 

VIolent offenses 1,786 100.0% 44.7% 11.6% 4.1% 15.1% 20.0% 4.5% 
Murder/manslaughter 79 100.0 45;6 3.8 1.3 15.2 22.8 11.4 
Negligent manslaughter 22 100.0 72.7 0 0 4.5 22.7 0 
Assault 150 100.0 61.3 7.3 2.7 12.7 13.3 2.7 
Robbery 1,346 100.0 40.1 13.8 4.3 16.5 21.1 4.2 
Rape 57 100.0 61.4 1.8 1..8 7.0 22.8 5.3 
Other sex offensesc 60 100.0 78.3 1.7 3.3 1.7 6.7 8.3 
Kidnaping 66 100.0 45.5 7.6 7.6 13.6 21.2 4.5 
Threats against the President 6 100.0 - - - - - -

Property offenses 3',371 100.0% 60.3% 7.1'% 3.4% 12.2% 11.0% 5.9% 

Fraudulent offenses 2,058 100.0% 65.5% 6.6% 2.8% 10.5% 8.2% 6.4% 
Embezzlement 229 100.0 82.5 3.5 .9 5.7 3.1 4.4 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 1,148 100.0 69.9 2.8 2.5 10.3 7.8 6.7 
Forgery 523 100.0 52.6 15.3 4.2 12.4 10.5 5.0 
Counterfeiting 158 100.0 51.9 10.1 2.5 12.7 10.8 12.0 

Other offenses 1,313 100.0% 52.2% 7.9% 4.5% 14.8% 15.5% 5.1% 
Burglary 168 100.0 39.3 12.5 6.0 16.1 22.6 3.6 
Larcenyd 780 100.0 48.7 9.9 4.0 16.4 15.8 5.3 
Motor vehicle theft 189 100.0 63.0 1.6 5.8 10.1 14.3 5.3 
Arson 13 100.0 - - - - - -
Transportation of stolen froperty 148 100.0 68.2 1.4 4.1 11.5 8.8 6.1 
Other property offenses 15 100.0 - - - - - -

Drug offenses 7,697 100.0% 64.9% 7.5% 1.4% 8.2% 8.3% 9.6% 
Trafficking 7,373 100.0 64.8 7.7 1.4 8.0 B.5 9.6 
Possession and other 324 100.0 68,8 4.3 1.2 12.3 4.6 8.6 

Public order offenses 2,126 100.0% 64.0% 4.9% 2.9% 9.3% 9.4% 9.5% 

Regulatory offenses 305 100.0% 73.8% 2.3% .7% 6.6% 6.2% 10.5% 

Other offenses 1,,821 100.0% 62.3% 5.4% 3.3% 9.8% 9.9% 9.3% 
Weapons 653 100.0 56.2 9.2 2.0 12.1 14.7 5.8 
Immigration offenses 505 100.0 53.7 2.8 6.9 10.1 7.1 19.4 
Tax law violations 

Including tax fraud 154 100.0 92.9 .6 0 1.9 1.9 2.6 
Bribery 31 100.0 83.9 3.2 0 3.2 0 9.7 
Perjury 25 100.0 76.0 4.0 0 8.0 4.0 8.0 
National defense 9 100.0 - - - - - -
Escape 155 100.0 47.1 10.3 6.5 18,'\ 12.9 5.2 
Racketeering and extortion 212 100.0 81.1 2.4 0 
Gambling offenses 11 100.0 - - - - - -
Uquor offenses 0 100.0 ... ... ... ... ... ... 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 3 100.0 - - - - - -
Traffic 50 100.0 80.0 0 2.0 4.0 8,0 6.0 
Migratory birds 2 100.0 - -- - - - -
Other 11 100.0 - - - -- - -

Note: Total Includes tenninations of supervision for b Removal to inactive su~ervision or return to incarceration 
offenders whose offense category could not be determined. after arrest for a "majo or "minor" offense. 
The number of offenders who tenninated supervision in 

C May include some nonviolent offenses. 
1990 was 14,898. 

d Excludes transportation of stolen property. 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. 

S Excluding fraudulent property offenses; Including 
... No cases of this type occurred in the data, / 

destruction of property and trespass. 
a Removal to inactive supervision or return to Incarceration See data note 9. 

for violation of supervision conditions other than charges 
for new offenses. 
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Table 5.4 Characteristics of offenders terminating parole or supervised release, 1990 

Number of Percent terminating supervisions with: 
terminations of Technical violationsa 
parole or 

Offender supervised No Drug Fugitive New Administrative 
characteristics release Total violation use status Other crimeb case closures 

All offendersc 14,981 100.0% 61.4% 7.5% 2.4% 10.1% 10.5% 8.1% 

Sex 
Male 13,597 100.0% 61.0% 7.5% 2.4% 10.1% 11.0% 8.1% 
Female 1,384 100.0 65.2 8.4 2.3 10.0 5.1 9.0 

Race 
White 10,296 100.0% 67.0% 5.6% 2.5% 7.9% 8.5% 8.6% 
Black 4,288 100.0 47.6 12.8 2.2 15.3 15.0 7.1 
Other 390 100.0 63.6 1.8 1.8 11.3 13.8 7.7 

Ethnlclty 
Hispanic 2,801 100.0% 55.9% 8.8% 3.5% 9.6% 8.9% 13.3% 
Non-Hispanic 12,159 100.0 62.6 7.3 2.1 10.2 10.8 6.9 

Alii-
16-18 years 8 100.0% - - - - - -
19-20 years 114 100.0 28.1 7.9 7.9 20.2 17.5 18.4 
21-30 years 3,409 100.0 55.3 8.0 3.1 11.9 11.7 10.0 
31-40 years 5,938 100.0 59.0 9.2 2.2 10.9 11.0 7.6 
Over 40 years 5,482 100.0 68.5 5.5 2.0 7.8 8.9 7.3 

Education 
Less than high school graduate 7,016 100.0% 55.3% 9.2% 3.1% 11.6% 11.9% 8.8% 
High school graduate 4,606 100.0 62.8 7.4 2.1 10.0 10.7 7.0 
Some college 2,407 100.0 68.6 5.5 1.6 8.4 8.6 7.4 
College graduate 856 100.0 82.0 1.4 .5 3.2 3.5 9.5 

Drug abulle 
No Imown abuse 7,570 100.0% 71.7% 3.2% 2.1% 7.5% 8.9% 6.6% 
Drug hlstolY 4,839 100.0 54.9 13.4 2.2 12.8 12.5 4.2 

Note: Total Includes terminations of supervision for a Violation of supervision conditions other than charges 
offenders whose offense category could not be for new offenses. 
determined. The number of offenders who terminated b Includes both "major" and "minor" offenses. 
supervision in 1990 was 14,898. 

c Includes offenders with unknown characteristics. -Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. 
See data note 9. 
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TableS.S Parole and probation outcomes, by type of release, 1990 

Percent of offenders enterln~ supervision In 1990 who had 
violations during the first year of supervision 

Total Technical violationsa 

Type of offenders All Drug Fugitive New 
release supervised violations use status Other crimeb 

Parole 8,727 14.9% 4.6% 1.0% 5.3% 3.9% 

Supervised release 7,707 11.4% 2.3% 1.5% 4.5% 3.1% 

Mandatory release 4,356 11.3% 3.2% 1'.1% 4.0% 3.1% 

Probation Imposed 
bYludge 13,109 5.2% 1.0% .4% 2.8% 1.0% 
by magistrate 7,338 8.4 .7 .9 4.8 2.0 

a Removal to Inactive supervision or return to b Removal to inactive supervision or return to 
Incarceration for violation of surcervislon Incarceration after arrest for a "malor" or 
conditions other than charges or new offenses. "minor" offense. 

See data note 10. 
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Table 5.6 Average time to first release and percent of sentence served, for prisoners released In 1990 

Most serious offense Percent of Number of 
of conviction Tlme served sentence served prisoners releaseda 

All offenses 19.2 mo 89.4% 26,955 

Violent offenses 54.2 mo 72.3% 1,585 
Murder/manslaughter 64.9 69.6 80 
Assault 45.0 77.5 428 
Robbery 58.4 68.7 907 
Rape - 57.8 21 
Other sex offensesb 34.0 82.3 90 
Kidnaping 106.3 56.9 35 
Other violent offenses 25.8 124.4 24 

Property offenses 16.3 mo 89.6% 5,653 

Fraudulent offenses 15.1 mo 89.4% 4,072 
Embezzlement 11.6 92.3 415 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 15.2 88.0 2,912 
Forgery 14.6 91.1 346 
Counterfeiting 19.0 95.3 399 

Other offenses 19.6 mo 90.2% 1,581 
Burglary 27.2 86.6 88 
LarcenyC 16.8 94.2 938 
Motor vehicle theft 22.6 85.4 227 
Arson 38.8 74.1 39 
Transportation of stolen J'roperty 28.3 76.3 185 
Other property offenses 8.5 98.7 104 

Drug offenses 29.7 mo 80.9% 8,012 
Trafficking 30.7 79.1 7,590 
Possession and other 10.3 112.6 422 

Public order offenses 8.6mo 97.4% 11,553 

Regulatory offenses 18.2 mo 93.2% 503 

Other offenses 8.1 mo 97.5% 11,050 
Weapons 20.9 97.2 1,249 
Immigration offenses 4.1 100.5 7,804 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 12.0 76.7 466 
Bribery 11.5 87.0 82 
Perjury 13.2 90.6 70 
National defense 20.7 91.9 25 
Escape 18.4 96.7 175 
Racketeering and extortion 31.2 71.4 497 
Gambling offenses - - 2 
Uquor offenses - - 2 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 24.8 82.2 72 
Traffic 2.0 100.1 452 
Migratory birds 7.3 102.5 35 
Other 13.9 112.3 119 

Note: Total includes prisoners whose offense category could b May include some nonviolent offenses. 
not be determined. C Excluding transportation of stolen property. 
-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. d Excluding fraudulent property offenses; including 
a Includes 790 releases for which the time served until first destruction of property and trespass. 

release was unknown. See data notes 11 and 12. 
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Table 5.7 Average time served to first release, by sentence length and offense, for prisoners released In 1990 

Mean time served 

Sentenc~ All Violent 
Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

Imposed offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

12 mo 13 mo 13 mo 11 mo 12 mo 14 mo 12 mo 14 mo 
24 20 23 18 21 21 20 21 
36 26 30 23 24 27 25 26 
48 32 36 28 30 32 33 
60 39 42 33 39 39 41 39 
72 44 51 38 41 44 40 
84 48 58 44 46 
96 51 65 41 49 49 52 

108 53 50 
120 59 71 51 59 55 56 
144 64 79 58 60 
180 76 BB 73 72 64 
240 98 109 76 
300 121 126 

-Too few cases to obtain statistically reliable data. a Sentence for the single most serious offense. See 

".No cases of this type occurred In the data. data notes 11 and 12. 
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Table 5.8 Admissions and releases of Federal prisoners, by offense, 1990 

Prisoners received Prisoners released Net 
Most serious original Population at Population at population 
offense of conviction start of year District court All other First release All other end of year change 

All offense. 52,568 32,487 11,125 26,955 12,236 56,989 4,421 

Violent offen.e. 10,180 1,544 1,508 1,585 2,090 9,557 -623 
Murder/manslaughter 1,379 85 118 80 269 1,233 -146 
Assault 2,130 370 342 428 450 1,964 ·166 
Robbery 5,426 926 862 907 1,149 5,158 ·268 
Rape 328 6 48 21 75 286 -42 
Other sex offenses 418 108 79 90 75 440 22 
Kidnaping 447 33 26 35 41 430 ·17 
Other violent offenses 52 16 33 24 31 46 -6 

Property offen.e. 8,554 5,309 3,821 5,653 4,096 7,935 -619 

Fraudulent offense. 5,260 3,978 2,385 4,072 2,438 5,113 ·147 
Embezzlement 484 421 382 415 405 467 ·17 
Fraud (excluding tax fraud) 3,564 3,006 1,372 2,912 1,325 3,705 141 
Forgery 668 249 403 346 488 486 ·182 
Counterfeiting 544 302 228 399 220 455 ·89 

Other offens •• 3,294 1,331 1,436 1,581 1,658 2,822 -472 
Burglary 514 84 130 88 198 442 -72 
Larceny 1,660 785 1,013 938 1,131 1,389 ·271 
Motor vehicle theft 450 167 102 227 121 371 -79 
Arson 164 47 15 39 14 173 9 
Transportation of stolen property 379 160 106 185 107 353 ·26 
Other property offenses 127 88 70 104 87 94 ·33 

Drug offen.e. 25,309 13,326 3,029 8,012 3,182 30,470 5,161 
Trafficking 24,852 12,856 2,686 7,590 2,815 29,989 5,137 
Possession and other 457 470 343 422 367 481 24 

Public order offen.e. 8,090 12,147 1,971 11,553 2,070 8,585 495 

Regulatory offen.e. 733 539 225 503 249 745 12 

Other offen •• s 7,357 11,608 1,746 11,050 1,821 7,840 483 
Weapons 2,489 1,843 495 1,249 505 3,073 584 
Immigration offenses 1,863 7,678 284 7,804 293 1,728 ·135 
Tax law violations 

including tax fraud 490 480 160 466 159 505 15 
Bribery 69 91 26 82 29 75 6 
Perjury 79 81 28 70 29 89 10 
National defense 54 26 14 25 13 56 2 
Escape 350 177 80 175 104 ~28 ·22 
Racketeering and extortion 1,507 551 102 497 126 1,537 30 
Gambling offenses 3 5 ° 2 2 4 1 
Uquor offenses 4 2 ° 2 1 3 ·1 
Mail or transport of 

obscene material 124 63 20 72 16 119 ·5 
Traffic 130 453 452 452 464 119 ·11 
Migratory birds 16 36 18 35 14 21 5 
Other 179 122 67 119 66 183 4 

Other prisoners * 435 161 796 152 798 442 7 

* Offense not classifiable, or not a violation of U.S. Code. 
See data notes 11, 12 and 13. 
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Methodology 

The source of data for all tables In 
this compendium is the BJS Federal 
justice database maintained by Abt 
Associates Inc. The database is 
presently constructed from source 
files provided by the Executive Office 
for U.S. Attorneys, the Administrative 
Office of the U.S. Courts, the Pretrial 
Services Agency (PSA), the United 
States Sentencing Commission, and 
the U.S. Bureau of Prisons. Federal 
law prohibits the use of these flies for 
any purposes other than research or 
statistics. 

Records In the Federal justice data­
base are matched according to a sta­
tistically weighted combination of 
names, other personal identifiers, 
dates of court appearances, types of 
offenses, and other relevant informa­
tion contained in the files. Using the 
matched data flies, it is possible to 
combine information about two or 
more stages of the processing of a 
criminal matter or case, for example 
from adjudication to probation or pa­
role supervision. 

The unit of analysis in the tables In 
chapters 1 to 4 Is a combination of a 
person (or corporation) and a matter 
or case. For example, if a single per­
son Is involved in three different crimi­
nal cases during the time period 
specified In the table, he or she is 
counted three times in the tabulation. 
Similarly, 11 a single criminal case In­
volves a corporate defendant and 
four Individual defendants, It counts 
five times In the tabulation. In chap­
ter 5, the unit of analysis for Incarcer­
ation, probation, parole, or other su­
pervised release Is a person entering 
custody or supervision, or a person 
leaving custody or supervision. For 
example, a person who is committed 
once to the custody of the U.S. Bu­
reau of Prisons concurrently upon 
conviction on two cases in the indicat­
ed time period Is counted as one ad­
mission to a term of Incarceration In 
the tabulation. A person who term 1-

nates probation twice In the Indicated 
time period (e.g. with a violation and 
again after reinstatement) is counted 
as two terminations of probation. (In 
previous years' compendia, the tables 
showed the numbers of persons ter­
minating supervision.) 

Wherever possible, matters or cases 
have been selected according to some 
event which occurred during calendar 
year 1990 (January 1, 1990, through 
December 31, 1990). Some data 
files provided by source agencies are 
organized according to different time 
frames (fiscal years or statistical 
years); these have been combined 
and extracted into calendar years for 
purposes of this compendium. Fur­
ther, files which are organized by their 
source agencies according to calen­
dar year nonetheless Include some 
pertinent records in later years' files. 
For example, tabuiations of cases 
terminated during calendar year 1990 
in this compendium have been as­
sembled from source files containing 
records of 1990 terminations which 
were entered Into the data system 
during 1990 or 1991. Unless other­
wise noted, data tables describe the 
calendar year 1990. 

The availability of particular items of 
Information is affected by the data 
source. Data on prosecutors' deci­
sions prior to court filing are provided 
for cases investigated by U.S. attof­
neys, but not for those handled by the 
Criminal Division of the U.S. Depart­
ment of Justice. Criminal Division 
cases enter the data base once they 
are filed in U.S. district court, howev­
er. Many items of social and demo­
graphic information come from pre­
sentence investigation records or 
supervision records, and are available 
only for arrested defendants who 
were convicted and/or began serving 
a sentence involving supervised re­
lease. (This particulariy affects sex, 
race, ethnicity, and prior record Infor­
mation.) 

• 
The offense classification procedure 

used in this compendium is based on 
the classification system followed by 
the Administrative Office of the U.S. 
Courts. SpecifiC offenses in the Ad· 
ministratlve Office classification are 
combined to form the BJS categories 
shown in the compendium tables.* 
For data sources that Include United 
States Code citations, but do not in­
clude the Administrative Office of­
fense classifications, United States 
Code titles and sections are translat­
ed Into the Administrative Office clas­
sification system and then aggregated 
into the offense categories used in 
the tables. Offense categories for 
prisoners In chapter 5 are based on 
combinations of offense designations 
used by the Bureau of Prisons. They 
are similar to the categories In other 
chapters and other tables in chapter 
5, but may not be directly compara­
ble. 

Where more than one offense is 
charged or adJUdicated, the most seri­
ous offense (the one that mayor did 
result In the most severe sentence) is 
used in classification. Prisoners are 
classified according to the offense 
which actually bears the longest in­
carceration sentence. The offense 
description may change as the crimi­
nal Justice process proceeds. Tables 
indicate whether investigated, charged 
or adjudicated offenses are used. 

Tables 1.1, 1.2, and 1.4 in chapter 1 
and table 3.4 In chapter 3 used a dif­
ferent classification of racketeering 
offenses than in earlier years of this 
compendium. From 1984 to 1989, 
some matters received or concluded 
as racketeering offenses were cate-

"'These categories correspond to thC;l BjS 
crime definitions and, to the extent 
possible, are organized and presented 
consistent with 8JS publications on State 
criminal Justice systems. 
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gorlzed according to their predicate 
offense (e.g. murder), or were Includ­
ed only In the total of "all offenses· If 
the predicate offense was unknown In 
the source data. Beginning In the 
1990 compendium, racketeering of­
fenses are Included In the category 
"racketeering and extortion." 

Tables concerning prisoners in chap­
ter 5 distinguish between prisoners 
committed by U.S. district courts for 
violations of the U.S. Code and other 
prisoners. Prisoners released after 
commitment from U.S. district court 
are called "first releases." The other 
admissions and releases Include of­
fenders who are returning to prison 
after their first release, such as pro­
bation, parole, or supervised release 
violators, offenders convicted in other 
courts, such as military or District of 
Columbia courts, and persons admit­
ted to prison as material witnesses or 
for purposes of treatment, examina­
tion, or transfer to another authority. 
Offenders who enter or leave a prison 
temporarily, e.g. for purposes of tran­
sit to another location, for health care, 
or to serve a weekend sentence, are 
not counted as admitted or released. 
Persons who are detained for purpos­
es of deportation by the INS and who 
are not criminal offenders are also not 
Included In the tables. Unlike BJS 
publications concerning State prison­
ers, which exclude prisoners serving 
sentences under one year, compendi­
um tables Include Federal prisoners 
who received sentences of any 
length. 

lime served In prison Is the number 
of months from the prisoner's arrival 
into custody of the Bureau of Prisons 
until first release from prison, plus 
any jail time served and credited. The 
calculation Is the same as that cur­
rently used by the Bureau of Prisons. 
Because other publications may In­
clude different groups of prisoners, 
clalculate time served differently, or 
use a different offense classification, 
compendium tables may differ from 
estimates of time served In previous 
publications by the Bureau of Prisons 
or in publications based on other data 
sources. 

The tables In the compendium are 
constructed to permit the user to 
make valid comparisons of numbers 
within each table and to compare per­
centage rates across tables. The to­
tal numbers of subjects In compendi­
um tables that are based on records 
linked between two flies are generally 
less than the total number of records 
either source file. Accordingly, com­
parisons of absolute numbers across 
two or more tables, or between tables 
In this volume and other data sources, 
are not necessarily valid. 
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Data notes 

1) Figure 2 refers to 109,948 sus­
pects investigated by U.S. attor­
neys in matters terminated in 1990 
(table 1.2). Sixty-eight percent of 
these suspects were prosecuted 
either in U.S. district court (60,521 
= 55%) or before a U.S. magistrate 
(14,188 = 13%). Since conviction 
data refer to a different cohort of 
defendants (those whose cases 
were terminated), and are classi­
fied by different offenses, statistical 
estimates are used for determining 
the length of the remaining hori­
zontal bars In the figure. Judges 
convicted 81 % of defendants in 
cases terminated In 1990 (60,521 x 
81 % = 48,962) (table 3.1). Magis­
trates convicted 63% of defen­
dants (14,188 x 63% = 8,956) (ta­
ble 3.4). The combined conviction 
rate is 53% of suspects investigat­
ed [(48,962 + 8,956)/109,948)] 

Of offenders convicted in U.S. dis­
trict court, 60% were sentenced to 
Incarceration (48,962 x 60% = 
29,550) and 30% were sentenced 
to probation without Incarceration 
(table 4.1) (48,962 x 30% = 
14,787). These are, respectively, 
27% (29,550/109,948) and 13% 
(14,787/109,948) of the suspects 
investigated. Sentences imposed 
after magistrate convictions are not 
Included, but magistrates normally 
impose fines rather than sentences 
of probation or incarceration. 

2) In chapter 1 tables 1.1, 1.2, 1.3, 
1.4, and 1.5 and in chapter 3 table 
3.4 were created from the docket 
and reporting data files of the Ex­
ecutive Office for U.S. Attorneys. 
Only records which showed a mat­
ter received in 1990 were selected 
for table 1.1. Only records which 
showed a matter terminated or 
filed as a case in 1990 were select­
ed for tables 1.2-1.5 and 3.4. The 
statistics in these tables corre­
spond to those published for 1990 

. In Federal Criminal Case Process­
ing,1980-90: With Preliminary 
Data for 1991. 

3) Offenses in the docket and report­
ing data files are classified by the 
TItle and Section of the United 
States Code for the most serious 
offense investigated. For tables in 
this compendium, these citations 
were translated into the corre­
sponding 4-digit offense codes 
used by the Administrative Office 
of the United States Courts. These 
4-digit codes were then aggregated 
Into the categories shown in the 
tables. U.S. Code citations often 
do not permit detailed classification 
of drug offenses by type of criminal 
activity involved. A person charged 
with conspiracy is classified under 
the SUbstantive offense alleged (for 
example, conspiracy to defraud is 
classified as a fraud) unless the 
type of conspiracy cannot be de­
termined from the U.S. Code cita­
tion. Unclassified conspiracies are 
included among ·conspiracy, aiding 
and abetting, traffic, and jurisdic­
tional offenses" in tables 1.1, 1.2, 
and 1.4, and In the corresponding 
district tables. 

4) In chapter 2 all tables were created 
from the Pretrial Services Agency 
data files. Information is obtained 
from defendants during a Pretrial 
Services Interview, but some de­
fendants are not interviewed be­
cause they refUse the interview or 
for other reasons. Tables include 
these noninterviewed defendants 
in the totals and include detail for 
them if data are available from 
sources other than intervieWS. 

5) I n chapter 2 tables 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 
and 2.6 were created from the Pre­
trial Services Agency data files. 
Only records scheduled for a pre­
trial interview in 1990 were select­
ed. In total, 41,764 defendants 

were scheduled for Interview, but 
data are Incomplete for some de­
fendants. 

6) Tables 2.4 and 2.5 in chapter 2 
were created from the Pretrial Ser­
vices Agency data files. Data de­
scribe defendants whose pretrial 
services were term inated in 1990. 

7) Tables 3.1 and 3.2 in chapter 3 and 
tables 4.1, 4.2, and 4.3 in chapter 
4 were derived from the Adminis­
trative Office master data files. 
Only records with cases terminated 
in 1990 were selected. 

8) Table 3.3 in chapter 3 and tables 
4.4 and 4.5 in chapter 4 were cre­
ated by matching the Administra­
tive Office master data files with 
the United States SentenCing 
Commission monitoring system 
files, which Include records for sen­
tences imposed under guidelines 
only. Previous years' compendia 
Included also information about 
characteristics of offenders who 
were not sentenced under guide­
lines, but during calendar year 
1990 Federal agencies other than 
the Sentencing Commission dis­
continued recording of data about 
convicted offender characteristics. 
Since the sentencing guidelines 
are effective for offenses commit­
ted after November 1, 1987, the 
offenders whose characteristics 
are Included in these tables for 
1990 are disproportionately offend­
ers whose court cases were com­
pleted rapidly. Further, Juvenile 
offenders are not subject to guide­
lines and are no longer Included In 
tables showing offender character­
Istics. Records were Included in 
the tables if the relevant Informa­
tion was available from either 
source. Administrative Office mas­
ter data file records which did not 
contain the relevant information 
and did not correspond to a Sen-
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• 
tenclng Commission record are 
excluded from the tabulated items. 
Tables Indicate the number of 
records for which relevant data 
were available. 

9) I n chapter 5 tables 5.1-5.4 were 
created from the probation and 
parole data files. Only records with 
one or more terminations of super­
vision in 1990 were selected. Such 
termination was counted separate­
ly. Technical violations and termi­
nations for new crimes are shown 
only if supervision terminated with 
incarceration or removal from ac­
tive supervision for reason of a vio­
lation. Previous years' compendia 
included all instances In which a 
violation or new crime was noted in 
the record, whether or not supervi­
sion was terminated for this rea­
son. Furthe!, earlier years' tables 
counted only the first instance of 
supervision suspension for an of­
fender in a calendar year; the 1990 
tables have been revised to show 
every instance of supervision ter­
mination during 1990. For both 
these reasons, the 1990 tables are 
not directly comparable with earlier 
years'tables. Under 1 percent of 
offenders under supervision experi­
enced 2 or more supervision termi­
nations In 1990. 

10) I n chapter 5, table 5.5 was creat­
ed from the probation and parole 
data files. Records with supervi­
sion opened or reinstated in 1990 
and having twelve or more months 
of supervision were selected. 

11) In chapter 5 tables 5.6, 5.7, and 
5.B, prisoners and the lengths of 
their sentences are classified ac­
cording to the offense associated 
with the longest single sentence 
actually imposed. (Classifications 
in other tables are based on the 
longest potential sentence allowed 
by law.) Prisoners serving con-

secutive sentences may have total 
imposed sentences exceeding the 
longest single sentence length. 
Accordingly, the time actually 
served can exceed the longest sin­
gle imposed sentence. 

Offense categories in tables 5.6, 
5.7, and 5.8 are based on combi­
nations of offense designations 
used by the Bureau of Prisons. 
They are similar to the categories 
in other tables in this compendium, 
but may not be directly compara­
ble. Offenses for some prisoners 
admitted or released could not be 
classified; these offenders are in­
cluded in the totals and are shown 
as "other prisoners" on the last line 
of tables. lime served is the num­
ber of months from the prisoner's 
arrival into custody of the Bureau 
of Prisons until first release from 
prison, plus any jail time served 
and credited. The calculation is 
the same as that currently used by 
the Bureau of Prisons. Other pub­
lications may include different 
groLJps of prisoners, calculate time 
served differently, or use a different 
offense classification, and conse­
quently their estimates of time 
served may differ from those in 
tables 5.6 and 5.7. 

12) Tables 5.6 and 5.7 include only 
prisoners committed by U.S. dis­
trict courts and received by the 
Bureau of Prisons in 1990. Prison­
ers committed by U.S. district 
courts but not for a violation of the 
U.S. code, or whose offense could 
not be classified, are included in 
the total but are not shown sepa­
rately. (Table 5.8, however, shows 
the number of these prisoners.) 
Other prisoners, such as probation 
and parole violators and prisoners 
committed by other courts such as 
courts martial or District of Colum­
bia Superior court, are excluded in 
tables 5.6 and 5.7, as are other 
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persons admitted to prison but not 
committed from a court. Unlike 
BJS publications concerning State 
prisoners, which exclude prisoners 
serving sentences under one year, 
tables 5.6,5.7, and 5.8 Include 
Federal prisoners who received 
sentences of any length. 

13) In chapter 5 table 5.8 shows all 
persons admitted to custody of the 
U.S. Bureau of Prisons in 1990 or 
released from custody in 1990. A 
single person may be counted in 
one or more columns of the table. 
The column heading "first release" 
refers to prisoners whose commit­
ment to the U. S. Bureau of Pris­
ons was by a U.S. district court 
and who were first released in 
1990. Prisoners counted In this 
column are the same as the pris­
oners included in tables 5.6 and 
5.7, except that table 5.8 shows as 
a separate line, as well ~s in the 
total, prisoners committed by a 
U.S. district court but not for a vio­
lation of the U.S. code, or whose 
offense could not be classified. 
Other columns in tabte 5.8 include 
prisoners who were committed by 
other courts, returned to prison for 
violation of the conditions of super­
vision, or were received for exami­
nation, treatment, or transfer to 
another jurisdiction. About 7% of 
these prisoners cannot be classi­
fied into Federal offense catego­
ries. (This figure is not comparable 
with earlier years' compendia be­
cause the methods for classifying 
source data offense codes were 
improved for the present compen­
dium.) Offenders returning to pris­
on for violation of the conditions of 
supervision, without a new court 
commitment, are classified accord­
ing to the offense with the longest 
single sentence originally imposed 
at conviction. 
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Table 0-1.1 Suspects In criminal matters received by U.S. attorneys, by offense, 1990 

Most serious offense Investigated 

Total All Violent 
Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

District suspects* offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

~II districts 111,118 100.0% 4.8% 26.5% 3.2% 30.3% 7.6% 27.5% 

Alabama, Middle 480 100.0% 3.1% 29.4% 5.0% 18.7% 8.4% 35.4% 
Alabama, Northern 798 100.0 3.4 32.6 5.6 27.9 7.8 22.6 
Alabama, Southern 522 100.0 1.2 23.6 1.9 49.1 7.0 17.2 
Alaska 231 100.0 7.0 23.1 6.1 33.2 7.0 23.6 
Arizona 3,224 100.0 9.7 16.7 2.0 31.8 3.1 36.7 

Arkansas, Eastern 675 100.0% 1.9% 32.2% 5.1% 41.8% 4.5% 14.5% 
Arkansas, Western 244 100.0 6.2 34.9 8.3 15.8 7.9 27.0 
California, Central 3,379 100.0 10.7 37.0 2.9 23.6 3.7 22.1 
California, Eastern 1,421 100.0 8.3 30.8 5.6 20.9 3.B 30.6 
California, Northern 1,921 100.0 8.5 32.3 2.1 21.6 '11.2 24:3 

California, Southern 7,934 100.0% 1.8% 6.1% .8% 17.7% 2.8% 70.7% 
Colorado 1,002 100.0 3.8 37.1 1.7 25.4 5.4 26.7 
Connecticut 704 100.0 5.9 42.2 2.6 19:9 3.9 25.5 
Delaware 277 100.0 2.6 17.9 3.3 39.9 5.5 30.8 
District of Columbia 697 100.0 4.9 28.6 .4 55.6 3.0 7.3 

Florida, Middle 3,244 100.0% 4.8% 27.3% 3.2% 42.3% 4.9% 17.5% 
Florida, Northern 798 100.0 7.5 25.9 1.7 .37.5 6.7 ·20.7 
Florida, Southern 3,957 100.0 3.1 17.5 3.2 49.9 5.7 20.6 
Georgia, Middle 577 100.0 4.9 31.4 2.1 32.0 5.1 24.4 
Georgia, Northern 1,235 100.0 4.6 31.7 4.6 21.1 6.5 31.5 

Georgia, Southern 672 100.0% 4.8% 18.8% 3.3% 29.1% 6.7% 37.3% 
Guam 232 100.0 3.5 45.0 .9 14.7 1.3 34.6 
Hawaii 593 100.0 6.7 25.8 9.0 35.2 5.6 17.7 
Idaho 383 100.0 8.4 35.9 5.8 9.2 4.7 35.9 
Illinois, Central 631 100.0 4.1 34.7 3.0 30.1 4.0 24.1 

Illinois, Northern 2,586 100.0% 4.4% 41.3% 5.4% 20.8% 8.9% 19.1% 
Illinois, Southern 491 100.0 3.3 26.0 3.5 32.4 14.8 20.0 
Indiana, Northern 521 100.0 3.5 32.3 6.9 25.8 7.7 23.8 
Indiana, Southern 614 100.0 8.3 41.7 2.3 11.5 6.7 29.4 
Iowa, Northern 389 100.0 4.5 28.4 2.9 44.5 5.5 14.2 

Iowa, Southern 412 100.0% 7.1% 26.5% '1.7% 44.7% 4.9% 15.0% 
Kansas 666 100.0 4.8 36.0 .8 30.8 6.5 21.1 
Kentucky, Eastern 602 100.0 2.5 22.4 5.0 43.6 12.7 13.7 
Kentucky, Western 802 100.0 6.1 29.1 2.7 31.7 5.9 24.5 
Louisiana, Eastern 1,601 100.0 1.7 26.8 3.0 18.0 20.1 30.5 

Louisiana, Middle 285 100.0% 2.5% 39.5% 1.1% 3.2% 26.0% 27.8% 
Louisiana, Western 1,563 100.0 1.6 13.5 .2.3 14.3 16.6 51.7 
Maine 424 100.0 2.6 18.3 '5.0 47.7 5.0 21.4 
Maryland 1,371 100.0 7.0 22.9 1.5 31.0 4.6 33.1 
Massachusetts 1,203 100.0 7.2 29.1 1.8 25.9 9.5 26.6 

Michigan, Eastern 2,501 100.0% 3.6% 30.1% 3.5% 29.0% 4.4% 29.4% 
Michigan, Western 423 100.0 6.0 35.8 6.3 25.2 5.5 21.2 
Minnesota 826 100.0 6.3 35.6 3.2 29.4 3.7 21.9 
Mississippi, Northern 754 100.0 2.1 20.0 1.7 20.0 34.3 21.8 

Mississippi, Southern 1,240 100.0% 3.5% 35.2% 2.2%· 13.2% 29.4% 16.6% 
Missouri, Eastern 967 100.0 4.3 24.9 3.6 33.2 14.1 19.8 
Missouri, Western 874 100.0 4.0 28.1 2.9 50.1 3.8 11.1 
Montana 630 100.0 8.1 26.5 6.6 19.7 10.0 29.0 
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Table 0-1.1 Continued 
Most serious offense investigated 

Total All Violent 
Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

District susE!ects* offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Rel!ulato!y Other 

Nebraska 499 100.0% 6.3% 35.1% 2.3% 26.7% 4.6% 25.0% 
Nevada 1,147 100.0 7.4 39.2 3.9 16.9 4.5 28.1 
New Hampshire 416 100;0 5.1 26.5 2.4 33.0 4.4 28.6 
New Jersey 2,315 100.0 2.3 44.1 6.7 17.8 12.3 16.8 
New Mexico 1,343 100.0 5.5 20.3 4.0 36.9 2.5 30.7 

New York, Eastern 3,325 100.0% 2.7% 24.1% 2.4% 48.7% 6.4% 15.6% 
New York, Northern 952 100.0 4.7 28.1 1.5 34.0 7.6 24.1 
New York, Southern 2,615 100.0 3.5 30.9 3.6 36.5 6.2 19.3 
New York, Western 1,243 100.0 3.1 31.4 1.7 29.1 9.1 25.6 
North Carolina, Eastern 747 ·100.0 7.0 33.2 5.6 30.5 4.0 19.7 

North Carolina, Middle 931 100.0% 7.8% 19.5% 3.5% 50.6% 4.2% 14.5% 
North Carolina, Western 1,106 100.0 8.2 18.3 2.8 42.2 9.2 19.2 
North Dakota 477 100.0 16.8 35.0 5.7 15.1 5.1 22.3 
Northern Mariana Islands 19 100.0 0 63.2 0 15.8 5.3 15.8 
Ohio, Northern 1,414 100.0 6.2 25.3 3.5 24.S 11.7 28.3 

Ohio, Southern 1,309 100.0% 6.1% 33.8% 4.9% 29.8% 7.0% 18.4% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 198 100.0 2.6 34.4 7.8 27.1 3.1 25.0 
Oklahoma, Northern 358 100.0 4.4 43.3 3.5 26.0 6.1 16.7 
Oklahoma, Western 505 100.0 3.2 35.2 4.0 24.7 12.3 20.4 
Oregon 1,068 100.0 10.9 16.2 4.9 42.0 4.6 21.4 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 1,m 100.0% 2.9% 31.9% 2.7% 35.0% 6.1% 21.4% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 721 100.0 5.3 29.3 3.9 27.6 6.9 27.0 
Pennsylvania, Western 752 100.0 4.4 36.6 5.4 19.3 13.3 21.0 
Puerto Rico 922 100.0 2.0 30.3 .9 34.8 9.1 23.0 
Rhode Island 379 100.0 4.8 31.9 .3 38.8 5.6 18.6 

South Carolina 1,732 100.0% 4.4% 30.5% 3.7% 22.8% 14.8% 23.9% 
South Dakota 528 100.0 33.0 15.5 14.0 15.3 4.6 17.6 
Tennessee, Eastern 965 100.0 5.6 28.5 6.4 33.8 6.5 19.3 
Tennessee, Middle 830 100.0 4.2 40.7 6.9 8.2 10.6 29.5 
Tennessee, Western 1,074 100.0 5.3 34.8 3.6 32.0 7.5 16.8 

Texas, Eastern 838 100.0% 2.3% 31.7% 2.8% 29.3% 16.9% 17.0% 
Texas, Northern 2,100 100.0 3.3 36.9 7.1 18.6 8.2 25.8 
Texas, Southern 4,887 100.0 1.4 19.5 2.1 40.2 12.5 24.4 
Texas, Western 3,066 100.0 2.5 20.6 2.3 45.1 3.4 26.1 
Utah 906 100.0 5.2 35.3 1.5 16.7 6.9 34.3 

Vermont 358 100.0% 3.7% 28.7% 2.2% 25.0% 7.0% 33.4% 
Virgin Islands 688 100.0 .5 12.7 3.9 18.5 47.1 17.4 
Virginia, Eastern 2,706 100.0 6.3 27.8 2.4 24.6 2.5 36.4 
Virginia, Western 639 100.0 2.7 18.4 2.4 44.9 5.7 26.0 
Washington, Eastern 675 100.0 8.2 15.7 3.5 23.3 3.2 46.1 

Washington, Western 1,636 100.0% 6.7% 22.9% 2.7% 35.2% 6.1% 26.4% 
West Virginia, Northern 366 100.0 3.6 21.8 3.4 42.9 3.9 24.4 
West Virginia, Southern 1,386 100.0 2.2 22.4 3.3 49.7 7.0 15.4 
Wisconsin, Eastern 706 100.0 8.4 24.6 4.5 35.2 6.2 21.1 
Wisconsin, Western 299 100.0 5.4 32.9 3.1 32.2 7.8 18.6 
Wyoming 319 100.0 9.1 29.3 3.5 23.0 10.1 24.9 

* Data describe suspectsln crllnlnal ma&tara .recelved by U.S. See text table 1 .1. 
attorneys in 1990. Inc.lude. suspects lor \Alborn offense 
category could not be de1ermifted. 
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Table 0-1.2 Suspects In criminal cases prosecuted, by offense, 1990 

Most serious offense investigated 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses suspects In All Violent Drug 

District cases filed* offenses t,ffenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All district. 60,521 100.0% 5.7% 23.9% 3.4% 42.0% 4.6% 20.4% 

Alabama, Middle 228 100.0% 4.8% 29.8% 8.3% 32.0% 8.8% 16.2% 
Alabama, Northern 406 100.0 5.5 26.3 5.3 33.8 5.0 24.3 
Alabama, Southern 473 100.0 .8 20.8 .6 61.4 5.5 10.8 
Alaska 123 100.0 7.~' 17.9 3.3 36.6 7.3 27.6 
Arizona 1,731 100.0 11.7' 14.5 1.8 49.7 2.9 19.4 

Arkansas, Eastern 404 100.0% 2.2% 23.6% 5.5% 58.0% 2.0% 8.7% 
Arkansas, Western 146 100.0 9.6 28.8 4.1 25.3 10.3 21.9 
California, Central 1,890 100.0 15.9 30.3 3.2 29.6 4.0 17.1 
California, Eastern 893 100.0 8.9 22.1 4.3 35.4 2.3 27.1 
California, Northern 731 100.0 12.4 32.9 1.1 28.4 5.9 19.3 

California, Southern 2,260 100.0% 5.2% 11.0% 1.7% 51.0% 3.7% 27.4% 
Colorado 473 100.0 5.4 35.0 1.1 31.8 4.5 22.3 
Connecticut 419 100.0 6.6 29.6 5.1 33.5 4.9 20.4 
Delaware 204 100.0 2.5 21.0 2.0 49.5 4.0 21.0 
District of Columbia 292 100.0 1.0 11.8 .7 80.6 1.0 4.8 

Florida, Middle 1,916 100.0% 4.5% 19.8% 2.9% 57.9% 2.5% 12.3% 
Florida, Northern 520 100.0 3.9 22.0 1.4 54.7 4.1 14.0 
Florida, Southern 2,498 100.0 4.0 15.2 3.6 55.8 3.9 17.4 
Georgia, Middle 362 100.0 6.6 20.2 2.2 47.1 5.3 18.6 
Georgia, Northern 835 100.0 6.8 29.7 5.7 33.9 3.6 20.3 

Georgia, Southern 324 100.0% 3.9% 18.4% 6.9% 44.9% 6.9% 19.0% 
Guam 106 100.0 5.7 43.8 0 15.2 1.0 34.3 
Hawaii 371 100.0 8.4 21.1 i1.4 43.4 4.3 11.4 
Idaho 148 100.0 5.5 28.3 4.1 22.8 6.2 33.1 
Illinois, Central 423 100.0 5.0 27.5 1.4 37.9 2.6 25.6 

Illinois, Northern 1,395 100.0% 4.7% 36.2% 6.7% 29.5% 4.5% 18.5% 
Illinois, Southern 279 100.0 3.0 26.2 5.9 43.9 3.3 17.7 
Indiana, Northern 335 100.0 4.2 29.6 3.3 31.0 1.5 30.4 
Indiana, Southern 318 100.0 9.2 39.7 3.5 24.4 2.9 20.3 
Iowa, Northern 203 100.0 3.0 27.0 1.5 46.5 6.0 16.0 

Iowa, Southern 241 100.0% 10.0% 19.1% 1.7% 56.4% 1.7% 11.2% 
Kansas 321 100.0 9.7 31.0 0 38.9 1.9 18.5 
Kentucky, Eastern 428 100.0 2.3 17.8 4.2 49.3 11.9 14.5 
Kentucky, Western 403 100.0 8.6 31.1 3.0 34.7 4.8 17.7 
Louisiana, Eastern 672 100.0 2.4 30.1 3.6 36.7 6.7 20.4 

Louisiana, Middle 49 100.0% 6.5% 80.4% 4.3% 2.2% o % 6.5% 
Louisiana, Western 298 100.0 4.5 36.9 3.1 32.4 4.5 18.5 
Maine 222 100.0 4.1 12.7 2.7 60.6 4.5 15.4 
Maryland 815 100.0 9.5 25.9 1.7 38.8 3.0 21.1 
Massachusetts 542 100.0 8.3 28.2 2.0 32.1 7.1 22.3 

Michigan, Eastern 1,296 100.0% 3.3% 29.9% 3.2% 37.8% 2.9% 22.9% 
Michigan, Western 285 100.0 7.4 29.1 4.6 31.2 5.7 22.0 
Minnesota 595 100.0 6.2 30.9 3.2 38.:3 5.2 16.2 
Mississippi, Northern 296 100.0 3.7 32.2 5.4 27.5 2.0 29.2 

Mississippi, Southern 400 100.0% 4.4% 38.1% 4.1% 20.5% 5.4% 27.5% 
Missouri, Eastern 457 100.0 4.4 27.1 4.2 44.5 5.9 13.9 
Missouri, Western 637 100.0 2.5 23.4 4.3 57.2 3.5 9.2 
Montana 372 100.0 9.6 25.3 4.7 23.4 10.2 26.7 
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Table 0·1.2 Continued 

Most serious offense investigated 

Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
suspects In All Violent Drug 

District casesfiled* offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses ReQulato~ Other 

Nebraska 301 100.0% 4.4% 30.6% 5.4% 37.7% 4.0% 17.8% 
Nevada 643 100.0 7.9 32.9 4.0 22.5 4.0 28.1 
New Hampshire 181 100.0 4.3 32.3 1.6 34.9 4.3 22.6 
New Jersey 941 100.0 3.1 35.4 15.6 26.1 8.1 11.6 
New Mexico 844 100.0 7.0 9.7 1.2 53.9 2.0 26.1 

New York, Eastern 1,783 100.0% 2.2% 18.4% 1.3% 56.2% 6.9% 14.9% 
New York, Northern 517 100.0 5.0 24.7 1.9 42.1 6.0 20.2 
New York, Southern 1,756 100.0 2.3 30.6 3.4 42.9 5.7 15.0 
New York, West~rn 407 100.0 5.3 22.2 .5 35.8 3.3 33.0 
North Carolina, Eastern 518 100.0 6.6 34.3 4.3 33.7 3.1 18.0 

North Carolina, Middle 657 100.0% 9.7% 16.3% 3.0% 55.6% 2.4% 12.9% 
North Carolina, Western 826 100.0 8.1 15.8 3.1 41.9 9.4 21.7 
North Dakota 217 100.0 18.6 35.8 4.2 22.3 3.7 15.3 
Northern Mariana Islands 2 100.0 0 100.0 0 0 0 0 
Ohio, Northern 687 100.0 6.6 31.5 4.3 30.4 3.2 24.0 

Ohio, Southern 707 100.0% 5.9% 31.6% 3.7% 38.3% 4.0% 16.6% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 90 100.0 3.3 40.0 8.9 34.4 2.2 11.1 
Oklahoma, Northern 290 100.0 4.8 45.2 4.0 27.2 6.3 12.5 
Oklahoma, Western 370 100.0 8.4 33.7 4.3 29.3 6.3 17.9 
Oregon 738 100.0 15.0 12.1 3.3 46.3 3.5 19.8 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 1,141 100.0% 2.7% 25.5% 1.7% 47.9% 2.8% 19.4% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 443 100.0 5.4 28.7 5.2 31.1 6.6 23.1 
Pennsylvania, Western 435 100.0 4.2 36.8 5.6 23.6 5.1 24.8 
Puerto Rico 666 100.0 1.5 29.1 .9 43.2 6.9 18.3 
Rhode Island 220 100.0 2.8 22.5 0 57.3 2.8 14.7 

South Carolina 874 100.0% 6.9% 27.4% 4.8% 31.1% 4.9% 24.8% 
South Dakota 338 100.0 32.6 15.4 12.4 16.3 4.5 18.7 
Tennessee, Eastern 610 100.0 7.8 23.7 6.0 35.4 6.0 21.2 
Tennessee, Middle 413 100.0 7.5 31.1 5.3 10.4 3.4 42.2 
Tennessee, Western 639 100.0 4.6 22.0 2.7 47.8 4.9 18.0 

Texas, Eastern 445 100.0% 3.2% 22.3% 3.9% 41.1% 9.1% 20.5% 
Texas, Northern 1,112 100.0 4.8 24.7 7.6 30.4 3.6 28.8 
Texas, Southern 4,038 100.0 1.4 19.6 2.1 49.9 4.2 22.8 
Texas, Western 2,067 100.0 2.0 16.5 1.6 54.2 2.6 23.1 
Utah 354 100.0 9.3 21.S 3.3 26.0 4.5 35.3 

Vermont 195 100.0% 1.0% 33.5% 1.5% 30.4% 4.1% 29.4% 
Virgin Islands 443 100.0 .5 13.6 .5 18.4 49.9 17.1 
Virginia, Eastern 1,153 100.0 6.9 27.6 2.0 40.5 2.8 20.2 
Virginia, Western 500 100.0 2.2 18.6 2.8 50.6 6.6 19.2 
Washington, Eastern 504 100.0 7.9 11.6 3.0 22.3 2.2 52.9 

Washington, Western 782 100.0% 7.5% 21.7% 1.7% 38.6% 3.4% 29.1% 
West Virginia, Northern 275 100.0 3.4 15.4 2.6 52.8 1.1 24.7 
West Virginia, Southern 545 100.0 2.2 13.8 1.1 69.9 1.9 11.0 
WIsconsin, Eastern 461 100.0 10.9 24.8 3.8 44.6 3.3 12.6 
WIsconsin, Western 172 100.0 4.7 31.8 4.7 39.4 2.9 16.5 
Wyoming 168 100.0 9.6 25.9 3.0 31.3 7.2 22.9 

* Data describe Iluspects In cases filed by U.S. attorneys In 1990. See text table 1.2. 
Includes suspects for whom offense category could not be determined. 
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Table 0-1.3 Suspects In matters declined, by offense, 1990 

Total Most serious offense investigated 
suspects Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

In matters All Violent 
District declined'" offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All dlatrlcta 35,239 100.0% 4.1% 37.4% 3.9% 18.6% 15.1% 20.9% 

Alabama, Middle 120 100.0% 1.7% 45.3% .9% 14.5% 9.4% 28.2% 
Alabama, Northem 383 100.0 2.4 42.4 6.6 22.5 13.3 12.7 
Alabama, Southem 155 100.0 2.6 53.9 4.5 13.6 10.4 14.9 
Alaska 69 100.0 7.4 39.7 4.4 17.6 10.3 20.6 
Arizona 648 100.0 17.8 28.6 5.6 18.1 9.4 20.6 

Arkansas, Eastern 312 100.0% 1.3% 48.9% 1.9% 27.5% 5.5% 14.9% 
Arkansas, Western 63 100.0 4.8 35.5 11.3 8.1 11.3 29.0 
California, Central 970 100.0 5.9 35.4 3.0 22.0 5.5 28.2 
Cali"rornia, Eastern 327 100.0 3.9 46.8 3.9 22.7 5.0 17.7 
California, Northern 795 100.0 6.2 32.6 1.7 14.0 28.7 16.9 

California, Southern 337 100.0% 2.1% 25.3% 2.4% 32.2% 10.5% 27.4% 
Colorado 468 100.0 3.3 42.1 5.5 15.7 8.1 25.3 
Connecticut 212 100.0 1.4 46.4 2.4 8.1 3.8 37.8 
Delaware 45 100.0 2.2 35.6 0 13.3 6.7 42.2 
District of Columbia 107 100.0 1.8.2 43.4 0 12.1 3.0 23.2 

Florida, Middle 1,154 100.0% 3.7% 36.7% 3.2% 29.9% 8.1% 18.4% 
Florida, Northem 272 100.0 8.7 30.9 1.1 24.9 15.8 18.5 
Florida, Southern 1,221 100.0 2.7 20.8 2.7 40.6 8.7 24.6 
Georgia, Middle 192 100.0 2.7 40.1 3.7 22.5 7.0 24.1 
Georgia, Northern 726 100.0 1.4 22.7 2.5 2.4 54.0 17.1 

Georgia, Southern 106 100.0% 5.8% 40.4% 9.6% 16.3% 6.7% 21.2% 
Guam 54 100.0 5.6 53.7 3.7 11.1 9.3 16.7 
Hawaii 164 100.0 3.7 34.6 1.9 27.8 5.6 26.5 
Idaho 181 100.0 8.0 44.6 6.3 2.9 13.7 24.6 
Illinois, Central 212 100.0 2.4 48.1 8.1 21.9 3.3 16.2 

Illinois, Northern 3,305 100.0% 3.4% 41.9% 6.7% 9.4% 10.7% 27.9% 
Illinois, Southern 211 100.0 1.9 28.5 3.4 18.8 32.9 14.5 
Indiana, Northern 174 100.0 4.0 42.2 1.7 6.9 6.4 38.7 
Indiana, Southern 243 100.0 8.0 54.4 5.5 8.4 7.2 16.5 
Iowa, Northern 201 100.0 3.0 46.7 2.5 31.5 7.1 9.1 

Iowa, Southern 90 100.0% 3.4% 47.7% 11.4% 8.0% 17.0% 12.5% 
Kansas 153 100.0 4.1 45.5 0 13.8 6.2 30.3 
Kentucky, Eastern 169 100.0 6.6 31.1 9.6 21.0 12.0 19.8 
Kentucky, Western 279 100.0 2.9 34.9 4.0 32.0 5.8 20.5 
Louisiana, Eastern 697 100.0 3.2 20.1 2.0 7.0 44.9 22.7 

Louisiana, Middle 160 100.0% 3.1% 45.9% 2.5% 3.8% 28.3% 16.4% 
Louisiana, Western 397 100.0 2.6 40.1 3.1 22.6 9.8 21.9 
Maine 208 100.0 1.5 12.3 2.9 70.6 5.4 7.4 
Maryland 393 100.0 7.2 32.6 1.0 34.9 5.9 18.3 
Massachusetts 522 100.0 4.7 34.2 3.3 20.4 14.5 22.9 

Michigan, Eastern 743 100.0% 2.5% 38.2% 5.3% 28.0% 7.3% 18.7% 
Michigan, Western 156 100.0 4.6 41.8 7.2 22.9 8.5 15.0 
Minnesota 217 100.0 5.1 35.3 5.6 20.5 12.1 21.4 
Mississippi, Northern 366 100.0 .8 12.7 .6 7.2 56.7 22.0 

Mississippi, Southern 582 100.0% 3.7% 36.7% 1.9% 7.0% 41.8% 8.9% 
Missouri, Eastern 554 100.0 3.0 40.3 1.9 21.3 23.2 10.3 
Missouri, Western 287 100.0 2.8 43.9 7.7 21.1 5.3 19.3 
Montana 87 100.0 10.5 41.9 2.3 9.3 10.5 25.6 
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Table 0-1.3 Continued 

Total Most serious offense investieated 
suspects Property offenses Public order offenses 
in matters All Violent Drug 

District declined· offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Reeulato!}: Other 

Nebraska 158 100.0% 5.3% 57.9% 2.6% 7.2% 13.8% 13.2% 
Nevada 402 100.0 3.0 56.0 2.8 6.3 10.8 21.3 
New Hampshire 206 100.0 i'.4 35.0 2.0 26.6 7.9 21.2 
New Jersey 727 100.0 2.1 51.1 1.3 9.5 17.7 18.4 
New Mexico 431 100,0 6,8 27,2 6.6 13.1 5.2 41.2 

New York. Eastern 760 100.0% 3.6% 32.0% 3.9% 39.6% 8.2% 12.7% 
New York. Northern 411 100.0 3.0 45.1 2.5 12.4 10.9 26.1 
New York. Southern 1.'02 100.0 2.9 44,9 6.0 15.3 9.7 21.2 
New York. Western 504 100.0 1.0 47.5 2.7 21.3 14.3 13.1 
North Carolina. Eastern 129 100.0 1.6 45.0 3.1 20,9 7.0 22.5 

North Carolina. Middle 126 100.0% 2.4% 35.0% 6.5% 31.7% 7.3% 17.1% 
North Carolina. Western 111 100.0 10.1 46.8 4.6 6.4 11.9 20.2 
North Dakota 134 100,0 13.6 41.7 4.5 10.6 8.3 21.2 
Northern Mariana Islands 5 100.0 0 60.0 0 0 0 40.0 
Ohio. Northern 775 100.0 6.9 31.4 3.8 19.3 9.7 28.9 

Ohio. Southern 508 100.0% 2.8% 46.4% 6.7% 24.5% 5.3% 14.2% 
Oklahoma. Eastern 75 100.0 2.9 47.1 8.6 14.3 7.1 20.0 
Oklahoma. Northern 35 100,0 0 43.8 0 18.8 9.4 28.1 
Oklahoma. Western 251 100.0 1.2 54.3 7.7 15,8 4.0 17.0 
Oregon 229 100.0 4.4 22.2 4.0 28.0 11.6 29,8 

Pennsylvania. Eastern 365 100.0% 4.4% 51.5% 2.2% 18.0% 5.0% 18,8% 
Pennsylvania. Middle 195 100.0 5.0 27.4 2.2 20.7 11.2 33.5 
Pennsylvania. Western 513 100.0 3.7 39.6 4.7 18.5 22.0 1 i.4 
Puerto Rico 231 100,0 2.6 54.8 3.5 5.7 11.4 21.9 
Rhode Island 80 100.0 7.5 35.0 1.3 13.8 28.8 13.8 

South Carolina 637 100.0% 3,5% 36.6% 5,5% 13,6% 18,7% 22.0% 
South Dakota 144 100.0 3B.7 14.8 15.5 17.6 2.8 10.6 
Tennessee. Eastern 250 100.0 .4 43.9 3.7 21.1 7.7 23.2 
Tennessee. Middle 200 100.0 0 59.5 3.0 8.0 16.0 13.5 
Tennessee. Western 310 100.0 4.5 62.5 4.9 5.B 6.8 15,5 

Texas. Eastern 383 100.0% 1.6% 39.4% 1.3% 18.6% 24.7% 14.4% 
Texas. Northern 840 100.0 1.8 43.9 4.0 14.2 18.9 17.2 
Texas. Southern 878 100.0 1.2 16.2 1.3 11.1 50,7 19.6 
Texas. Western 456 100.0 2.5 38.9 3.8 21.0 10.1 23.7 
Utah 266 100.0 4.2 50.4 2.9 4.6 17.1 20.8 

Vermont 65 100.0% 4.6% 27.7% 3.1% 21.5% 26.2% 16,9% 
Virgin Islands 95 100.0 0 8.1 1.2 15,1 72,1 3.5 
Virginia. Eastern 607 100,0 8.0 47.5 2.7 11.7 6.4 23,7 
Virginia. Western 63 100.0 3.3 27.9 4.9 23.0 13.1 27.9 
Washington. Eastern 89 100.0 6.B 36.4 11.4 9.1 25.0 11.4 

Washington. Western 742 100.0% 4.5% 26.7% 5.6% 24.6% 15.9% 22.8% 
West Virginia, Northern 202 100.0 1.0 34.7 .5 40.1 9.9 13.9 
West Virginia. Southern 673 100.0 3.2 26.5 .9 41.6 11.0 16.8 
Wisconsin. Eastern 156 100,0 B.6 40.8 3.9 13.8 7,9 25.0 
Wisconsin. Western 99 100,0 5.2 57,7 2.1 9.3 9.3 16.5 
Wyoming 134 100,0 5.2 44.0 1,5 6.7 14.2 28.4 

• Data describe suspects in criminal matters declined by U.S. See text table 1 .2, 
attorneys in 1990. Includes suspects for whom offense 
category could not be detennlned. 

District tables 67 



Table 0-2.1 Form of pretrial release or detention, 1990 

Percent of defendants who were: 
Released at any time on: Detalnedc 

Most serious Total Personal Unsecured Financial Without Financial 
offense charged defen<iantsa recognizance bond conditionsb ball conditions 

All district. 48.585 14.8% 30.0% 15.1% 36.5% 19.2% 

Alabama. Middle 261 .8% 86.6% 4.2% 13.0% 3.1% 
Alabama. Northern 275 1.1 66.9 10.2 25.8 5.8 
Alabama. Southern 238 45.4 16.0 8.8 38.7 7.1 
Alaska 140 52.9 22.9 10.0 15.0 6.4 
Arizona 2.384 25.3 10.7 9.0 49.7 9.9 

Arkansas, Eastern 267 74.9% 5.6% 7.9% 26.2% 4.9% 
Arkansas. Western 72 20.8 38.9 19.4 13.9 22.2 
California. Central 1.898 .8 23.7 23.8 39.9 27.4 
California. Eastern 581 11.4 7.4 18.8 66.8 16.5 
California. Northern 436 16.3 12.8 21.6 57.1 24.1 

California. Southern 1.259 4.0% 12.0% 19.0% 14.1% 63.9% 
Colorado 477 27.7 31.0 16.2 24.9 14.3 
Connecticut 289 2.1 52.9 12.8 37.7 9.3 
Delaware 130 13.8 49.2 10.8 32.3 6.9 
District of Columbia 4 25.0 75.0 0 75.0 0 

Florida. Middle 1.345 5.1% 37.2% 16.7% 40.5% 18.2% 
Florida. Northern 301 30.6 14.3 8.6 44.5 4.0 
Florida. Southern 2.375 .2 26.8 19.9 32.5 40.7 
Georgia. Middle 252 4.4 45.6 14.7 24.6 21.4 
Georgia. Northern 560 .9 41.4 26.4 29.1 23.9 

Georgia. Southern 322 34.8% 18.6% 25.2% 19.3% 23.9% 
Hawaii 206 4.9 35.4 15.5 52.4 16.0 
Idaho 132 43.9 19.7 1.5 43.9 0 
Illinois. Central 77 15.6 40.3 11.7 51.9 11.7 
illinois. Northern 755 .4 49.8 15.1 39.6 14.0 

Illinois. Southern 199 3.0% 63.8% 6.5% 24.6% 12.6% 
Indiana. Northern 245 20.0 54.7 4.1 29.4 2.4 
Indiana. Southern 288 31.6 28.8 7.6 35.1 2.4 
Iowa. Northern 109 33.0 47.7 6.4 15.6 1.8 
Iowa. Southern 172 .6 64.0 2.3 42.4 2.3 

Kansas 300 10.7% 49.7% 9.7% 31.7% 8.7% 
Kentucky. Eastern 298 7.4 44.6 30.2 18.5 18.1 
Kentucky. Western 308 2.9 77.9 2.6 26.0 1.9 
Louisiana. Eastern 590 1.0 57.5 12.4 31.7 16.3 
Louisiana. Middie 61 4.9 85.2 6.6 1.6 4.9 

Louisiana. Western 200 10.0% 55.0% 9.0% 32.0% 5.0% 
Maine 145 5.5 28.3 31.7 35.9 7.6 
Maryland 768 46.1 13.0 11.8 35.5 7.3 
Massachusetts 552 8.0 43.5 15.9 43.8 9.8 
Michigan. Eastern 1.344 1.6 78.4 1.1 26.4 1.3 
Michigan. Western 237 6.8 72.6 5.1 16.9 4.6 

Minnesota 499 8.8% 56.9% 9.4% 31.9% 5.4% 
Mississippi. Northern 226 5.3 55.6 19.6 12.4 21.3 
MislSissippi. Southern 289 42.2 23.2 11.8 19.0 14.2 
Missouri. Eastern 402 .5 33.6 34.3 24.4 22.9 
Missouri. Western 461 16.1 47.5 2.6 36.9 10.0 
Montana 175 58.9 .6 10.9 25.1 9.7 
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Table 0-2.1 Continued 

Percent of defendants who were: 

Released at any time on: Detainedc 

Most serious Total Personal Unsecured Financial Without Financial 
offense charged defendantsS recognizance bond conditionsb bail conditions 

Nebraska 250 66.0% 7.6% 1.6% 29.2% .4% 
Nevada 554 52.2 10.5 5.6 36.3 7.9 
New Hampshire 100 37.0 38.0 10.0 17.0 11.0 
New Jersey 974 8.0 41.1 22.8 20.4 22.6 
New Mexico 709 28.9 13.4 11.3 60.9 16.6 

New York, Eastern 1,663 12.1% 22.1% 9.6% 59.0% 6.2% 
New York, Northern 418 33.3 21.1 18.2 29.2 11.0 
New York, Southern 1,480 18.2 25.9 20.7 37.4 13.4 
New York, Western 337 25.2 21.1 24.0 10.4 40.1 
North Carolina, Eastern 87'0 57.6 18.5 5.7 21.8 3.9 

North Carolina, Middle 349 16.9% 26.4% 17.5% 42.1% 11.5% 
North Carolina, Western 580 .5 51.2 12.8 43.3 7.9 
North Dakota 207 45.9 14.0 4.3 39.1 2,9 
Ohio, Northern 615 8.0 53,2 11.2 26,2 12,0 
Ohio, Southern 464 35.6 15.5 17.2 32.5 15.1 

Oklahoma, Eastern 87 1.1% 64.4% 5.7% 27.6% 9.2% 
Oklahoma, Northern 201 .5 55.2 13.9 14.4 17.4 
Oklahoma, Western 270 28.1 34.4 6.7 34.4 6.7 
Oregon 579 48.7 .3 1.0 76.5 1.4 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 983 1.1 49.4 12.2 40.6 9.8 

Pennsylvania, Middle 325 39.4% 23.7% 12.9% 22.5% 13.5% 
Pennsylvania, Western 311 1.0 68.2 11.9 19.6 6.8 
Puerto Rico 623 10.0 5.1 14.1 68.9 16.9 
Rhode Island 122 20.5 0 21.3 45.9 24.6 
South Carolina 276 7.6 48.6 24.6 20.3 20.7 

South Dakota 243 63.4% 17.3% .8% 44.4% .8% 
Tennessee, Eastern 340 17.9 35.3 22.9 22.6 16.8 
Tennessee, Middle 174 20.7 46.6 10.3 22.4 4.0 
Tennessee, Western 328 22.6 7.3 43.6 28.0 32.9 
Texas, Eastern 270 3.3 71.9 5.2 32.2 7.4 

Texas, Northern 799 28.5% 9.1% 20.9% 36.2% 26.7% 
Texas, Southern 3,382 1.6 27.8 24.4 20.0 5t.4 
Texas, Western 3,148 .6 16.0 14.9 60.4 24.4 
Utah 185 20.0 13.5 10.3 56.8 8.\'3 
Vermont 126 9.5 26.2 31.7 31.7 25.4\ 

Virgin Islands 36'1 3.6% 31.6% 15.2% 31.6% 30.5% 
Virginia, Eastern 816 24.1 19.0 15.0 39.3 14.0 
Virginia, Western 405 31.1 36.3 21.0 16.0 19.3 
Washington, Eastern 202 24.8 2.5 7.4 44.6 26.2 
Washington, Western 567 28.9 8.5 14.8 54.9 15.7 

West Virginia, Northern 59 13.6% 78.0% 6.8% o % 1.7% 
West Virginia, Southern 408 1.5 79.4 2.7 35.5 1.2 
Wisconsin, Eastern 348 31.3 17.0 24.7 23.6 29.9 
Wisconsin, Western 135 62.2 5.2 5.9 31.1 8.1 
Wyoming 39 0 64.1 2.6 35.9 15.4 

Note: Data describe detention or release at any time following the initial 
bail hearing. 

b InclUdes deposit bond, surety bond, and collateral 
bond. 

The sum of the defendants released and detalned exceeds 100% 
c Initially held two or more days. 

because some defendants who were initially detalned eventually raised See text table 2.1. 
bailor had the conditions of their bail changed by rehearing or appeal. 

S Data describe defendants scheduled for pretrial interview in 1990. Total 
includes defendants for whom release status data were unavailable. 
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Table 0-2.2 Behavior of defendants released prior to trial, 1990 

Percent of released defendants who had: 

Violations while on release 
Total No New offense charged Most serious defendants violation An~ Failed to Technical Release 

offense charged released* recorded vloation appear Felony Misdemeanor violations revoked 

All districts 22.,977 87.7% 12.3% 2.5% 1.8% 1.1% 7.9% 4.5% 

Alabama, Middle 259 95.8% 4.2"A> 1.5% .4% o % 2.7% 3.1% 
Alabama, Northern 204 95.6 4.4 .5 .5 .5 3.4 1.5 
Alabama, Southern 141 87.2 12.8 2.1 .7 0 9.9 7.8 
Alaska 111 95.5 4.5 0 .9 .9 2.7 2.7 
Arizona 861 81.0 19.0 7.5 1.5 2.0 8.7 5.3 

Arkansas, Eastern 211 n.7% 22.3% 3.8% 3.3% o % 17.1% 14.2% 
Arkansas, Western 59 94.9 5.1 1.7 0 1.7 1.7 1.7 
California, Central 851 91.1 8.9 2.4 .7 .7 5.4 2.5 
California, Eastern 242 85.1 14.9 3.7 .8 .8 12.0 6.2 
California, Northern 175 85.1 14.9 5.7 1.7 2.3 5.7 3.4 

California, Southern 190 81.1% 18.9% 2.6% 1.1% 1.1% 14.7% 9.5% 
Colorado 275 89.8 10.2 2.2 1.1 .4 7.3 3.3 
Connecticut 209 89.0 11.0 1.4 1.9 2.9 6.2 5.3 
Delaware 83 73.5 26.5 2.4 0 0 24.1 24.1 
Florids, Middle 766 87.1 12.9 1.2 1.8 1.3 9.7 4.0 

Florida, Northem 170 95.3% 4.7% .6% 1.2% .6% 2.4% 2.9% 
Florida, Southern 832 79.4 20.S 5.0 3.2 1.1 13.9 3.8 
Georgltll, Middle 108 90.7 9.3 0 6.5 0 3.7 4.6 
Georg!a, Northern 414 8aA 11.6 1.2 4.1 .7 5.8 3.1 
Georgia, Southern 215 89.3 10.7 0 .9 0 9.8 7.4 

Hawaii 66 80.3% 19.7% 4.5% 3.0% 0 % 13.6% 12.1% 
Idaho 92 98.9 1.1 0 1.1 0 0 1.1 
Illinois, Central 30 80.0 20.0 0 0 6.7 13.3 13.3 
Illinois, Northern 505 79.4 20.6 7.7 3.2 4.4 9.5 4.8 
Illinois, Southern 125 94.4 5.6 .8 1.6 .8 2.4 3.2 

Indiana, Northern 191 89.5% 10.5% 1.0% 1.6% 2.1% 7.9% 5.8% 
Indiana, Southern 198 98.0 2.0 .5 .5 .5 1.0 1.5 
Iowa, Northern 75 89.3 10.7 0 1.3 0 10.7 5.3 
Iowa, Southern 69 75.4 24.6 2.9 4.3 1.4 20.3 7.2 
Kansas 197 89.8 10.2 2.5 2.0 .5 6.1 4.6 

Kentucky, Eastern 1n 85.9% 14.1% 1.7% 1.7% 1.1% 10.7% 6.2% 
Kentucky, Western 156 89.1 10.9 1.9 2.6 0 7.1 7.1 
Louisiana, Eastern 347 83.6 16.4 2.6 2.0 .9 13.3 4.6 
Louisiana, Middle 47 100.0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
Louisiana, Western 131 91.6 8.4 1.5 1.5 0 5.3 2.3 

Maine 87 90.8% 9.2"A> 1.1% 2.3% 3.4% 2.3% 9.2% 
Maryland 263 76.4 23.6 3.0 1.9 1.9 18.6 3.4 
Massachusetts 277 88.1 11.9 1.4 1.8 1.1 8.7 6.1 
Michigan. Eastern 857 92.2 7.8 .5 1.2 .4 6.1 2.6 
Michigan, Western 195 95.4 4.6 2.1 .5 0 2.1 4.1 

Minnesota 328 89.0% 11.0% .3% .6% 2.1% 9.1% 6.4% 
Mississippi, Northern 96 87.5 12.5 0 4.2 5.2 4.2 3.1 
Mississippi, Southern 144 97.2 2.8 .7 0 0 2.1 1.4 
Mrssouri, Eastern 274 71.5 28.5 2.9 6.2 4.7 21.2 4.4 
Missouri, Western 263 87.5 12.5 1.5 .4 0 11.8 4.9 
Montana 100 99.0 1.0 0 0 0 1.0 1.0 
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Table 0-2.2 Continued 

Percent of released defendants who had: 

Violations while on released 
Total No New offense charge 

Most serious defendants violation Any Failed to Technical Release 
offense charged released* recorded violation appear Felony Misdemeanor violations revoked 

Nebraska 177 83.6% 16.4% 2.3% 2.3% 1.1% 11.3% 7.3% 
Nevada 339 82.0 18.0 1.8 1.5 3.8 12.1 4.1 
New Hampshire 94 83.0 17.0 4.3 1.1 0 11.7 9.6 
New Jersey 339 85.3 14.7 4.1 3.2 2.4 S.8 3.2 
New Mexico 412 86.7 13.3 5.1 2.4 1.2 4.6 3.6 

New York, Eastern 134 99.3% .7% .7% o % o % 0 % .7% 
New York, Northern 231 93.5 6.5 3.5 2.6 0 .9 1.3 
New York, Southern 337 84.6 15.4 6.2 4.2 2.4 5.9 1.8 
New York, Western 224 86.6 13.4 .9 3.1 3.1 8.0 4.0 
North Carolina, Eastern 537 93.3 6.7 .2 .9 .7 5.2 3.7 

North Carolina, Middle 224 86.6% 13.4% 2.2% 1.3% .4% 10.3% 6.3% 
North Carolina, Western 292 92.1 7.9 0 2.1 .7 5.1 6.2 
North Dakota 122 91.8 8.2 1.6 0 .8 6.6 2.5 
Ohio, Northern 418 89.0 11.0 2.2 1.2 .5 8.1 3.1 
Ohio, Suuthern 174 87.4 12.6 1.1 2.9 1.7 9.2 6.9 

Oklahoma, Eastern 65 100.0% 0 % o % 0 % 0 % o % o % 
Oklahoma, Northern 131 93.9 6.1 0 0 0 6.1 3.1 
Oklahoma, Western 165 89.7 10.3 .6 0 .6 9.1 4.8 
Oregon 239 86.2 13.8 .8 2.9 1.3 9.6 7.9 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 497 91.8 8.2 1.8 1.8 1.0 4.2 3.4 

Pennsylvania, Middle 205 96.6% 3.4% o % o % .5% 2.9% .5% 
Pennsylvania, Western 166 89.8 10.2 0 1.2 .6 9.6 2.4 
Puerto Rico 118 86.4 13.6 .8 0 0 12.7 5.1 
Rhode Island 20 90.0 10.0 5.0 5.0 0 0 0 
South Carolina 81 91.4 8.6 1.2 1.2 1.2 7.4 4.9 

South Dakota 178 73.6% 26.4% .6% 1.1% 9.6% 15.2% 18.5% 
Tennessee, Eastern 214 Q7.2 2.8 0 .5 0 2.3 2.3 
Tennessee, Middle 99 87.9 12.1 1.0 2.0 1.0 9.1 3.0 
Tennessee, Western 146 88.4 11.6 .7 7.5 .7 4.1 10.3 
Texas, Eastern 176 80.7 19.3 1.7 1.1 0 17.0 4.5 

Texas, Northern 482 86.5% 13.5% 2.9% n% .8% 7.7% 6.4% 
Texas, Southern 1,660 91.7 8.3 4.4 .9 .3 2.9 2.1 
Texas, Western 810 85.2 14.8 4.2 1.1 .7 9.4 4.4 
Utah 57 94.7 5.3 0 1.8 0 3.5 1.8 
Vermont 73 86.3 13.7 2.7 4.1 0 6.8 11.0 

Virgin Islands 193 87.6% 12.4% .5% 5.7% o % 6.2% 10.4% 
Virginia, Eastern 296 8.2 11.8 1.4 .7 1.4 8.8 6.8 
Virginia, Western 212 86.8 13.2 .5 2.8 1.4 9.0 6.6 
Washington, Eastern 35 94.3 5.7 5.7 Q 0 0 0 
Washington, Western 235 88.5 11.5 .9 1.1 .9 9.8 4.7 

West Virginia, Northern 45 100.0% o % o % o % 0 % o % o % 
West Virginia, Southern 307 82.4 17.6 2.9 2.6 1.3 12.7 10.1 
Wisconsin, Eastern 221 77.8 22.2 .9 1.4 2.3 19.5 5.0 
Wisconsin, Western 67 93.1 6.9 0 0 2.3 4.6 2.3 
Wyoming 24 95.8 4.2 0 0 0 4.2 0 

Note: A defendant with more than one ~pe of violation appears in 
more than one column. A dafendant wi more than one of the same 

* Data describe defendants whose pretrial services were 
terminated in 1990. Excludes defendants who were 

type of violation appears only once in that column. Therefore, sum of released but whose records did not contain sufficient 
individual violations exceeds the total. Not all violations resulted in infonnation to determine type of release or violation 
revocation. behavior. 

See text table 2.4. 
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Table D-3.1 Conviction rate, by most serious offense charged, 1990 

Percent of defendants convicted 

Total All Violent 
Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

District defendants offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All dhatrlcta 58,704 80.9% 83.3% 87.6% _ 77.2% 83.6% 81.2% 73.9% 

Alabama, Middle 338 81.1% 87.5% 83.8% 82.4% 82.1% 84.6% 77.2% 
Alabama, Northern 371 84.9 88.9 92.2 86.7 80.7 93.8 78.8 
Alabama, Southern 344 83.4 100.0 85.:' 100.0 81.5 60.0 94.3 
Alaska 192 80.2 100.0 83.3 58.6 83.6 68.4 86.9 
Arizona 1,209 84.8 80.9 91.1 78.1 85.3 69.2 85.5 

Arkansas, Eastern 357 76.8% 85.7% 80.3% 93.1% 70.1% 66.7% 94.7% 
Arkansas, Western 141 87.9 72.7 91.3 80.0 84.0 75.0 95.0 
California, Central 1,213 91.8 92.5 95.9 91.0 87.0 92.6 91.8 
California, Eastern 707 84.4 94.0 83.1 74.2 82.1 79.3 87.8 
California, Northern 832 85.3 89.5 87.2 80.0 81.9 84.0 86.3 

California, Southern 1,744 88.0% 76.6% 90.0% 86.1% 88.7% 79.6% 89.2% 
Colorado 470 87.0 86.4 93.7 78.3 89.8 78.6 83.0 
Connecticut 321 91.0 85.7 87.4 100.0 91.5 82.4 95.6 
Delaware 180 82.2 100.0 96.3 80.0 84.7 33.3 71.9 
District of Columbia 758 73.1 93.3 92.3 94.1 65.2 61.1 82.2 

Florida, Middle 1,401 87.2% 87.1% 92.3% 93.5% 87.4% 78.8% n.6% 
Florida, Northern 350 86.9 90.0 77.5 100.0 92.9 72.2 81.1 
Florida, Southern 1,986 87.3 82.8 92.5 80.8 88.0 84.4 81.1 
Georgia, Middle 2,129 80.6 100.0 86.6 94.7 79.7 73.7 79.8 
Georgia, Northem 690 81.6 86.5 89.9 85.7 73.7 89.5 84.5 

Georgia, Southern 473 81.2% 100.0% 87.2% 84.8% 87.6% 54.5% 74.3% 
Guam 172 63.4 27.3 n.8 83.3 54.9 100.0 80.5 
Hawaii 1,694 45.0 75.0 SO.5 58.0 89.9 45.5 39.4 
Idaho 131 78.6 100.0 96.3 61.5 81.1 87.5 64.1 
Illinois, Central 327 83.2 84.6 81.3 92.3 78.7 86.7 92.0 

Illinois, Northern 1,069 94.3% 91.2% 96.8% 94.5% 92.3% 98.1% 91.2% 
Illinois, Southern 270 92.6 77.8 94.8 88.9 95.8 100.0 85.7 
Indiana, Northern 310 87.1 100.0 94.6 95.2 74.5 100.0 87.1 
Indiana, Southern 450 71.8 83.9 88.3 57.1 83.5 100.0 58.7 
Iowa, Northern 113 93.8 100.0 90.0 94.7 100.0 92.9 

Iowa, Southern 170 87.1% 90.9% 90.0% n.8% 83.7% 100.0% 93.3% 
Kansas 424 74.8 90.9 69.3 73.8 83.1 61.1 68.2 
Kentucky, Eastern 315 81.3 92.9 75.4 89.5 82.5 66.7 85.4 
Kentucky, Western 475 76.8 84.6 82.2 76.8 74.2 75.0 73.0 
Louisiana, Eastern 599 89.3 100.0 95.3 89.3 90.4 75.6 78.3 

Louisiana, Middle 63 95.2% 97.3% 50.0% 100.0% 100.0% 94.4% 
Louisiana, Western 384 64.8 100.0 88.5 79.7 46.9 92.9 69.1 
Maine 194 90.7 100.0 83.3 83.3 92.4 100.0 85.3 
Maryland 914 80.3 79.7 88.3 86.6 78.7 78.4 74.1 
Massachusetts 482 85.7 90.0 87.5 71.4 90.2 82.1 82.9 

Michigan, Eastern 790 87.0% 79.3% 87.4% 90.3% 87.5% 86.4% 85.3% 
Michigan, Westem 219 86.8 100.0 87.8 85.7 85.7 90.9 82.5 
Minnesota 515 83.9 89.3 76.4 100.0 92.0 87.5 68.3 
Mississippi, Northern 188 88.3 87.5 88.1 93.3 89.8 85.7 86.0 

Mississippi, Southern 309 81.9% 80.0% 82.1% 87.5% 84.3% 90.9% 71.7% 
Missouri, Eastern 375 83.5 90.9 90.5 88.9 81.5 86.4 70.5 
Missouri, Western 1 ;140 46.5 84.2 96.0 93.2 76.5 82.8 27.9 
Montana 318 72.6 83.3 66.3 72.0 '74.2 51.4 85.1 
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Table 0-3.1 Continued 

Percent of defendants convicted 

Total All Violent 
Property offenses 

Drug 
Public order offenses 

District defendants offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulato~ Other 

Nebraska 296 84.1% 93.3% 88.8% 82.4% 80.7% 69.2% 90.3% 
Nevada 437 82.6 91.4 84.6 77.8 72.2 87.0 83.7 
New Hampshire 137 78.8 71.4 78.8 100.0 76.0 70.0 85.7 
New Jersey 86t' 81.0 93.1 78.4 85.6 81.1 71.4 84.0 
New Mexico 717 78.0 80.2 70.5 75.0 77.9 66.7 82.6 

New York, Eastern 1,290 91.7% 76.5% 92.3% 91.9% 92.0% 89.4% 94.0% 
New York, Northern 551 67.9 35.2 79.6 54.5 82.9 71.4 61.1 
New York, Southern 1,239 90.8 100.0 90.8 90.9 89.2 95.2 92.4 
New York, Western 369 89.7 100.0 93.3 100.0 90.2 93.8 76.4 
North Carolina, Eastern 1,213 59.9 62.9 80.0 50.0 79.8 94.7 51.8 

North Carolina, Middle 523 85.7% 94.2% 86.8% 89.3% 86.0% 64.3% 75.6% 
North Carolina, Western 638 82.9 92.3 81.9 55.6 87.2 69.0 83.6 
North Dakota 202 88.6 71.1 89.1 100.0 95.5 90.9 94.7 
Northern Mariana Islands 9 33.3 0 100.0 33.3 0 
Ohio, Northern 633 89.9 97.2 97.7 94.2 81.4 96.3 88.6 

Ohio, Southern 620 89.5% 82.6% 93.5% 89.3% 88.9% 76.2% 86.0% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 85 78.8 100.0 73.5 92.3 83.3 75.0 73.7 
Oklahoma, Northern 222 94.1 100.0 95.7 93.3 93.0 100.0 90.6 
Oklahoma, Western 496 85.5 84.6 93.9 62.7 86.2 86.4 90.2 
Oregon 555 86.5 95.9 83.1 84.2 85.7 83.3 85.7 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 821 91.1% 90.0% 93.9% 97.1% 90.7% 90.7% 83.0% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 317 83.6 94.1 78.9 70.8 95.6 77.8 77.9 
Pennsylvania, Western 320 80.3 81.3 78.3 90.9 83.7 94.4 71.9 
Puerto Rico 511 80.8 60.0 83.6 80.0 73.8 72.7 88.0 
Rhode Island 124 95.2 100.0 100.0 100.0 95.5 80.0 91.3 

South Carolina 697 74.2% 97.1% 71.6% 66.7% 76.1% 76.7% 73.2% 
South Dakota 283 83.7 75.3 84.4 88.9 87.9 90.0 91.9 
Tennessee, Eastern 493 86.4 75.0 88.3 94.3 84.0 79.3 88.4 
Tennessee, Middle 404 83.4 81.5 85.7 71.7 81.8 94.1 85.0 
Tennessee, Western 509 85.7 88.9 92.6 100.0 83.2 85.7 80.7 

Texas, Eastern 379 78.4% 77.8% 81.5% 63.6% 76.4% 71.9% 86.5% 
Texas, Northern 1,024 86.3 93.2 86.6 81.4 84.2 89.6 88.5 
Texas, Southern 3,177 83.8 61.5 89.1 84.1 81.2 86.6 85.7 
Texas, Western 2,103 86.8 94.4 94.7 79.2 85.3 75.0 84.0 
Utah 388 78.9 80.0 78.6 72.3 82.6 82.4 79.1 

Vermont 128 88.3% 100.0% 82.1% 100.0% 90.2% 66.7% 89.7% 
Virgin Islands 458 69.9 73.5 85.5 79.4 50.6 63.6 61.0 
Virginia, Eastern 3,153 68.3 68.4 75.2 45.9 84.7 71.4 68.9 
Virginia, Western 326 92.0 66.7 87.5 87.5 95.0 88.0 90.5 
Washington, Eastern 520 63.5 50.0 36.9 61.1 56.9 50.0 75.9 

Washington, Western 1,525 78.1% 92.7% 92.5% 57.8% 67.2% 81.8% 82.8% 
West Virginia, Northern 259 83.8 33.3 84.3 50.0 84.2 70.0 94.7 
West Virginia, Southern 446 87.0 77.8 77.5 94.1 89.0 81.8 84.7 
Wisconsin, Eastern 337 92.9 96.S 91.1 93.3 92.7 80.0 96.0 
Wisconsin, Western 143 88.8 83.3 94.4 82.4 90.0 33.3 90.5 
Wyoming 144 91.7 90.9 88.0 90.0 91.4 100.0 94.4 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. See text table 3.1. 
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Table 0-3.2 Convicted offenders, by most serious offense charged, 1990 

Percent of convicted offenders 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
convicted All Violent Drug 

District offenders offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All districts 47,486 100.0% 5.0% 21.3% 7.4% 35.3% 4.0% 27.0% 

Alabama, Middle 274 100.0% 2.6% 20.8% 15.3% 25.2% 4.0% 32.1% 
Alabama, Northern 315 100.0 5.1 30.2 8.3 30.5 4.8 21.3 
Alabama, Southern 287 100.0 1.7 30.3 3.1 49.1 4.2 11.5 
Alaska 154 100.0 6.5 9.7 11.0 29.9 8.4 34.4 
Arizona 1,025 100.0 10.7 15.!) 4.9 46.8 2.6 19.0 

Arkansas, Eastern 274 100.0% 2.2% 20.8% 9.9% 49.6% 4.4% 13.1% 
Arkansas, Western 124 100.0 6.5 33.9 9.7 16.9 2.4 30.6 
California, Central 1,114 100.0 16.7 29.3 6.4 23.4 2.2 22.0 
California, Eastern 597 100.0 10.6 18.9 7.7 25.3 3.9 33.7 
California, Northern 710 100.0 7.2 34.6 5.1 20.4 9.6 23.1 

California, Southern 1,535 100.0% 3.2% 11.1% 2.0% 51.3% 4.8% 27.5% 
Colorado 409 100.0 4.6 25.4 4.4 27.9 5.4 32.3 
Connecticut 292 100.0 6.2 26.0 3.8 29.5 4.8 29.8 
Delaware 148 100.0 1.4 17.6 8.1 56.1 1.4 15.5 
District of Columbia 554 100.0 2.5 23.8 5.8 59.2 2.0 6.7 

Florida, Middle 1,222 100.0% 5.0% 24.6% 3.5% 52.7% 3.4% 10.8% 
Florida, Northern 304 100.0 3.0 20.4 6.3 52.0 4.3 14.1 
Florida, Southern 1,733 100.0 3.1 20.6 3.6 54.7 4.4 13.6 
Georgia, Middle 1,716 100.0 .8 3.4 4.2 6.2 1.6 83.8 
Georgia, Northern 563 100.0 5.7 25.2 12.8 37.8 3.0 15.5 

Georgia, Southern 384 100.0% 2.9% 10.7% 20.3% 27.6% 1.6% 37.0% 
Guam 109 100.0 5.5 12.8 13.8 35.8 1.8 30.3 
Hawaii 763 100.0 2.4 5.0 6.2 11.7 .7 74.2 
Idaho 103 100.0 S.8 25.2 7.8 29.1 6.8 24.3 
Illinois, Central 272 100.0 4.0 28.7 8.8 36.8 4.8 16.9 

Illinois, Northern 1,008 100.0% 3.1% 39.1% 10.2% 24.8% 5.3% 17.6% 
Illinois, Southern 250 100.0 2.8 22.0 19.2 45.6 .8 9.6 
Indiana, Northern 270 100.0 3.0 39.3 7.4 27.0 3.3 20.0 
Indiana, Southern 323 100.0 8.0 25.7 6.2 20.4 3.1 36.5 
Iowa, Northern 106 100.0 5.7 25.5 0 50.9 5.7 12.3 

Iowa, Southern 148 100.0% 6.8% 18.2% 4.7% 48.6% 2.7% 18.9% 
Kansas 317 100.0 6.3 24.9 18.6 32.5 3.5 14.2 
Kentucky, Eastern 256 100.0 5.1 20.3 6.6 49.6 4.7 13.7 
Kentucky, Western 365 100.0 6.0 16.4 38.1 19.7 4.9 14.8 
louisiana, Eastern 535 100.0 4.9 30.5 9.3 36.8 6.4 12.1 

Louisiana, Middle 60 100.0% o % 60.0% 1.7% 5.0% 5.0% 28.3% 
Louisiana, Western 249 100.0 3.6 18.5 20.5 33.3 5.2 18.9 
Maine 176 100.0 5.7 8.5 2.8 62.5 4.0 16.5 
Maryland 734 100.0 8.6 17.4 14.0 35.3 4.0 20.7 
Mass..'\chusetts 413 100.0 8.7 23.7 6.1 29.1 7.7 24.7 

Michigan, Eastern 687 100.0% 3.3% 26.3% 9.5% 36.7% 5.5% 18.6% 
Michigan, Western 190 100.0 4.7 37.9 6.3 28.4 5.3 17.4 
Minnesota . 432 100.0 5.8 25.5 5.8 45.1 4.9 13.0 
Mississippi, Northern 166 100.0 4.2 22.3 8.4 31.9 3.6 29.5 

Mississippi, Southern 253 100.0% 4.7% 34.4% 8.3% 29.6% 7.9% 15.0% 
Missouri, Eastern 313 100.0 3.2 24.3 10.2 46.3 6.1 9.9 
Missouri, Western 530 100.0 3.0 18.1 10.4 23.4 4.5 40.6 
Montana 231 100.0 13.0 25.5 7.8 21.2 7.8 24.7 
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Table 0-3.2 Continued 

Percent of convicted of-lenders 

Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
convicted All Violent Drug 

District offenders offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Reaulato~ Other 

Nebraska 249 100.0% 5.6% 28.5% 5.6% 45.4% 3.6% 11.2% 
Nevada 361 100.0 8.9 42.7 5.8 14.4 5.5 22.7 
New Hampshire 108 100.0 4.6 24.1 1.9 35.2 6.5 27.8 
New Jersey 702 100.0 3.8 35.8 14.4 30.5 4.3 11.3 
New Mexico 559 100.0 12.3 9.8 2.1 53.5 1.8 20,4 

New York, Eastern 1,183 100.0% 2.2% 23.2% 2.9% 53.5% 6.4% 11.8% 
New York, Northern 374 100.0 5.1 20.9 4.8 32.4 £' .. 7 30.2 
New York, Southern 1,125 100.0 2.4 29.1 6.2 42.0 ~;2 15.1 
New York, Western 331 100.0 4.5 25.4 8.2 36.3 ~~1 16.6 
North Carolina, Eastern 727 100.0 3.0 11.6 7.8 20.1 5.0 52.5 

North Carolina, Middle 448 100.0% 10.9% 17.6% 5.6% 56.3% 2.0% 7.6% 
North Carolina, Western 529 100.0 11.3 21.4 3.8 38.8 5.5 19.3 
North Dakota 179 100.0 15.1 31.8 3.9 23.5 5.6 20.1 
Northern Mariana Islands 3 100.0 0 66.7 0 33.3 0 0 
Ohio, Northern 569 100.0 6.2 30.1 8.6 31.5 4.6 19.2 

Ohio, Southern 555 100.0% 3.4% 33.9% 12.1% 38.9% 2.9% 8.8% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 67 100.0 4.5 37.3 17.9 14.9 4.5 20.9 
Oklahoma, Northern 209 100.0 4.3 42.6 6.7 31.6 1.0 13.9 
Oklahoma, Western 424 100.0 5.2 25.2 11.1 23.6 4.5 30.4 
Oregon 480 100.0 14.6 13.3 6.7 45.0 4.2 16.3 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 748 100.0% 3.6% 36.8% 4.4% 38.9% 5.2% 11.1% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 265 100.0 6.0 26.8 6.4 32.8 5.3 22.6 
Pennsylvania, Western 257 100.0 5.1 36.6 3.9 31.9 6.6 16.0 
Puerto Rico 413 100.0 1.5 39.5 1.9 28.6 1.9 26.6 
Rhode Island 118 100.0 1.7 20.3 3.4 53.4 3.4 17.8 

South Carolina 517 100.0% 6.4% 30.8% 8.5% 27.7% 4.4% 22.2% 
South Dakota 237 100.0 30.8 16.0 13.5 21.5 3.8 14.3 
Tennf3ssee, Eastern 426 100.0 3.5 19.5 15.5 38.3 5.4 17.8 
Tennessee, Middle 337 100.0 6.5 30.3 9.8 13.4 4.7 35.3 
Tennessee, Western 436 100.0 3.7 22.9 4.6 51.1 1.4 16.3 

Texas, Eastern 297 100.0% 2.4% 22.2% 4.7% 41.4% 7.7% 21.5% 
Texas, Northern 884 100.0 4.6 22.7 12.9 24.1 6.8 28.8 
Texas, Southern 2,662 100.0 .9 13.7 2.8 44.2 3.2 35.2 
Texas, Western 1,825 100.0 1.9 25.6 6.9 43.4 1.5 20.8 
Utah 306 100.0 6.5 14.4 15.4 23.2 4.6 35.9 

Vermont 113 100.0% 2.7% 20.4% 3.5% 40.7% 1.8% 31.0% 
Virgin Islands 320 100.0 19.1 20.3 26.6 12.8 2.2 19.1 
Virginia, Eastern 2,152 100.0 4.2 8.6 10.0 18.0 1.6 57.5 
Virginia, Western 300 100.0 .7 11.7 4.7 56.7 7.3 19.0 
Washington, Eastern 330 100.0 5.5 7.3 3.3 22.4 1.5 60.0 

Washington, Western 1,191 100.0% 4.3% 10.3% 7.5% 18.4% 2.3% 57.3% 
West Virginia, Northern 217 100.0 .9 19.8 .5 59.0 3.2 16.6 
West Virginia, Southern 388 100.0 1.8 8.0 4.1 68.6 4.6 12.9 
Wisconsin, Eastern 313 100.0 8.3 26.2 4.5 44.4 1.3 15.3 
Wisconsin, Western 127 100.0 3.9 26.8 11.0 42.5 .8 15.0 
Wyoming 132 100.0 7.6 16.7 6.8 48.5 7.6 12.9 

See text table 3.1. 
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Table D-3.3 Characteristics of convicted offenders, 1990 

Percent of offenders with selected characteristics 

Total 
Ethnicity 

Sex Race Age 
convicted Non 

District defendants* Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 19-20 21-30 31-40 40+ 

All districts 47,543 84.5% 15.5% 66.1% 29.4% 4.5% 21.0% 79.0% 2.1% 37.6% 32.7% 27.6% 

Alabama, Middle 274 73.1% 26.9% 52.2% 47.8% o % .7% 99.3% 3.3% 32.2% 26.4% 38.0% 
Alabama, Northern 315 76.8 23.2 59.6 40.4 0 1.3 98.7 2.2 38.4 26.1 33.3 
Alabama, Southern 288 71.7 28.3 63.9 35.6 .5 3.7 96.3 1.4 38.5 29.3 30.8 
Alaska 154 n.8 22.2 76.9 23.1 0 5.2 94.8 5.9 29.4 31.4 33.3 
Arizona 1,028 91.0 9.0 87.9 1.9 10.2 53.5 46.5 4.3 38.3 32.4 24.7 

Arkansas, Eastern 2n 85.1% 14.9% 54.4% 45.1% .5% 3.1% 96.9% .6% 38.2% 37.6% 23.6% 
Arkansas, Western 125 90.8 9.2 83.1 16.9 0 7.7 92.3 0 38.9 25.9 35.2 
California, Central 1,114 85.4 14.6 64.5 28.9 6.5 31.5 68.5 1.8 36.8 35.2 26.3 
California, Eastern 597 86.6 13.4 88.1 9.2 2.7 4.6 95.4 .7 25.7 27.9 45.7 
California, Northern 711 83.1 16.9 63.4 22.4 14.2 7.6 92.4 .9 30.0 36.8 32.3 

California, Southern 1,536 85.6% 14.4% 92.0% 5.4% 2.7% 45.8% 54.2% 1.8% 42.1% 36.4% 19.5% 
Colorado 409 78.1 21.9 71.7 26.0 2.3 8.7 91.3 1.0 33.3 32.8 32.8 
Connecticut 292 90.0 10.0 74.4 24.4 1.3 18.1 81.9 2.0 37.4 26.5 34.0 
Delaware 148 88.7 11.3 43.4 55.7 .9 0 100.0 1.0 59.4 21.9 17.7 
District of Columbia 556 85.1 14.9 9.6 85.7 4.7 5.6 94.4 6.7 52.1 26.1 15.1 

Florida, Middle 1,222 84.7% 15.3% 64.5% 35.5% o % 5.8% 94.2% 2.6% 35.6% 33.1% 28.7% 
Florida, Northern 305 89.8 10.2 57.4 40.7 1.9 4.6 95.4 1.0 36.5 37.1 25.4 
Florida, Southern 1,734 82.9 17.1 82.6 17.0 .4 51.6 48.4 1.0 30.6 35.7 32.8 
Georgia, Middle 1,716 81.5 18.5 53.6 45.0 1.3 1.3 98.7 3.6 39.9 27.5 29.0 
Georgia, Northern 569 85.9 14.1 58.4 40.7 1.0 3.6 96.4 .4 29.1 40.3 30.2 

Georgia, Southern 384 82.4% 17.6% 35.3% 64.7% o % 2.2% 97.8% 3.1% 45.4% 34.6% 16.9% 
Hawaii 763 84.3 15.7 32.0 10.7 57.3 2.4 97.6 1.3 27.6 27.6 42.1 
Idaho 103 73.2 26.8 n.5 2.8 19.7 25.4 74.6 1.5 41.2 35.3 22.1 
Illinois, Central 272 80.9 19.1 73.8 24.1 2.1 6.4 93.6 1.5 34.6 42.3 21.5 
Illinois, Northern 1,009 86.5 13.5 51.7 44.8 3.6 15.5 84.5 1.2 32.1 39.9 26.8 

Illinois, Southern 250 n.S% 22.2% 60.4% 38.2% 1.4% 3.5% 96.5% 0 % 36.7% 33.6% 29.7% 
Indiana, Northern 270 84.7 15.3 69.4 28.2 2.4 6.5 93.5 .9 33.9 33.9 31.3 
Indiana, Southern 323 75.3 24.1 73.3 25.3 1.4 6.2 93.8 .8 31.8 35.7 31.8 
Iowa, Northern 106 87.3 12.7 96.4 3.6 0 3.6 96.4 0 27.7 38.3 34.0 
Iowa, Southern 148 85.0 15.0 81.3 15.9 2.8 3.7 96.3 2.1 41.1 28.4 28.4 

Kansas 317 78.4% 21.6% 67.7% 28.8% 3.5% 9.0% 91.0% 1.6% 39.6% 27.5% 31.3% 
Kentucky, Eastern 256 84.2 15.8 84.7 13.4 2.0 5.0 95.0 1.1 38.1 37.0 23.8 
Kentucky, Western 366 73.1 26.9 74.7 22.5 2.8 4.0 96.0 6.0 39.2 20.7 34.1 
Louisiana, Eastern 535 n.9 22.1 54.7 44.9 .4 7.4 92.6 .9 31.1 28.4 39.6 
Louisiana, Middle 60 60.0 40.0 76.0 24.0 0 8.0 92.0 0 25.0 41.7 33.3 

Louisiana, Western 251 87.3% 12.7% 76.4% 20.9% 2.7% .9% 99.1% 1.0% 31.3% 34.3% 33.3% 
Maine 176 92.6 7.4 95.8 2.5 1.7 6.3 93.7 4.6 52.8 28.7 13.9 
Maryland 734 80.4 19.6 36.4 62.6 1.0 2.8 97.2 . 1.9 43.6 35.5 18.9 
Massachusetts 413 89.1 10.9 71.4 22.7 5.9 18.2 81.8 2.5 34.3 26.3 36.9 
Michigan, Eastern 687 8",· '. ~ '" 14.8 45.0 54.0 1.0 2.0 98.0 .6 42.9 26.0 30.5 
Michigan, Western 190 74.4 25.6 82.6 15.1 2.3 2.3 97.7 3.9 31.6 42.1 22.4 

Minnesota 432 84.1% 15.9% 59.5% 35.4% 5.1% 3.4% 96.6% 1.1% 35.6% 41.4% 21.8% 
Mississippi, Northern 167 82.4 17.6 58.2 41.8 0 1.1 98.9 1.1 33.3 27.6 37.9 
Mississippi, Southern 253 75.9 24.1 51.9 44.9 3.2 3.8 96.2 .7 32.9 36.4 30.1 
Missouri, Eastern 313 84.9 15.1 49.5 50.0 .5 1.1 98.9 3.1 42.9 30.1 23.9 
Missouri, Western 531 81.3 18.7 63.7 35.9 .4 .4 99.6 .8 30.9 38.7 29.6 
Montana 231 86.2 13.8 43.6 1.1 55.3 4.3 95.7 2.4 31.0 35.7 31.0 
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Table 0·3.3 Continued 

Percent of offenders with selected characteristics 

Total 
Ethnicity 

convicted 
Sex Race 

Non 
Age 

District defendants· Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 19·20 21·30 31·40 40+ 

Nebraska 249 78.7% 21.3% 60.3% 31.9% 7.8% 2.1% 97.9% 1.7% 50.0% 31.7% 16.7% 
Nevada 361 79.5 20.5 75.8 18.8 5.5 3.6 96.4 2.6 28.2 32.1 37.2 
New Hampshire 108 81.0 19.0 92.1 6.3 1.6 17.5 82.5 0 28.3 50.0 21.7 
New Jersey 702 84.9 15.1 72.2 22.9 4.9 25.7 74.3 .8 28.1 35.7 35.4 
New Mexico 559 90.7 9.3 88.4 4.8 6.8 49.0 51.0 2.2 38.4 38.2 21.2 

New York, Eastern 1,183 88.5% 11.5% 45.6% 47.0% 7.4% 14.8% 85.2"10 .8% 39.6% 37.8% 21.6% 
New York, Northern 374 82.3 17.7 77.6 16.7 5.7 19.4 80.6 2.4 35.3 31.1 31.1 
New York, Southern 1,125 88.9 11.1 46.8 40.7 12.5 43.2 56.8 1.6 38.5 34.9 25.0 
New York, Western 331 86.5 13.5 60.1 36.5 3.4 5.1 94.9 0 33.3 32.1 34.5 
North Carolina, Eastern 727 80.3 19.7 44.6 50.3 5.2 2.6 97.4 1.8 42.0 29.0 27.2 

North Carolina, Middle 448 84.9% 15.1% 36.4% 61.2"10 2.4% 3.8% 96.2% 3.0% 41.3% 32.7% 23.1% 
North Carolina, Western 529 84.7 15.3 63.5 33.2 3.3 1.4 98.6 1.1 24.1 25.9 48.9 
North Dakota 179 87.0 13.0 76.1 4.3 19.6 15.2 84.8 5.0 23.8 33.8 37.5 
Ohio, Northern 569 81.5 18.5 45.8 52.9 1.3 3.4 96.6 3.4 37.6 34.6 24.3 
Ohio, Southern 555 72.3 27.7 42.9 54.7 2.4 1.6 98.4 4.0 42.0 25.3 28.4 

Oklahoma, Eastern 67 75.0% 25.0% 90.0% 10.0% o % o % 100.0% 2.8% 30.6% 27.8% 38.9% 
Oklahoma, Northern 209 78.3 21.7 59.4 39.6 .9 0 100.0 1.1 42.9 30.8 25.3 
Oklahoma, Western 424 84.0 16.0 67.9 29.5 2.6 4.5 95.5 3.5 37.8 34.3 24.5 
Oregon 480 89.0 11.0 79.8 7.4 12.9 14.7 85.3 2.8 32.5 40.2 24.4 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 748 79.7 20.3 47.0 46.5 6.5 19.9 80.1 1.9 44.6 25.4 28.2 

Pennsylvania, Middle 265 79.9% 20.1% 78.6%· 16.9% 4.5% 7.8% 92.2% 2.1% 35.7% 30.7% 31.4% 
Pennsylvania, Western 257 82.0 18.0 67.6 31.7 .7 1.4 98.6 0 26.6 35.2 38.3 
Puerto Rico 414 83.3 16.7 58.6 41.4 0 45.8 54.2 0 38.2 45.6 16.2 
Rhode Island 118 95.2 4.8 85.7 7.1 7.1 33.3 66.7 2.6 50.0 18.4 28.9 
South Carolina 517 82.9 17.1 49.8 47.3 2.9 4.1 95.9 2.3 27.6 33.0 37.1 

South Dakota 238 78.7% 21.3% 46.0% 3.2% 50.8% o % 100.0% 4.6% 39.4% 35.8% 20.2% 
Tennessee, Eastern 427 84.8 15.2 86.2 13.1 .7 .7 99.3 3.1 36.6 28.6 31.7 
Tennessee, Middle 337 82.6 17.4 66.3 32.6 1.1 2.2 97.8 .6 40.3 24.S 34.6 
Tennessee, Western 435 84.S 15.2 40.7 59.3 0 1.3 98.7 5.4 39.8 33.3 21.5 
Texas, Eastern 299 88.1 11.9 63.2 30.8 6.0 8.5 91.5 1.6 30.3 32.4 35.6 

Texas, Northern 885 82.6% 17.4% 70.9% 23.6% 5.4% 20.2% 79.8% .5% 35.1% 36.0% 28.4% 
Texas, Southern 2,662 90.5 9.5 92.3 5.1 2.6 76.5 23.5 2.2 47.5 29.7 20.7 
Texas, Western 1,828 85.1 14.9 81.3 14.3 4.4 50.0 50.0 2.2 37.2 31.9 28.7 
Utah 306 88.2 11.8 78.7 12.0 9.3 9.9 90.1 2.9 33.6 30.7 32.9 
Vermont 113 84.1 15.9 89.8 5.7 4.5 6.8 93.2 1.2 44.0 36.9 17.9 

Virgin Islands 320 91.3% 8.7% 21.7% 78.3% o % 21.7% 78.3% 4.8% 42.9% 33.3% 19.0% 
Virginia, Eastern 2,168 85.7 14.3 34.5 62.3 3.2 5.1 94.9 4.0 39.3 29.4 27.1 
Virginia, Western 302 83.4 16.6 69.5 30.5 0 .5 99.5 3.2 42.5 35.5 18.8 
Washington, Eastern 333 93.2 6.8 83.5 2.1 14.4 64.4 35.6 1.9 31.9 23.0 43.2 
Washington, Western 1,191 88.9 11.1 68.5 21.8 9.7 10.6 89.4 1.0 38.2 35.2 25.6 

West Virginia, Northern 217 69.9% 30.1% 61.3% 38.7% o % 1.1% 98.9% o % 45.6% 38.0% 16.5% 
West Virginia, Southern 389 84.8 15.2 61.2 38.4 .4 .4 99.6 4.9 35.5 38.8 20.8 
Wisconsin, Eastern 313 86.4 13.6 40.2 51.5 8.3 6.8 93.2 .8 51.6 23.0 24.6 
Wisconsin, Western 127 86.3 13.8 87.5 8.8 3.8 2.5 97.5 0 43.1 36.6 19.7 
Wyoming 132 77.3 22.7 88.4 2.3 9.3 2.3 97.7 5.0 27.5 47.5 20.0 

Note: Percents for individual characteristics were calculated on the basis of • Data describe offenders in cases terminated in 1990. 
available data. Data were available only for offenders sentenced under Total excludes offenders f<lr whom these characteristics 
guidelines. do not apply (e.g. corporations) • 
••. No cases of this type occurred in the data. See text table 3.3 and data note 8. 
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Table 0-4.1 Incarceration rate, by offense, 1990 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to IncarcerEltionB 

Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
offenders All Violent Drug 

District sentencedb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Re~ulatory Other 

All districts 47.486 60.4% 87.2% 44.1% 41.0% 86.4% 38.9% 44.3% 

Alabama, Middle 274 41.2% 100.0% 34.7% 21.7% 73.5% 12.5% 30.7% 
Alabama, Northern 315 50.2 87.5 28.7 51.9 70.7 43.8 44.3 
Alabama, Southern 287 69.3 77.8 44.3 50.0 87.8 11.1 76.5 
Alaska 154 50.6 80.0 66.7 29.4 60.9 23.1 45.3 
Arizona 1,025 70.3 88.3 48.8 45.5 79.8 40.0 70.5 

Arkansas, Eastern 274 82.8% 100.0% 67.2% 66.7% 91.7% 76.9% 86.5% 
Arkansas, Western 124 62.9 75.0 63.9 62.5 95.2 ,20.0 47.4 
California, Central 1,114 76.4 96.9 58.8 52.2 95.4 40.7 74.0 
California, Eastern 597 67.5 93.2 44.2 27.7 89.0 40.9 69.7 
California, Northern 710 47.7 94.2 30.3 38.7 77.4 49.3 37.4 

California, Southern 1,535 71.4% 95.7% 45.5% 45.7% 78.0% 38.4% 76.8% 
Colorado 409 51.3 89.5 50.9 23.1 72.0 38.5 35.3 
Connecticut 292 63.0 82.4 38.5 40.0 86.7 28.6 66.7 
Delaware 148 73.6 100.0 40.0 15.4 90.2 33.3 87.0 
District of Columbia 554 72.7 71.4 42.3 40.0 88.9 90.0 66.7 

Florida, Middle 1,222 76.4% 98.3% 48.3% 54.8% 93.1% ::18.3% 71.6% 
Florida, Northern 304 79.3 90.0 57.4 40.9 94.9 38.5 82.5 
Florida, Southern 1,733 80.0 82.4 51.9 60.3 94.8 70.9 73.5 
Georgia, Middle 1,716 10.5 76.9 48.3 22.2 92.2 10.3 2.0 
Georgia, Northern 563 72.8 100.0 56.4 63.4 88.7 58.8 60.7 

Georgia, Southern 384 49.2% 100.0% 56.4% 33.3% 95.1% 33.3% 20.4% 
Guam 109 39.4 50.0 35.7 74.4 50.0 15.2 
Hawaii 763 15.9 80.0 54.1 15.9 64.0 50.0 3.2 
Idaho 103 82.5 85.7 60.7 85.7 100.0 87.5 84.6 
Illinois, Central 272 62.9 90.9 42.7 20.0 91.8 50.0 52.1 

Illinois, Northern 1,008 49.9% 97.0% 29.9% 45.0% 82.5% 39.1% 46.1% 
Illinois, Sol,lthern 250 63.2 100.0 21.6 43.1 96.5 16.7 39.1 
Indiana, Northern 270 57.4 62.5 27.7 54.5 84.5 55.6 76.3 
Indiana, Southern 323 44.9 87.0 45.0 42.9 53.1 36.4 33.9 
Iowa, Northern 106 77.4 83.3 56.0 94.3 25.0 78.6 

Iowa, Southern 148 82.4% 100.0% 53.8% 62.5% 95.8% 16.7% 88.9% 
Kansas 317 57.1 95.0 44.7 1.8 93.5 14.3 66.7 
Kentucky, Eastern 256 77.3 86.7 53.3 77.3 92.6 21.4 74.4 
Kentucky, Western 365 40.8 81.0 51.7 7.2 82.6 41.2 45.9 
Louisiana, Eastern 535 59.4 95.5 30.0 29.4 87.4 52.8 64.0 

Louisiana, Middle 60 61.7% 59.5% 100.0% 50.0% 64.7% 
Louisiana, Western 249 53.0 55.6 63.4 41.5 66.2 50.0 39.3 
Maine 176 86.4 100.0 64.3 83.3 94.5 85.7 63.3 
Maryland 734 55.2 94.7 42.3 20.8 78.7 46.9 38.5 
Massachusetts 413 72.6 82.9 59.6 52.0 89.1 67.7 69.7 

Michigan, Eastern 687 74.1% 90.9% 63.7% 60.0% 91.2% 31.7% 73.3% 
Michigan, Western 190 63.2 88.9 53.6 28.6 88.2 25.0 65.7 
Minnesota 432 80.1 92.0 65.5 66.7 96.4 22.7 76.3 
Mississippi, Northern 166 72.3 87.5 45.7 88.2 86.3 40.0 72.0 

Mississippi, Southern 253 61.3% 100.0% 48.9% 65.0% 82.7% 20.0% 55.3% 
Missouri, Eastern 313 82.1 100.0 64.1 60.0 100.0 42.1 83.9 
Missouri, Western 530 50.6 94.1 44.3 84.6 95.2 17.9 19.4 
Montana 231 55.8 66.7 33.3 52.6 78.3 31.6 64.9 
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Table 0-4.1 Continued 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to Incarcerationa 

Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
offenders All Violent Drug 

District sentencedb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Re~ulat0!1 Other 

Nebraska 249 74.7% 100.0% 65.3% 30.8% 91.8% 66.7% 
Nevada 361 54.6 87.9 45.0 55.0 74.5 43.5 49.4 
New Hampshire 108 68.5 80.0 50.0 33.3 85.3 80.0 
New Jersey 702 53.1 83.3 38.0 47.0 78.5 28.1 43.7 
New Mexico 559 77.3 80.0 43.8 56.3 87.6 37.5 75.8 

New York, Eastern 1,183 66.6% 84.0% 38.5% 46.9% 88.6% 36.5% 40.7% 
New York, Northern 374 58.3 83.3 50.0 41.2 86.7 48.0 35.1 
New York, Southern 1,125 60.5 65.4 45.2 36.2 84.4 12.3 52.5 
New York, Western 331 53.2 80.0 31.7 27.6 78.0 37.9 46.6 
North Carolina, Eastern 727 30.7 81.8 34.5 38.1 72.1 25.7 11.0 

North Carolina, Middle 448 86.2% 97.9% 60.8% 69.6% 95.6% 54.5% 82.5% 
North Carolina, Western 529 56.9 79.4 37.9 38.9 64.7 38.5 56.9 
North Dakota 179 49.2 46.2 28.8 80.0 10.0 70.3 
Northern Mariana Islands 3 66.7 50.0 100.0 
Ohio, Northern 569 57.1 97.1 30.7 31.9 89.8 30.8 51.4 

Ohio, Southern 555 62.7% 88.9% 34.0% 31.3% 96.6% 43.8% 68.9% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 67 55.2 66.7 43.5 63.6 77.8 16.7 66.7 
Oklahoma, Northern 209 64.6 100.0 55.7 61.5 73.8 50.0 63.3 
Oklahoma, Western 424 59.0 100.0 67.6 40.0 84.0 45.0 35.8 
Oregon 480 85.0 97.1 71.0 62.5 90.2 54.5 89.0 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 748 57.4% 91.7% 33.2% 42.4% 84.6% 20.5% 56.5% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 265 60.0 76.5 41.3 46.7 72.9 42.9 67.8 
Pennsylvania, Western 257 48.2 53.8 15.6 44.4 87.7 17.6 58.5 
Puerto Rico 413 38.7 50.0 12.4 37.5 93.2 14.3 21.1 
R hade Island 118 89.8 100.0 69.6 80.0 100.0 33.3 90.9 

South Carolina 517 52.0% 93.3% 25.2% 35.0% 86.1% 16.0% 52.5% 
South Dakota 237 70.5 79.7 40.5 45.2 96.2 20.0 81.3 
Tennessee, Eastern 426 68.1 93.8 44.2 46.7 88.1 34.8 75.6 
Tennessee, Middle 337 51.9 83.3 47.3 44.4 83.3 23.8 45.5 
Tennessee, Western 436 70.4 100.0 35.3 13.6 SO.3 SO.O 75.0 

Texas, Eastern 297 79.1% 100.0% 60.3% 71.4% 91.5% 65.2% 80.9% 
Texas, Northern 884 73.4 91.4 59.8 55.1 92.7 57.3 79.7 
Texas, Southern 2,662 68.4 62.5 34.7 45.9 85.1 26.8 66.6 
Texas, Western 1,825 71.3 93.1 36.8 36.7 95.3 54.5 76.1 
Utah 306 49.7 77.8 39.1 34.0 78.9 28.6 40.0 

Vermont 113 81.4% 100.0% 54.5% 100.0% 95.7% 100.0% 75.0% 
Virgin Islands 320 74.7 80.6 66.7 63.1 84.6 40.0 90.8 
Virginia, Eastern 2,152 36.8 67.4 62.5 31.0 79.9 40.5 19.0 
Virginia, Western 300 65.7 100.0 25.0 57.1 75.3 52.2 68.4 
Washington, Eastern 330 84.8 88.2 54.5 64.3 80.8 20.0 92.5 

Washington, Western 1,191 27.7% 82.2% 46.7% 11.1% 58.1% 46.4% 12.8% 
West Virginia, Northern 217 61.3 100.0 37.2 75.4 66.7 41.0 
West Virginia, Southern 388 76.5 83.3 51.6 80.0 80.7 77.S 69.5 
Wisconsin, Eastern 313 78.3 100.0 45.8 71.4 93.5 85.4 
Wisconsin, Western 127 85.8 100.0 68.6 85.7 100.0 77.S 
Wyoming 132 77.3 100.0 45.0 55.6 98.4 8.3 83.3 

Note: Offenses are classified by most serious offense of b Data describe offenders convicted and sentenced in 

conviction cases terminated In 1990. 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. See text table 4.1 . 

a Includes regular, split or mixed, life, Indeterminate, and youth 
sentences. 
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Table 0-4.2 Incarceration rate, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to incarcerationa 

Total Ethnicity 

offenders 
Sex Race Non 

Age 

District sentencedb Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 19·20 21·30 31·40 40+ 

All dlst{lcta 47,543 81.5% 54.1% 76.6% 79.3% 74.8% 86.0% 74.7% 74.4% 78.6% 79.2% 72.0% 

Alabama, Middle 274 67.3% 13.9% 47.1% 59.4% 100.0% 52.6% 25.0% 48.7% 62.5% 47.8% 
Alabama, Northern 315 68.1 22.9 60.0 54.1 50.0 57.7 33.3 60.4 72.2 50.0 
Alabama, Southern 288 82.8 51.6 77.1 67.9 100.0 100.0 73.0 66.7 60.0 82.0 81.3 
Alaska 154 76.2 100.0 75.0 100.0 66.7 70.9 33.3 60.0 81.3 70.6 
Arizona 1,028 86.5 55.3 82.7 75.0 93.0 88.7 76.8 82.4 87.3 81.1 81.4 

Arkansas, Eastern 277 91.6% 86.2% 90.6% 90.9% 100.0% 100.0% 90.5% 100.0% 90.5% 93.5% 89.7% 
Arkansas, Western 125 81.4 50.0 77.8 81.8 100.0 76.7 71.4 64.3 89.5 
California, Central 1,114 84.7 67.4 84.5 83.0 56.1 86.4 80.3 80.0 86.2 82.1 80.7 
California, Eastern 597 85.3 50.0 82.6 70.4 75.0 71.4 81.4 73.2 76.6 88.1 
California, Northern 711 76.3 40.5 71.2 80.0 51.4 57.9 71.3 67.2 80.5 63.9 

California, Southern 1,536 86.5% 54.6% 82.8% 69.4% 77.8% 89.0% 75.9% 72.7% 79.9% 82.3% 85.6% 
Colorado 409 64.9 39.6 58.6 61.4 60.0 68.4 58.5 100.0 50.7 56.1 66.7 
Connecticut 292 72.2 37.5 69.7 66.7 50.0 93.1 63.4 66.7 72.7 79.5 56.0 
Delaware 148 85.1 50.0 80.4 81.4 100.0 81.1 100.0 82.5 81.0 70.6 
District of Columbia 556 86.9 56.3 71.0 83.7 80.0 83.3 82.2 84.2 89.2 77.0 62.8 

Florida, Middle 1,222 90.3% 74.2% 86.3% 90.1% 91.9% 86.7% 93.3% 90.1% 88.4% 82.3% 
Florida, Northern 305 90.2 68.2 83.9 94.3 75.0 90.0 87.9 100.0 90.3 87.7 90.0 
Florida, Southern 1,734 85.0 68.9 84.5 72.5 33.3 92.5 71.4 57.1 78.6 84.4 82.6 
Georgia, Middle 1,716 65.9 25.0 56.8 61.8 100.0 57.7 80.0 61.8 65.8 40.0 
Georgia, Northern 569 82.8 58.1 78.1 80.6 100.0 90.9 78.9 76.5 83.9 79.8 

Georgia, Southern 384 81.3% 66.7% 60.4% 88.6% 66.7% 78.9% 75.0% 81.4% 73.3% 77.3% 
Hawaii 763 68.6 46.2 62.5 87.5 74.4 66.7 100.0 81.0 100.0 25.0 
Idaho 103 92.3 73.7 85.5 50.0 100.0 94.4 84.9 100.0 89.3 87.5 86.7 
Illinois, Central 272 86.0 44.4 80.8 73.5 33.3 88.9 77.3 100.0 80.0 76.4 82.1 
Illinois, Northern 1,00SI 70.6 49.0 74.9 59.9 61.5 85.7 64.4 25.0 69.4 70.1 64.4 

Illinois, Southern 250 77.7% 40.6% 69.0% 69.1% 100.0% 40.0% 70.5% 78.7% 79.1% 36.8% 
Indiana, Northern 271D 71.4 57.9 60.5 88.6 100.0 87.5 68.1 100.0 76.3 65.8 68.6 
Indiana, Southern 323 67.3 44.4 58.9 67.6 100.0 88.9 59.9 100.0 56.1 69.6 56.1 
Iowa, Northern 106 89.6 57.1 84.9 100.0 50.0 86.8 84.6 94.4 93.8 
Iowa, Southern 148 91.2 68.8 89.7 76.5 100.0 100.0 87.4 50.0 84.6 100.0 85.2 

Kansas 317 81.4% 39.5% 74.6% 66.7% 71.4% 88.9% 70.7% 33.3% 81.9% 68.0% 63.2"A. 
Kentucky, Eastern 256 84.7 71.9 83.0 88.9 25.0 70.0 83.3 100.0 81.9 84.3 77.8 
Kentucky, Western 366 47.3 13.4 40.3 35.7 30.0 38.5 15.4 30.6 53.3 45.9 
Louisiana, Eastern 535 65.8 31.5 60.2 56.9 33.3 60.2 50.0 62.9 54.7 56.2 
Louisiana, Middle 60 66.7 70.0 78.9 33.3 100.0 65.2 83.3 60.0 75.0 

Louisiana, Western 251 66.7% 42.9% 64.3% 69.6% 64.2% 71.0% 61.8% 54.5% 
Maine 176 94.6 77.8 93.0 100.0 100.0 87.5 94.1 80.0 89.5 96.8 100.0 
MafYland 734 80.9 64.3 72.1 81.0 66.7 87.5 77.3 60.0 80.5 78.3 67.3 
Massachusetts 413 83.2 58.3 79.0 84.0 84.6 95.0 77.2 60.0 76.5 84.6 79.5 
Michigan, Eastern 687 87.4 65.5 78.2 88.5 100.0 75.0 84.1 100.0 87.1 85.1 78.2 
Michigan, Western 190 73.4 45.5 66.2 69.2 50.0 50.0 66.7 50.0 81.3 76.5 

Minnesota 432 87.5% 68.1% 82.3% 90.4% 73.3% 100.0% 83.9% 100.0% 89.2% 86.1% 66.7% 
Mississippi, Northern 167 85.3 43.8 77.4 78.9 100.0 77.8 100.0 72.4 91.7 78.8 
Mississippi, Southern 253 70.8 60.5 58.5 81.7 40.0 66.7 68.4 100.0 63.8 73.1 67.4 
Missouri, Eastern 313 86.7 64.3 79.3 87.1 100.0 100.0 83.2 40.0 84.3 79.6 92.3 
Missouri, Western 531 79.3 57.1 70.1 85.1 100.0 75.1 76.0 75.5 75.0 
Montana 231 56.8 38.5 53.7 100.0 53.8 50.0 54.4 100.0 57.7 53.3 42.3 
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1 
Table 0-4.2 Continued 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to incarcerationa 

Total Sex 
Ethnicity 

Race Age 
offenders Non 

District sentencedb Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 19·20 21·30 31-40 40+ 

Nebraska 249 86.5% 60.0% 75.3% 88.9% 90.9% 100.0% 80,4% 100.0% 88.3% 78.9% 50.0% 
Nevada 361 68.2 44.1 65.6 58.1 55.6 66.7 63.1 75.0 65.9 68.0 60.3 
New Hampshire 108 76.5 58.3 74.1 75.0 100.0 67.3 82,4 80.0 53.8 
New Jersey 702 54,4 37.2 50.7 52.3 64.3 49.3 52.6 50.0 50.0 57,4 49.5 
New Mexico 559 88.7 59.5 86.1 84.2 85.2 88.S 83.4 87.5 90.6 82.5 82.9 

New York, Eastern 1,183 90.9% 91.0% 87.5% 95.2% 83.7% 91.9% 90.7% 100.0% 94.6% 94.3% 76.6% 
New York, Northern 374 79.2 51.6 69.6 93.1 80.0 97.1 68.S 75.0 81.4 69.2 67.3 
New York, Southern 1,125 74.2 51.5 74,4 67.7 72,4 84.2 62.2 88.9 75.6 70.5 65.2 
New York, Western 331 61.7 58.3 56.1 67.7 83.3 77.8 60,4 70.9 62.3 54.4 
North Carolina, Eastern 727 75.5 55.3 64.0 79,4 60.0 100.0 70.7 66.7 77.5 69.4 67,4 

North Carolina, Middle 448 92.7% 68.6% 82.9% 92.3% 100.0% 92.3% 88.9% 88.9% 93.6% 85.9% 81.4% 
North Carolina, Western 529 77,4 31.S 60.9 84.6 77.8 100.0 70.2 100.0 77.3 73.2 66,4 
North Dakota 179 67.5 50.0 65.7 100.0 55.6 100.0 59.0 50.0 68.4 74.1 50.0 
Ohio, Northern 569 70.4 49.1 54.4 77.1 50.0 80.0 66.0 77.8 67.7 67.0 67.2 
Ohio, Southern 555 74.5 51.9 57.8 77.6 44.4 100.0 67.8 57.1 65.1 70.5 68.7 

Oklahoma, Eastern 67 73.3% 30.0% 66.7% 25.0% 62.5% 100.0% 54.5% 60.0% 57.1% 
Oklahoma, Northern 209 86.7 47.8 73.0 85.7 100.0 78.3 100.0 79.5 75.0 82.6 
Oklahoma, Western 424 87.0 76.0 81.1 93.5 100.0 85.7 84.7 100.0 87.0 75.5 85.7 
Oregon 480 91.7 73.3 88.0 90.0 100.0 97.5 88.4 85.7 96.2 87.9 83.3 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 748 78.3 36.2 69.4 68.2 80.0 80.4 67.0 75.0 71.6 66.7 68.3 

Pennsylvania, Middle 265 74.0% 45.2% 62.0% 92.3% 85.7% 83.3% 66.9% 66.7% 74.0% 67.4% 59.1% 
Pennsyfvania, Western 257 76.3 20.0 62.8 72.7 100.0 50.0 66.4 61.8 71.1 69.4 
Puerto Rico 414 88.3 91.7 92.7 82.8 93.9 84.6 88.5 90.3 81.8 
Rhode Island 118 92.5 50.0 91.7 66.7 100.0 100.0 85.7 100.0 100.0 100.0 81.8 
South Carolina 517 60.1 28.6 48.4 59.5 85.7 80.0 53.6 100.0 47.5 60.3 47.6 

South Dakota 238 90.0% 63.0% 81.0% 50.0% 89.1% 84.3% 80.0% 79.1% 87.2% 81.8% 
Tennessee, Eastern 427 80.8 53.5 74.9 86.5 100.0 50.0 76.9 62.5 70.8 78.7 84.3 
Tennessee, Middle 337 70.4 50.0 57.4 85.0 100.0 100.0 66.1 70.3 69.2 65.5 
Tennessee, Western 436 86.9 55.6 78.5 84.7 100.0 81.9 85.7 78.8 86.2 71.4 
Texas, Eastern 299 89.3 58.3 86.6 82.3 91.7 100.0 84.2 100.0 80.7 88.5 88.1 

Texas, Northern 885 86.1% 70.0% 83.8% 88.1% 56.0% 83.9% 83.2% 100.0% 85.0% 88.1% 77.3% 
Texas, Southern 2,662 83.2 53.8 80.9 68.9 87.2 83.2 70.5 88.6 80.5 79.9 78.4 
Texas, Western 1,828 87.5 58.9 85.8 80.4 73.5 87.4 72.9 66.7 86.0 86.3 67.1 
Utah 306 75,4 22.2 66.9 77.8 78.6 86.7 67.2 75.0 74.5 74.4 58.7 
Vermont 113 90.5 57.1 87.3 60.0 75,0 100.0 84.1 100.0 78.4 90.3 93.3 

Virgin Islands 320 81.0% 100'oo'{. 100.0% 77.8% 80.0% 83.3% 100.0% 66.7% 100.0% 100.0% 
Virginia, Eastern 2,168 83.9 52.4 74.3 83.3 57.9 83.3 79.0 81.0 83.1 81.3 69.2 
Virginia, Western 302 75.0 45.7 65.1 81.3 100.0 70.0 83.3 68.4 83.3 48.6 
Washington, Eastern 333 92.3 50.0 89.3 80.0 91.2 96.1 77.4 100.0 91.2 81.6 90.2 
Washington, Western 1,191 90.2 37.5 84.5 85.1 81.0 91.3 83.5 100.0 85.5 82.9 86.3 

West Virginia, Northern 217 80.0% 60.7% 63.2% 91.7% 100.0% 73.9% 72.2% 73.3% 61.5% 
West Virginia, Southern 389 85.0 66.7 75.1 93.4 100.0 100.0 82.2 100.0 80.5 80.0 82,4 
Wisconsin, Eastern 313 89.5 38.9 81.1 85.3 72.7 88.9 82.1 81.0 89.3 83.3 
Wisconsin, Western 127 88.4 63.6 82.9 100.0 100.0 100.0 84.6 80.6 92.3 85.7 
Wyoming 132 82.4 50.0 76.3 75.0 76.7 50.0 54.5 84.2 87.5 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. b Data describe offenders in cases terminated in 1990 . 
a Includes regular, split or mixed, life, Indeterminate, and youth sentences. See text table 4,4 and data note 8. 
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Table 0·4.3 Average Incarceration sentence length Imposed, by offense, 1990 

Average sentence in months for offenders convicted of:Q 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
sentenced tab All Violent Drug 

District Incarceration offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All dlatrlcta 28,659 57.2mo 89.2mo 21.9mo 22.4mo 80.9mo 26.7 mo 28.5mo 

Alabama, Middle 113 32.9mo 85.0 mo 14.6 mo 12.1 mo 48.4mo 19.0 mo 10.Smo 
Alabama, Northern 158 45.5 93.3 22.3 23.6 53.6 52.4 35.5 
Alabama, Southern 199 85.7 36.9 16.4 16.5 124.1 6.0 35.5 
Alaska 78 34.4 73.5 6.7 1.8 54.9 1.0 20.0 
Arizona 721 35.1 63.3 6.8 13.3 43.0 22.5 16.7 

Arkansas, Eastern 227 35.3mo 70.3mo 13.1 mo 12.3mo 47.0mo 28.0mo 26.7mo 
Arkansas, Western 78 51.6 105.0 32.7 18.5 94.3 46.0 29.3 
California, Central 851 71.7 99.8 27.2 35.3 127.9 8.9 22.4 
California, Eastern 40S 60.3 100.9 19.6 24.1 115.6 23.1 15.8 
California, Northern 339 57.4 83.6 31.7 37.8 97.9 21.2 22.4 

California, Southern 1,096 40.4 mo 80.9 mo 16.8mo 15.9mo 55.7mo 12.7mo 16.9mo 
Colorado 210 39.9 72.2 23.4 27.0 60.5 19.8 19.4 
Connecticut 184 43.6 102.1 16.1 19.5 62.6 29.8 23.6 
Delaware 109 60.1 87.0 16.8 8.0 69.5 11.0 51.9 
District of Columnla 403 74.2 84.6 18.3 37.4 91.6 25.0 35.1 

Florida, Middle 933 88.4 mo 125.3mo 25.1 mo 17.5mo 109.5 mo 12.3 mo 67.2mo 
Florida, Northern 241 104.9 101.1 15.8 11.9 145.9 29.6 51.2 
Florida, Southern 1,387 86.4 82.3 27.9 25.2 112.9 46.0 48.4 
Georgia, Middle 180 64.1 150.7 17.7 18.3 84.7 30.7 41.1 
Georgia, Northern 410 68.6 86.8 29.1 25.7 99.3 6.0 54.8 

Georgia, Southern 189 80.1 rno 99.6 mo 16.4mo 13.0mo 124.4 mo 36.0mo 36.2mo 
Guam 43 70.7 51.3 210.0 60.0 72.0 5.0 
Hawaii 121 48.9 76.4 22.5 7.9 69.8 12.0 9.8 
Idaho 85 52.5 99.0 25.2 4.8 101.6 15.1 25.5 
Illinois, Central 171 68.7 93.1 42.7 11.0 85.0 27.2 56.9 

Illinois, Northern 503 60.3mo 88.2mo 25.6mo 30.1 mo 93.9mo 22.6 mo 42.5 mo 
Illinois, Southern 158 65.9 '113.7 11.3 12.1 81.0 1.0 56.6 
Indiana, Northern 155 59.0 70.8 34.4 17.9 108.6 29.6 21.2 
Indiana, Southern 145 55.1 153.5 25.2 19.3 65.3 15.5 37.0 
Iowa, Northern 82 71.2 3HI.2 18.7 72.5 4.5 31.6 

Iowa, Southern 122 64.1 mo 98.0 mo 10.1 mo 5.6mo 81.6 mo 15.0 mo 46.9mo 
Kansas 181 71.0 74.2 21.3 1.0 109.6 2.5 31.0 
Kentucky, Eastern 198 51.3 145.0 21.8 15.4 58.0 39.3 29.8 
Kentucky, Western 149 50.7 115.7 24.1 19.7 69.8 14.6 20.9 
Louisiana, Eastern 318 58.9 121.5 17.2 28.2 79.1 23.8 26.8 

Louisiana, Middle 37 25.9 mo 19.5 mo 52.3mo 36.0mo 30.5mo 
Louisiana, Western 132 32.4 50.2 21.2 13.3 50.6 31.5 20.6 
Maine 152 64.7 98.5 8.8 11.8 74.4 30.0 45.8 
Maryland 405 72.3 110.5 18.4 20.4 91.9 29.8 52.0 
Massachusetts 300 45.0 89.0 15.6 15.9 67.4 17.9 32.1 

Michigan, Eastern 509 53.5 mo 78.4 mo i3.0mo 33.1 mo 79.7 mo 52.9 mo 43.0 mo 
Michigan, Western 120 37.3 75.3 14.2 4.5 62.6 23.3 19.0 
Minnesota 346 67.0 114.6 2M 22.6 91.5 48.4 34.5 
Mississippi, Northern 120 47.2 71.1 18.9 20.5 71.9 61.5 35.4 

Mississippi, Southern 155 36.1 mo 48.9 rno 19.5mo 14.5mo 51.2 mo 15.8 mo 34.8mo 
Missouri, Eastern 257 56.7 88.6 20.1 20.3 72.5 18.1 64.3 
Missouri, Western 268 76.6 138.3 27.4 25.3 125.6 21.8 23.6 
Montana 129 44.5 67.2 22.3 18.S 78.1 14.5 2S.4 

82 Compe1ldium of Federal Justice Statistics, 1990 



Table 0-4.3 Continued 

Avera\le sentence in months for offenders convicted Of:B 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
sentenced tO

b 
All Violent Drug 

District incarceration offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Rellulato!y Other 

Nebraska 186 47.0 mo 66.6 mo 20.0 mo 39.0 mo 63.0 mo 17.2 mo 
Nevada 197 42.1 58.3 15.0 103.8 75.1 17.0 33.9 
New Hampshire 74 46.3 53.0 19.0 18.0 67.7 35.S 
New Jersey 373 50.1 65.6 22.7 17.8 75.4 39.0 44.4 
New Mexico 432 31.8 40.7 14.1 30.4 39.9 10.4 11.6 

New York, Eastern 788 51.7 mo 58.9 mo 16.9 mo 21.5 mo 62.1 mo 24.6 mo 34.8mo 
New York, Northern 218 44.7 55.7 21.4 114.9 56.4 12.1 31.1 
New York, Southern 681 61.2 117.2 23.3 15.7 81.8 26.0 39.2 
New York, Western 176 35.2 43.5 18.7 12.3 44.3 26.6 26.9 
North Carolina, Eastern 223 58.1 69.3 20.3 21.6 88.7 6.9 37.6 

North Carolina, Middle 386 92.8 mo 88.1 mo 32.4 mo 15.8 mo 117.3mo 50.3 mo 56.4 mo 
North Carolina, Western 301 68.6 99.7 30.8 20.6 85.9 27.6 45.3 
No.rth Dakota 88 27.9 43.4 11.5 38.6 2.0 19.4 
Northern Mariana Islands 2 12.5 1.0 24.0 
Ohio, Northern 325 63.0 95.9 32.4 12.6 83.3 38.1 32.3 

Ohio, Southern 348 58.0 mo 93.5 mo 19.7 mo 19.1 mo 77.6 mo 32.6 mo 33.8 mo 
Oklahoma, Eastern 37 59.1 124.0 37.7 27.7 122.7 21.0 48.9 
Oklahoma, Northern 135 91.1 225.7 27.5 16.6 168.0 65.0 31.4 
Oklahoma, Western 250 45.9 110.9 21.3 23.9 69.9 7.8 28.0 
Oregon 408 61.4 89.9 17.6 18.6 82.6 12.3 25.7 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 429 57.5 mo 80.3 mo 32.2 mo 41.1 mo 71.3 mo 37.9 mo 35.0 mo 
Pennsylvania, Middle 159 48.1 55.2 21.2 8.1 7.0.5 15.0 44.0 
Pennsylvania, Western 124 83.0 137.3 30.5 39.0 103.4 126.0 41.6 
Puerto Rico 160 68.4 49.0 16.8 6.7 90.0 7.0 26.3 
Rhode Island 106 50.2 43.5 13.7 18.3 67.9 27.0 32.0 

South Carolina 269 61.6 mo 88.1 mo 20.4 mo 24.5 mo 89.9 mo 59.0 mo 32.6 mo 
South Dakota 167 34.3 54.5 12.6 17.9 32.3 8.0 15.8 
Tennessee, Eastern 290 55.8 129.8 26.8 30.0 75.7 10.3 27.4 
Tennessee, Middle 175 36.6 49.8 12.7 12.4 86.1 17.8 28.1 
Tennessee, Western 307 59.3 125.1 17.9 10.7 66.1 74.0 50.3 

Texas, Eastern 235 60.7 mo 64.0 mo 26.2 mo 42.8 mo 81.5 mo 33.5 mo 56.0 mo 
Texas, Northern 649 57.1 88.5 24.6 17.8 123.9 44.4 34.5 
Texas, Southern 1,822 36.4 42.5 17.4 25.3 53.2 57.7 12.9 
Texas, Western 1,301 50.2 57.7 17.9 25.3 68.6 20.7 28.8 
Utah 152 50.9 107.4 20.4 27.7 83.0 3.5 17,5 

Vermont 92 49.3 mo 24.0 mo 9.5mo 9.5mo 77.4 mo 23.8 mo 31.8 mo 
Virgin Islands 239 53.9 118.1 10.7 34.8 122.5 9.8 10.6 
Virginia, Eastern 792 52.5 95.2 15.9 9.8 99.0 14.0 18.1 
Virginia, Western 197 55.3 38.0 19.6 13.1 70.2 11.4 39.8 
Washington, Eastern 280 23.6 50.7 18.9 15.0 59.4 6.0 10.7 

Washington, Western 330 68.3 mo 99.8 mo 35.9 mo 13.0 mo 118.5 mo 18.2 mo 18.8 mo 
West Virginia, Northern 133 49.5 59.5 31.4 55.4 50.0 31.0 
West Virginia, Southern 297 40.0 67.8 18.6 28.1 44.3 20.1 33.8 
Wisconsin, Eastern 245 79.2 107.8 14.7 23.9 111.9 30.9 
Wisconsin, Western 109 47.9 51.4 22.0 15.8 68.4 39.4 
Wyoming 102 51.4 43.5 24.9 6.2 61.9 24.0 46.3 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. b Data describes offenders convicted and sentenced to 
a Excludes life sentences and indeterminate sentences for youthful or incarceration in cases terminated in 1990. 

drug offeders. See text table 4.2. 
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Table 0-4.4 Probation rate, by offense, 1990 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to ~roba.tiona 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
offenders All Violent Drug 

Disirict sentencedb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All dlstrlcta 47,486 39.5% 22.2% 64.5%- 58.6% 21.6% 59.3% 37.3% 

Alabama, Middle 274 58.8% 69.4% 82.6% 26.5% 87.5% 64.8% 
Alabama, Northem 315 49.8 31.3 70.2 51.9 32.6 56.3 47.1 
Alabama, Southern 287 33.1 33.3 62.5 50.0 15.8 55.6 17.6 
Alaska 154 63.6 30.0 86.7 82.4 45.7 76.9 69.8 
Arizona 1,025 30.7 14.4 43.9 52.3 21.5 61.8 36.5 

Arkansas, Eastern 274 20.8% .44.8% 33.3% 9.0% 23.1% 18.9% 
Arkansas, Western 124 41.9 25.0 38.9 50.0 4.8 80.0 60.5 
California, Central 1,114 32.8 5.8 60.3 50.7 9.9 44.4 35.5 
California, Eastern 597 45.9 39.0 65.5 66.0 34.5 59.1 39.3 
California, Northern 710 88.9 94.2 92.9 87.1 91.7 75.4 84.8 

California, Southern 1,535 29.5% 4.3% 56.4% 54.3% 23.4% 58.6% 23.9% 
Colorado 409 45.0 10.5 55.6 69.2 28.0 65.4 48.5 
Connecticut 292 44.9 29.4 74.4 70.0 18.1 57.1 42.2 
Delaware 148 25.7 76.0 . 38.5 9.8 33.3 21.7 
District of Columbia 554 31.2 21.4 66.4 63.3 12.3 60.0 35.9 

Florida, Middle 1,222 24.4% 1.7% 55.0% 40.5% 7.5% 44.7% 31.8% 
Florida, Northern 304 20.4 10.0 49.2 45.5 4.4 46.2 20.0 
Florida, Southern 1,733 20.6 17.6 49.6 39.7 5.8 29.1 26.8 
Georgia, Middle 1,716 18.4 15.4 62.1 76.4 12.7 13.8 14.3 
Georgia, Northern 563 43.5 30.3 72.9 54.9 18.3 82.4 46.1 

Georgia, Southern 384 49.7% 48.7% 71.8% 6.8% 50.0% 72.1% 
Guam 109 49.5 50.0 .57.1 93.3 28.2 50.0 51.5 
Hawaii 763 8.5 20.0 24.3 31.8 14.6 33.3 4.1 
Idaho 103 29.1 14.3 35.7 42.9 7.4 62.5 34.6 
Illinois, Central 272 50.0 36.4 77.5 86.7 24.7 41.7 43.8 

Illinois, Northern 1,008 61.3% 6.1% 83.0% 72.5% 23.2% 65.2% 68.3% 
Illinois, Southern 250 46.0 90.2 56.9 23.0 33.3 52.2 
Indiana, Northern 270 56.3 37.5 83.2 50.0 26.8 66.7 49.2 
Indiana, Southam 323 54.2 26.1 66.2 61.9 64.1 63.6 44.4 
Iowa, Northern 106 37.7 33.3 68.0 18.9 75.0 35.7 

Iowa, Southern 148 19.6% 53.8% 37.5% 4.2% 50.0% 22.2% 
Kansas 317 36.6 15.0 52.6 59.6 9.7 57.1 38.6 
Kentucky, Eastern 256 21.9 13.3 44.4 22.7 10.7 71.4 15.4 
Kentucky, Western 365 58.9 23.8 !53.4 87.1 24.6 64.7 49.2 
Louisiana, Eastern 535 44.3 13.6 73.1 78.4 15.2 47.2 41.3 

Louisiana, Middle 60 63.3% 64.9% 100.0% 66.7% 50.0% 58.8% 
Louisiana, Western 249 52.2 44.4 48.8 64.2 44.6 50.0 55.4 
Maine 176 11.4 50.0 6.4 14.3 16.7 
Maryland 734 43.9 5.3 60.0 77.4 24.1 50.0 52.6 
Massachusetts 413 32.4 22.9 51.9 40.0 14.3 45.2 31.3 

Michigan, Eastern 687 34.4% 9.1% 48.6% 52.3% 16.1% 61.0% 36.6% 
Michigan, Western 190 39.5 33.3 44.9 64.3 23.5 33.3 45.7 
Minnesota 432 31.9 36.0 48.7 57.1 15.6 68.2 28.8 
Mississippi, Northern 166 30.7 25.0 60.0 17.6 '13.7 40.0 32.0 

Mississippi, Southern 253 77.5% 58.3% 85.2% 75.0% 74.7% 80.0% 71.1% 
Missouri, Eastern 313 25.9 55.1 46.7 .7 63.2 35.5 
Missouri, Western 530 44.5 5.9 56.7 21.2 5.6 64.3 68.2 
Montana 231 57.1 56.7 73.3 57.9 32.6 84.2 50.9 
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Table 0-4.4 Continued 

Percent of convicted offenders sentenced to ~robationa 
Total Property offenses Public order offenses 
offenders b All Violent Drug 

District sentenced offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulato~ Other 

Nebraska 249 33.3% 7.1% 52.8% 61.5% 20.0% 50.0% 30.0% 
Nevada 361 54.0 24.2 67.1 50.0 35.3 47.8 56.5 
New Hampshire 108 35.2 20.0 62.5 66.7 14.7 71.4 28.6 
New Jersey 702 50.9 16.7 68.4 54.0 24.9 71.9 60.9 
New Mexico 559 21.8 20.0 60.4 37.5 12.8 58.3 19.4 

New York, Eastern 1,183 74.6% 68.0% 87.3% 90.6% 67.2% 81.0% 76.4% 
New York, Northern 374 48.7 55.6 65.0 64.7 33.3 64.0 46.5 
New York, Southern 1,125 38.1 26.9 58.5 62.3 13.4 81.5 41.9 
New York, Western 331 62.8 40.0 73.2 79.3 52.5 69.0 63.8 
North Carolina, Eastern 727 43.6 13.6 57.1 60.3 30.7 80.0 41.0 

North Carolina, Middle 448 15.2% 2.1% 43.0% 34.8% 5.2% 45.5% 17.5% 
North Carolina, Western 529 35.9 17.5 61.2 44.4 30.4 53.8 23.5 
North Dakota 179 43.0 34.6 62.7 100.0 22.5 40.0 29.7 
Northern Mariana Islands 3 33.3 50.0 
Ohio, Northern 569 42.9 5.7 69.3 63.8 11.4 50.0 52.3 

Ohio, Southern 555 41.3% 16.7% 71.3% 62.7% 7.8% 62.5% 39.3% 
Oklahoma, Eastern 67 50.7 33.3 73.9 36.4 22.2 66.7 40.0 
Oklahoma, Northern 209 42.1 60.2 38.5 26.2 50.0 36.7 
Oklahoma, Western 424 34.7 8.7 38.0 57.8 18.1 65.0 35.8 
Oregon 480 19.6 7.4 46.8 40.6 10.7 50.0 15.9 

Pennsylvania, Eastern 748 46.7% 16.7% 74.8% 63.6% 20.6% 35.9% 50.0% 
Pennsylvania, Middle 265 39.2 23.5 56.0 53.3 28.2 57.1 30.5 
Pennsylvania, Western 257 54.1 53.8 86.5 55.6 12.3 76.5 51.2 
Puerto Rico 413 54.0 16.7 83.9 62.5 2.6 71.4 64.9 
Rhode Island 118 28.8 65.2 20.0 7.9 66.7 50.0 

South Carolina 517 46.6% 6.7% 74.8% 62.5% 15.3% 68.0% 44.3% 
South Dakota 237 31.6 21.6 62.2 58.1 7.5 70.0 21.9 
Tennessee, Eastern 426 38.3 12.5 65.4 66.7 11.9 65.2 37.2 
"fennessee, Middle 337 46.3 16.7 59.3 131.1 14.3 90.5 41.5 
Tennessee, Western 436 31.9 70.6 90.9 12.1 50.0 22.7 

Texas, Eastern 297 24.9% 45.6% 35.7% 10.3% 34.8% 26.5% 
Texas, Northern 884 31.0 8.6 50.2 31.6 10.2 49.3 27.6 
Texas, Southern 2,662 SO.7 37.5 62.8 52.7 15.2 71.1 31.7 
Texas, Western 1,82.5 45.8 27.6 75.5 67.5 28.5 50.0 38.3 
Utah 306 73.9 50.0 82.6 78.7 69.0 100.0 71.8 

Vermont 113 27.4% 27.3% 37.0% 50.0% 16.7% 
Virgin Islands 320 42.8 45.2 53.3 54.8 20.5 60.0 26.2 
Virginia, Eastern 2,152 49.0 27.9 48.4 59.7 22.0 54.1 56.4 
Virginia, Western 300 33.3 63.9 14.3 25.9 56.5 33.3 
Washington, Eastern 330 40.0 23.5 45.5 57.1 42.5 80.0 37.7 

Washington, Western 1,191 45.2% 91.1% 70.8% 31.1% 87.4% 71.4% 25.4% 
West Virginia, Northern 217 41.5 65.1 100.0 26.2 33.3 66.7 
West Virginia, Southern 388 27.6 16.7 58.1 40.0 22.0 22.2 35.6 
Wisconsin, Eastern 313 31.9 3.7 74.7 42.9 6.5 100.0 39.6 
Wisconsin, Western 127 48.8 40.0 54.3 50.0 44.4 100.0 50.0 
Wyoming 132 55.3 30.0 85.0 55.S 47.6 91.7 38.9 

Note: Offenses are classified by most serious offense of conviction. b Data describe offenders convicted and sentenced in 
... No cases of this type occurred In the data. cases terminated in 1990 . 

a Includes offenders with split or mixed sentences. See text table 4.3. 
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Table 0-5.1 Probation supervisions terminating with a new crime, by original offense, 1990 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crimea 

Total 
Original offense 

probation All Violent Property offenses Drug Public order offenses 

District termlnationsb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatorz: Other 

All district. 23,541 4.5% 7.7% 4.3% 6.4% 3.8% 3.0% 4.5% 

Alabama, Middle 185 3.8% 100.0% 12.5% o % o % 14.3% 1.1% 
Alabama, Northern 339 7.1 0 10.5 7.5 6.3 0 5.7 
Alabama, Southern 118 6.8 0 6.5 0 10.7 8.3 
Alaska 44 2.3 0 0 0 0 7.1 
Arizona 723 2.5 6.0 3.3 7.8 1.4 0 1.4 

Arkansas, Eastern 126 3.2% 3.3% 12.5% o % 0 % o % 
Arkansas, Western 73 6.8 0 18.2 0 0 0 2.6 
California, Central 869 6.1 11.6 5.4 8.8 2.5 3.0 6.7 
California, Eastern 309 3.6 0 0 2.9 1.9 0 6.9 
California, Northern 540 6.3 13.3 4.5 18.2 2.7 9.1 5.3 

California, Southern 762 3.5% 9.1% 3.3% 17.9% 3.3% 1.2% 2.8% 
Colorado 284 8.5 20.0 5.6 17.9 11.8 9.7 6.1 
Connecticut 152 3.3 0 0 7.7 0 4.4 
Delaware 45 8.9 18.2 0 0 0 0 
District of Columbia 359 3.9 0 2.7 3.4 8.5 3.7 0 

Florida, Middle 324 4.0% 0 % 6.5% 7.1% o % o % 1.6% 
Florida, Northern 215 4.2 0 0 6.9 18.2 0 2.5 
Florida, Southern 606 5.4 9.1 4.8 12.0 4.6 9.7 5.3 
Georgia, Middle 282 5.0 0 2.0 0 6.7 0 7.4 
Georgia, Northern 397 4.8 0 7.5 4.9 4.4 3.4 2.0 

Georgia, Southern 237 2.1% 0 % 7.1% 6.7% 11.8% 0 % .5% 
Hawaii 116 .9 0 0 0 3.8 0 0 
Idaho 77 1.3 0 3.7 0 0 0 0 
Illinois, Central 147 4.8 0 3.9 14.3 0 0 11.5 
illinois, Northern 769 1.0 5.6 .8 2.1 1.4 0 0 

Illinois, Southern 122 5.7% 0 % 2.9% 3.0% 6.9% 0 % 15.8% 
Indiana, Northern 135 3.7 0 4.5 0 4.3 0 4.8 
Indiana, Southern 199 1.5 0 2.1 0 2.0 0 1.3 
Iowa, Northern 48 2.1 0 0 0 0 20.0 
Iowa, Southern 50 2.0 0 0 16.7 0 0 0 

Kansas 154 7.8% 20.0% 12.5% 9.5% 0 % o % 6.9% 
Kentucky, Eastern 63 14.3 0 17.2 25.0 0 14.3 0 
Kentucky, Western 382 3.4 22.2 4.2 2.2 8.3 0 2.7 
Louisiana, Eastern 411 3.2 33.3 3.8 7.7 5.9 1.4 0 
Louisiana, Western 267 1.5 0 1.6 6.7 0 0 1.4 

Maine 50 2.0% o % o % o % 100.0% o % 
Maryland 1,167 3.6 3.7 2.1 4.3 1.5 6.7 4.1 
Massachusetts 228 4.8 12.5 3.2 0 2.6 9.1 8.9 
Michigan, Eastern 582 2.9 12.5 4.2 5.3 .9 5.9 2.9 
Michigan, Western 153 3.9 0 4.6 4.2 4.8 5.0 0 

Minnesota 151 5.3% 20.0% 6.5% 20.0% 0 % 16.7% o % 
Mississippi; Northern 108 3.7 0 7.1 0 0 0 3.4 
Mississippi, Southern 163 10.4 0 15.4 25.0 0 0 8.3 
Missouri, Eastern 142 2.8 6.7 0 0 0 0 
Missouri, Western 174 6.3 0 5.5 5.0 12.5 0 6.9 
Montana 98 1.0 0 0 5.6 0 0 0 
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Table 0-5.1 Continued 

~ercent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crimea 

Total 
Original offense 

probation All Violent Proeertv offenses Drug Public order offenses 

District terminationsb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

Nebraska 125 1.6% 25.0% o % o % o % 25.0% o % 
Nevada 310 7.1 11.1 2.5 4.3 11.5 3.6 9.8 
New Hampshire 33 3.0 0 0 0 0 20.0 0 
New Jersey 451 3.3 33.3 3.4 8.3 0 1.9 2.3 
New Mexico 180 1.7 0 0 5.3 0 3.6 1.9 

New York, Eastern 473 2.5% 0 % 2.1% 4.7% 2.4% 4.2% 1.0% 
New York, Northern 109 .9 0 0 0 0 14.3 0 
New York, Southern 719 2.8 15.4 1.4 8.2 4.0 0 .7 
New York, Western 180 3.9 0 7.4 3.2 2.4 6.7 0 
North Carolina, Eastern 444 3.8 8.3 3.0 2.1 6.8 0 3.8 

North Carolina, Middle 112 B.9% o % 10.2% 7.7% o % o % 13.6% 
North Carolina, Western 269 7.8 9.1 10.8 15.0 5.4 2.6 7.2 
North Dakota 76 2.6 7.7 0 6.3 0 0 0 
Ohio, Northern 247 5.3 13.3 3.3 11.9 7.5 0 0 
Ohio, Southern 258 4.7 0 6.3 3.4 2.3 9.1 2.0 

Oklahoma, Northern 101 4.0% 0 % 1.1% 14.3% 5.3% o % 11.1% 
Oklahoma, Western 148 5.4 0 5.7 6.3 4.2 0 7.0 
Oregon 128 3.9 0 3.7 0 5.0 7.7 5.6 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 496 .8 0 0 2.3 1.1 0 1.9 
Pennsylvania, Middle 153 2.6 0 1.8 0 0 6.3 5.9 

Pennsylvania, Western 129 4.7% 0 % 5.7% 15.4% 3.3% o % o % 
Puerto Rico 166 1.8 0 1.5 4.2 5.0 0 0 
South Carolina 124 8.9 50.0 11.9 4.8 12.5 3.6 8.7 
South Dakota 86 7.0 23.1 4.2 5.3 8.3 0 0 
Tennessee, Eastern 168 6.5 0 10.3 20.0 0 0 5.4 

Tennessee, Middle 198 6.6% 0 % 7.5% 7.9% 14.3% 9.1% 3.0% 
Tennessee, Western 208 6.3 0 6.9 20.0 0 0 2.8 
Texas, Eastern 86 5.8 8.3 0 0 9.1 5.6 
Texas, Northern 291 5.2 25.0 4.1 3.3 7.4 0 7.7 
Texas, Southern 899 7.5 20.0 8.2 3.8 10.2 1.7 6.0 

Texas, Western 498 5.8% 10.0% 3.6% 3.1% 8.7% o % 7.2% 
Utah 196 4.6 0 7.0 6.7 7.4 9.1 1.3 
Vermont 42 2.4 0 0 0 0 6.3 
Virgin Islands 57 14.0 16.7 0 23.8 33.3 0 0 
Virginia, Eastern 1,203 8.1 4.3 .1 8.9 3.3 0 9.0 
Virginia, Western 174 4.6 20.0 5.3 20.0 0 0 5.2 

Washington, Eastern 91 4.4% o % 6.7% o % 5.0% 9.1% 3.4% 
Washington, Western 385 2.9 20.0 1.2 11.8 .5 11.8 5.2 
West Virginia, Northern 72 11.1 16.0 50.0 3.3 0 8.3 
West Virginia, Southern 127 3.9 0 0 3.6 0 15.8 
Wisconsin, Eastern 110 .9 0 0 7.1 0 0 0 
Wisconsin, Western 48 4.2 0 33.3 0 0 0 

Note: Offenses are classified by most serious offense of conviction. b Data describe probation terms which terminated In 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. 1990 because of a violation, because the term expired, 

a Supervision terminated with Incarceration or removal to Inactive 
or for administrative reasons. 

status after arrest for a "major" or "minor" offense. See text table 5.1. 
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Table 0-5.2 Probation supervisions terminating wHh a new crime or technical violation, by original offense, 1990 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crime or technical vlolationa 

Total 
Original offense 

probation All Violent Property offenses Drug Public order offenses 
District termlnationsb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses ReQulato~ Other 

All districts 23,541 16.0% 23.1% 15.2% 22.3% 16.5% 10.6% 14.8% 

Alabama, Middle 185 10.8% 100.0% 21.9% 8.6% 12.5% 14.3% 6.4% 
Alabama, Northern 339 20.4 11.8 25.3 24.5 18.8 33.3 16.3 
Alabama, Southern 118 19.5 0 19.4 23.1 25.0 8.3 
Alaska 44 4.5 9.1 0 0 0 7.1 
Arizona 723 22.7 30.0 18.9 32.8 25.7 10.0 19.0 

Arkansas, Eastern 126 7.1% 8.3% 12.5% 11.1% o % 3.6% 
Arkansas, Western 73 11.0 0 18.2 16.7 0 0 7.9 
California, Central 869 18.0 33.3 17.9 27.5 11.4 13.6 13.5 
California, Eastern 309 22.7 7.1 13.8 14.7 30.2 23.1 27.7 
California, Northern 540 15.7 20.0 14.4 38.2 11.0 13.6 11.4 

California, Southern 762 23.5% 18.2% 20.3% 46.4% 23.4% 26.5% 21.5% 
Colorado 284 21.1 20.0 20.8 28.6 23.5 22.6 18.4 
Connecticut 152 13.2 13.0 16.7 7.7 12.5 17.8 
Delaware 45 17.8 22.7 50.0 0 0 22.2 
District of Columbia 359 16.7 7.7 17.8 17.2 17.1 18.5 12.1 

Florida, Middle 324 18.2% o % 18.8% 33.3% 10.9% 15.8% 15.9% 
Florida, Northern 215 20.5 57.1 12.0 24.1 18.2 7.7 21.0 
Florida, Southern 606 17.8 27.3 20.4 24.0 13.8 16.1 17.7 
Georgia, Middle 282 14.5 50.0 8.0 2.3 6.7 0 21.0 
Georgia, Northern 397 21.4 10.0 25.6 22.2 20.0 17.2 18.2 

Georgia, Southern 237 13.1% 0 % 28.6% 33.3% 35.3% 0 % 8.8% 
Hawaii 116 6.0 0 3.1 21.4 7.7 0 2.8 
Idaho 77 14.3 0 22.2 16.7 33.3 0 6.9 
Illinois, Central 147 16.3 0 15.6 28.6 6.3 33.3 26.9 
Illinois, Northern 769 17.8 22.2 14.8 34.3 18.1 9.3 9.8 

Illinois, Southern 122 13.1% 0 % 11.4% 6.1% 13.8% 0 % 31.6% 
Indiana, Northern 135 9.6 0 9.1 6.7 8.7 0 19.0 
Indiana, Southern 199 10.1 0 2.1 0 8.2 0 19.5 
Iowa, Northern 48 12.5 0 0 33.3 11.8 60.0 
Iowa, Southern 50 8.0 0 4.8 16.7 28.6 0 0 

Kansas 154 16.2% 20.0% 17.5% 23.8% o % o % 20.7% 
Kentucky, Eastern 63 19.0 0 20.7 33.3 16.7 14.3 0 
KentuckY, Western 382 5.5 22.2 8.3 2.9 16.7 6 4.7 
Louisiana, Eastern 411 12.7 66.7 15.1 46.2 21.6 2.8 1.0 
Louisiana, Middle 106 9.4 14.8 40.0 14.3 0 4.7 

Louisiana, Western 267 7.1% o % 7.9% 13.3% o % o % 8.6% 
Maine 50 8.0 0 0 6.7 100.0 12.5 
Maryland 1,167 15.3 18.5 9.7 20.3 11.1 20.0 16.4 
Massachusetts 228 7.0 25.0 5.4 0 5.1 9.1 10.7 
Michigan, Eastern 582 11.9 25.0 18.0 15.8 7.4 11.8 8.7 
Michigan, Western 153 12.4 0 10.8 20.8 9.5 25.0 0 

Minnesota 151 10.6% 20.0% 11.3% 50.0% o % 33.3% 3.7 
Mississippi, Northern 108 6.5 0 7.1 0 25.0 0 6.8 
Mississippi, Southern 163 25.8 0 36.5 37.5 10.5 0 25.0 
Missouri, Eastern 142 8.5 11.7 30.0 4.2 6.7 0 
Missouri, Western 174 12.6 50.0 9.6 10.0 21.9 0 17.2 
Montana 98 5.1 0 0 22.2 0 0 7.7 
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Table 0·5.2 Continued 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crime or technical violationa 

Total 
Original offense 

probation All Violent ProEerty offenses Drug Public order offenses 

District terminationsb offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

Nebraska 125 12.0% 25.0% 6.0% 30.0% 17.1% 25.0% 4.5% 
Nevada 310 21.0 22.2 18.5 34.8 23.1 7.1 22.4 
New Hampshire 33 15.2 0 0 0 0 60.0 12.5 
New Jersey 451 12.4 33.3 12.3 22.9 9.0 3.8 13.8 
New Mexico 180 6.7 30.0 7.3 10.5 3.4 3.6 3.8 

New York, Eastern 473 12.1% 13.3% 14.1% 10.9% 17.9% 8.3% 7.3% 
New York, Northern 109 1.8 0 0 0 0 14.3 3.0 
New York, Southern 719 12.1 69.2 7.4 20.0 18.1 13.2 4.4 
New York, Western 180 18.9 0 20.4 19.4 14.6 6.7 27.0 
North Carolina, Eastern 444 16.2 33.3 13.4 34.0 16.9 8.3 13.2 

North Carolina, Middle 112 27.7% 0 % 28.8% 30.8% 46.2% 25.0% 13.6% 
North Carolina, Western 269 20.8 18.2 29.2 35.0 13.5 7.7 20.6 
North Dakota 76 23.7 53.8 10.0 31.3 33.3 0 0 
Ohio, Northern 247 18.2 20.0 15.6 26.2 22.5 5.3 17.1 
Ohio, Southern 258 11.6 0 11.7 17.2 13.6 9.1 8.2 

Oklahoma, Eastern 43 4.7% 10.0% o % o % o % o % 
Oklahoma, Northern 101 16.8 33.3 13.6 28.6 21.1 0 22.2 
Oklahoma, Western 148 13.5 0 13.2 18.8 12.5 12.5 14.0 
Oregon 128 25.0 44.4 22.2 42.9 25.0 15.4 16.7 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 496 22.0 29.4 26.8 36.4 20.0 12.2 12.3 

Pennsylvania, Middle 153 3.3% 0 % 3.6% o % o % 6.3% 5.9% 
PennsylVania, Western 129 9.3 0 9.4 30.8 6.7 0 5.6 
PUerto Rico 166 7.8 0 9.0 20.8 5.0 0 2.8 
South Carolina 124 21.8 100.0 23.8 14.3 25.0 10.7 30.4 
South Dakota 86 18.6 46.2 12.5 26.3 8.3 16.7 0 

Tennessee, Eastern 168 11.9% o % 17.9% 20.0% 9.1% 6.7% 9.8% 
Tennessee, Middle 198 17.7 0 25.4 26.3 14.3 9.1 7.5 
Tennessee, Western 208 14.4 25.0 16.8 32.0 2.5 0 8.3 
Texas, Eastern 86 8.1 8.3 10.0 0 18.2 5.6 
Texas, Northern 291 17.9 25.0 15.2 33.3 33.3 0 15.4 

Texas, Southern 899 24.4% 60.0% 20.5% 24.5% 30.4% 10.3% 22.1% 
Texas, Western 498 16.7 10.0 14.3 10.8 22.8 8.0 18.6 
Utah 196 12.8 0 17.5 20.0 18.5 18.2 6.7 
Vermont 42 7.1 0 0 10.0 0 12.5 
Virgin Islands 57 33.3 41.7 15.4 52.4 33.3 0 0 

Virginia, Eastern 1,203 18.5% 8.7% 13.1% 17.8% 20.5% 17.6% 19.1% 
Virginia, Western 174 8.0 40.0 10.5 20.0 3.2 3.1 6.9 
Washington, Eastern 91 12.1 0 6.7 15.4 15.0 18.2 10.3 
Washington, Western 385 17.7 40.0 15.5 17.6 17.6 23.5 15.5 
West Virginia, Northern 72 18.1 16.0 75.0 13.3 0 16.7 

West Virginia, Southern 127 7.1% 3.0% 8.3% 7.3% 0 % 15.8% 
Wisconsin, Eastern 110 18.2 0 14.6 50.0 25.0 0 13.8 
Wisconsin, Western 48 14.6 12.5 33.3 8.3 0 15.4 
Wyoming 50 2.0 0 0 0 0 0 5.6 

Note: Original offenses are classified by most serious offense of b Data describe probation terms which terminated In 
conviction. 1990 because of a violation, because the term expired, 
... No cases of this type occurred In the data. or for administrative reasons • 

a Supervision terminated with reincarceration or removal to inactive See text table 5.1. 
status for violation of supervision conditions or charges for new 
offenses. 
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Table D·5.3 Probation supervisions terminating with a new crime, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crimea 

Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

Total Race Age Known No 
probation Sex Non· drug known 

District terminationsb Male Female White Black other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·20 21·30 31-40 Over 40 history abuse 

All districts 23,541 5.0% 2.7% 3.9% 6.3% 4.2% 5.9% 4.3% 3.7% 6.2% 6.4% 4.7% 2.5% 7.5% 3.9% 

Alabama, Middle 185 4.1% 3.1% 2.B% 5.6% 0 % 0 % 3.B% o % 4.1% 6.0% 1.8% o % 3.0% 
Alabama, Northern 339 7.5 5.7 5.4 10.1 0 0 7.1 0 7.1 13.0 5.1 1.1 17.4 5.3 
Alabama, Southern 118 6.9 6.5 7.1 6.7 0 0 7.1 0 11.1 8.B 3.6 12.5 7.0 
Alaska 44 3.2 0 0 16.7 0 2.3 0 0 0 0 0 3.0 
Arizona 723 3.1 0 1.6 4.2 5.4 1.6 2.B 0 2.8 3.9 .9 2.4- 0 3.7 

Arkansas, Eastern 126 3.3% 2.8% 1.4% 5.9% o % o % 3.2% 0 % 6.7% 2.0% 2.3% 11.8% 2.2% 
Arkansas, Western 73 7.1 5.9 3.3 25.0 0 7.2 0 0 4.8 10.0 7.7 25.0 6.1 
California, Central 869 7.1 2.6 5.3 9.3 4.0 6.4 6.0 0 0 7.5 7.9 4.2 10.4 5.4 
California, Eastern 309 4.5 0 3.7 3.2 0 16.7 3.3 0 5.1 3.1 2.5 4.8 3.9 
California, Northern 540 7.7 3.1 6.4 7.1 3.7 5.3 6.4 0 0 6.5 5.7 5.5 12.2 5.0 

California, Southern 762 3.6% 3.3% 3.2% 7.9% o % 3.9% 3.4% 20.0% 5.3% 4.8% 2.4% 2.6% 2.5% 3.7% 
Colorado 284 9.6 4.6 9.1 7.3 0 21.1 7.5 0 14.5 5.5 7.0 22.9 7.8 
Connecticut 152 3.2 3.7 3.3 3.4 0 3.5 0 5.3 3.0 7.9 1.8 
Delaware 45 5.4 25.0 0 26.7 8.9 7.7 23.1 0 0 14.8 
District of Columbia 359 5.5 .B 0 5.4 0 5.6 3.8 0 5.4 5.6 .9 9.3 1.9 

Florida, Middle 324 5.2% o % 3.0% 9.6% o % o % 4.1% o % 0 % 6.3% 5.6% 2.5% 7.7% 4.1% 
Florida, Northern 215 4.6 3.2 3.1 6.4 20.0 0 4.2 0 0 7.1 4.7 1.5 0 7.7 
Florida, Southern 606 6.7 1.9 5.3 6.1 8.2 4.4 0 7.4 6.8 3.3 10.0 4.2 
Georgia, Middle 282 5.1 4.5 5.9 4.0 0 0 5.1 0 0 11.3 1.4 0 0 4.1 
Georgia, Northern 397 6.0 1.8 4.0 6.4 0 0 4.8 0 0 6.6 2.7 5.6 12.7 4.2 

Georgia, Southern 237 3.2% 0 % 2.2% 2.0% a 'l'.i 0 % 2.2% a % 0 % 0 % 4.5% 3.3% 9.5% 1.8% 
Hawaii 116 1.2 a 2.3 a 0 .9 a 0 2.9 a 10.0 0 
Idaho 77 1.7 0 1.4 a 0 1.4 0 2.9 0 0 1.5 
Illinois, Central 147 6.3 0 1.7 19.2 0 a 4.9 a 11.4 a 5.1 2.8 5.3 
Illinois, Northern 76& 1.1 .7 .8 1.5 0 2.6 1.0 a 0 1.9 1.1 .8 5.2 .5 

Illinois, Southern 122 7.5% 2.4% 5.5% 6.5% 5.7% a % a %14.3% 2.1% 6.7% o % 7.1% 
Indiana, Northern 135 5.5 'I) 3.6 4.1 a 0 4.0 7.4 5.3 0 12.5 1.8 
Indiana, Southern 199 1.8 a 1.2 2.8 0 0 1.5 0 a 1.9 1.7 1.2 2.5 1.3 
Iowa, Northern 48 2.9 0 2.3 0 0 2.1 5.9 0 0 a 3.0 
Iowa, Southern 50 3.4 0 2.5 0 2.0 a 6.3 0 0 2.8 

Kansas 154 B.6% 6.1% 6.5% 10.0% 16.7% o % 8.2% 100.0% 20.0% 9.1% 2.1% 8.9% 4.3% 8.2% 
Kentucky, Eastern 63 16.0 7.7 15.0 0 a 14.3 0 25.0 22.2 6.5 50.0 12.3 
Kentucky, Western 382 4.5 a 2.3 6.3 0 a 3.5 33.3 2.7 1.7 9.3 0 6.3 4.0 
Louisiana, Eastern 411 2.8 4.2 2.4 5.0 a a 3.2 0 2.6 4.9 2.1 8.9 2.8 
Louisiana, Western 267 1.4 1.9 1.4 1.8 0 a 1.5 0 9.1 2.2 1.7 0 a 1.3 

Maine 50 2.4% o % 2.1% o % a % o % 2.0% ... 100.0% o % a % o % o % o % 
Maryland 1,167 4.0 1.9 2.7 5.0 0 3.4 3.6 a 14.0 5.2 2.0 1.8 5.7 3.4 
Massachusetts 228 5.7 0 3.8 17.6 0 20.0 4.5 0 7.8 9.6 0 14.3 2.8 
Michigan, Eastern 5B2 3.4 1.4 2.2 4.5 0 0 2.9 6.5 SA 2.8 1.8 1.9 4.1 
Michigan, Western 153 4.5 2.4 1.7 13.3 a 3.9 0 5.3 5.8 1.6 8.0 3.3 

Minnesota 151 5.0% 6.5% 3.0% 21.4% 20.0% a % 5.4% 9.1% 6.8% 1.6% 14.3% 2.5% 
Mississippi, Northern 108 5.1 0 2.4 7.7 3.7 a a 3.8 6.3 2.6 33.3 2.4 
Mississippi, Southern 163 10.7 9.5 7.6 16.4 a 0 10.6 0 15.6 9.4 9.8 6.3 9.6 
Missouri, Eastern 142 0 8.9 2.1 4.3 a 2.8 0 4.0 4.3 1.4 10.5 1.7 
Missouri, Western 174 6.1 7.1 7.0 5.1 a 6.3 a 3.0 10.9 3.9 13.6 4.0 
Montana 98 1.4 0 1.8 0 0 1.1 0 a a 2.8 0 1.3 
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Table D·5.3 Continued 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crimea 

Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

Total Race Age Known No 
probation Sex Non· drug known 

District terminationsb Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·20 21·30 31·40 Over 40 history abuse 

Nebraska 125 2.0% a % 1.0% a % 14.3% a % 1.6% a % ... 7.1% a % a % a % 1.1% 
Nevada 310 7.6 4.3 7.1 9.1 a 27.3 5.6 16.7 12.2 10.7 2.1 14.3 1.4 
New Hampshire 33 3.7 a 3.1 a 3.0 a a 5.3 a 4.0 
New Jersey 451 2.B 6.6 2.9 4.6 a 2.8- 3.4 a 3.0 1.3 5.4 1.3 3.7 
New Mexico 180 2.0 a 2.0 a a a 2.3 a a 1.8 1.8 1.6 a 2.6 

New York, Eastern 473 3.1% a % 1.7% 3.7% 2B.6% a % 2.6% a % 2.9% 4.4% 1.0% 5.5% 1.7% 
New York, Northern 109 1.2 a 1.0 a a .9 4.5 a a a 1.2 
New York, Southern 719 3.1 1.4 2.4 3.B a 4.9 2.2 a a 7.3 2.9 .6 8.9 .B 
New York, Western 180 4.0 3.2 3.5 5.7 a a 3.9 a 11.6 3.3 a 6.3 4.2 
North Carolina, Eastern 444 4.2 2.8 4.1 3.7 0 0 3.9 0 4.0 5.6 2.7 2.0 4.5 3.9 

North Carolina, Middle 112 11.1% 3.2% 6.2% 12.8% a % 9.2% a % 7.4% 13.3% 5.1% 11.1% 8.9% 
North Carolina, Western 269 8.8 4.7 5.0 14.0 23.1 0 7.8 12.5 10.0 13.6 4.1 4.7 5.6 6.2 
North Dakota 76 3.4 a 0 a 5.9 a 2.7 a a 3.8 5.3 0 8.3 1.9 
Ohio, Northern 247 5.4 4.5 3.9 9.2 0 a 5.5 a 7.9 6.6 2.2 33.3 0 
Ohio, Southern 258 4.2 6.1 4.0 7.4 a a 4.7 a a 7.9 4.9 2.8 0 5.8 

Oklahoma, Northern 101 5.3% o % 4.1% 3.7% 4.0% ... 100.0% 8.0% a % 2.4% 11.8% 2.6% 
Oklahoma, Western 148 7.3 1.9 2.5 9.1 42.9 0 5.6 15.6 2.0 a 16.1 2.8 
Oregon 128 4.3 2.9 4.3 a a 0 4.0 a 16.7 2.0 0 4.0 3.5 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 496 1.0 0 1.0 .5 0 0 .8 0 0 1.9 .4 2.9 .3 
Pennsylvania, Middle 153 3.4 a 2.9 a a 0 2.6 6.9 3.6 a 6.7 1.0 

Pennsylvania, Western 129 6.5% 0 % 2.9% 11.5% o % 4.7% 17.6% 5.0% 1.4% 11.8% 3.8% 
Puerto Rico 166 2.5 a 1.9 1.8 3.3 0 a 2.0 3.3 0 5.9 1.7 
South Carolina 124 8.1 10.5 8.7 9.4 8.9 10.0 9.8 7.5 21.4 6.0 
South Dakota 86 7.9 4.3 2.9 9.6 7.0 a 28.6 7.7 6.9 a a 7.4 
Tennessee, Eastern 168 7.5 a 6.3 14.3 a 6.5 a a 8.5 7.3 5.0 16.7 4.2 

Tennessee, Middle 198 7,2% 5.0% 5.6% 9.3% a % o % 6.6% 25,0% 4.8% 9.7% 4.2% 10.7% 6.3% 
Tennessee, Western 208 5.8 7.2 5.1 7.7 6.3 8.5 5.4 5.3 14.3 5.1 
Texas, Eastern 86 3.3 11.5 6.2 4.8 a 6.1 a 11.1 4.2 2.9 22.2 5.1 
Texas, Northern 291 6.1 1.6 5.1 5.7 a 9.7 4.6 5.2 8.5 2.5 6.1 5.4 
Texas, Southern 899 7.9 5.4 7.9 2.6 a 9.5 4.1 a 15.4 8.3 8.5 4.9 14.5 7.1 

Texas, Western 498 6.5% 3.8% 5.5% 7.9% 10.0% 6.1% 5.7% 13.3% 6,1% 7.2% 3.4% 9.0% 5.2% 
Utah 196 5.2 a 3.9 15.4 a 12.5 4.3 a 3.9 8.2 1.3 a 5.6 
Vermont 42 2.8 a 2.6 a 2.5 a 6.3 a a 3.3 
Virgin Islands 57 16.0 a 0 15.4 a 17.8 20.0 17.6 7.7 a 28.6 3.1 
Virginia, Eastern 1,203 9.0 3.1 7.0 10.3 9.4 a 8.3 0 11.6 9.7 7.8 2.9 8.3 7.4 
Virginia, Western 174 5,4 a 3.9 9.1 0 4.6 0 a 7.0 3.6 4.5 6.9 5.6 

Washington, Eastern 91 4.8% 3.6% 4.6% a % 5.3% 4.2% a % a % 6.5% 3.2% 4.0% 11.1% 3.4% 
Washington, Western 385 3.5 1.0 2.7 6.1 a a 2.9 a a 3.2 4.1 1.9 11.9 .7 
West Virginia, Northern 72 9.5 22.2 3.4 50.0 0 11.1 33.3 4.5 5.9 23.6 6.5 
West Virginia, Southern 127 4.0 3.6 4.3 0 4.0 a 9.1 1.9 4.0 5.6 2.5 
Wisconsin, Eastern 110 1.3 0 0 3.6 a a .9 a 3.1 a a a 1.2 
Wisconsin, Western 48 5.6 a 4.4 a a a 4.3 a 5.9 5.3 0 5.9 

... No cases of this type occurred in the data. b Data describe probation terms which terminated in 1990 
a Supervision terminated with incarceration or removal to inactive because of a Violation, because the term expired, or for 

status after arrest for a "major" or "minor" offense. administrative reasons. 
See text table 5.2. 
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Table D-5.4 Probation supervisions terminating with a new crime or technical violation, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crime or technical violation a 

Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

Total Race Age Known No 
probation Sex Non· drug known 

District terminalionsb Male Female White Black Other Hisp'anic Hispanic 16·16 19·20 21·30 31·40 Over 40 history abuse 

All district, 23,541 17.0% 12.6% 12.9% 25.3% 16.1% 19.5% 15.6% 19.1% 24.6% 23.0% 17.3% 7.6% 30.7% 12.0% 

Alabama, Middle 165 12.4% 7.8% 9.2% 13.9% 0 % o % 11.0% o % 13.7% 16.0% 1.6% 25.0% 9.0% 
Alabama, Northem 339 21.6 16.1 13.7 31.8 0 0 20.5 50.0 35.7 32.1 17.3 4.3 50.0 11.5 
Alabama, Southem 11B 20.7 16.1 15.3 33.3 0 0 20.5 100.0 33.3 23.5 9.4 50.0 19.0 
Alaska 44 6.5 0 2.9 16.7 0 4.7 0 0 7.1 0 0 6.1 
Arizona 723 24.7 14.2 19.4 33.3 33.3 25.3 21.6 23.1 25.0 27.1 25.1 10.4 34.5 19.B 

Arkansas, Eastem 126 7.6% 5.6% 2.7% 13.7% o % o % 7.2% ... 100.0% 13.3% 5.9% 2.3% 29.4% 3.3% 
Arkansas, Westem 73 10.7 11.B B.2 25.0 25.0 10.1 0 0 4.6 10.0 15.4 50.0 9.1 
Califomia, Central 869 19.7 11.6 15.1 30.2 10.0 14.9 18.6 0 25.0 26.9 21.0 11.2 39.6 14.1 
Califom ia, Eastem 309 25.9 10.6 22.1 29.0 14.3 63.3 21.5 57.1 26.3 24.5 10.1 38.7 16.1 
Califomia, Northem 540 18.2 9.9 13.7 18.8 16.7 10.5 15.7 0 66.7 19.6 16.2 9.3 24.4 13.5 

Califomia, Southem 762 24.1% 21.B% 22.5% 38.1% 11.1% 21.9% 24.3% 40.0% 42.1% 31.4% 23.9% B.9% 31.3% 15.4% 
Colorado 284 21.9 18.5 18.2 30.9 33.3 42.1 19.6 0 31.6 22.0 14.0 51.4 18.4 
Connecticut 152 15.2 3.7 13.1 13.8 0 14.1 10.3 15.8 12.1 23.7 9.9 
Delaware 45 16.2 25.0 0 53.3 17.8 15.4 46.2 0 16.7 18.5 
District of Columbia 359 16.9 16.4 3.2 21.8 0 5.6 17.3 26.6 21.4 20.0 7.1 27.8 10.2 

Florida, Middle 324 19.0% 15.3% 13.3% 44.2% o % 12.5% 1B.4% o %100.0%28.1%25.8% 9.2% 33.3% 15.0% 
Fiorida, Northern 215 25.5 8.1 18.4 27.7 20.0 0 20.6 20.0 31.3 31.0 16.3 7.6 22.2 21.2 
Florida, Southern 606 19.1 14.3 14.7 31.3 19.9 17.1 0 26.4 20.8 10.7 34.3 13.5 
Georgia, Middle 282 16.3 9.0 9.6 20.0 25.0 0 14.6 0 0 23.5 12.2 6.4 7.7 14.7 
Georgia, Northern 397 23.2 17.0 15.6 31.9 16.7 0 21.6 50.0 5.6 27.9 29.1 11.8 45.5 17.0 

Georgia, Soutf)9rn 237 16.9% 6.0% 11.9% 15.2% o % 33.3% 12.6% o % 15.4% 12.6% 15.2% 11.5% 57.1% 9.9% 
Hawaii 116 6.2 5.7 4.7 50.0 5.6 6.0 0 15.0 11.8 0 10.0 3.2 
Idaho 77 16.7 5.9 14.1 16.7 0 15.5 11.1 23.5 5.9 33.3 12.3 
Illinois, Central 147 19.8 5.6 12.7 34.6 0 0 16.9 33.3 22.9 12.0 15.3 13.9 14.9 
Illinois, Northern 769 18.3 15.8 9.3 33.8 0 17.9 17.8 0 60.0 36.5 24.0 8.0 46.4 12.9 

Illinois, Southem 122 16.3% 7.1% 12.1% 16.1% 13.1% o % 0 %33.3% B.3% 11.1% o % 13.3% 
indiana, Northern 135 11.0 6.B 6.0 16.3 0 0 10.4 11.1 14.0 3.9 31.3 6.4 
Indiana, Southem 199 12.1 0 6.B 25.0 0 50.0 9.7 0 66.7 15.1 10.3 4.9 10.0 10.0 
!owa, Northern 48 17.6 0 11.4 100.0 a 12.5 29.4 7.1 0 27.3 6.1 
Iowa, Southern 50 6.9 9.5 7.5 10.0 B.O 7.1 12.5 5.0 25.0 5.6 

Kansas 154 18.1% 12.2% 12.0% 25.0% 33.3% 12.5% 16.4% 100.0% 40.0% 22.7% 14.6% 8.9% 13.0% 14.5% 
Kentucky, Eastern 63 18.0 23.1 20.0 0 0 19.0 0 41.7 22.2 9.7 50.0 17.5 
Kentucky, Westem 382 6.6 2.1 3.9 9.9 a 0 5.7 33.3 2.7 4.0 12.0 2.2 12.5 6.2 
Louisiana, Eastern 411 10.4 20.0 5.2 30.8 0 0 12.7 20.0 18.3 13.3 7.5 35.6 10.8 
Louisiana, Middle 106 5.7 26.3 2.4 33.3 9.4 0 12.1 12.5 3.4 66.7 9.B 

Louisiana, Western 267 8.4% 1.9% 4.B% 16.1% o % o % 6.9% 50.0% 9.1% 9.0% 6.7% 4.9% 9.5% 9.0% 
Maine 50 9.B 0 8.3 a 0 a 8.2 ... 100.0 12.5 a 5.9 15.4 2.9 
Ma'Yland 1,167 16.1 12.0 11.1 20.9 17.2 6.9 15.6 0 34.9 21.5 13.3 6.4 24.1 12.3 
Massachusetts 228 8.3 0 5.7 23.5 0 40.0 6.3 0 11.B 13.7 0 21.4 3.9 
Michigan, Eastern 582 12.7 9.2 B.7 19.0 a a 11.9 12.9 13.6 14.8 6.0 16.9 9.B 
Michigan, Western 153 11.7 14.3 5.9 40.0 0 12.4 0 18.4 17.3 4.8 28.0 6.6 

Minnesota 151 10.8% 9.7% 7.6% 35.7% 20.0% a % 10.7% 18.2% 13.6% 3.2% 19.0% 6.6% 
Mississippi, Northern 108 7.6 3.4 4.9 11.5 6.5 0 0 15.4 6.3 2.6 66.7 2.4 
Mississippi, Southern 163 26.4 23.8 18.1 41.8 a a 26.1 0 25.0 31.3 19.7 43.!! 24.0 
Missouri, Eastern 142 6.2 13.3 5.3 14.9 0 8.5 ... 100.0 20.0 6.4 4.3 31.6 5.2 
Missouri, Westem 174 12.1 14.3 11.6 17.9 a 12.6 0 12.1 17.2 9.2 27.3 7.2 
Montana 98 7.0 0 7.1 2.4 a 5.4 a 3.1 3.4 8.3 a 3.9 
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Table 0-5.4 Continued 

Percent of probation supervisions terminating with a new crime or technical violationa 

Elhnicity 
Drug abuse 

Total Race Age Known No 
probation Sex Non· drug known 

District terminatlonsb Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·16 19·2021·30 31·40 Over 40 history abuse 

Nebraska 125 14.1% 3.6% 7.6% 20.0% 57.1% o % 12.2% 10MX, ... 26.6% 6.3% 3.4% 21.4% 7.9% 
Nevada 310 20.9 21.3 20.2 27.3 33.3 36.4 19.8 33.3 36.5 19.0 12.7 39.3 13.1 
New Hampshire 33 14.8 16.7 15.6 0 15.2 50.0 9.1 15.6 66.7 8.0 
New Jersey 451 11.6 16.4 6.0 26.6 0 11.1 12.6 14.3 17.6 12.7 9.1 19.0 9.4 
New Mexico 160 6.B 6.1 5.9 8.3 13.3 0 9.1 0 33.3 6.B 5.4 4.6 4.5 1.B 

New York, Eastern 473 13.4% 5.9% 9.5% 19.4% 26.6% 16.7% 12.0% o % 16.3% 14.6% 6.7% 30.9% 8.6% 
New York, Northern 109 2.4 0 1.0 25.0 0 1.8 9.1 0 0 0 1.2 
New York, South'IJrn 719 13.0 6.4 B.3 19.9 6.3 17.2 10.6 0 0 26.0 14.6 2.5 27.4 5.6 
New York, Western 160 19.5 16.1 14.7 31.4 100.0 0 19.0 25.0 32.6 15.0 13.7 lB.6 17.4 
North Carolina, Eastern 444 14.6 21.1 13.3 21.3 30.6 20.0 16.2 40.0 12.0 21.2 16.4 5.9 31.8 14.1 

North Carolina, Middle 112 27.2% 29.0% 15.4% 44.7% o % 26.4% o % 40.7% 28.9% 17.9% 61.1% 20.0% 
North Carolina, Western 269 21.0 20.3 15.6 36.8 3cr.ll 100.0 20.5 25.0 10.0 28.4 23.3 14.1 22.2 19.9 
North Dakota 76 25.9 16.7 10.0 0 41.2 0 24.0 16.7 25.0 36.5 26.3 0 50.0 15.4 
Ohio, Northern 247 20.7 6.8 13.4 32.3 0 44.4 17.4 0 27.0 24.2 6.6 91.7 22.7 
Ohio, Southern 25B 10.4 15.2 9.4 20.4 0 0 11.7 0 33.3 20.6 13.4 4.6 27.5 8.5 

Oklahoma, Eastern 43 5.6% o % 5.4% o % 0 % 4.7% o % 0 % o % o % o % 
Oklahoma, Northern 101 17.1 16.0 14.9 22.2 17.0 ... 100.0 24.0 20.6 7.3 41.2 11.8 
Oklahoma, Western 148 15.6 9.6 9.3 27.3 42.9 0 13.9 31.1 8.0 3.B 41.9 6.4 
Oregon 128 26.6 20.6 22.2 B3.3 20.0 0 25.4 85.7 41.7 22.0 10.6 40.0 18.8 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 496 22.3 20.5 11.3 36.8 66.7 30.0 21.9 0 41.5 26.5 11.5 42.3 13.4 

Pennsyivania, Middle 153 4.2% o % 3.6% o % o % o % 3.3% 6.9% 3.6% 1.5% 6.1% 2.0% 
Pennsylvania, Western 129 11.6 2.8 3.9 30.8 0 9.3 29.4 10.0 4.2 23.5 5.7 
Puerto Rico 166 9.1 4.4 8.4 7.3 8.7 7.1 0 11.B B.2 4.1 17.6 7.8 
South Carolina 124 19.B 26.3 15.2 40.6 21.8 40.0 22.0 11.3 57.1 16.0 
South Dakota 86 22.2 8.7 8.8 25.0 16.6 100.0 42.9 26.9 17.2 0 0 19.1 

Tennessee, Eastern 166 12.3% 9.1% 11.9% 14.3% o % 11.9% o % 0 % 18.6% 9.8% B.3% 27.8% 9.3% 
Tennessee, Middle 198 14.5 25.0 14.0 27.8 0 50.0 17.3 25.0 25.0 17.7 4.2 39.3 14.0 
Tennessee, Western 208 16.5 10.1 9.4 20.9 14.4 22.0 13.5 9.3 33.3 12.0 

Texas, Eastern 66 6.7 11.5' 7.7 9.5 0 B.5 0 14.6 6.3 2.9 33.3 6.B 
Texas, Northern 291 18.3 16.1 13.2 35.8 66.7 19.4 17.7 28.6 23.4 6.8 39.4 14.3 

Texas, Southern 899 26.4% 15.5% 24.6% 23.7% o % 26.8% 20.3% 100.0% 76.9% 34.1% 22.4% 11.5% 52.1% 16.4% 
Texas, Western 498 17.9 13.1 15.9 22.2 10.0 17.4 16.0 13.3 23.6 16.2 10.1 32.8 13.1 
Utah 196 12.7 13.0 10.0 46.2 33.3 12.5 12.8 60.0 11.8 13.1 9.2 25.0 11.2 
Vermont 42 5.6 16.7 7.1 0 7.5 11.8 6.3 0 28.6 3.3 
Virgin Islands 57 38.0 0 40.0 32.7 25.0 35.6 80.0 35.3 15.4 20.0 50.0 15.6 

Virginia, Eastern 1,203 20.2% 9.2% 16.3% 23.7% 9.4% 3.3% lB.9% o % 26.1% 21.8% 18.2% 6.3% 33.1% ' 13.7% 
Virginia, Western 174 8.8 3.7 7.9 9.1 0 8.1 0 25.0 14.0 5.5 4.5 13.8 5.6 
Washington, Eastern 91 '12.7 10.7 12.6 0 5.3 13.9 0 50.0 12.9 16.1 4.0 33.3 10.3 
Washington, Western 385 17.6 17.; 16.0 36.4 15.0 20.0 17.6 0 17.4 21.3 1B.4 12.4 38.1 12.7 
West Virginia, Northern 72 17.5 22.2 6.8 75.0 0 18.1 53.3 9.1 6.8 38.1 10.9 

West Virginia, Southern 127 7.1% 7.1% 7.7% o % 7.2% o % 18.2% 5.6% 4.0% 13.9% 3.8% 
Wisconsin, Eastern 110 16.9 21.2 12.5 35.7 0 0 18.5 0 18.6 23.1 13.2 40.0 18.3 
Wisconsin, Western 48 19.4 0 13.3 50.0 0 0 14.9 8.3 23.5 10.5 23.1 11.8 
Wyoming 50 2.4 0 2.2 0 0 0 2.2 7.1 0 0 7.1 0 

Note: Original offenses are classified by most serious offense of b Data describe probation terms which terminated In 1990 
conviction. because of a Violation, because the term expired, or fl)r 
... No cases of this type occurred In the data. administrative reasons. . 

a Supervision terminated with relncarceratlon or removal to Inactive See text table 5.2. 
status for violation of supervision conditions or charges for new 
offenses. 
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Table 0-5.5 Parole or supervised release terminating with a new crime, by original offense, 1990 

Number of Percent terminating supervision with a new crimea 
terminations of Original offense 
parole or 

All Violent Property offenses Drug Public order offenses superviRed 
District release offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All districts 14,981 10.5% 20.0% 8.2% 15.5% 8.3% 6.2% 9.9% 

Alabama, Middle 42 11.9% o % o % 16.7% 18.2% o % o % 
Alabama, Northern 187 13.9 29.4 9.8 22.2 11.1 0 10.7 
Alabama, Southern 78 10.3 0 9.1 0 9.4 27.3 
Arizona 373 7.5 11.5 3.4 11.8 7.5 0 3.4 
Arkansas, Eastern 88 11.4 25.0 13.6 0 13.9 0 0 

Arkansas, Western 29 10.3% 33.3% 28.6% o % o % o % 
California, Central 864 6.3 11.3 4.4 10.0 4.0 15.8 .9 
California, Eastern 241 7.1 16.4 6.3 11.1 3.2 2.4 
California, Northern 257 12.8 18.2 15.8 11.1 10.9 0 15.4 
California, Southern 359 5.6 5.9 9.1 18.2 4.6 0 5.2 

Colorado 186 15.6% 19.0% 6.9% 15.0% 15.1% 0 % 25.9% 
Connecticut 89 9.0 16.7 0 0 12.1 0 0 
Delaware 23 4.3 0 0 33.3 0 0 
District of Columbia 612 20.8 24.3 10.4 28.4 18.1 100.0 28.1 
Florida, Middle 518 7.1 25.0 6.6 15.2 5.4 11.1 0 

Florida, Northern 162 18.5% 22.2% 22.2% 33.3% 18.1% 33.3% o % 
Florida, Southern 1,030 8.6 7.4 11.7 14.3 8.3 4.8 7.7 
Georgia, Middle 63 20.6 53.3 10.0 27.3 6.7 0 0 
Georgia, Northern 236 12.3 20.5 7.0 18.8 9.7 0 13.6 
Georgia, Southern 89 7.9 30.0 11.1 6.7 2.4 0 

Idaho 18 27.8% 66.7% 25.0% o % 16.7% 0 % 50.0% 
Illinois, Central 66 4.5 0 0 0 6.7 q 14.3 
Illinois, Northern 277 7.2 21.1 0 7.7 8.1 0 9.1 
Illinois, Southern 61 3.3 50.0 0 0 0 0 0 
Indiana, Northern 79 11.4 42.9 8.3 8.3 7.1 0 20.0 

Indiana, Southern 98 12.2% 8.3% 7.7% 40.0% 13.0% 0 % 14.3% 
Iowa, Northern 33 9.1 25.0 0 0 0 0 28.6 
Iowa, Southern 53 9.4 0 0 0 12.5 0 14.3 
Kansas 103 18.4 46.2 15.0 12.5 12.5 18.2 
Kentucky, Eastern 83 15.7 58.3 7.7 11.8 10.0 0 0 

Kentucky, Western 119 8.4% 16.7% o % 30.0% 6.8% 0 % o % 
Louisiana, Eastern 165 7.3 12.5 7.1 5.9 7.2 0 20.0 
Louisiana, Western 53 3.8 0 16.7 0 0 0 
Maine 45 8.9 0 0 0 11.8 0 
Maryland 373 12.3 27.4 6.8 11.6 8.1 0 23.8 

Massachusetts 181 7.2% 14.3% 18.2% 14.3% 5.1% 0 % o % 
Michigan, Eastern 319 8.2 36.4 1.9 4.3 3.5 0 17.6 
Michigan, Western 69 , 14.5 33.3 16.7 12.5 9.7 16.7 
Minnesota 174 16.1 ,38.9 7.7 6.7 15.5 50.0 6.3 
Mississippi, Northern 31 32.3 75.0 16.7 0 44.4 50.0 20.0 

Mississippi, Southern 67 10.4% 20.0% o % 40.0% 9.1% 25.0% 8.3% 
Missouri, Eastern 214 21.5 21.4 13.9 30.0 21.4 0 32.0 
Missouri, Western 146 13.7 20.8 14.8 12.5 8.9 0 19.0 
Montana 41 4.9 0 0 0 0 33.3 20.0 
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Table 0·5.5 Continued 

Number of Percent terminating sUpelVision with a new crimea 
terminations of Original offense 
parole or 

All Violent Pro~ertv offenses Drug Public order offenses supelVi~ed 
District release offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory other 

Nebraska 43 11.6% 50.0% 11.1% 20.0% 9.1% o % o % 
Nevada 93 14.0 21.4 6.7 26.6 12.9 50.0 11.1 
New Jersey 246 4.9 6.6 4.7 6.3 3.7 0 7.7 
New Mexico 132 6.8 21.1 0 0 5.7 0 6.5 
New York, Eastern 532 4.5 12.2 5.4 4.0 4.1 0 0 

New York, Northern 53 3.8% 50.0% 14.3% o % o % 0 % 
New York, Southern 505 10.1 8.5 2.4 10.7 12.0 0 0 
New York, Western 56 8.9 0 9.1 16.7 4.0 100.0 0 
North Carolina, Eastern 106 20.8 40.9 14.3 33.3 3.8 0 20.0 
North Carolina, Middle 114 16.7 28.0 8.3 37.5 11.1 0 20.0 

North Carolina, Western 112 15.2% 31.8% 3.6% 30.0% 7.1% 0 % 7.7% 
North Dakota 35 11.4 13.3 0 16.7 12.5 0 
Ohio, Northern 211 16.6 18.0 30.0 26.1 8.9 0 16.7 
Ohio, Southern 193 15.5 26.7 13.3 38.1 6.6 0 5.3 
Oklahoma, Eastern 28 32.1 100.0 0 11.1 45.5 0 

Oklahoma, Northern 65 3.;% o % 5.6% o % 3.2% 0 % 0 % 
Oklahoma, Western 137 6.6 33.3 0 23.5 3.0 0 0 
Oregon 132 11.4 17.6 0 21.4 5.9 0 15.8 
Pennsylvania, Eastem 226 .4 4.2 0 0 0 0 0 
Pennsylvania, Middle 48 8.3 16.7 10.0 50.0 4.3 0 0 

Pennsylvania, Western 133 9.0% 17.6% 9.5% 11.8% 7.5% 0 % o % 
Puerto Rico 202 7.9 26.7 3.8 19.2 3.9 0 14.3 
Rhode Island 11 36.4 0 25.0 75.0 
South Carolina 60 20.0 62.5 22.2 9.1 5.9 16.7 
South Dakota 81 13.6 17.5 0 37.5 5.6 0 

Tennessee, Eastern 96 16.7% 41.7% 15.8% 4.5% 14.3% 20.0% 
Tennessee, Middle 115 11.3 12.5 4.8 21.1 3.6 0 16.7 
Tennessee, Western 111 9.9 28.6 0 20.0 5.8 0 14.3 
Texas, Eastern 101 Q~ 16.7 3.7 41.7 5.6 0 0 
Texas, Northern 427 10.1 7.1 8.9 11.8 9 .. 1 7.1 14.9 

Texas, Southern 791 11.3% 33.3% 20.3% 7.7% 1Q.4% 10.0% 8.2% 
Texas, Western 538 11.5 7.7 2.9 12.2 11.7 37.5 14.4 
Utah 42 9.5 20.0 0 0 13.3 0 0 
Virgin Islands 22 13.6 12.5 28.6 0 
Virginia, Eastern 228 15.4 37.5 8.6 30.0 8.0 0 14.6 

Virginia, Western 42 19.0% 50.0% o % 50.0% 5.9% 0 % 18.2% 
Washington, Eastern 44 9.1 20.0 0 0 5.3 0 16.7 
Washington, Western 122 9.8 24.1 11.1 0 5.2 0 6.7 
West Virginia, Northern 48 2.1 0 0 0 3.1 0 0 

West Virginia, Southern 50 12.0% 100.0% 25.0% 22.2% 6.7% 0 % 0 % 
Wisconsin, Eastern 62 9.7 28.6 0 16.7 3.6 0 
Wisconsin, Western 36 8.3 14.3 0 0 5.3 0 33.3 
Wyoming 12 16.7 0 0 16.7 50.0 

Note: Original offenses are classified by most serious offense of b Data describe supelVislon terms which terminated In 
conviction. !f!:.~ } 1990 because of a violation, because the term expired, 
... No cases of this type occurred in the data. ,pr for administrative reasons • 

a SupelVlslon terminated with relncarceration or removal to inactive Soo text table 5.3. 

status after arrest for a "malor" or "minor" offense. 
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Table 0-5.6 Parole or supervised release terminating with a new crime or technical violation, by original offense, 1990 

Number of Percent terminating supervision with 8 new crime or technical violations 
terminations of Original offense 
parole or 

All Violent Property offenses Drug Public order offenses supervl8ed 
District release offenses offenses Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory Other 

All dlatrlct. 14,981 30,5% 50.8% 28.0% 42.7% 25.5% 15.7% 28.3% 

Alabama, Middle 42 2t.4% 50.0% o % 16.7% 27.3% o % 20.0% 
Alabama, Northern 187 34.2 35.3 41.5 37.0 3M 0 32.1 
Alabama, Southern 78 37.2 0 36.4 30.0 40.6 45.5 
Alaska 11 9.1 0 0 0 25.0 0 
Arizo(la 373 28.2 51.3 20.7 29.4 23.1 0 19.0 

Arkansas, Eastern 88 25.0% 50.0% 40.9% 7.7% 19.4% 0 % 20.0% 
Arkansas, We!ltern 29 ' 17.2 33.3 28.6 20.0 8.3 0 
California, Central 864 32.8 60.3 25.4 46,0 16.6 21.1 25.0 
California, Eastern 241 40.7 70.9 31.3 55.6 ,'1,6 22.0 
California, Northern 257 29.6 54.5 28.9 48,1 "1,8 33.3 23.1 

California, Southern 359 32.3% 67.6% 51.5% 72.7% ~3.6% 10.0% 26.8% 
Colorado 186 28.0 23.8 27.6 50.0 22.1 0 37.0 
Connecticut 89 19.1 50,0 0 14.3 20.7 0 20,0 
Delaware 23 26.1 50.0 0 66,7 30.0 0 
District of Columbia 612 57.8 55.1 34.3 67.9 59.5 100.0 66.7 

Florida, Middle 518 28.4% 66.7% 31.1% 36.4% 23.3% 33.3% 25.0% 
Florida, Northern 162 30.2 44.4 33.3 50.0 29.3 33.3 10.0 
Florida, Southern 1,030 23.3 37.0 29.1 39.3 22.0 14.3 20.5 
Georgia, Middle 63 36.5 73,3 10.0 54.5 13,3 100.0 10.0 
Georgia, Northern 236 32.2 46.2 27.9 50.0 22.6 28.6 31.8 

Georgia, Southern 89 43,8% 80.0% 55.6% 53.3% 31.0% o % 
HawaII 48 16.7 20,0 25.0 50.0 15.4 0 0 
Idaho 18 44.4 66,7 25.0 0 50.0 0 100.0 
illinois, Central 66 30.3 0 5.9 37.5 43.3 0 42.9 
lainols, Northern 277 21.3 36.8 20.8 25.6 20.7 0 13.6 

illinois, Southern 61 23.0% 100.0% o % o % 17.1% 0 % 57.1% 
Indiana, Northern 79 25.3 42.9 25.0 41.7 19.0 0 20.0 
Indiana, Southern 98 24.5 37,5 15.4 40,0 17.4 0 42.9 
Iowa, Northern 33 30.3 50,0 0 100.0 11.8 0 71.4 
Iowa, Southern 53 26.4 33.3 0 66.7 21.9 0 28.6 

Kansas 103 31.1% 69.2% 40.0% 12.5% 20.0% 27.3% 
Kentucky, Eastern 83 SO.1 66.7 7.7 41.2 26.7 0 10.0 
Kentucky, Western 119 18.5 50.0 9.1 60.0 12.3 0 {) 

Louisiana, Eastern 165 29.1 50.0 21.4 58.8 23.7 18.8 20.0 
Louisiana, Middle 34 20.6 50.0 0 25.0 27.3 0 0 

Louisiana, Western 53 20,8% 33.3% 25.0% 6.7% 30,8% 20.0% 
Maine 45 15.6 0 0 0 20.6 0 
Maryland 373 33.8 59.7 31.8 32.6 25,8 0 47.6 
Massachusetts 181 11,6 21.4 27,3 28,6 8,5 0 0 
Michigan, Eastern 319 19.1 54.5 13,5 17.4 13.3 0 26,5 
Michigan, Western 69 29,0 50,0 27.8 62.5 19.4 16.7 

Minnesota 174 31.6% 50.0% 15.4% 46.7% 29.1% 50,0% 25.0% 
Mississippi, Northern 31 32.3 75,0 16.7 0 44.4 50,0 20.0 
Mississippi, Southern 67 25.4 40.0 21,1 60,0 18.2 25,0 25,0 
Missouri, Eastern 214 40.7 50.0 33.3 65.0 38.4 14.3 44.0 
Missouri, Western 146 29,5 58,3 37,0 43,8 12,5 50,0 19.0 
Montana 41 17.1 10,0 50,0 14,3 7.1 33.3 40,0 
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Table 0-5.6 Continued 

Number of Percent terminating supervision with a new crime or technical violationa 

terminations of Original offense 
parole or 

All Violent Pro~et:tl offenses Drug Public order offenses superviEed 
District release offenses offens~s Fraudulent Other offenses Regulatory other 

Nebraska 43 27.9% 50.0% 44.4% 20.0% 18.2% 66.7% o % 
Nevada 93 30.1 42.9 33.3 28.6 22.6 50.0 22.2 
New Jersey 246 21.1 55.9 16.3 18.8 14.7 0 23.1 
New Mexico 132 15.9 26.3 0 16.7 17.0 0 16.1 
New York, Eastern 532 16.5 31.7 14.3 20.0 15.8 0 10.5 

New York, Northern 53 11.3% 50.0% 28.6% 0 % 6.5% 11.1% 
New York, Southern 505 33.1 46.8 9.8 46.4 34.0 0 22.2 
New York, Western 56 32.1 20.0 36.4 58.3 16.0 100.0 50.0 
North Carolina, Eastern 106 37.7 59.1 28.6 66.7 11.5 25.0 33.3 
North Carolina, Middle 114 39.5 48.0 45.8 75.0 28.9 0 30.0 

North Carolina, Western 112 39.3% 50.0% 42.9% 60.0% 21.4% 0 % 23.1% 
North Dakota 35 37.1 33.3 0 66.7 25.0 40.0 
Ohio, Northern 211 27.0 34.0 50.0 34.8 16.5 0 16.7 
Ohio, Southern 193 30.1 42.2 26.7 42.9 25.0 0 15.8 
Oklahoma, Eastern 28 35.7 100.0 0 22.2 45.5 0 

Oklahoma, Northern 65 26.2% 50.0% 22.2% 16.7% 29.0% 0 % 28.6% 
Oklahoma, Western 137 16.8 44.4 29.2 23.5 11.9 0 0 
Oregon 132 34.1 64.7 15.4 50.0 15.7 0 31.6 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 226 25.7 50.0 15.4 62.5 23.1 20.0 15.0 
Pennsylvania, Middle 48 18.8 50.0 20.0 50.0 13.0 0 0 

Pennsylvania, Western 133 21.1% 47.1% 23.8% 29.4% 14.9% 0 % 0 % 
Puerto Rico 202 28.7 40.0 46.2 53.8 18.1 0 42.9 
Rhode Island 11 54.5 0 75.0 75.0 
South Carolina 0 33.3 75.0 22.2 54.5 11.8 33.3 
South Dakota 81 28.4 35.0 0 50.0 5.6 50.0 

Tennessee, Eastern 96 25.0% 58.3% 31.6% 9.1% 14.3% 33.3% 
Tennessee, Middle 115 25.2 37.5 19.0 42.1 21.4 33.3 19.4 
Tennessee, Western 111 20.7 42.9 4.5 46.7 15.4 0 14.3 
Texas, Eastern 101 33.7 50.0 29.6 83.3 25.0 0 26.7 
Texas, Northern 427 37.5 21.4 34.7 38.2 40.6 28.6 37.3 

Texas, Southern 791 36.5% 54.2% 43.8% 38.5% 34.3% 10.0% 39.9% 
Texas, Western 538 51.1 53.8 47.1 65.3 53.2 75.0 40.7 
Utah 42 35.7 50.0 33.3 66.7 26.7 0 25.0 
Vermont 32 6.3 0 0 7.1 0 10.0 
Virgin Islands 22 22.7 12.5 42.9 14.3 

Virginia, Eastern 228 28.9% 58.3% 20.0% 46.7% 17.0% 0 % 33.3% 
Virginia, Western 42 21.4 50.0 0 50.0 11.8 0 18.2 
Washington, Eastern 44 34.1 60.0 25.0 50.0 26.3 0 41.7 
Washington, Western 122 42.6 65.5 44.4 62.5 34.5 33.3 20.0 
West Virginia, Northern 48 6.3 0 0 0 9.4 0 0 

West Virginia, Southern 50 16.0% 100.0% 25.0% 33.3% 10.0% 0 % 0 % 
Wisconsin, Eastern 62 25.8 50.0 0 50.0 21.4 0 
Wisconsin, Western 36 22.2 28.6 0 0 26.3 0 33.3 
Wyoming 12 25.0 33.3 0 16.7 50.0 

Note: Original offenses are classified by most serious offense of b Data describe supervision terms which terminated in 
conviction. 1990 because of a violation, because the term expired, 
... No cases of this type occurred in the data. or for administrative reasons • 

a Supervision terminated with reincarceration or removal to inactive See text table 5.3. 
status for violation of supervision conditions or charges for new 
offenses. 
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Table 0-5.7 Parole or supervised release terminating with a new crime, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Number of 
Percent terminating supervision with a new crimea 

terminations of Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

parole or Race Age Known No 
supervi~ed 

Sex Non· drug known 
District release Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·20 21·30 31-40 Over 40 history abuse 

All districts 14,981 11.0% 5:1% 8.5% 15.0% 13.8% 8.9% 10.8% 50.0% 17.5% 11.7% 11.0% 8.9% 12.5% B.9% 

Alabama, Middle 42 10.0% 50.0% 5.0% 1B.2% 11.9% 16.7% 13.3% 9.5% 30.0% 6.5% 
Alabama, Northern 187 14.9 7.7 14.0 13.B 13.9 0 17.4 11.4 13.6 B.5 15.5 
Alabama, Southern 7B 10.0 12.5 6.8 15.2 0 10.3 0 6.7 7.1 14.7 12.5 7.9 
Arizona 373 7.B 0 5.2 17.6 15.4 4.1 9.7 0 20.0 4.0 10.6 4.5 10.B 6.6 
Arkansas, Eastern 8B 13.0 0 12.7 9.1 0 11.5 23.B 5.9 9.1 9.4 10.2 

Arkansas, Western 29 7.7% 33.3% 8.0% 25.0% o % 10.7% o %20.0% 6.7% 16.7% 5.3% 
California, Central 864 6.B 1.2 5.4 10.4 0 4.5 7.2 0 6.0 6.4 5.3 8.0 5.1 
California, Eastern 241 6.5 12.0 7.2 6.9 0 4.0 7.4 0 9.6 3.7 6.1 7.4 7.9 
California, Northern 257 13.3 9.7 11.1 14.9 27.3 9.1 13.1 5.4 17.1 9.6 15.2 11.5 
California, Southern 359 6.0 0 6.2 0 0 6.5 4.9 0 8.3 5.5 2.6 5.4 6.3 

Colorado 186 16.7% 0 % 13.4% 27.0% 0 % 12.5% 16.0% 20.5% 9.5% 20.6% 25.8% 6.9% 
Connecticut 89 9.2 0 7.8 12.0 7.1 9.3 0 4.8 13.5 6.9 18.5 4.3 
Delaware 23 4.5 0 9.1 0 0 4.3 0 0 0 14.3 0 6.3 
District of Columbia 612 23.0 7.6 4.2 21.4 0 21.1 0 21.9 20.7 19.5 23.6 16.B 
Florida, Middle 51B 7.7 1.9 5.4 11.9 0 0 7.2 0 5.7 8.4 6.5 10.3 5.8 

Florida, Northern 162 16.B% 12.5% 15.4% 2B.2% o % 18.4% 50.0% 46.4% 15.6% 5.6% 25.6% 11.3% 
Florida, Southern 1,030 8.9 5.9 8.7 B.5 0 9.3 8.1 33.3 7.3 9.9 7.7 12.4 8.0 
Georgia, Middle 63 22.4 0 9.8 40.9 0 21.0 10.0 45.5 6.7 23.1 20.0 
Georgia, Northern 236 13.6 a 11.2 14.0 0 12.4 7.7 1B.1 9.0 19.B 6.4 
Georgia, Southern B9 B.6 a 11.6 4.3 7.9 4.2 12.5 3.1 9.1 5.6 

Idaho 1B 26.7% 33.3% 21.4% 50.0% 66.7% 20.0% o % 50.0% 25.0% 28.6% 16.7% 44.4% 
Illinois, Central 66 4.9 a 5.8 a a 4.6 14.3 2.9 4.0 0 6.8 
Illinois, Northern 277 8.0 0 6.B B.2 0 13.6 6.7 5.6 8.6 6.B 10.0 4.9 
Illinois, Southern R1 3.5 a 2.2 6.7 3.3 a 3.3 4.5 a 5.7 
Indiana, Northern '19 12.5 a 7.7 19.2 0 a 13.4 18.2 13.8 7.7 14.3 7.0 

Indiana, Southern 98 11.7% 25.0% 11.1% 12.5% 100.0% a % 12.5% a % 6.3% 10.3% 15.0% 15.B% 7.4% 
Iowa, Northern 33 10.7 0 9.7 a a 9.1 ... 100.0 10.0 0 12.5 5.6 8.3 
Iowa, Southern 53 10.0 a 4.B 30.0 0 a 9.8 a 9.1 16.7 15.8 7.7 
Kansas 103 19.8 a 16.0 20.0 66.7 40.0 17.3 ... 100.0 26.9 20.5 8.3 20.4 19.0 
Kentucky, Eastern 83 16.2 11.1 14.1 25.0 a 15.9 25.0 5.9 20.0 19.2 9.3 

Kentucky, Western 119 B.9% o % 5.0% 27.B% B.4% ... 100.0% 3.6% 8.5% 7.5% 7.1% 10.0% 
Louisiana, Eastern 165 B.2 0 5.2 10.1 a 7.4 5.4 9.5 6.3 4.B 5.9 
Louisiana, Western 53 2.5 7.7 0 B.3 0 3.9 0 10.0 a a a a 
Maine 45 9.5 0 9.8 a a 9.1 22.2 a a 20.0 0 
Maryland 373 13.1 3.4 7.9 15.4 a 12.5 a 6.4 14.5 13.7 11.B 12.4 

Massachusetts 181 7.8% a % 7.3% 6.7% a % 4.2% 7.6% a % 7.9% 10.3% 3.7% 18.2% .9% 
Michigan, Eastern 319 9.0 0 5.7 11.0 25.0 7.9 10.9 8.B 6.4 10.2 7.B 
Michigan, Western 69 16.1 7.7 14.0 11.B 50.0 0 15.4 40.0 13.9 10.7 7.7 19.4 
Minnesota 174 17.7 0 9.2 28.9 B3.3 25.0 15.5 50.0 24.4 13.4 12.5 20.8 9.3 
Mississippi, Northern 31 33.3 0 25.0 40.0 32.3 50.0 41.7 15.4 33.3 30.0 

Mississippi, South\lrn 67 11.9% 0 % 9.8% 12.0% a % 10.4% ... 100.0% 16.7% 9.4% 5.0% 6.3% 11.1% 
Missouri, Eastern 214 23.7 a 13.5 29.7 50.0 21.5 29.2 19.3 19.2 22.B 20.2 
Missouri, Western 146 15.1 5.0 8.2 24.5 a 14.0 9.4 16.9 13.2 10.3 17.4 
Montana 41 5.4 a B.O a 4.9 ... 100.0 5.9 a 0 5.3 0 
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Table D-5.7 Continued 

Number of 
Percent terminating supervision with a new crimea 

terminations of Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

parole or Sex Race Age Known No 
superviEed Non· drug known 

District release Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·20 21·30 31·40 Over 40 history abuse 

Nebraska 43 9.8% 50.0% 5.7% 28.6% 100.0% 11.6% 28.6% 4.3% o % 12.5% 7.1% 
Nevada 93 13.6 16.7 14.3 16.7 0 0 14.6 28.6 12.5 8.5 15.2 14.6 
New Jersey 246 5.2 0 3.1 8.4 0 0 5.7 0 5.8 6.1 5.2 6.2 
New Mexico 132 7.1 0 6.4 0 12.5 2.4 8.9 33.3 2.8 11.8 2.4 7.5 6.8 
New York, Eastern 532 4.8 2.0 4.2 5.5 0 0 4.7 0 8.7 3.5 3.0 9.2 2.9 

New York, Northern 53 3.9% o % 2.3% 11.1% o % o % 3.8% 7.1% 0 % 6.3% o % 7.4% 
New York, Southern 505 10.6 4.7 9.7 11.0 6.3 13.4 7.5 100.0 0 14.6 10.4 4.7 14.9 6.6 
New York, Western 56 10.6 0 B.6 9.5 0 9.1 7.1 12.0 5.9 5.3 10.3 
North Carolina, Eastern 106 23.7 0 7.7 36.7 0 0 21.4 ... 100.0 24.0 23.8 13.5 4.8 25.0 
North Carolina, Middle 114 18.2 6.7 20.0 13.7 0 16.7 4.5 14.3 25.6 12.5 20.0 

North Carolina, Western 112 16.2% o % 16.4% 11.1% ·22.2% 15.2% o % 20.8% 13.3% 15.0% 10.3% 16.7% 
North Dakota 35 12.5 0 0 19.0 11.4 0 10.0 12.5 20.0 7.7 11.1 
Ohio, Northern 211 15.7 28.6 5.0 31.9 25.0 16.3 ... 100.0 20.0 14.8 14.5 27.8 24.0 
Ohio, Southern 193 17.3 4.0 15.0 16.7 0 0 15.7 12.2 14.9 19.1 18.8 13.3 
Oklahoma, Eastern 28 33.3 0 2B.O 100.0 0 32.1 ... 100.0 36.4 25.0 45.5 13.3 

Oklahoma, Northern 65 3.6% o % o % 12.5% 3.1% 7.1% o % 3.7% o % 6.5% 
Oklahoma, Western 137 5.6 16.7 6.3 2.9 28.6 0 6.8 0 12.9 5.2 4.4 6.5 2.9 
Oregon 132 11.7 8.3 B.8 25.0 33.3 0 11.5 20.0 7.3 10.9 7.3 7.8 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 226 .5 0 0 1.0 0 0 .5 0 0 1.2 0 0 0 
Pennsylvania, Middle 48 4.7 40.0 10.5 0 0 8.7 14.3 4.8 10.0 15.4 6.7 

Pennsylvania, Western 133 9.2% 7.7% 5.5% 17.1% o % 9.0% 20.0% 8.9% 6.5% 2.9% 11.5% 
Puerto Rico 202 8.6 0 8.0 8.0 7.7 8.9 0 11.4 5.4 10.2 B.2 10.1 
Rhode Island 11 40.0 0 36.4 0 40.0 0 42.9 100.0 50.0 42.9 
South Carolina 60 20.0 20.0 13.5 30.4 20.0 27.3 11.5 22.7 37.5 12.2 
South Dakota 81 15.7 0 0 18.6 13.6 66.7 10.0 18.5 5.0 9.1 14.3 

Tennessee, Eastern 96 16.9% 15.4% 16.9% 14.3% 16.7% 53.3% 14.3% 5.8% 26.1% 7.9% 
Tennessee, Middle 115 12.7 0 10.7 10.7 33.3 50.0 9.9 0 9.4 15.2 9.1 11.1 10.B 
Tennessee, Western 111 11.6 0 3.3 17.6 9.9 0 9.7 17.1 4.7 B.8 10.6 
Texas, Eastern 101 9.6 0 5.5 17.9 0 9.2 15.8 '9.3 5.1 7.1 8.9 
Texas, Northern 427 10.1 9.7 8.5 14.0 100.0 14.9 9.2 ... 100.0 12.7 10.6 7.6 9.6 10.1 

Texas, Southern 791 11.7% 5.2% 11.4% 9.8% 11.3% 11.2% o % 7.7% 11.8% 14.4% 14.7% 9.6% 
Texas, Western 538 12.1 6.1 10.6 16.1 33.3 9.8 13.7 16.7 4.9 13.0 15.1 9.5 8.7 
Utah 42 10.3 0 11.1 0 0 50.0 7.5 21.4 6.3 0 5.6 13.6 
Virgin Islands 22 13.6 16.7 12.5 2B.6 S.7 1S.7 11.1 0 28.6 8.3 
Virginia, Eastern 228 16.4 7.4 10.0 21.2 25.0 0 15.7 50.0 17.7 14.6 13.4 16.7 14.5 

Virginia, Western 42 21.6% o % 18.2% 22.2% 19.0% 20.0% 19.2% 16.7% 8.7% 29.4% 
Washington, Eastern 44 9.8 0 11.1 0 0 13.3 6.9 25.0 6.3 0 16.7 8.3 
Washington, Western 122 9.5 16.7 10.5 B.3 0 0 10.5 0 12.5 15.8 5.3 9.8 11.3 
West Virginia, Northern 48 2.3 0 0 4.6 0 2.1 0 5.9 0 0 0 

West Virginia, Southern 50 12.8% 0 % 9.1% 33.3% 12.0% 4.8% 16.7% 18.8% 10.0% 16.7% 
Wisconsin, Eastern 62 10.5 0 5.3 16.7 16.7 0 10.5 10.5 13.0 5.3 7.7 13.2 
Wisconsin, Western 36 6.5 20.0 9.4 0 0 0 8.6 14.3 14.3 0 13.3 5.6 
Wyoming 12 16.7 14.3 100.0 0 16.7 20.0 16.7 0 20.0 16.7 

... No cases of this type occurred In the data. b Data describe supervision terms which terminated in 1990 
a Supervision terminated with reincarceration or removal to because of a violation, because the term expired, or for 

inactive status after arrest for a "major" or "minor" offense. administrative reasons. 
See text table 5.4. 
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Table 0-5.8 Parole or supelVlsed release terminating wHh a new crime or technical violation, by offender characteristics, 1990 

Number of 
Percent terminating supervision with a new crime or technical violationa 

terminations of Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

parole or Race Age Known No 
superviged 

Sex Non· drug known 
District release Mt,le Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·2021·3031-40 Over 40 history abuse 

All districts 14,981 31.0% 25.8% 24.4% 45.3% 28.7% 30.8% 30.4% 100.0% 53.5% 34.7% 33.3% 24.2% 40.9% 21.7% 

Alabama, Middle 42 20.0% SO. 0% 15.0% 27.3% 21.4% 33.3% 13.3% 23.8% 40.0% 16.1% 
Alabama, Northem 187 34.2 34.6 24.8 55.2 34.2 0 47.8 34.3 25.8 39.0 23.2 
Alabama, Southern 78 35.7 50.0 29.5 48.5 0 37.2 ... 100.0 33.3 35.7 38.2 45.8 23.7 
Alaska 11 9.1 14.3 0 0 9.1 0 0 33.3 0 20.0 
Arizona 373 28.6 15.4 23.4 41.2 46.2 19.3 33.9 100.0 80.0 22.0 27.7 27.0 SO.O 24.7 

Arkansas, Eastern 88 26.0% 18.2% 27.3% "1.2% o % 25.3% 38.1% 17.6% 24.2% 25.0% 20.4% 
Arkansas, Western 29 15.4 33.3 12.0 50.0 0 17.9 0 30.0 13.3 16.7 15.8 
California, Central 864 33.4 26.8 28.6 52.2 3.6 29.4 34.6 23.1 38.5 34.7 28.1 45.7 19.2 
California, Eastern 241 39.8 48.0 38.5 62.1 0 20.0 43.1 ... 100.0 44.2 44.4 37.4 46.9 28.7 
California, Northern 257 29.6 29.0 19.9 51.4 36.4 27.3 29.8 ... .24.3 37.8 22.1 39.1 22.1 

California, Southern 359 31.4% 42.9% 29.0% 63.6% 40.0% 16.3% 44.2% SO.O% 34.3% 35.4% 25.6% SO.9% 25.3% 
Colorado 186 2~.3 8.3 24.6 45.9 0 33.3 27.2 38.5 22.6 28.6 33.3 15.8 
Connecticut 89 19.5 0 15.6 28.0 14.3 20.0 ... 100.0 14.3 18.9 17.2 25.9 12.8 
Delaware 23 27.3 0 9.1 45.5 0 26.1 ... 100.0 20.0 20.0 28.6 0 25.0 
District of Columbia 612 59.6 47.8 20.8 59.4 0 58.8 ... 100.0 55.5 62.6 50.3 62.1 35.0 

Florida, Middle 518 28.5% 26.9% 21.0% 47.6% 33.3% 16.7% 28.5% 50.0% 37.5% 31.9% 20.5% 41.0% 19.1% 
Florida, Northern 162 30.5 25.0 22.0 56.4 0 30.4 50.0 50.0 33.6 13.0 46.2 17.0 
Florida, Southern 1,030 24.1 14.1 21.6 32.9 0 20.9 25.4 ... 100.0 24.5 25.4 20.1 37.3 19.7 
Georgia, Middle 63 39.7 0 24.4 59.1 0 37.1 10.0 72.7 20.0 46.2 31.4 
Georgia, Northern 236 33.2 22.7 26.6 40.9 .0 32.5 28.2 38.3 29.0 42.0 20.8 

Georgia, Southern 89 44.4% 37.5% 30.2% 56.5% 43.8% 54.2% 56.3% 21.9% 40.9% 38.9% 
Hawaii 48 15.2 50.0 15.4 100.0 10.0 0 17.0 62.5 17.6 0 28.6 10.3 
Idaho 18 46.7 33.3 35.7 75.0 100.0 33.3 0 SO.O 50.0 42.9 16.7 55.6 
Illinois, Central 66 31.1 20.0 25.0 50.0 0 30.8 71.4 29.4 20.0 4B.2 20.6 
Illinois, Northern 277 23.1 3.8 16.4 30.6 0 27.3 20.8 25.0 28.0 16.2 37.1 13.7 

Illinois, Southern 61 24.6% o % 17.4% 40.0% 23.0% 22.2% 30.0% 13.6% 22.7% 20.0% 
Indiana, Northern 79 23.6 42.9 17.3 42.3 0 27.3 25.4 36.4 31.0 17.9 39.3 14.0 
Indiana, Southern 98 24.5 25.0 19.8 43.8 100.0 0 25.0 ... 100.0 6.3 30.8 22.5 26.3 18.5 
Iowa, Northern 33 32.1 20.0 32.3 0 0 30.3 .. , 100.0 40.0 21.4 25.0 22.2 41.7 
Iowa, Southern 53 28.0 0 21.4 50.0 0 0 27.5 38.5 22.7 22.2 42.1 15.4 

Kansas 103 32.3% 14.3% 26.7% 40.0% BS.7% 40.0% 30.6% ... 100.0% 4B.2% 33.3% 16.7% 34.7% 28.6% 
Kentucky, Eastern 63 31.1 22.2 2B.8 50.0 100.0 29.3 37.5 26.5 28.0 38.5 18.6 
Kentucky, Western 119 19.6 0 13.9 44.4 18.5 ... 100.0 17.9 17.0 12.5 21.4 17.1 
Louisiana, Eastern 165 30.1 21.1 16.7 46.4 33.3 29.0 27.0 34.9 25.0 39.7 14,1 
Louisiana, Middle 34 20.0 25.0 18.2 25.0 100.0 16.2 12.5 26.7 0 20.0 17,6 

Louisiana, Western 53 25.0% 7.7% 13.8% 29.2% 100.0% 17.6% o % 40.0% 10.5% 21.1% 11.1% 14.7% 
Maine 45 16.7 0 17.1 0 100.0 13.6 27.8 10.5 0 25.0 9.5 
Maryland 373 35.8 10.3 15.8 46.2 0 34.3 0 25.6 41.3 29.1 38.2 24.1 
Massachusetts 181 12.0 7.1 12.0 10.0 0 8.3 12.1 0 15.8 15.5 6.1 27.3 2.8 
Michigan, Eastern 319 20.8 3.2 14.4 24.8 50.0 18.7 20.0 23.4 14.4 28.0 12.8 
Michigan, Western 69 28.6 30.8 24.0 41.2 50.0 0 30.B ... 100.0 27.8 17.9 30.8 19.4 

Minnesota 174 34.2% 6.3% 20.8% 60.5% 83.3% 33.3% 31.7% 50.0% 36.6% 31.7% 27.1% 39.0% 20.0% 
Mississippi, Northern 31 33.3 0 25.0 40.0 32.3 50.0 41.7 15.4 33.3 30.0 
Mississippi, Suuthern 67 28.8 0 17.1 40.0 0 25.4 ... 100.0 25.0 34.4 10.0 25.0 26.7 
Missouri, Eastern 214 41.2 35.0 24.3 58.4 50.0 40.7 54.2 42.0 30.8 50.6 34.2 
Missouri, Western 146 31.7 15.0 21.6 44.9 0 29.4 18.8 37.3 28.3 27.6 29.0 
Montana 41 18.9 0 24.0 6.3 17.1 ... 100.0 17.6 7.1 22.2 15.8 5.9 
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Table 0-5.8 Continued 

Number of 
Percent terminating supervision with a new crime or technical violationa 

terminations of Ethnicity 
Drug abuse 

parole or Race Age Known No 
supervi~ed 

Sex Non· drug known 
District release Male Female White Black Other Hispanic Hispanic 16·18 19·20 21·30 31·40 Over 40 history abuse 

Nebraska 43 26.8% 50.0% 20.0% 57.1% 100.0% 27.9% 50.0% 17.4% 16.7% 25.0% 21.4% 
Nevada 93 30.9 25.0 28.6 41.7 25.0 0 31.5 52.4 29.2 19.1 39.4 20.8 
New Jersey 246 21.5 15.4 9.9 43.4 0 5.9 23.2 14.0 20.4 25.3 31.2 15.5 
New Mexico 132 15.9 16.7 15.5 33.3 12.5 11.9 17.8 33.3 8.3 29.4 4.8 22.5 9.5 
New York, Eastern 532 17.6 6.0 14.7 20.7 14.3 26.1 16.2 ... 100.0 21.4 17.8 12.1 27.5 14.0 

New York, Northern 53 11.8% o % 11.6% 11.1% o % o % 11.5% 7.1% 8.7% 18.8% 13.6% 11.1% 
New York, Southern 505 32.5 39.5 30.8 38.5 6.3 40.2 27.4 100.0 50.0 43.7 30.1 25.5 47.0 20.8 
New York, Western 56 31.9 33.3 14.3 61.9 0 32.7 50.0 36.0 11.8 42.1 20.7 
North Carolina, Eastern 106 39.8 23.1 15.4 63.3 20.0 0 37.9 ... 100.0 48.0 40.5 27.0 33.3 33.3 
North Carolina, Middle 114 41.4 26.7 36.7 45.1 0 39.5 18.2 46.9 41.9 30.0 36.4 

North Carolina, Western 112 41.0% 14.3% 29.9% 55.6% 44.4% 39.3% ... 100.0% 54.2% 44.4% 25.0% 41.4% 31.8% 
North Dakota 35 40.6 0 7.1 57.1 37.1 75.0 40.0 25.0 40.0 38.5 38.9 
Ohio, Northern 211 26.9 28.6 13.3 45.1 75.0 25.1 ... 100.0 34.0 27.2 21.1 55.6 28.0 
Ohio, Southern 193 29.2 36.0 24.2 40.3 0 50.0 29.8 28.6 28.4 30.9 42.2 21.9 
Oklahoma, Eastern 28 37.0 0 32.0 100.0 0 35.7 ... 100.0 45.5 25.0 54.5 13.3 

Oklahoma, Northern 65 26.8% 22.2% 22.4% 37.5% 26.2% 42.9% 29.2% 14.8% 32.1% 16.1% 
Oklahoma, Western 137 15.2 33.3 10.5 31.4 28.6 0 17.3 0 38.7 12.1 8.9 21.7 7.1 
Oregon 132 34.2 33.3 29.2 62.5 66.7 0 34.6 36.7 40.0 26.1 36.4 17.6 
Pennsylvania, Eastern 226 26.2 16.7 13.9 40.6 0 55.6 24.5 ... 100.0 43.3 33.7 13.8 35.7 13.5 
Pennsylvania, Middle 48 14.0 60.0 15.8 30.0 0 19.6 42.9 19.0 10.0 23.1 13.3 

Pennsylvania, Western 133 20.8% 23.1% 11.0% 43.9% o % 21.1% 26.7% 28.6% 12.9% 28.6% 14.9% 
Puerto Rico 202 28.5 31.3 28.0 28.0 29.0 24.4 50.0 38.6 29.3 20.3 52.5 23.6 
Rhode Island 11 60.0 0 54.5 0 60.0 33.3 57.1 100.0 50.0 71.4 
South Carolina 60 34.5 20.0 21.6 52.2 33.3 63.6 23.1 27.3 62.5 22.0 
South Dakota 81 31.4 9.1 4.5 37.3 28.4 66.7 26.7 33.3 20.0 9.1 32.7 

Tennessee, Eastern 96 25.3% 23.1% 23.6% 42.9% 25.0% 60.0% 17.9% 17.3% 30.4% 17.5% 
Tennessee, Middle 115 24.5 30.8 21.4 35.7 33.3 50.0 24.3 0 25.0 32.6 1B.2 36.1 18.5 
Tennessee, Western 111 22.1 12.5 15.0 27.5 20.7 ... 100.0 29.0 28.6 7.0 26.5 19.7 
Texas, Eastern 101 34.0 26.6 15.1 82.1 0 34.7 52.6 37.2 20.5 42.9 22.2 
Texas, Northern 427 36.7 41.9 30.7 57.0 100.0 37.3 37.5 ... 100.0 47.1 40.6 28.7 47.1 27.2 

Texas, Southern 791 37.5% 24.1% 36.3% 39.3% 37.9% 33.2% 42.9% 40.7% 38.B% 28.6% 48.4% 30.7% 
Texas, Western 538 51.7 44.9 47.7 77.4 33.3 49.7 53.1 50.0 39.4 55.5 56.2 67.6 39.8 
Utah 42 35.9 33.3 38.9 0 33.3 50.0 35.0 35.7 43.B 25.0 33.3 40.9 
Vermont 32 6.9 0 3.4 50.0 0 6.3 0 10.0 0 11.1 0 9.1 
Virgin Islands 22 22.7 16.7 25.0 42.9 13.3 16.7 33.3 0 28.S 25.0 

Virginia, Eastern 228 29.9% 22.2% 18.3% 41.3% 25.0% 22.2% 29.0% 50.0% 35.5% 27.1% 25.4% 33.3% 25.6% 
Virginia, Western 42 24.3 0 18.2 33.3 21.4 20.0 23.1 16.7 13.0 29.4 
Washington, Eastern 44 36.6 0 33.3 50.0 25.0 26.7 37.9 25.0 43.8 31.3 66.7 20.8 
Washington, Western 122 41.4 66.7 35.8 70.8 33.3 25.0 43.9 66.7 33.3 55.3 36.8 52.9 28.3 
West Virginia, Northern 48 4.5 25.0 3.7 9.5 0 6.4 10.0 11.8 0 5.9 0 

West Virginia, Southern 50 14.9% 33.3% 13.6% 33.3% 16.0% 9.5% 25.0% 18.8% 15.0% 16.7% 
Wisconsin, Eastern 62 24.6 40.0 15.8 44.4 33.3 0 28.1 36.8 26.1 15.8 38.5 18.4 
Wisconsin, Western 36 22.6 20.0 21.9 50.0 0 0 22.9 14.3 28.6 20.0 40.0 11.1 
Wyoming 12 25.0 28.6 100.0 0 25.0 20.0 33.3 0 20.0 16.7 

... No cases of this type occurred In the data. b Data describe supervision terms which terminated in 1990 
a Supervision terminated with relncarceration or removal to inactive because of a violation, becausa the term expired, or for 

status for violation of supervision conditions or charges for new administrative reasons. 
offenses. See text table 5.4. 
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Glossary 

This glossary defines each of the 
terms used in the tables. The defini­
tions specifically describe the criteria 
used in establishing table classifica­
tions. 

Definitions of offense categories de­
scribe all offenses included in each 
category. Statutory sections are cited 
iii paren1heses at the end of each 
definitiun. 

Agriculture violation - violation 0'/ 
the Federal statutes on agriculture 
and conservation, for example, viola­
tions of the Agricultural Acts, Federal 
Seed Act, Game Conservation Acts, 
Insecticide Act, and the Packers and 
Stockyards Act; also violation of laws 
concerning plant quarantine and the 
handling of animals pertaining to re­
search (title 7 U.S.C. except sections 
on food stamps). 

Antitrust - violation of Federal anti­
trust statutes (15 U.S.C. 1, 2, 3, 8, 13(A)­
(F), 20, 24, 701, and 72). 

Arson - willfully or maliciously set­
ting, or attempting to set, fire to any 
property within the special maritime 
and territorial jurisdiction of the United 
States as defined In 18 U.S. C. 7 (18 

U.S.C.81). 

Assault - intentionally inflicting or 
attempting or threatening to inflict 
bodily injury to anyone within the spe­
cial maritime and territorial jurisdiction 
of the United States as defined in 18 
U.S.C. 7 or to any Government offi­
cial, foreign official, official guest, in­
ternationally protected person, or any 
officer or employee of the United 
States designated in section 1114 of 
title 18; also certain violations of the 
Fair Housing Law (18 U.S.C.111, 
112(A)-(C), 113(A)-(F), 114, 351 (C)-(E), 
372,1501-2, 1751(E), 1991, 2231 (A)(B) , 
and 2233; 21 U.S.C. 461 (C), 675(A)(B), and 
1041 (C); 26 U.S.C. 7212(A)(B); 42 U.S.C. 
361 O(A) , 3611(F), and 3631; 46 U.S.C. 
701(6); and 49 U.S.C. 1472(k1) and 
1475(J)(k1». 

Ball- the sum of money promised 
as a condition of release, to be paid if 
a released defendant defaults (18 
U.S.C.3142(c». 

Bribery - offering or promising any­
thing of value with Intent to unlawfully 
Influenr:e a public official, bank em­
ployee, officer or employee of the 
U.S. Government, witness, or any 
common carrier as well as soliciting 
or accepting such an offer. Soliciting 
or receiving anything of value in con­
sideration of aiding a person to obtain 
employment in the U.S. Government. 
Receiving or soliciting any remunera­
tion, directly or indirectly, In cash or 
any kind in return for purchasing, or­
dering, leasing, or recommending to 
purchase any good, service, facility, 
or item for which payment may be 
made through Medical Assistance 
Programs. Bribing in sporting con­
tests is also illegal (18 U.S.C. 201 (A)-(I), 
203-5, 207(B)(C), 208-15, and 224; 21 
U.S.C. 622; 26 U.S.C. 7214(A); 42 U.S.C. 
1396H(B); 46 U.S.C. 239(1); and 49 U.S.C. 
10(4), 917(B), and 1472(0». 

Burglary - breaking and entering 
into another's property with intent to 
steal within the special maritime and 
territorial jurisdiction of the United 
States, as defined in 18 U.S. C. 7; 
also including breaking and entering 
into any official bank, credit union, 
savings and loan Institution, post of­
fice, vessel or steamboat assigned to 
the use of mail service, or personal 
property of the United States or 
breaking the seal or lock of any car­
rier facility containing interstate or 
foreign shipments of freight or ex­
press (18 U.S.C. 2111, 2113(A), and 2115-
17). 

Collateral bond - an agreement 
made by a defendant as a condition 
of his or her pretrial release that re­
quires the defendant to post property 
valued at the full bail amount as an 
assurance of his or her intention to 
appear at trial. 

Conspiracy - an agreement by two 
or more persons to commit or to ef­
fect the commission of an unlawful 
act or to use unlawful means to ac­
complish an act that is not in itself 
unlawful; also any overt act in further­
ance of the agreement. A person 
charged with conspiracy is classified 
under the substantive offense al­
leged. 

Counterfeiting - falsely making, 
forging, or altering any obligation or 
security of the United States, foreign 
obligation or security, coin or bar 
stamped at any mint in the United 
States, money order issued by the 
Postal Service, domestic or foreign 
stamp, or seal of any department or 
agency of the United States. Pass­
ing, selling, attempting to pass or sell, 
or bringing into the United States any 
of the above falsely made articles. 
Making, selling, or possessing any 
plates or stones used for printing 
counterfeit obligations or securities of 
the United States, foreign obligations 
or securities, Government transporta­
tion requests, or postal stamps (18 
U.S.C. 331, 471-74, 476-81, 485-88, 490, 
492,500-502,506-7, and 509; 21 U.S.C. 
458(04) and 611 (B4); 26 U.S.C. 5604(A4) 
and 7241: and 46 U.S.C. 410). 

Declination - the decision by a 
prosecutor not to file a case. 

Deposit bond - an agreement 
made by a defendant as a condition 
of his or her release that requires the 
defendant to post a fraction of the bail 
before he or she Is released. 

Detention - the legally authorized 
confinement of persons after arrest, 
whether before or during prosecution. 
Only those persons held 2 or more 
days are classified as detained In this 
compendium. 

Dlsmissal- termination of a case 
before trial or other final judgment 
(Including nolle prosequi and deferred 
prosecution) . 
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Disposition - the decision made on 
a case brought before the Federal 
criminal courts. 

Distribution - delivery (other than 
by administering or dispensing) of a 
controlled sUbstance (21 U.S.C. 802). 

District of Columbia - the jurisdic­
tion of the U.S. district court for the 
District of Columbia. This compen­
dium Includes Federal offenses pros­
ecuted In U.S. district courts and ex­
cludes violations of the District of 
Columbia code and cases prosecuted 
In the District of Columbia superior 
court. 

Drug offenses - possessing or traf­
ficking In (distributing, importing, 
and manufacturing) controlled sub­
stances. Also furnishing of fraudulent 
or false Information concerning pre­
scriptions as well as any other un­
specified drug-related offense. (See 
specific offenses In this glossary for 
citations.) 

Embezzlement - fraudulently mis­
applying property by a person to 
whom such property has been en­
trusted or into whose hands It has 
lawfully come where offense is com­
mi~ted by bank officers or employees; 
officers or employees of the Postal 
Service; officers of lending, credit, or 
Insurance Institutions; any officer or 
employee of a corporation or associa­
tion engaged In commerce as a com­
mon carrier; court officers of the U.S. 
courts; or officers or employees of the 
United States. Embezzling, stealing, 
or knowingly converting to one's own 
use or the use of another or without 
authority selling, conveying, or dis­
posing of any money, property, 
records, or thing of value to the 
United States or any department 
thereof (12 U.S.C. 630; 15 U.S.C. 
645(6)(C); 18 U.S.C. 332, 334, 641-57, 660, 
664, 665(A)(B), 1025, 1163, 1709-11 and 
1721; 22 U.S.C. 1179; 29 U.S.C. 501 (C) 
and 502(B); 38 U.S.C. 3501; and 42 U.S.C. 
2703A, 2971 F(A)(B), 3220(B), and 3791). 

Escape - departing or attempting to 
depart from the custody of a correc­
tlonallnstitutlon; a judicial, correc­
tional, or law enforcement officer; or a 

hospital where one Is committed for 
drug abuse and drug dependency 
problems. Knowingly advising, aid­
ing, assisting, or procuring the escape 
or attempted escape of any person 
from a correctional facility, an officer, 
or the above-mentioned hospital as 
well as concealing an escapee. Forc­
Ibly rescuing any person in an attempt 
to prevent execution or forcibly re­
moving or attempting to remove the 
dead body of an executed offender in 
order to prevent an autopsy. Aiding 
or enticing any person belonging to 
the Armed Forces of a belligerent na­
tion or fraction, who Is interned In the 
United States In accordance with the 
law of nations, to escape or attempt 
to escape. Providing or attempting to 
provide to an inmate in prison a pro­
hibited object or making, possessing, 
obtaining, or attempting to make or 
obtain a prohibited object (as defined 
In section 1791C 01 title 18). Instigat­
Ing, assisting, attempting to cause, or 
causing any mutiny or riot at any Fed­
eral penal, detention, or correctional 
facility or conveying into any of these 
Institutions any dangerous Instrumen­
talities (18 U.S.C. 751, 752(A)(B), 753-57, 
1071-74, 1791-92,3150, and 4082(0); 42 
U.S.C. 261 (B)(C) and 3425-26; and 50 
U.S.C. 822-23). 

Failure to appear - willful absence 
from any court appointment. 

.Felony - a criminal offense punish­
able by death or Imprisonment for a 
term exceeding 1 year (18 U.S.C. 1). 

Filing - The initiation of a criminal 
case In U.S. district court by formal 
submission to the court of a charging 
document alleging that one or more 
named persons have committed one 
or more specified offenses. In this 
compendium, each defendant In a 
case Is counted separately, and only 
the most serious alleged offense Is 
considered. 

Financial conditions - monetary 
conditions upon which release of a 
defendant before trial Is contingent. 
Includes deposit bond, surety bond, 
and collateral bond (see individual 
defin itions). 
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Food and drug violations - viola­
tions of the Federal Food and Drug 
Act (21 U.S.C. 16-17,20-23,62-63,104, 
111,115,117,120,122,124,126,134(A)­
(E), 141-45,151-55, 157, 158,201,203, 
205,207,209-12,331 (A)-(G), 331 (12)(13), 
331(J)-(P),333(A)(B),458(A1)-(A5),459, 
460(A)-(0), 461 (A), 463, 466 (A) , 
61 0(A)(8)(B2)(C) , 611 (A)(B3), 620(0), 642, 
676 (A) , 1037, 1041 (A), 1175, and 1175F; 
and 26 U.S.C. 4591, 4594(A)-(C), 4597(A), 
4804(A2)(A4)(B), 4805(8), 4814(A1), 
4815(A)(B), 4817, 4833(A2)(B)(C), 4834(A), 
4841,4862(B), 
7234(A)(C)(01 )(D2A)(02B)(03)(04) , 
7235(A)-(E), 7236, 7264, 7265(A)(B), and 
7266(A1)-(A3)(B». 

Forgery - falsely and with Intent to 
defraud, making, counterfeiting, alter­
ing, or possessing with Intent to pass 
off as genuine any U.S. Postal Ser­
vice money order; postmarking stamp 
or impression; obligation or security of 
the United States; foreign obligation, 
security, or bank note; contractors' 
bond, bid, or public record; seal of a 
court or any department or agency of 
the U.S. Government; the signature 
of a judge or court officer; ships' pa­
pers; documents on entry of vessels; 
deed; power of attorney; customs 
matters; bond of distilleries; military or 
naval discharge certificate; coin or 
bar; and so forth. Also making, pos­
sessing, selling, or printing plates or 
stones for counterfeiting obligations 
or securities and receiving, possess­
ing, concealing, seiling, or disposing 
of any falsely made securities, tax 
stamps, or pledges that have crossed 
a State or the U.S. boundary after 
being stolen or unlawfully converted 
(18 U.S.C. 471-74, 478-79, 482-85, 493-98, 
500,503,505-8,1025,2314-15, and 2318; 
19 U.S.C. 1436; 21 U.S.C. 458(B)(C1 )(C2) , 
and 611 (B1); 26 U.S.C. 5601 (A4)(AS); 43 
U.S.C. 1191-92; and 49 U.S.C. 1472(B». 

Fraud - unlavl1ully depriving a per­
son of his or her property or legal 
rights through Intentional misrepre­
sentation of fact or deceit other than 
forgery or counterfeiting. Includes 
violations of statutes pertaining to 
lending and credit Institutions, the 
Postal Service, Interstate wire, radio, 
television, veterans benefits, allot­
ments, bankruptcy, marketing agree­
ments, commodity credit, the Securl-



ties and Exchange Commission, rail­
road retirement, unemployment, So­
oial Security, false personation, citi­
zenship, passports, conspiracy, and 
claims and statements, excluding tax 
fraud. The category excludes fraud 
involving tax violations that are shown 
in a separate category under "Public 
order, other offenses.· (See specific 
offenses in this glossary for citations.) 

Fraudulent property offenses -
see "Property offenses, fraudulent." 

Gambling - transporting, manufac­
turing, selling, possessing, or using 
any gambling device in the District of 
Columbia or any possession of the 
United States or within Indian country 
or the special maritime and territorial 
jurisdiction of the United States as 
defined in section 7 of title 18. Also 
transporting gambling devices in the 
jurisdiction of the United States, ex­
cept under authority of the Federal 
Trade Commission or any State that 
has a law providing for their exemp­
tion from these provisions, transmit­
ting wagering information in interstate 
or foreign commerce, interstate trans­
porting of wagering paraphernalia, 
importing or transporting lottery tick­
ets, or mailing lottery tickets or re­
lated matter. An employee of the 
Postal Service acting as a lottery 
agent is considered guilty of this of­
fense (15 U.S.C. 1172-76; and 18 U.S.C. 
1 082(A)(B) , 1084, 1301-3,1953, and 1955). 

Guilty plea - a plea in response to 
formal charges admitting that the de­
fendant committed offenses as 
charged. This category also includes 
pleas of nolo contendere. 

Hispanic - ethnic category based 
on classification by reporting agency. 
Hispanic persons may be of any race. 

Homicide - see "Murder." 

Immigration offenses - offenses 
Involving illegal entrance into the 
United States, illegally reentering af­
ter being deported, willfully failing to 
deport when so ordered, or willfully 
remaining beyond days allowed on 
conditional permit. Falsely represent­
Ing oneself to be a citizen of the 

United States or counterfeiting any 
visa, permit, or other document to 
enter the United States as well as 
violating any of the provisjons for 
travel of citizens or aliens during war 
or national emergency. Also bringing 
in or harboring any aliens not duly 
admitted by an immigration officer (8 
U.S.C. 331, 333·34, 338-39, 1185(C), 
1252(D)(E),1282(A)(C),1286-87, 1321, and 
1324-26; and 18 U.S.C. 911 and 1546). 

Incarceration - any sentence of 
confinement, including prison, jail, 
and other residential placements. 

Indeterminate sentence - a prison 
sentence whose maximum or mini­
mum term is not specifically estab­
lished at the time of sentencing (18 
U.S.C. 4205 B(1)(2)). 

Jurisdictional offenses - acts that 
are Federal crimes because of the 
place in which they occur, such as on 
an aircraft, on Federal land or prop­
erty, and for certain crimes on Indian 
reservations or at sea, but that can­
not be classified in a more specific 
SUbstantive category. 

Kidnaping - unlawfully seizing any 
person, within the special maritime 
and territoriat jurisdiction of the United 
States as defined by section 7 of title 
18, for ransom or reward, except in 
the case of a minor by a parent. Also 
receiving, possessing, or disposing of 
any money or other property that has 
been delivered as ransom or reward 
in connection with a kidnaping as well 
as conspiring to kidnap. This offense 
includes kidnaping or attempting to 
kidnap any Government official, the 
President of the United States, the 
President-elect, the Vice President, 
any foreign official, any official guest, 
or any internationally protected per­
son (18 U.S.C. 351 (B)-(D), 1201·2, and 
1751 (B)-(C». 

Labor law violations - violations of 
the Fair Labor Standards Act, the 
Taft-Hartley Act (labor-management 
relations), the Byrnes Act (transporta­
tion of strikebreakers), laws regarding 
the 8-hour day on public works, and 
peonage laws (18 U.S.C. 1231 and 1581· 
88; 29 U.S.C. 162, 186(A), 206-7, 

211 (C)(D), 212, 214-15, 216(A), 439(A)-(C), 
463(B), 503(C), 504(B), and 1131; and 40 
U.S.C.321-22). 

Larceny - taking and carrying away 
with Intent to steal any personal prop­
erty of another, within the special 
maritime and territorial jurisdiction of 
the United States, as defined in '18 
U.S.C. 7. Stealing, possessing, con­
verting to one's own use, or illegally 
selling or disposing of anything of 
value to the United States or any of 
its departments or agencies or any 
property made or being made under 
contract for the United States or any 
of its departments or agencies. 
Stealing anything of value (in excess 
of $1 00) from a bank, the Postal Ser­
vice, or any interstate or foreign ship­
ments by carrier. Receiving or pos­
sessing stolen property or pirate 
property. Stealing or obtaining by 
fraud any funds, assets, or property 
that are the subject of a grant, con­
tract, or other form of assistance, 
whether received directly or indirectly, 
from the Law Enforcement Assis­
tance Administration or that belong to 
or are entrusted to the custody of an 
Indian tribal organization. This of­
fense category excludes the transpor­
tation of stolen property (18 U.S.C. 641, 
659,661-62,1024,1163,1660,1702,1704, 
1707-8, and 2113(B)(C); 42 U.S.C. 3791; 
and 49 U.S.C. 1472(K1)). 

Liquor violations - violations of 
Internal Revenue Service laws on li­
quor as well as viotations of liquor 
laws not cited under these laws, such 
as smuggling goods into the United 
States; dispensing or unlawfully pos­
sessing Intoxicants in Indian country; 
transporting intoxicating liquors into 
any State, territory, district, or pos­
session where sale is prohibited; ship­
ping packages containing unmarked 
and unlabeled intoxicants; failing to 
declare liquor at customs; shipping 
liquor by C.O.D.; knowingly delivering 
a liquor shipment to someone other 
than to whom It has been consigned; 
and violating in any way the Federal 
Alcohol Administration Act (18 U.S.C. 
545,1154-56, and 1262-65; 19 U.S.C.1461; 
26 U.S.C. 5061 (B), 5113(A), 5115, 5171 (A), 
5179(A)-80, 5214(A), 5221 (A), 5273(B), 
5291 (A), 5301 (A)-(C), 5601 (A1)-(A4)(A6)-
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(A14), 5602, 5603(A)(B), 5604(A1)-(A3), 
(A6)-(A 13)(A 15)-(A 19), 5605-7, 5608(A)(B), 
5661 (A)(B) , 5662, 5671-72, 5674, 5676(1-
3)(5), 5681 (A)-(e), 5682-83, 5685(A)(B), 
5686-87, S689, and 5691 (A); and 27 U.S.C. 
203, 205(E)(F), 206(A)(B), 207, and 
208 (A)(O». 

Mailing or transportation of ob­
scene materials - knowingly using 
the mail for mailing obscene or crime­
inciting matter, as defined in 18 
U.S.C. 1461 and 39 U.S.C. 3001 (E). 
Also.transporting for sale or distribu­
tion, importing, or transporting any 
obscene matter in interstate or for­
eign commerce (18 U.S.C. 1461-63, 
1465, and 1718). 

Major offense - (while on condi­
tional release) - ailegation, arrest, or 
conviction of a crime for which the 
minimum sentence is incarceration for 
over 90 days or greater than 1 year 
on probation. (See Introduction to 
Probation Statistical Reporting, Ad­
ministrative Office of the U.S. Courts, 
1981.) 

Mandatory release - the release of 
an inmate from prison after confine­
ment for a time period equal to his or 
her full sentence minus statutory 
good-time, if any. Federal prisoners 
released on mandatory release may 
still be subject to a period of 
postrelease community supervision. 

Matter - a potential case under re­
view by a U.S. attorney on which 
more than 1 hour is expended. 

Matters concluded - matters about 
which a final decision has been 
reached by a U.S. attorney. Specifi­
cally includes matters filed as cases, 
matters declined after investigation, 
matters referred for disposition by 
U.S. magistrates, and matters other­
wise terminated without reaching 
court. 

Mlgra·tory birds offenses - taking, 
killing, or possessing migratory birds, 
or any part, nest, or egg thereof, in 
violation of Federal regulations or the 
transportation laws of the State, terri­
tory, or district from which the bird 
was taken. Misuse or nonuse of a 

migratory-bird hunting and conserva­
tion stamp. Violation of the reguia­
tions of Bear River Refuge and 
Ouchita National Forest Sanctuary 
and Refuge (16 U.S.C. 690(O)(G), 693A, 
701,703-6, 707(A)(B), 708-11, and 
718(A)(E)(G». 

Minor offense (while on conditional 
release) - conviction of a crime for 
which the maximum sentence is in­
carceration for 90 days or less, pro­
bation of 1 year or less, or a fine of 
$500 or less. (See Introduction to 
Probation Statistical Reporting, Ad­
ministrative Office of the U.S. Courts, 
1981.) 

Misdemeanor - a criminal offense 
punishable by a jail term not exceed­
ing 1 year and any offense specifi­
cally defined as a misdemeanor by 
the Administrative Office of the U.S. 
Courts for the purposes of data col­
lection. (This category inciudes of­
fenses previously called minor of­
fenses that were reclassified under 
the Federai Magistrates Act of 1979.) 

Mixed sentence - a sentence re­
quiring the convicted offender to 
serve more than 6 months of incar­
ceration, followed by a term of proba­
tion. Unless otherwise noted, offend­
ers receiving mixed sentences are 
included In both incarceration and 
probation categories (see also ·Split 
sentence"). 

Most serious offense - the offense 
with the greatest potentiai penalty. 

Motor carrier violations - viola­
tions of the Federal statutes listed 
below concerning the Motor Carrier 
Act (15 U.S.C. 1986, 1990, and 1990(C); 
El.nd 49 U.S.C. 1 (7)(17)(20),10(1), 
15(11)(12),41 (1),46,301-4, 322(A)(O), 
917(A)(E)(F), 1021 (A)(B)(E) (F), and 
1159(A». 

Motor vehicle theft - interstate or 
foreign transporting, receiving, con­
cealing, storing, bartering, selling, or 
disposing of any stolen motor vehicle 
or aircraft (18 U.S.C. 2312 and 2313; and 
49 U.S.C. 14721, 11A, 11 B, NA, and NB). 
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Murder - committing or attempting 
to commit murder (first or second de­
gree) or voluntary manslaughter 
within the special maritime and territo­
rial jurisdiction of the United States 
(18 U.S.C. 7). Killing or attempting to 
kill any Government official, the Presi­
dent of the United States, the Presi­
dent-elect, the Vice President, any 
officers and employees of the United 
States, any foreign officials, any offi­
cial guests, or any internationally pro­
tected persons. As applied to the 
owner or charterer of any steamboat 
or vessel, knowingly and willfully 
causing or allowing fraud, neglect, 
misconduct, or violation of any law 
resulting in loss of life (18 U.S.C. 
351 (A), 1111-16, 1751 A, and 2113(E); 21 
U.S.C. 461 (C) and 675(C); and 49 U.S.C. 
1472(K1». 

National defense violations - vio­
lations of the national defense laws 
on the Selective Service Acts, the 
Defense Production Act, the Eco­
nomic Stabilization Act of 1970 (which 
includes prices, rents, and wages), 
the Subversive Activities Control Act, 
alien registration, treason (including 
espionage, sabotage, sedition, and 
the Smith Act), curfew and restricted 
areas, exportation of war materials, 
trading with an enemy, and use of 
uniform and any other violations of 
the Federal statutes concerning na­
tional defense (50 U.S.C. 210, 321-29, 
and 824; 50 A U.S.C. 327, 462, 468, and 
2061-66; 8 U.S.C. 1304 (d-e), 1306 (a-d); 
18 U.S.C. 792-95, 797-99, 953, 2153 (a-b), 
2154 (a-b), 2155 (a-b), 2156 (a-b), 2381, 
2384-90; and 42 U.S.C. 2273, 2274 (a-b), 
2275-77, 2278 A (b), 2278 A (c)(b), and 
2462 (g». 

Negligent manslaughter - causing 
the death of another, within the spe­
cial maritime and territorial jurisdiction 
of the United States as defined in 18 
U.S.C. 7, by wanton or reckless disre­
gard for human life. Also negligent 
manslaughter of any Government offi­
cial, the President of the United 
States, the President-elect, the Vice 
President, any officers and employ­
ees of the United States, any foreign 
officials, any official guests, or any 
internationally protected persons. 
This offense category also includes 
misconduct, negligence, or inattention 



to duties by ship officers on a steam­
boat or vessel resulting in death to 
any person (18 U.S.C. 351 (A), 1112, 
1114-16, and 1751 (A); and 49 U.S.C. 
1472(K1». 

Nolo contendere - defendant's plea 
In a criminal case indicating that he or 
she will not contest charges, but not 
admitting or denying guilt. 

Not convicted - acquittal by bench 
or Jury trial, mistrial, and dismissal 
(including nolle prosequi and deferred 
prosecution) . 

Offense - violation of U.S. criminal 
law. Where more than one offense is 
charged, the offense with the greatest 
potential penalty is reported. 

Other property offenses - offenses 
that involve the destruction of prop­
erty moving in interstate or foreign 
commerce in the possession of a 
common or contract carrier. The ma­
licious destruction of Government 
property, or injury to U.S. postal prop­
erty such as mailboxes or mailbags. 
Trespassing on timber and Govern­
ment lands is also included in this cat­
egory of offenses (15 U.S.C. i 281; 16 
U.S.C. 3, 9A, 45A, 45C-E, 114, 121-24, 146, 
152,163,171, 403H-4, 413, 430H, 430Q, 
430V, 460K-3, 460N-3, 460N-5, 460N-7, 
471, 476-78, 478A, 479, 481-82, 551, and 
604-6; 18 U.S.C. 1164, 1361-64, 1705-6, 
1851-63,2071 (A)(8) , and 2072; 24 U.S.C. 
286; 40 U.S.C. 53, 101, 193(E)(O)(P)-(R), 
and 318(C); and 43 U.S.C. 316K}. 

Other public order offenses - vio­
lations of laws pertaining to abortion; 
bigamy; disorderly conduct on the 
U.S. Capitol grounds; civil disorder; 
hunting, trapping, or fishing on Indian 
lands or military areas and zones; 
and obscene or harassing telephone 
calls (18 U.S.C. 231, 1165, 1384-85, and 
2101; 40 U.S.C. 193(B)-(O)(F)(G)(O)(P); 
and 47 U.S.C. 223). Included in "public 
order, non-regulatory offenses" (q.v.). 

Other regulatory offenses - viola­
tions of civil rights, election laws, the 
Communication Act (including wire 
tapping and wire Interception), con­
tempt, laws regarding congressional 
contempt, custom laws (except nar­
cotics and liquor), importation of inju-

rious animals and birds, interstate 
commerce (the Connally Act, Hot Oil 
Act, transportation or importation of 
prison-made goods, and the Railroad 
and Transportation Act), maritime and 
shipping laws, laws regarding stow­
aways, the Federal Boat Safety Act of 
1971, the Federal Water Pollution 
Control Act, U.S. postal laws (exclud­
Ing Injury to postal property), intimida­
tion of witness laws, aircraft regula­
tions, explosives (except in vessels), 
the Gold Acts, train wrecking, and 
any other regulatory offenses not 
listed above. (For citations refer to 
the United States Title and Code 
Criminal Offense Citations, Adminis­
trative Office of the U.S. Courts, Sep­
tember 1982.) 

Other sex offenses - transporting, 
coercing, or enticing any women to go 
from one place to another in Inter­
state or foreign commerce, in the Dis­
trict of Columbia, or in any territory or 
possession of the United States with 
the intent and purpose to engage in 
prostitution, debauchery, or any other 
immoral purpose. Importing, main­
taining, or harboring any women for 
purposes of prostitution or debauch­
ery or for any other immoral purpose. 
These offenses may be either violent 
or nonviolent (8 U.S.C. 1328 and 18 
U.S.C. 2421-24). 

Parole - period of supervision after 
release from custody before the expi­
ration of sentence. 

Perjury - knowingly or willfully giving 
false evidence or swearing to false 
statements under oath or by arty 
means procuring or instigating any 
person to commit perjury. Making 
any false material declarations under 
oath in any proceeding before or an­
cillary to any court or grand jury of the 
United States. This offense also in­
cludes any officers and employees of 
the Government listed under 13 
U.S.C. 21-25 who willfully or know­
ingly furnish or causa to be furnished 
any false information or statement (8 
U.S.C. 1357(8), 13 U.S.C. 213,18 U.S.C. 
1621-23, and 22 U.S.C. 1203). 

Personal recognizance - pretrial 
release condition in which the defen-

dant promises to appear at trial and 
no financial conditions are required to 
be met. 

Petty offense - criminal offense 
punishable by Imprisonment for a 
term not exceeding 6 months or a fine 
not more than $500 or both (18 U.S.C. 
1 (3». 

Possession - acquiring a controlled 
SUbstance by misrepresentation or 
fraud, attempting or conspiring to 
possess, or simple possession of a 
controlled SUbstance In schedules I-V 
(as defined by 21 U.S.C. 812). Also 
possession of a controlled substance 
in schedule I or II or a narcotic drug in 
schedule III or IV on board a vessel of 
the United States or vessels within 
custom waters of the United States or 
by any citizen of the United States on 
board a vessel. Possessing any 
punch, die, plate, stone, or any other 
thing designed to reproduce the label 
upon any drug or container is an of­
fense under this category. Distribut­
ing a small amount of marijuana for 
no remuneration is treated as simple 
possession and, therefore, is Included 
in this offense category (21 U.S.C. 
843(A3)(A5), 844(A), 846, 955, and 962-63). 

Pretrial diversion - an agreement 
to defer (and possibly drop) prosecu­
tion conditioned on the defendant's 
good behavior and/or participation in 
programs during a stated period. 

Pretrial release - the release of a 
defendant from custody, for all or part 
of the time before or during prosecu­
tion. The defendant may be released 
either on personal recognizance or 
unsecured bond or on financial condi­
tions. The category includes defen­
dants released within 2 days after 
arrest and defendants who were ini­
tially detained but subsequently re­
leased after raising bail or having re­
lease conditions changed at a 
subsequent hearing. 

Property offenses, fraudulent­
property offenses Involving the ele­
ments of deceit or intentional misrep­
resentation. Specifically includes em­
bezzlement, fraud (excluding tax 
fraud), forgery, and counterfeitlng. 
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Property offenses, non-fraudulent 
- violent offenses against property: 
burglary, larceny, motor vehicle theft, 
arson, transportation of stolen prop­
erty, and other property offenses (de­
struction of property and trespassing). 
These offenses are termed "non­
fraudulent· only for the purpose of 
distinguishing them from the category 
"property offenses, fraudulent,· 
above. 

Public order, non-regulatory of­
fenses - offenses concerning weap­
ons; immigration; tax law violations 
(tax fraud); bribery; perjury; national 
defense; escape; racketeering and 
extortion; gambling; liquor; mailing or 
transporting of obscene materials; 
traffic; migratory birds; conspiracy, 
aiding and abetting, and jurisdictional 
offenses; ani "other public order of­
fenses· (q.v.). These offenses are 
termed "non-regulatory· only for the 
purpose of distinguishing them from 
the category "public order, regulatory 
offenses,· below. 

Public order, regulatory offenses 
- violations of regulatory laws and 
regulations in agriculture, antitrust, 
labor law, food and drug, motor car­
rier, and other regulatory offenses 
that are not specifically listed in the 
category "public order, non-regulatory 
offenses· above. 

a.v. - refer to the appropriate entry 
in this glossary for a definition of 
terms marked "(q.v.): 

Racketeering and extortion - using 
interstate or foreign commerce or any 
facility in interstate or foreign com­
merce to aid racketeering enterprises 
such as arson, bribery, gambling, li­
quor, narcotics, prostitution, and ex­
tortionate credit transactions. For 
officers or employees of the United 
States, or anyone representing him­
self or herself as such, obtaining 
property or money from another, with 
his or her consent Induced by actual 
or threatened force, violence, black­
mail, or unlawful interference with em­
ployment or business. Transmitting 
by Interstate commerce or through 
the mail any threat to injure the prop­
erty, the person, or the reputation of 
the addressee or of another or to kid-

nap any person with Intent to extort 
(18 U.S.C. 872-74, 875(A-D), 876-77, 892-
94, 1951-52, 1954, 1962(A-D), and 1963; 19 
U.S.C. 60; 27 U.S.C. 205(C); and 42 U.S.C. 
2703(8». 

Rape - rape, assault with intent to 
commit rape, and carnal knowledge 
of a female under 16 who is not one's 
wife, within the territorial and special 
maritime jurisdictions of the United 
States as defined In 18 U.S.C. 7 (18 
U.S.C. 113(A), and 2031-32; and 49 U.S.C. 
1472(K1)). 

Remove - transfer from Federal 
court (usually to a State court). 

Robbery - taking anything of value 
from the person or presence of an­
other by force or by intimidation, 
within the special maritime and territo­
rial jurisdiction otthe United States 
(18 U.S.C. 7). Also robbery of bank 
property, U.S. postal property, or per­
sonal property of the United States. 
Also assaulting or putting the life of 
any person in jeopardy by the use of 
a dangerous weapon while commit­
ting or attempting to commit such 
robbery (18 U.S.C. 113(8), 1661, 1991, 
2111-12, 2113(A)(D)(E), and2114; and 49 
U.S.C.1472(K1». 

Sentence - sanction imposed on a 
convicted offender. For sentences to 
incarceration, the maximum time the 
offender may be held in custody Is 
reported. (See also "Split sentence,· 
"Mixed sentence,· "I ndeterminate 
sentence," and "Youth sentence.") 

Special maritime and territorial ju­
risdiction - areas of Federal juris­
diction outside the jurisdiction of any 
State, including (1) the high seas, 
Great Lakes, and connecting water­
ways; (2) Federal lands; and (3) U.S.­
owned aircraft In flight over the high 
seas (18 U.S.C. 7). 

Split sentence - a sentence requir­
ing the convicted person to serve a 
period of confinement of 6 months or 
less, followed by a period of proba­
tion. Unless otherwise noted, con­
victed offenders receiving split sen­
tences are included in both the 
incarceration and probation catego­
ries (see "Mixed sentence·). 
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Stale ~ too old to support successful 
prosecution. 

Surety bond - an agreement by the 
defendant as a condition of his or her 
release that requires a third party 
(usually a bail bondsman) to promise 
to pay the full ball Clmount In the 
event that the defendant fails to ap­
pear. 

Suspect - a person who Is under 
investigation or interrogation as a 
likely perpetrator of a specific criminal 
offense. 

Tax law violations - tax fraud of­
fenses such as Income tax fraud; 
evading or defeating tax; willful failure 
to file; fraudulently withholding on ex­
emption certificate or failing to supply 
information; counterfeiting any 
stamps with intent to defraud the col­
lection or payment of tax; willful fail­
ure to collect or pay tax; putting 
fraudulent or false statements on tax 
returns; failure to obey summons to 
produce any papers concerning 
taxes; preparers of returns disclosing 
or using any information for any pur­
pose other than to assist In preparing 
returns; failing to furnish receipts for 
employees of tax withheld; failing to 
furnish information relating to certain 
trusts, annuity, and bond purchase 
plans; and not obtaining a license for 
a business that makes a profit from 
foroign items. Also Included in this 
offense category are violations of ex­
cise and wagering tax laws and any 
other laws listed below from the Inter­
nal Revenue Service title (26 U.S.C. 
3402,4411-12,4918(E)(H),4919(B2), 
5751 (A1)(A2), 5752(A)-(D), 5762(A1)-
(A 11 )(8), 6047(A)-(C), 6051, 6056, 6331, 
6420(E2), 6421 (F2), 6424(02), 6427(E2), 
6674,7001,7121-22,7201-5,7206(1)­
(4)(5A)(S8), 7207,7208(1),7210, 7213(A1)­
(A3)(B).(D), 7215(A), 7216, 7231-32, 
7322(2),7261-62, 7272(A), 7512, 7513(8), 
7602-3, and 7604(8); and 50A U.S.C. 
243(A». 

Technical violation - failure to 
comply with any of the conditions of 
pretrial release, probation, or parole, 
excluding alleged new criminal activ­
Ity. May result in revocation of re­
lease status. Examples of conditions 
that may be imposed and then vio-



lated Include remaining within a speci­
fied jurisdiction, or appearing at speci­
fied Intervals for drug tests. 

Tern;!,atlon - [Pretrial services] 
execution of sentence, acquittal, dis­
missal, diversion, or fugitive status. 
[U.S. district court] conviction, acquit­
tal, or dismissal. 

Threats against the President -
knowingly and willfully depositing In 
the mail, at any post office, or by any 
letter carrier a letter, paper, writing, 
print, missive, or document containing 
any threat to take the life of or to In­
flict bodily harm upon the President, 
Vice President, or any other officer in 
order of succession to the Presi­
dency. Knowingly and willfully making 
such threats in any way to the above­
named people (18 U.S.C. 871). 

Traffic offenses - driving while in­
toxicated or any moving or parking 
violations on Federal lands (40 U.S.C. 
212 B). 

Trafficking - importing any con­
trolled substance in schedule I, II, III, 
IV, or V {as defined by 21 U.S.C, 
812}. Manufacturing, distributing, 
selling, or possessing with intent to 
manufacture, distribute, or sell a con­
trolled substance or a counterfeit sub­
stance. Exporting any controlled sub­
stance In schedules I-V. Manufacturing 
or distributing a controlled substance 
in schedule I or II for purposes of un­
lawful importation. Making or distrib­
uting any punch, die, plate, stone, or 
any other thing designed to reproduce 
the label upon any drug or container 
or removing or obliterating the label or 
symbol of any drug or container. Ob­
taining a prescription of a controlled 
substance in schedule III or IV with­
out a written or oral prescription. Dis­
tributing for reasons other than medi­
cal a controlled SUbstance in schedule 
V. Illegally crossing the border if the 
individual is addicted to or using 
drugs or has been convicted of any 
violation of narcotics or marijuana 
laws (18 U.S.C. 1407; and 21 U.S.C. 
825(A)-(D), 829(B}(C), 841 (A) (B1 A)(B2)­
(B4), 842(A4)-(A8), 843(A1)(A2)(A5)(B), 
845(A)(B), 846, 952(A)(B), 953(A)(C)(E), 
954-55,957,959, 960(A1)(B2), 961 (2), and 
962-63). 

Transportation of stolen property 
- transporting, seiling, or receiving 
stolen goods, stolen securities, stolen 
moneys, stolen cattle, fra.!Jdulent 
State tax stamps, or articles used in 
counterfeiting if the above articles or 
goods Involve or constitute interstate 
or foreign commerce (18 U.S.C. 2314· 
17). 

Trial conviction - conviction by 
judge or jury after trial. 

True blll- an indictment. 

United States - the territory occu­
pied by the 50 states, the District of 
Columbia {q.v.}, Guam, Puerto Rico, 
and the U.S. Virgin Islands. 

U.S. attorneys - all United States 
attorneys. Prosecutorial data in this 
compendium come from the Docket 
and Reporting System of the Execu­
tive Office for U.S. Attorneys. 

Unsecured bC7nd - an agreement 
by the defendant as a condition of his 
or her release in which the defendant 
agrees to pay full bond amount in the 
event of nonappearance at trial, but is 
not required to post security as a con­
dition to release. 

Violation (of pretrial release, pro­
bation, or parole) - allegation of a 
new crime or a technical violation 
(q.v.) while on pretrial release, proba­
tion, or parole. 

Violent offenses - threatening, at­
tempting, or actually using physical 
force against a person. Includes mur­
der, negligent manslaughter, assault, 
robbery, rape, other sex offenses 
{some of which may be nonviolent}, 
kidnaping, and threats against the 
President. {See epecific offenses for 
citations.} 

Weapons violations - violations of 
any of the provisions of sections 922 
and 923 of title 18 concerning the 
manufacturing. importing, possessing, 
receiving, and licensing of firearms 
and ammunition. ManlJfacturing, seil­
Ing, possessing, or transporting 
{within any territory or possession of 
the United States, within Indian coun-

try, or within the special maritime and 
territorial Jurisdiction of the United 
States} (18 U.S.C. 7) any switchblade 
knife. Engaging in importing, mant,,;· 
facturing, or dealing In firearms If not 
registered with the secretary In the 
Internal Revenue Service District in 
which the business Is conducted or 
not having paid a special occupational 
tax. Carrying on the U.S. Capitol 
grounds or within U.S. Capitol build­
ings any firearm, dangerous weapon, 
explosive, or incendiary device (2 
U.S.C. 167(D); 15 U.S.C. 124243; 18 
U.S.C. 922(A)-(M), 923, and 924(A)-(C); 
18A U.S.C. 1202(A1)-(A5).(B1)(B5); 26 
U.S.C. 5801-2, 5811-12, 5821-22, 5841-44, 
5851, 5861 (A)-(L), and 5871; 40 U.S.C. 
193F(A): and 49 U.S.C. 1472(L1)(L2)). 

Youth sentence - a sentence of 
confinement under the Youth Correc­
tions Act (18 U.S.C. 5010(8)(C)). 
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Crime and older 
Americans: 
New information 
package 

Essential facts for 
researchers, policymakers, 
criminal justice professionals, 
and students 

• 20 tables describing 
crimes committed against 
older Americans and the 
involvement of the elderly 
in crime. 

• List of other sources of 
information 011 crime and 
older Americans. 

• Bibliography detailing a 
wide variety of publications 
that address crime and 
America's elderly. 

As the elderly population has 
grown, there has been continued 
concern about the effects of 
crime on this age group. This 
unique package provides data on 
how crime affects the fast­
growing elderly population and 
offers a useful resource for 
professionals interested in 
tracking such trends. 

This new information package is 
now available from the Bureau 
of Justice Statistics (BJS) 
Clearinghouse. Drawing from 
national sources for crime 
statistics-including the BJS 

National Crime Victimization 
Survey, the FBI Uniform 
Crime Reports, and the BJS 
National Corrections Reporting 
Program-the package discusses 
the types of crimes in which 
older Americans are most 
likely to be the victims or the 
offenders. 

You may order your copy for 
only $15.00. Call the BJS Clear­
inghouse at 1-800-732-3277 and 
have your VISA, MasterCard, or 
Government purchase order 
number at hand. Or complete and 
return the order fonn below. 

_____________________________________________ a __________________________ • ________ m ___________ ._. __ ._._A ______________ M __________ _ 

Please send me copies of the updated 
Crime and Older Americans Information 
Package (NCJ 140091) for $15.00 each. 
Name: __________________________ _ 

Organization: ___________________ _ 

Address: __________________________ _ 

City, State, ZIP: 
Telephone: ____________ _ 

Method of payment 

o Payment of $ enclosed 
o Check payable to NC,JRS 
o Money order payable to NCJRS 
o Government purchase order # _______ _ 

Please bill my 

o NCJRS deposit account 

#-----------------------------o VISA 0 MasterCard Exp. date: 

#------------------------------
Signature: ________________________ _ 

Please detach this form and mail it, with 
payment, to: 

BJS Clearinghouse 
Dep::lrtment F 
Box 6000 
Rockville, MD 20850 



Bureau of Justice Statistics 
reports 
(Revised September 1993) 

Call toll·free 800·732·3277 to order BJS 
reports, to be added to one of the BJS 
mailing lists, or to speak to a reference 
specialist in statistics at the Bureau of 
Justice Statistics Clearinghouse, 
P.O. Box 179, Dept. BJS-236, 
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701-0179. 
For drugs and crime data, cali the Drugs 
& Crime Data Center & Clearinghouse, 
1600 Research Blvd., Rockville, MD 
20850, toll·free 800·666·3332. 

BJS maintains these mailing lists: 
• Law enforcement reports 
• Federal statistics ,-
• Drugs and crime data 
• Justice expenditure and employment 
• Privacy and security of criminal histories 
and criminal justice information policy 
• BJS bulletins and special reports 
• State felony courts 
• Corrections 
• National Crime Victimization Survey 
• Sourcebook of Criminal Justice 
Statistics (annual) 

Single copies of reports are free; use 
NCJ number to order. Postage and 
handling are charged for bulk orders 
of single reports. For single copies 01 
mUltiple titles, up to 10 titles are free; 
11·40 titles $10; more than 40, $20; 
libraries call for special rates. 

Public-use tapes of BJS data sets 
and other criminal justice data are 
available from the National Archive 
of Criminal Justice Data (formerly 
CJAIN), P.O. Box 1248, Ann Arbor, MI 
48106 (toll·free 800·999·0960). 

National Crime Victimization 
Survey 
Crlmlnat victimization In the U.S.: 

1991 (final), NCJ-139563, 1/93 
1973-90 trends, NCJ·139564, 1/93 
1990 (iinal), NCJ-134126, 2/92 

Crime and older Americans Information 
package, NCJ-140091, 4/93, $15 

Crime victimization In city, suburban, 
and rural areas, NCJ·135943, 6/92 

School crlms, NCJ-131645, 9/91 
Teenage victims, NCJ-128129, 5/91 
Female victims of violent crime, 

NCJ-126826,1/91 
The Nation's two crime measures: Uniform 

Crime Reports and the National Crime 
Survey, NCJ-122705, 4/90 

Redesign 01 the National Crime Survey, 
NCJ-11 1457,3/89 

The seasonality of crime victimization, 
NCJ·111033,6/88 

Victimization and fear of crime: World 
perspectives, NCJ-93872, 1/85, $9.15 

The National Crime Survey: Working papers, 
Vol. I, History, NCJ-75374, 8/82 
Vol. II, Methodology, NCJ-90307, 12184, 

$9.90 

BJS bulletins 
Crime and the Nation's households, 1992, 

NCJ-143288, 9/93 
Criminal victimization 1991, NCJ-136947, 

10/92 
The crime of rape, NCJ-96777, 3/85 
Household burglary, NCJ-96021, 1/85 
Measuring crime, NCJ-75710, 2/81 

BJS special reports 
Elderly victims, NCJ-138330, 10/92 
Handgun crime victims, NCJ-123559, 7/90 
Black victims, NCJ-122562, 4/90 
Hispanic victims, NCJ-120507, 1/90 
The redesigned National Crime Survey: 

Selected new data, NCJ-114746, 1/89 
Molor vehicle theft, NCJ-109978, 3/88 
Violent crime trends, NCJ-107217, 11/87 
Robbery victims, NCJ-104638, 4187 
Violent crime by strangers and non-

strangers, NCJ-103702, 1/87 
Preventing domestic violence against 

women, NCJ-102037, 8/86 
Crime prevention measures, NCJ-100438, 

3/86 
The use of weapons In committing crimes, 

NCJ-99643, 1/86 
Reporting crimes to the police, 

NCJ-99432, 12185 

BJS technical reports 
New directions for NCS, NCJ-115571, 3/89 
Series crimes: Report 01 a field test, 

NCJ-104615,4/87 

Corrections 
BJS bulletins and special reports 

HIV In U.S. prisons and JailS, NCJ-143292, 
9/93 

Prisoners In 1992, NCJ-141874, 5/93 
Capital punishment 1991, NCJ-136946, 

10/92 
Drug enforcement and treatment In 

prisons, 1990, NCJ-134724, 7/92 
Women In prison, NCJ-127991, 4/91 
Violent State prisoners and their victims, 

NCJ-124133,7/90 
Prison rule violators, NCJ-120344, 121B9 
Recidivism of prisoners released In 1983, 

NCJ-116261,4/89 
Drug use and crime: State prison Inmate 

survey, 1986, NCJ-111940, 7/88 
Time served In prison and on parole, 1984, 

NCJ-108544, 12187 
Profile of State prison Inmates, 1986, 

NCJ-109926,1/B8 
Imprisonment In four countries, 

NCJ-103967,2/87 

Prisoners at midyear 1993 (press release), 
NCJ-143960, 9/93 

Correctional populations In the U.S.: 
1991, NCJ-142729, 8/93 
1990, NCJ-134946, 7/92 

Survey of State prison Inmates, 1991, 
NCJ-136949,5/93 

Census of State and Federal correctional 
faCilities, 1990, NCJ-137003, 6/92 

Prisons and prisoners In the United States, 
NCJ-137002,4/92 

National Corrections Reporting Program: 
1990, NCJ-141879, 5/93 
1989, NCJ-138222, 11/92 
1988, NCJ-134929, 4/92 

Staib and Federal Institutions, 1926-86: 
Race of prisoners admitted, NCJ-125618, 

6/91 
Historical statistics on prisoners, 

NCJ·111098, 6/88 

Census of jails and survey 
of Jail inmates 
BJS bulletins and special reports 

Jail Inmates, 1992, NCJ-143284, 8/93 
Drunk ~rlvlng: 1989 Survey of Inmates 

of Local Jails, NCJ-134728, 9/92 
Women In Jail, 1989, NCJ-134732, 3/92 
Drugs and jail Inmates, NCJ-130836, 8/91 
Profile of jail Inmates, 1989, 

NCJ-129097,4/91 
Population density In local Jails, 1988, 

NCJ-122299, 3/90 
Census of local Jails, 1988, 

NCJ-121101,2/90 

Census of tocal Jails, 1988: 
Summary and methodology, vol. t, 

NCJ-127992,3/91 
Data for Individual Jails In the Northeast, 

Midwest, South, West, vols. II-V, 
NCJ-130759-130762, 9/91 

Census of local Jails, 1983: Selected 
findings, methodology, summary tables, 
vol. V, NCJ-112795, 11/88 

Probation and parole 
BJS bulletins and special reports 

Probation and parote: 
1990, NCJ-133285, 11/91 
1989, NCJ-125833, 11/90 

Recidivism of young parolees, 
NCJ. 104916, 5/87 

Juvenile corrections 
Children In custody: Census of public and 

private Juvenile detention, correctional, 
and shelter facilities, 1975-85, NCJ-114065, 
6/89 

Survey of youth In custody, 1987 (special 
report), NCJ-113365, 9/88 

Expenditure and employment 
Justice expenditure and employment: 

1990 (BJS bulletin), NCJ-135777, 9/92 
1988 (full report), NCJ-125619, 8/91 
Extracts,1984, '85, '86, NCJ-124139, 8/91 

Justice variable pass-through data, 1990: 
Anti-drug abuse formula grants (BJS 
technical report), NCJ·133018, 3/92 

Courts 
BJS bulletins 

Felony sentences In State COI.lrtS, 1990, 
NCJ-1401B6,3/93 

Pretrial release of felony defendants, 1990, 
NCJ-139560, 11/92 

Prosecutors In State courts, 1990, 
NCJ-134500, 3/92 

Pretrial release of felony defendants, 1988, 
NCJ-127202,2191 

Felony sentences In State courts, 1988, 
NCJ-126923,12190 

Criminal defense for the poor, 1986, 
NCJ-112919,9/88 

BJS special reports 
Murder In families, NCJ-143498, 9/93 
Murder In large urban counties, 1988, 

NCJ-140614,3/93 
Recidivism of felons on probation, 

1986-89, NCJ-134177, 2192 
Felony case processing In State courts, 

1986, NCJ-121753, 2190 

Felony defendants In large urban counties, 
1990: National Pretrial Reporting Program, 
NCJ·141872,5/93 

National JUdicial Reporting Program,1988, 
NCJ-135945,1/93 

The prosecution 01 felony arrests: 
1988, NCJ-130914, 2192 
1987. NCJ-124140, 9/90 

Felonli sentenced to probation In State 
courts, 1986, NCJ-124944, 11/90 

Felony defendants In large urban counties, 
1988, NCJ-122385, 4/90 

Profile of felons convicted In State courts, 
1986, NCJ-120021, 1/90 

Felony laws of 50 States and the District of 
Columbia, 1986, NCJ-105066, 2188, $14.60 

State court model statistical dictionary: 
Supplement, NCJ-98326, 9/85 
1st edition, NCJ-62320, 9/80, $10.60 

Privacy and security 
Criminal justice Information policy: 

Use and management of criminal history 
record Information: A comprehensive 
report, NCJ-143501, 10/93 

Survey of criminal history Information 
systems,1992, NCJ-143500, 9/93 

Report of the National Task Force on 
Criminal History Record Disposition 
Reporting, NCJ-135836, 6/92 

Attorney General's program for Improving 
the Nation's criminal history recilrds: 

BJS Implementation status report, 
N CJ-134722, 3/92 

Identifying felons who attempt to 
purchase firearms, NCJ-128131, 3/91, 
$9.90 

Assessing completeness and accuracy of 
criminal history record Information: 
Audit guide, NCJ-133651, 2192 

Forensic DNA analysis: Issues, 
NCJ-128567, 6/91 

Statutes requiring use of criminal history 
record Information, NCJ-129B96, 6/91 

original records of entry, NCJ-125626, 
12/90 

Strategies for Improving data quality, 
NCJ-115339,5/89 

Public access to criminal history record 
Information, NCJ-111458, 11/B8 

Juvenile records and lecordkeeplng 
systems, NCJ-112815, 11/88 

Automated fingerprint Identification 
systems: Technology and policy Issues, 
NCJ-104342,4/B7 

Criminal justice "hot"lIIes, NCJ-101850, 
12/86 

Expert witness manual, NCJ-77927, 9/81, 
$11.50 

BJS/SEARCH conference proceedings: 
National conference on Improving the 

quality of criminal history Information: 
NCJ-133532,2192 

Criminal justice In the 1990's: The future 
of Information management, 
NCJ-121697, 5/90, $7.70 

Juvenile and adult records: One system, 
one record? NCJ-114947, 1/90 

Open VS. confidential records, 
NCJ-113560, 1188 

Compendium of State privacy and security 
legislation: 

1592, NCJ-137058, 7/92 
1992 full report (1 ,500pp, mlcroiiche $2, 

hard copy, $184), 7/92 

See order form 
on last page 

Law Enforcement Management 
and Administrative Statistics 
LEMAS,1990: Data for Individual agencies 

with 100 or more officers, NCJ-134436, 
9/92 

BJS bulletins and special reports 
Census of State and local law enforcement 

agenCies 1992, NCJ-142972, 7/93 
Drug enforcement by police and sheriffs' 

departments, 1990, NCJ-134505,5/92 
State and local police departments, 1990, 

NCJ-133284,2192 
Sheriffs' departments, 1990, NCJ-133283, 

2192 
Police departments In large cities, 1987, 

NCJ-119220, 8/89 
Profile of State and local law enforcement 

agencles,1987, NCJ-113949, 3/89 

Drugs & crime 
Drugs, crime, and the justice system: 

A national report, NCJ-133652, 5/93 
Technical appendix, NCJ-139578, 6/93 
Brochure/order form, NCJ-142961, 7/93 

Catalog of selected Federal publications 
on Illegal drug and alcohol abuse, 
NCJ-139562,6/93 

Drugs and crime facts: 
1992, NCJ-139561, 3/93 

State drug resources: 1992 natior.al 
directory, NCJ-134375, 5/92 

Federal drug data for nallonal policy, 
NCJ-122715, 4/90 

Federal justice statistics 
Compendium of Federal justice statistics: 

1990, NCJ-143499, 9/93 
1989, NCJ-134730, 5/92 

Federal criminal case processing, 1980-90, 
with preliminary dota for 1991 , 
NCJ-136945, 9/92 

The Federal civil Justice system (BJS 
bulletin), NCJ-104769, 8/87 

Federal offenses and offenders 
BJS special reports 

Prosecuting criminal enterprises: Federal 
offenses and offenders, NCJ·142524, 9/93 

Federal sentencing In transition, 1986-90, 
NCJ-134727,6/92 

Immigration offenses, NCJ-124546, 8/90 
Federal criminal cases, 1980-87, 

NCJ-118311,7/89 
Drug law vlolotors, 1980-86, NCJ-111763, 

6/88 
Pretrial release and detention: The Ball 

Reform Act of 1984, NCJ-109929,2i88 

General 
BJS bulletins and special reports 

Patterns 01 robbery and burglary 
in 9 States,1984-88, NCJ-13736B, 11/92 

Forgery and fraud·related offenses 
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Please put me on the mailing iist for: 

o Law enforcement reports -
National data on State and local 
police and sheriffs' departments: 
operations, equipment, personnel, 
salaries, spending, policies, and 
programs 

o Federal statistics - Federal case 
processing: investigation through 
prosecution, adjudication, sentencing, 
incarceration 

o Drugs and crime - Sentencing and 
time served by drug offenders, drug 
use at time of crime by jail inmates 
and State prisoners, and other quality 
data on drugs, crime, and law 
enforcement 

To be added to any BJS mailing 
list, please copy or cut out this 
page, fill in, fold, stamp, and 
mail to the Bureau of Justice 
Statistics Clearinghouse 
at the address below. 

o Justice expenditure and employ­
ment - Spending and staffing by 
Federal/State/local governments and 
by function (police, courts, correc­
tions, etc.) 

o Privacy and security of criminal 
history information and information 
policy - New State legislation; main­
taining and relel:tsing intelligence and 
investigative records; data quality 

o BJS bulletins & special reports­
Timely reports of the most current 
justice data 

o State felony courts - Defendant 
demographics and criminal history; 
pretrial release, prosecution, adjudi­
cation, and sentencing; State felony 
laws; indigent defense 

o Corrections reports - Results of 
sample surveys and censuses of jails, 
prisons, parole, probation, and other 
corrections data 

o National Crime Victimization 
Survey reports - The only ongoing 
national survey of crime victims 

o Sourcebook of Criminal Justice 
Statistics (annual) - Broad-based 
data from 150+ sources (400+ tables, 
100+ figures, subject index, annotated 
bibliography, addresses of sources) 

o Send me a signup form for the 
NIJ Catalog (free 6 times a year), 
which abstracts both private and 
government criminal justice publica­
tions and lists upcoming conferences 
and training sessions in the field. 

Name: ________________________________________ _ 

Title: ___________________ _ 

Organization: _______________________________________ _ 

Street or box: ________________________________________ _ 

City, State, ZIP: __________________ _ 
You will receive an annual 
renewal card. If you do not 
return it, we must drop you 
from the mailing list. 

Dayumephonenumber: _______________________________________ _ 

To order copies of recent 
BJS reports, attach a list 
of titles and NCJ order 
numbers. 

U.S. Department of Justice 
Bureau of Justice Statistics 
Washington, D.C. 20531 

Criminal justice interest: _______________________________________ _ 

Please put organization 

and title here if you used 

home address above: _______________________________________ _ 

Bureau of Justice Statistics Clearinghouse 
P.O. Box 179, Dept. BJS·236 
Annapolis Junction, MD 20701-0179 

Place 
first-class 

stamp 
here 



Selected Bureau of Justice Statistics 
Publications on CD-ROM 

The National Economic, Social, and Environmental Data Bank (NESE-DB) CD-ROM, 
produced by the U.S. Department of Commerce, is a comprehensive electronic infor­
mation source focusing on the U.S. economy, society, and environment. 

NESE-DB presents the full text of many of the Federal Government's most popular 
publications on CD-ROM, including The Economic Report of the President, Toxics in 
the Community, Health Statistics U.S., and Digest of Educational Statistics. The fol­
lowing publications from the Bureau of Justice Statistics (BJS) are also included: 

• Criminal Victimization in the U.S., 1990 (text and tables) 
• Capital Punishment, 1990 (text) 
• Crime and the Nation's Households, 1990 (text) 
• Drugs and Jail Inmates, 1989 (text) 
• Felony Sentences in State Courts, 1988 

(text) 
• Female Victims of Violent Crime (text) 
• Jaillnmates, 1990 (text) 
• Prisoners in 1990 (text) 
• Profile of Jail Inmates (text) 
• Probation and Parole, 1990 (text) 
• School Crime (text) 
• Women in Prison (text) 

The CD-ROM includes ASCII text, Lotus 
tables, and updated Browse software. It can be used on any 
IBM-compatible PC with at least 640K of memory, an ISO 9660 
(standard) CD-ROM reader, and Microsoft CD-ROM extensions 
(version 2.0 or higher). 

The NESE-DB CD-ROM can be purchased from the BJS Clearinghouse for $15. For 
more information, call 1-800-732-3277. 

To order your copy of the NESE-DB CD-ROM, please send a check or money order for $15 made out to the BJS Clearinghouse to P.O. Box 
6000, 2B, Rockville, MD 20850. 

You may also purchase the CD-ROM by using VISA or MasterCard. Please include type of card, card number, card holder's name and 
address, and expiration date for processing. 

Credit Card Type and Number ___________ _ Expiration Date _____ _ 

Name and Address of Card Holder ______________________ _ 
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Questions about drugs 
and crime? 

Call1-B00-666-3332 

Drugs & Crime Data Center 
& Clearinghouse 
1600 Research Boulevard 
Rockville, MD 20850 

Official Business 

To order this report 
or ask about other BJS 
crime and justice data: 

Call1-800-732-32n 

Bureau of Justice Statistics 
Clearinghouse 
Box 6000 
Rockville, MD 20850 

Or call the BJS se~tion of the 
NCJRS electronic bulletin board 
for the latest data releases: 

1-301-738-8895 
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